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AGENDA ITEM
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B) X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 171306 FOR MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE
SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES
OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

(D) Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




EP EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DisTRICT

Hasted fro Tecellense
ko Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance

Digitally signed by Luis A.
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Vélez

Date: 2016.06.29 12:59:51
Date: Thursday, June 30, 2016 -05'00°
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 171306 for Music

Instruments and Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal Number 171306 for Music Instruments and Supplies be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal
and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson RoaD @  EAGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @ T (830) 773-518]1 @  Ww\W.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

AN EquaL OrrorTuNiTY EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 171306 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

Item ; ; 3 -
No Qty. Description K&S Music* Olivas' Music Taylor Music Universal Melody | Washington Music
EAGLE PASS HIGH SCHOOL INSTRUMENTS

Adams 3.0 Octave Concert Vibrahone with Field Frame no motor ;
1 1 ADM-VCSE30 No Bid $3,440.00 $3,229.00 $3,630.00 $3,262.00
Pearl| Championship FFX Snare Drum PEA-FFXM1412/A-46 with
2 5 |carrier PEA-CXS, Case PEA-PD1412, Cover PEA-MDCG14, Stand PEA- No Bid $1,032.50 5$811.00 $947.00 $822.00
MSS3000

3 1 Yamaha YMP-202s Marching Mellophone $1,170.00 $1,947.00 $1,244.00 No Bid $1,236.00
4 1 Buffet Crampton R13 Bb Clarinet No Bid $2,549.50 $2,449.00 $2,644.00 $2,562.00
5 1 Yamaha YEP-3215 4-Valve Euphonium No Bid $1,864.50 $1,844.00 No Bid $1,832.00
6 1 Bach180S37T Stradivaris Trumpet No Bid $1,937.50 $2,022.00 $1,904.00 $2,004.00
7 1 Black Swamp Concert CM6514CR Snare No Bid No Bid $404.00 $449.00 $525.00
8 1 Trombone Prelude by Conn-SelmerTB711F $395.00 $939.50 $477.00 $492.00 $469.00
9 1 Yamaha Clarinet YCL-450 Silver Keys No Bid $939.50 $933.00 No Bid $923.00
10 1 Yamaha YEP-321 4-Valve Euphonium No Bid $1,651.50 $1,633.00 No Bid $1,623.00
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 171306 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

Item i~ e : : - :
No Qty. Description K&S Music Olivas' Music Taylor Music Universal Melody | Washington Music

11 1 Holton H378 Intermediate French Horn No Bid $2,224.50 $2,198.00 $2,299.00 $2,192.00

12 1 Yamaha HD-200 Harmony Director No Bid $897.50 $882.00 $1,400.00 $969.00

13 1 Selmer 1430LP Bb Bass Clarinet $995.00 $1,449.50 $1,428.00 $1,497.00 $1,428.00

14 1 Podium Command Tower B\:;;ZZIZK\;ith Tow pkg. and Transport No Bid $2.495.00 $2,488.00 No Bid No Bid

15 1 Yamaha Flute YFL361 H $949.00 $766.50 No Bid No Bid $753.00
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 171306 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

ItNe; Qty. Description K&S Music* Olivas' Music Taylor Music Universal Melody | Washington Music
C.C. WINN HIGH SCHOOL INSTRUMENTS
i 1 Tre Works db Classic Double Row Chimes-Model TW-TRE35 DB No Bid No Bid $159.00 $116.00 $215.00
2 1 | Tre Works Tres Hard Sided Gig Bag Chime Case-Model TW-TRES1 No Bid No Bid $39.00 $46.00 $50.00
3 1 Pearl Trap Table18x24-PTT-1824W No Bid $172.45 $98.00 $120.00 $108.00
4 2 Black Swap Rock Maple Wood Block Lrg-MWB1 BLA-MWB1 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $45.00 $47.00
§ g | YamahaBoom cymbal Stand-lg:;;; Weight Double Braced-YAM- No Bid $84.95 No Bid No Bid $95.00
6 2 Black Swap 10” Double Row Tambourine TCl Model BLA TC1 No Bid No Bid $148.00 $167.00 $200.00
7 1 LP Multi Guiro LP452 No Bid $44.50 No Bid $42.29 $50.00
8 2 LP Afuche/Cabasa-Standard Wood(LP234A) Model LP-LP234A No Bid $34.50 $28.88 $31.75 $36.00
9 1 Presonus Studio Live 24.4 Digital Mixer 24 Channel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,799.00
10 | 1 Yamaha Standard Series Timpani YAM TP4304CL No Bid $7,936.50 No Bid No Bid $7,797.00
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 171306 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
lt;: Qty. Description K&S Music* Olivas' Music Taylor Music Universal Melody | Washington Music

11 | 1 |Zildjian High Octave Professional Crotales with Bar Model ZIL-POG65 No Bid $1,897.50 No Bid $964.00 $1,850.00
12 1 |Zildjian Low Octave Professional Crotales with Bar Model Z1L-P0675 No Bid $1,897.50 No Bid $964.00 $1,850.00
13 1 Weiss Bell Tree - Mountable with Steel Fram Model SW-450 No Bid No Bid $229.95 No Bid No Bid
14 1 Weiss Steel Sleigh Bells Model CRL-SLEIGHBELLS No Bid No Bid $39.99 No Bid No Bid
5 |, § | ST TR el e No Bid No Bid $67.00 $75.45 $95.00
16 2 LP Clave. Traditional Maple (LP262), No Bid $12.95 $12.95 $11.73 $14.00
17 | 2 | zildjian 18" K Constantinople Suspended Cymbal Model ZIL-K1012 No Bid $344.00 $285.00 $263.00 $290.00
18 4 Zildjian K Dark Thin Crash Cymbal 16" K0913 No Bid $227.00 5166.00 $176.00 $190.00
19 | 3 Zildjian 10" A Custom Splash Cymbal Model ZIL-A20542 No Bid $112.50 $84.00 $89.00 $95.00
20 | 3 Zildjian 18" A Custom Crash Cymbal Model ZILA20516 No Bid $233.50 $170.00 $181.00 $195.00
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 171306 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

I't\le: Qty. Description K&S Music* Olivas' Music Taylor Music Universal Melody | Washington Music
21 | 4 Zildjian 10" K Splash Cymbal Model ZIL-K0858 No Bid $124.00 $92.00 $97.00 $105.00
22 4 Zildjian 18" Classic Orchestral Suspended Cymbal Model A0419 No Bid $257.50 $177.00 $190.00 $200.00
23 | 4 Zildjian Oriental Chine 16" No Bid No Bid $144.00 $152.00 $165.00
24 | 1 | Zildjian 20" K Constantinople Suspended Cymbal Model Z1L-K1014 No Bid $398.00 $328.00 $305.00 $325.00
25 | 1 |[Black Swamp Concert Maple 14x5 Snare Drum Model BLA-Mss1MD No Bid No Bid No Bid $853.00 $505.00
26 | 3 Pearl 5-1030L Concert Snare Drum Stand Model PEA-S1030L No Bid $113.00 $99.00 $130.00 $109.00
97 2 Pearl Philharmonic Concert 5:::’1[;;'.:;? Solid shell maple Model PEA No Bid $798.50 5752.00 $863.00 $776.00
28 1 Pearl Philharmonic Concert S::Fr’ifsrgm - Maple 14X5 Model PEA- No Bid $794.50 $467.00 $547.00 $475.00
29 1 LP Palladium Conga Se;gzl:ldli(?tg_:‘;anag;; Stand Item #443367 - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 1 LP Slide Mount Double Conga Stand Standard Item #H71813 - Model No Bid $207.00 No Bid 5167.00 $195.00

LP290S
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 171306 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

I:: Qty. Description K&S Music* Olivas' Music Taylor Music Universal Melody | Washington Music
§i, | i || eelereumatia s iashLangs Stendtandard kem No Bid $81.25 No Bid $55.07 $75.00
39 | 1 | Yemaha MOXF8 Music Pron:;:::iz:::)nthesizer MPN: MOXF8 (for No Bid $1,236.95 No Bid No Bid $2,997.00
33 3 | Black Humes & Berg Enduro Snare Case w/foam HUM-DR 475BKSP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00
34 | 2 Toca Castenet Machine TOC-T23001 No Bid §52.75 $39.00 $49.23 $60.00
35 1 LP Granite Block Set LP1210 No Bid $207.00 $139.00 $167.00 $190.00
36 1 Black Swap 10" Double row Tambourine TC1 No Bid No Bid $148.00 $167.00 $195.00
37 10 Pearl Hoop Protector BDR1 No Bid $15.60 $12.49 $16.45 $14.00
38| 6 Pearl Rack Clamp PCX100 No Bid $29.40 $18.49 $23.17 $20.00
39 | 1 YAMAHA FP-8500C Bass Drum Pedal No Bid $159.50 No Bid No Bid $150.00
40 | 2 LP Clave Grenadilla LP261 No Bid $21.00 $18.99 $19.82 $25.00
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