Dear Board Members,

While under the effects of Covid-19 restrictions, | must say this year’s competitive bid process has again ran fairly smooth. We had twelve
companies across the country request the bid. Six of the twelve companies were awarded various items in the bid based on lowest responsible
bid factors. We did have one local company Central Supply whose bid was mailed late and they were disqualified. One concern vendors have
shared is any products related to disinfectants may be delayed due to Covid-19, the raw materials to make the chemical just isn’t available
right now. As you all know the demand has been extremely high forcing companies to go into allocation mode to try and me the needs of all
customers. We continue to explore and sample chemicals, equipment and processes to improve on what we do on a daily basis and promote
efficiencies in the custodian department. The competitive bid process does help to drive pricing down. We will issue PO’s for each award,
this will help to expedite delivery.

Enough can’t be said for the way our school district serves this community, again thank you for your unyielding support of the custodian
department.

Bid Schedule:

April 9,2020  Public Notice for custodian supply RFP.

April 23,2020  All questions and samples must be submitted to Unit 5 contact by this date.
April 25,2020  Question responses will be broadcast to all registered vendors on this date.
April 27,2020  Responses to RFP due; Bid opening at 3:00 pm at Unit 5 Central Office.
May 13,2020  Board of Education reviews and votes on Bid Response.

May 18, 2020  PO’s for awarded supplies out to vendors.

June 29, 2020  Awarded bid supplies due in warehouse on this date.

We are looking forward to another successful summer cleaning season.
Best regards,

Craig Montgomery,
Director of Custodians

McLean County

Unit District No. 5
Educating each student to achieve personal excellence.




Expert Chemical & Supply

Attn: Jeff Burrows

16711 Richmond Ave., Suite C

Hazel Crest, IL 60429

708.331.2236

Email: jburrows@expertchemical.com

Central Supply Company

Attn: Stephanie Shoemaker

501 N. Prairie Street

Bloomington, IL 61701

309.660.7302

Email: sshoemaker@centralsupplyco.com

Kaeb Sanitary Supply, Inc.
Attn: Clint Kaeb

500 East Bell Street
Bloomington, IL 61701
309.531.7916

Email: cdkaeb@kaebsanitary.com

Miller Janitor Supply
Attn: Tom Miller

1817 W. Hovey Avenue
Normal, IL 61761
309.452.8396

Email: tom.miller@millerjanitorsupply.com

Midland Paper Company

Attn: Mike Bolt

2500 Heather Ridge Drive

Normal, IL 61761

3093.824.0026

Email: mike.bolt@midlandpaper.com

2020 - 21 Bid Candidates

Chemical Maintenance Company
Kassandra Schieber

Account Manager

1100A W. Bloomington Rd
Champaign, IL 61821

O: 217-359-6262

C: 309-200-6923
kassi.schieber@cmiclean.com

Unipak Corp

Yolanda Revilla

PO Box 300027

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Tel. 888-808-5120
customercare@unipakcorp.net

Pyramid School Products
Daniel Sanders

6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, Florida 33610-1908
Phone- (800) 792-2644
biddept@pyramidsp.com
WWW.pyramidsp.com

Tiles In Style, LLC

Mark Shak

Phone: (877) 817-2841

Direct: (630) 219-1978
email:mshak@tilesinstyle.com
www.tilesinstyle.com

Deltek

Jacqueline Sessa

509 Olive Way, Suite 400,

Seattle, WA 98101

206.373.9150
email:jacquelinesessa@deltek.com
www.deltek.com

Central Poly-Bag Corp
Angelica Santos

Bid Coordinator

2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ 07036

Tel: 908-862-7570
angie@centralpoly.com

Mercer Technologies Firm

Garrett Mercer

Business Development

1501 E. 15th Ave # 115

Gary, Indiana 46402
mercertechnologiesfirm@gmail.com


mailto:biddept@pyramidsp.com
tel:%28877%29%20817-2841
tel:%28630%29%20219-1978
mailto:mshak@tilesinstyle.com
http://www.tilesinstyle.com/
mailto:angie@centralpoly.com
mailto:mercertechnologiesfirm@gmail.com

McLean County USD # 5 Custodian Supply Bid
Opening Submissions
Monday, April 27, 2020 3:00pm

Bid Company Custodian Supplies Paper Towels Toilet Paper Can Liners

Chemical Maintenance Inc

1100 A Bloomington, Rd. X X X X

Champaign, IL 61821

Central Supply Company

Bloomington, IL 61701

Expert Chemical & Supply

16711 Richmond Ave. X X X [ ——

Hazel Crest, IL 60429

Kaeb Sanitary Supply Inc.

P.O. Box 3122 X X X X

Bloomington, IL 61702

Miller Janitorial Supply
1817 W. HoveyAve. X - en an e - e en e - e a» e
Normal, IL 61762

Midland Paper Company

150 Unit Dr. ———— X X X

Normal, IL 61771

Pyramid School Products

6510 North 54th Street X ——— ———— -
Tampa, Florida 33610-1908
Unipak Corp
PO Box 300027 ——— ——— ——— X

Brooklyn, NY 11230




McLean County Unit District 5
1809 W. Hovey Ave., Normal, IL 61761
Custodial Supplies Bid

2020-21
1. List unit price as well as total price.
2. Prices are to be FOB to 1999 Eagle Rd., Normal, IL.
3. Material will be purchased by line item.
4. Deliveries to be made as soon as possible.
5. For additional information, contact Martin Hickman 309.557.4010 or Craig Montgomery 309.557.4102.
Unit Item Expert Central Kaeb Miller Midland Pyramid Unipak
Qnty Meas. Code |Specifications Chem. Sup. Supply Sanitary Janitorial Paper Products Corp
400 each []CS0200 |Unisan toilet bowl mop/acid swab UNS160 No Bid No Bid $292.00 $256.00 No Bid $420.00 No Bid
48 each []CS0230 |Unisan Angler Broom 13" sweep, 42" long, 7/8" dia. No Bid No Bid No Bid $243.36 No Bid $191.52 No Bid
25 each []CS0240 |Bowl Brush or equivalent No Bid No Bid $77.50 $81.25 No Bid $32.25 No Bid
60 each []CS0281 |[Spartan Concentrate Window Cleaner Quart Size - or equivalent No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
240 each []CS0282 |Green Certified Bowl Cleaner 9% Quart Size - or equivalent No Bid No Bid $597.60 $508.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
144 each ]CS0283 |Bon Ami Powder Cleanser, 210z No Bid No Bid $161.28 No Bid No Bid $185.76 No Bid
48 each JCS0541 [Stainless Steel Cleaner — Polish, 200z No Bid No Bid $170.40 $168.48 No Bid $132.00 No Bid
Spartan Disinfectant deodorant spray Spring Breeze
300 each [JCS0300 |16 oz aerosol can, Steriphene Il. or equivalent No Bid No Bid $1,110.00 $852.00 No Bid $801.00 No Bid
50 each JCS0310 |GPC 59209 Twin Roll Jr. Jumbo Toilet Tissue Dispenser $1,650.00 No Bid $969.00 $1,564.00 $1,522.50 No Bid No Bid
100 each JCS0312 |GPC 54338 Vista® Hygienic Push Paddle Roll Towel Dispenser $3,600.00 No Bid $3,368.00 $3,425.00 $3,170.00 No Bid No Bid
36 each [JCS0350 |Handheld Microfiber Telescopic Duster/w Pole No Bid No Bid $436.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 cases JCS0480 ]20" White Polishing Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. No Bid No Bid $359.40 $340.00 No Bid $359.40 No Bid
30 cases |CS0483 ]20" Red Scrubbing Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. No Bid No Bid $359.40 $340.00 No Bid $359.40 No Bid
30 cases |CS0482 |20" Black Stripping Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. No Bid No Bid $359.40 $340.00 No Bid $359.40 No Bid
40 cases [CS0484 |20" Maroon Aggressive Stripping Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. No Bid No Bid $687.20 $628.00 No Bid $999.20 No Bid
120 each [JCS0462 |20 oz. Wet Mop Head, banded and looped ends, cotton/rayon blend. No Bid No Bid No Bid $465.60 No Bid $382.80 No Bid
144 each [JCS0465 |24 oz. Wet Mop Head, banded and looped ends, cotton/rayon blend. No Bid No Bid No Bid $718.56 No Bid $573.12 No Bid




Unit Item Expert Central Kaeb Miller Midland Pyramid Unipak
Qnty Meas. Code |Specifications Chem. Sup. Supply Sanitary Janitorial Paper Products Corp
24 each []CS0470 |36" Unger Nifty Nabbers No Bid No Bid $627.89 $662.88 No Bid $647.52 No Bid
240 each ]CS0650 [Yellow medium size beige cellulose sponge 1 5/8" X 4 1/4" X 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid $388.80 No Bid $127.20 No Bid
200 each JCS0610 |3M Scrubbing & Sponge Pads, #74 or #44 ETC - 3 1/2" x 6 1/4" x 7/8" No Bid No Bid $120.00 $66.00 No Bid $114.00 No Bid
480 each [JCS0611 |Heavy Duty Scouring Pads, 6" x 9" No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.00 No Bid $90.72 No Bid
2000 each []CS0700 |Eco-Fresh Wave Urinal Screen Spiced Apple No Bid No Bid $2,736.00 $2,740.00 No Bid $3,300.00 No Bid
50 each [JCS0730 |Rubbermaid # 2957 Desk Waste Basket, (Black) NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid $540.00 $538.50 No Bid $314.50 No Bid
48 each [JCS0731 |Rubbermaid # 3569 Hall Waste Basket, Gray) NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid $2,863.20 $2,910.40 No Bid $1,919.04 No Bid
50 each ]CS0732 [JRubbermaid Brute # 2640 Dolly, NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid $2,331.50 $2,473.50 No Bid $1,249.00 No Bid
10 cases [CS0400 Powder Free Medium Vinyl Gloves 10 boxes/cs No Bid $250.00 $202.50 $223.00 No Bid $299.00 $249.50
20 cases [CS0402 Powder Free Large Vinyl Gloves 10 boxes/cs No Bid $500.00 $405.00 $446.00 No Bid $598.00 $499.00
40 cases [|CS0401 |Powder Free Ex-Large Vinyl Gloves 10 boxes/cs No Bid $1,000.00 $810.00 $892.00 No Bid $1,196.00 $998.00
50 cases 260KL Health Gards Kraft Waxed Liners - or equivalent No Bid No Bid No Bid $778.00 No Bid $749.00 No Bid
Lite N Foamy Sunflower Fresh Spartan 1 gal. #3305-04
384 1gal. |CS0643 |NO SUBSTITUTE — 1 FREE DISPENSER PER CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,786.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan Green Solutions Industrial Cleaner, 5 gal. containers
36 5gal. ]CS0380 |NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,270.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan Consume Ecolyzer, 5 gal. containers
72 5gal. |JCS0641 |NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,543.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan Consume Drain Maintainer, 5 gal. containers
36 5gal. JCS0330 |NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,226.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan Neutral Disinfectant, 5 gal. containers
72 5gal. |CS0642 |NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,403.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan Clean By Proxy, gal. containers
144 5gal. JCS0510 |NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,616.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan Shine-line Floor Prep Neutralizer
36 5gal. ]CS0381 |5 gal. containers NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid No Bid $794.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan Step-Down, Wax Stripper, Non-butyl product,
180 5gal. |CS0741 |Non-Ammoniated, Low Odor, 5 gal. containers NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid $16,624.80 $8,514.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spartan I-Shine, Floor Sealer/Finish, 25% dry solids,
324 5gal. |CS0740 |optical enhancers, metal interlock, 5 gal. containers NO SUBSTITUTE No Bid No Bid $18,630.00 $19,290.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Totals of Awarded Custodial Products $6,348.35 $51,058.48 $3,170.00 $6,562.15




Unit Item Code | Specifications: 20 - 30 gallon can liners: Compliance, Standards - Expert Central Kaeb Miller Midland Pyramid Unipak
30 Virgin Resin (May contain no more than 30% repro, must accompany ch S S | Sani itorial d c
Qnty Meas. 451 a verification letter from manufacturer) em. Sup. upply anitary Janitorial Paper Products orp
Can Liners 30 x 37 in., 500/cs.Roll, 20 - 30 gal. size 0.51 mil.
500]cases low density color -black. (Sample Required) $9,620.00 $9,620.00 $9,270.00 $8,785.00
Unit ltem Code | Specifications: 40 - 45 gallon can liners: Compliance, Standards - Expert Central Kaeb Miller Midland Pyramid Unipak
M CS0451 Virgin Resin (May contain no more than 30% repro, must accompany ch s Supol Sani Janitorial P Prod c
Qnty eas. a verification letter from manufacturer) em. Sup. upply anitary anitorial aper roducts orp
Can Liners 40 x 48 in., 200/cs.Roll, 40 - 45 gal. size 0.73 mil.
650]cases low density color -black. (Sample Required) $11,024.00 $11,024.00 $11,502.40 $11,245.00
Total for Option 1 on Can Liner Products $20,644.00 $20,644.00 $20,772.40 $20,030.00
Total for Option 2 on Can Liner Products
Unit Item Code Specifications: Jumbo Jr. 2 Ply Toilet Paper Expert Central Kaeb Miller Midland Pyramid Unipak
Qnty Meas. CS0691 NOTE: Split Delivery dates July 2020 and December 2020 Chem. Sup. Supply Sanitary Janitorial Paper Products Corp
750|cases Jumbo Jr. 2 ply, 3.5" x 1000ft $14,137.50 | $14,437.50 $14,437.50 $13,800.00
Unit Item Code Specifications: White Roll Paper Towels Expert Central Kaeb Miller Midland Pyramid Unipak
Qnty Meas. CS0692 NOTE: Split Delivery dates July 2020 and December 2020 Chem. Sup. Supply Sanitary Janitorial Paper Products Corp
1500]cases White - 6 rolls/case, 7.87" to 8" x 800ft/roll, 2.0" core $26,775.00 $27,375.00 $27,375.00 $30,600.00
Option 2 $28,725.00
Total for Option 1 on Paper Products $40,912.50 $41,812.50 $41,812.50 $44,400.00
Total for Option 2 on Paper Products $42,525.00
Total Liner/Paper Total Liner/Paper
| $67,138.98 | $60,942.50 | $128,081.48 |
Indicates: Lowest Responsible Bid Items Awarded
Indicates: Withdraw bid item(s) due to bid pricing or no bid
Indicates: Item(s) did not meet NO SUBSTITUTE requirement

Item(s) did not meet or was below bid specifications
Item(s) requested specifications not provided in bid packet
Item(s) did not meet existing dispensing conditions

There was a miscalculation on behalf of bidder

No samples were provided for proof and testing period

Bid disqualified due to late arrival
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McLean County Unit District 5

1809 W. Hovey Ave., Normal, IL 61761
Custodial Supplies Bid
2020-21

List unit price as well as total price.

Prices are to be FOB to 1999 Eagle Rd., Normal, IL.
Material will be purchased by line item.

Deliveries to be made as soon as possible.

For additional information, contact Martin Hickman 309.557.4010 or Craig Montgomery 309.557.4102.

Unit Item Code Specifications: Jumbo Jr. 2 Ply Toilet Paper Expert
Qnty Meas. CS0691 NOTE: Split Delivery dates July 2020 and December20 Chem. Sup.
750]cases PJumbo Jr. 2 ply, 3.5" x 1000ft $14,137.50

Unit Item Code Specifications: White Roll Paper Towels Expert
Qnty Meas. CS0692 NOTE: Split Delivery dates July 2020 and December 2020 Chem. Sup.
1500]cases White - 6 rolls/case, 7.87" to 8" x 800ft/roll, 2.0" core $26,775.00

Option 2

Total for Option 1 on Paper Products $40,912.50

Indicates:

_ Indicates:

Indicates:

Lowest Responsible Bid Items Awarded

Withdraw bid item(s) due to bid pricing or no bid

Item(s) did not meet NO SUBSTITUTE requirement
Item(s) did not meet or was below bid specifications
Item(s) requested specifications not provided in bid packet
Item(s) did not meet existing dispensing conditions

There was a miscalculation on behalf of bidder

No samples were provided for proof and testing period

Bid disqualified due to late arrival




McLean County Unit District 5
1809 W. Hovey Ave., Normal, IL 61761
Custodial Supplies Bid
2020-21

1. List unit price as well as total price.
2. Prices are to be FOB to 1999 Eagle Rd., Normal, IL.
3. Material will be purchased by line item.
4. Deliveries to be made as soon as possible.
5. For additional information, contact Martin Hickman 309.557.4010 or Craig Montgomery 309.557.4102.
Unit Item Kaeb
onty Meas. Code |Specifications Sanitary
144 each | CS0283 |Bon Ami Powder Cleanser, 210z $161.28
50 each | CS0310 JGPC 59209 Twin Roll Jr. Jumbo Toilet Tissue Dispenser $969.00
36 each | CS0350 JHandheld Microfiber Telescopic Duster/w Pole $436.68
24 each | CS0470 |36" Unger Nifty Nabbers $627.89
2000 each | CS0700 |Eco-Fresh Wave Urinal Screen Spiced Apple $2,736.00
10 cases |CS0400 |Powder Free Medium Vinyl Gloves 10 boxes/cs $202.50
20 cases |CS0402 |Powder Free Large Vinyl Gloves 10 boxes/cs $405.00
40 cases | CS0401 |Powder Free Ex-Large Vinyl Gloves 10 boxes/cs $810.00
Totals of Awarded Custodial Products $6,348.35
Indicates: Lowest Responsible Bid Items Awarded
P Indicates: Withdraw bid item(s) due to bid pricing or no bid
Indicates: Item(s) did not meet NO SUBSTITUTE requirement

Item(s) did not meet or was below bid specifications
Item(s) requested specifications not provided in bid packet
Item(s) did not meet existing dispensing conditions

There was a miscalculation on behalf of bidder
No samples were provided for proof and testing period
Bid disqualified due to late arrival




McLean County Unit District 5

1809 W. Hovey Ave., Normal, IL 61761
Custodial Supplies Bid
2020-21

1. List unit price as well as total price.
2. Prices are to be FOB to 1999 Eagle Rd., Normal, IL.
3. Material will be purchased by line item.
4. Deliveries to be made as soon as possible.
5. For additional information, contact Martin Hickman 309.557.4010 or Craig Montgomery 309.557.4102.
Unit Item Miller
Qnty Meas. Code |Specifications Janitorial
400 each ] CS0200 JUnisan toilet bowl mop/acid swab _UNS160 $256.00
60 each ]| CS0281 |Spartan Concentrate Window Cleaner Quart Size - or equivalent $135.00
240 each | CS0282 |Green Certified Bowl Cleaner 9% Quart Size - or equivalent $508.80
30 cases | CS0480 120" White Polishing Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. $340.00
30 cases | CS0483 120" Red Scrubbing Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. $340.00
30 cases | CS0482 120" Black Stripping Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. $340.00
40 cases | CS0484 120" Maroon Aggressive Stripping Pads 1" thick 3M or ETC. $628.00
200 each | CS0610 J3M Scrubbing & Sponge Pads, #74 or #44 ETC - 3 1/2" x 6 1/4" x 7/8" $66.00
Lite N Foamy Sunflower Fresh Spartan 1 gal. #3305-04
384 1gal. | CS0643 |NO SUBSTITUTE — 1 FREE DISPENSER PER CASE $3,786.24
Spartan Green Solutions Industrial Cleaner, 5 gal. containers
36 5gal. | CS0380 INO SUBSTITUTE $1,270.08
Spartan Consume Ecolyzer, 5 gal. containers
72 5gal. | CS0641 INO SUBSTITUTE $3,543.12
Spartan Consume Drain Maintainer, 5 gal. containers
36 5gal. | CS0330 INO SUBSTITUTE $1,226.60
Spartan Neutral Disinfectant, 5 gal. containers
72 5gal. | CS0642 INO SUBSTITUTE $2,403.36
Spartan Clean By Proxy, gal. containers
144 5gal. | CS0510 INO SUBSTITUTE $7,616.16
Spartan Shine-line Floor Prep Neutralizer
36 5gal. ] CS0381 |5 gal. containers NO SUBSTITUTE $794.16
Spartan Step-Down, Wax Stripper, Non-butyl product,
180 5gal. ] CS0741 INon-Ammoniated, Low Odor, 5 gal. containers NO SUBSTITUTE $8,514.00
Spartan I-Shine, Floor Sealer/Finish, 25% dry solids,
324 5gal. | CS0740 Joptical enhancers, metal interlock, 5 gal. containers NO SUBSTITUTE $19,290.96
Totals of Awarded Custodial Products $51,058.48
Indicates: Lowest Responsible Bid Items Awarded
P Indicates: Withdraw bid item(s) due to bid pricing or no bid
Indicates: Item(s) did not meet NO SUBSTITUTE requirement

Item(s) did not meet or was below bid specifications
Item(s) requested specifications not provided in bid packet
Item(s) did not meet existing dispensing conditions

There was a miscalculation on behalf of bidder

No samples were provided for proof and testing period

Bid disqualified due to late arrival



McLean County Unit District 5

1809 W. Hovey Ave., Normal, IL 61761
Custodial Supplies Bid

2020-21
1. List unit price as well as total price.
2. Prices are to be FOB to 1999 Eagle Rd., Normal, IL.
3. Material will be purchased by line item.
4. Deliveries to be made as soon as possible.
5. For additional information, contact Martin Hickman 309.557.4010 or Craig Montgomery 309.557.4102.
Unit Item Midland
Qnty Meas. Code__|Specifications Paper
100 each | CS0312 JGPC 54338 Vista® Hygienic Push Paddle Roll Towel Dispenser $3,170.00
Totals of Awarded Custodial Products $3,170.00
Indicates: Lowest Responsible Bid Items Awarded
P Indicates: Withdraw bid item(s) due to bid pricing or no bid
Indicates: Item(s) did not meet NO SUBSTITUTE requirement

Item(s) did not meet or was below bid specifications
Item(s) requested specifications not provided in bid packet
Item(s) did not meet existing dispensing conditions

There was a miscalculation on behalf of bidder
No samples were provided for proof and testing period
Bid disqualified due to late arrival




McLean County Unit District 5

1809 W. Hovey Ave., Normal, IL 61761
Custodial Supplies Bid

2020-21
1. List unit price as well as total price.
2. Prices are to be FOB to 1999 Eagle Rd., Normal, IL.
3. Material will be purchased by line item.
4. Deliveries to be made as soon as possible.
5. For additional information, contact Martin Hickman 309.557.4010 or Craig Montgomery 309.557.4102.
Unit ltem Pyramid
onty Meas. Code |Specifications Products
48 each ]| CS0230 JUnisan Angler Broom 13" sweep, 42" long, 7/8" dia. $191.52
25 each ] CS0240 |Bowl Brush or equivalent $32.25
48 each ] CS0541 |Stainless Steel Cleaner — Polish, 200z $132.00
Spartan Disinfectant deodorant spray Spring Breeze
300 each ] CS0300 |]16 oz aerosol can, Steriphene Il. or equivalent $801.00
120 each CS0462 ]20 oz. Wet Mop Head, banded and looped ends, cotton/rayon blend. $382.80
144 each CS0465 ]24 oz. Wet Mop Head, banded and looped ends, cotton/rayon blend. $573.12
240 each ]| CS0650 |Yellow medium size beige cellulose sponge 1 5/8" X 4 1/4" X 6" $127.20
480 each | CS0611 JHeavy Duty Scouring Pads, 6" x 9" $90.72 |
50 each ] CS0730 JRubbermaid # 2957 Desk Waste Basket, (Black) NO SUBSTITUTE $314.50
48 each ] CS0731 JRubbermaid # 3569 Hall Waste Basket, Gray) NO SUBSTITUTE $1,919.04
50 each | CS0732 JRubbermaid Brute # 2640 Dolly, NO SUBSTITUTE $1,249.00
50 cases 260KL Health Gards Kraft Waxed Liners - or equivalent $749.00
Totals of Awarded Custodial Products $6,562.15
Indicates: Lowest Responsible Bid Items Awarded
_ Indicates: Withdraw bid item(s) due to bid pricing or no bid
Indicates: Item(s) did not meet NO SUBSTITUTE requirement

Item(s) did not meet or was below bid specifications
Item(s) requested specifications not provided in bid packet
Item(s) did not meet existing dispensing conditions

There was a miscalculation on behalf of bidder

No samples were provided for proof and testing period

Bid disqualified due to late arrival
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McLean County Unit District 5

1809 W. Hovey Ave., Normal, IL 61761
Custodial Supplies Bid
2019-20

List unit price as well as total price.

Prices are to be FOB to 1999 Eagle Rd., Normal, IL.

Material will be purchased by line item.

Deliveries to be made as soon as possible.

For additional information, contact Martin Hickman 309.557.4010 or Craig Montgomery 309.557.4102.

Unit Item Code Specifications: 20 - 30 gallon can liners: Compliance, Standards - Unipak
o : : 0
Qnty Meas. CS0451 Virgin Resin (May cqntaln no more than 30% repro, must accompany Corp
a verification letter from manufacturer)
Can Liners 30 x 37 in., 500/cs.Roll, 20 - 30 gal. size 0.51 mil.
500]cases low density color -black. (Sample Reguired) $8,785.00
Unit Item Code Specifications: 40 - 45 gallon can liners: Compliance, Standards - Unipak
o . : 0
Qnty Meas. CS0451 Virgin Resin (May cqr?tanj no more than 30% repro, must accompany Corp
a verification letter from manufacturer)
Can Liners 40 x 48 in., 200/cs.Roll, 40 - 45 gal. size 0.73 mil.
650]cases low density color -black. (Sample Required) $11,245.00
Total for Option 1 on Can Liner Products ] $20,030.00
Indicates: Lowest Responsible Bid Items Awarded
P indicates: Withdraw bid item(s) due to bid pricing or no bid
Indicates: Item(s) did not meet NO SUBSTITUTE requirement

Item(s) did not meet or was below bid specifications
Item(s) requested specifications not provided in bid packet
Item(s) did not meet existing dispensing conditions

There was a miscalculation on behalf of bidder
No samples were provided for proof and testing period
Bid disqualified due to late arrival
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