TABULATION FOR RFB 10-29-2018 CDO HIGH SCHOOL REPLACE LIBRARY CONDENSING UNITS AND DX COILS

Sunstate United Technologies
Midstate Energy | Pueblo Mechanical | Sun Mechanical Mechanical Tolin Mechanical Inc. DBA UNI-
ITEM DESCRIPTION LLC & Controls, LLC | Contracting, Inc. Services, L.L.C. Systems TECH

Base Bid 85,909.00 99,668.72 131,255.00 143,406.37 95,265.00 147,000.00
Performance Bond Cost 743.50 648.81 713.00 1,966.80 1,906.00 1,354.00
Payment Bond Cost 743.50 648.81 713.00 1,966.80 1,906.00 1,354.00

Net Bid Amount $87,396.00 $100,966.34 $132,681.00 $147,339.97 $99,077.00 $149,708.00
Tax 4,305.00 4,141.13 5,102.00 5,867.00 4,700.00 4,269.00

Total Bid Amount 91,701.00 105,107.47 137,783.00 153,206.97 103,777.00 153,977.00
Alternate Base Bid 136,077.00 166,600.75 138,257.00 No Bid 178,795.00 286,081.00
Alternate Performance Bond Cost 1,177.50 1,082.77 738.00 No Bid 3,576.00 2,677.00
Alternate Payment Bond Cost 1,177.50 1,082.78 738.00 No Bid 3,576.00 2,677.00
Alternate Net Bid Amount 138,432.00 168,766.30 139,733.00 No Bid 185,947.00 291,435.00
Alternate Tax 7,319.00 6,643.23 4,011.00 No Bid 9,955.00 11,380.00
Alternate Total Bid Amount 145,751.00 175,409.53 143,744.00 No Bid 195,902.00 302,815.00




