Bid #10-007 Addendum 1
Office Supplies

3/1/2010 8:00:00 AM Central
3/26/2010 2:00:00 PM Central

Batteries, AAA 8/PK0O

Line 1
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Pyramid School Products $1.84 RAYOVAC #ALAAA
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $2.03 RAY O VAC AL-AAA
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $5.46 EVEREADY# E92BP-8 (Order in multiples of 48)
School Specialty $9.15 Duracell As Specified School Specialty #1085347
Total Office Solution of West Texas $9.58
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) $5.89 EVEREADY AAA 8 PK
ENERGIZER BATTERIES, AAA, 8 PACK, ENERGIZER BATTERIES, AAA, 8 PACK, QTY-1
SUPPLIES NOW (Alt 1) $5.97 QTY-1 UOM=PK MFG#-EVEE92BP8 UOM=PK MFG#-EVEE92BP8
Batteries, AA 8/PK [
Line 2
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Pyramid School Products $1.84 RAYOVAC #ALAA
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $1.95 RAY O VAC AL-AA
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $5.46 EVEREADY# E91BP-8 (Order in multiples of 48)
School Specialty $9.04 Duracell As Specified School Specialty #1085342
Total Office Solution of West Texas $9.47
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) $5.89 EVEREADY AA 8 PK
ENERGIZER BATTERIES, AA, 8 PACK, ENERGIZER BATTERIES, AA, 8 PACK, QTY-1
SUPPLIES NOW (Alt 1) $5.97 QTY-1 UOM=PK MFG#-EVEE91BP8 UOM=PK MFG#-EVEE91BP8
Batteries, C 8/PK0O
Line 3
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $3.41 RAY O VAC AL-C
Pyramid School Products $3.60 RAYOVAC #ALC
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $9.89 EVEREADY# E93FP-8 (Order in multiples of 12)
School Specialty $15.59 Duracell As Specified School Specialty #1108076
Total Office Solution of West Texas $16.33 New Product Code MN14RT82
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid



ENERGIZER-Batteries, C, 8/Pack QTY-1 ENERGIZER-Batteries, C, 8/Pack QTY-1 UOM=PK

SUPPLIES NOW (Alt 1) $10.72 UOM=PK MFG#-93FP8 MFG#-93FP8
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) $11.39 EVEREADY C 8 PK

Batteries, D 8/PKO
Line 4
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Pyramid School Products $4.40 RAYOVAC #ALD
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $4.47 RAY O VAC AL-D
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $9.89 EVEREADY# E95FP-8 (Order in multiples of 12)
School Specialty $15.59 Duracell As Specified School Specialty #1108075
Total Office Solution of West Texas $16.33 New Product Code is MN13RT82
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid

ENERGIZER-Batteries, D, 8/Pack QTY-1 ENERGIZER-Batteries, D, 8/Pack QTY-1 UOM=PK
SUPPLIES NOW (Alt 1) $10.72 UOM=PK MFG#-EVEE95FP MFG#-EVEE95FP
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) $11.39 EVEREADY D 8 PK

Batteries, 9-Volt 4/PK[O
Line 5
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $3.49 RAY O VAC AL-9V
Pyramid School Products $3.60 RAYOVAC #AL9V
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $9.89 EVEREADY 522FP-4 (Order in multiples of 24)
School Specialty $15.43 Duracell As Specified School Specialty #1108079
Total Office Solution of West Texas $16.16
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid

ENERGIZER-Batteries, 9-Volt, 4/Pack QTY- ENERGIZER-Batteries, 9-Volt, 4/Pack QTY-1 UOM=PK
SUPPLIES NOW (Alt 1) $10.72 1 UOM=PK MFG#-EVE522FP8 MFG#-EVE522FP8
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) $11.39 EVEREADY 9VOLT 4 PK

Binder, 1" D-ring, non stick Vue, Whiteld

Binder, 1" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black(
Line 6
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

WILSON JONES# 27640 WHITE (Order in multiples of
12)dd

WILSON JONES# 27641 BLACK (Order in multiples of
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $1.73 12)



Baker Office Products $2.09
SAMSILL #16737(WHITE)O
Pyramid School Products $2.18 SAMSILL #13670(BLACK)
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $2.22
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-D-Ring Binder, 1lin Capacity
UOM=EACHO
O
ITEM NOTES: MFG ITEM#s SHOULD BE UNV20742-
WHITEDO
SUPPLIES NOW $2.37 UNV20741-BLACK
UNV20742 3.420
Total Office Solution of West Texas $3.42 UNV20741 3.42
SAMSILL 16437(WHITE)O
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $4.21 SAMSILL 16430(BLACK)
School Specialty No Bid
Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whitel
Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black[
Line 7
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
WILSON JONES# 27642 WHITE (Order in multiples of
12)dd
WILSON JONES# 27643 BLACK (Order in multiples of
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $2.06 12)
Baker Office Products $2.49
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $2.55
SAMSILL #16757(WHITE)O
Pyramid School Products $2.63 SAMSILL #16750(BLACK)
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-Ring Binder, 1-1/2in Capacity
SUPPLIES NOW $2.76 UOM=EACH
UNV20744 4.580
Total Office Solution of West Texas $4.58 UNV20743 3.58
SAMSILL 16457(WHITE)O
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $5.12 SAMSILL 16450(BLACK)
School Specialty No Bid



Binder, 2" D-ring, non stick Vue, White
Binderd
Binder, 2" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black
Binderd

Line 8
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
WILSON JONES# 27644 WHITE (Order in multiples of
6)0
WILSON JONES# 27645 BLACK (Order in multiples of
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $2.55 6)
SAMSILL #16767(WHITE)O
Pyramid School Products $2.86 SAMSILL #16760(BLACK)
Baker Office Products $2.87
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $2.98
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-D-Ring Binder, 2in Capacity
SUPPLIES NOW $3.20 UOM=EACH
UNV207460
Total Office Solution of West Texas $5.35 UNV20745
SAMSILL 16467(WHITE)O
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $6.11 SAMSILL 16460(BLACK)
School Specialty No Bid
Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue, Whiteld
Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black(
Line 9
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products $3.49
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $3.64
WILSON JONES# 27646 WHITE (Order in multiples of
6)0
WILSON JONES# 27647 BLACK (Order in multiples of
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $3.64 6)
SAMSILL #16787(WHITE)O
Pyramid School Products $3.94 SAMSILL #16780(BLACK)
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-D-Ring Binder, 3in Capacity
SUPPLIES NOW $3.95 UOM=EACH

Total Office Solution of West Texas

$6.12



SAMSILL 16487(WHITE)C

STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $8.27 SAMSILL 16480(BLACK)
School Specialty No Bid
Binder, 4" D-ring, non stick Vue, Whiteld
Binder, 4" d-ring, non stick Vue, Black[
Line 10
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products $4.39
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $4.50
WILSON JONES# 27648 WHITE (Order in multiples of
6)0
WILSON JONES# 27649 BLACK (Order in multiples of
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $4.82 6)
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-D-Ring Binder, 4in Capacity
SUPPLIES NOW $4.89 UOM=EACH
SAMSILL #16797(WHITE)O
Pyramid School Products $6.60 SAMSILL #16790(BLACK)
SAMSILL 16497(WHITE)O
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $11.31 SAMSILL 16490(BLACK)
UNV20994 11.860
Total Office Solution of West Texas $11.86 UNV20995 11.86
School Specialty No Bid
Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue, Whiteld
Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black(
Line 11
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products $10.85
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $10.93
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-D-Ring Binder, 5in Capacity
SUPPLIES NOW $12.06 UOM=EACH
UNV20997 13.450
Total Office Solution of West Texas $13.45 UNV20998 13.45
SAMSILL #16707(WHITE)O
Pyramid School Products $22.90 SAMSILL #16600(BLACK)



AFP INDUSTRIES, INC.
School Specialty

No Bid
No Bid

Line 12

Clips, 5/8" Binder, 12/bx[]

Name

School Specialty

STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO
Pyramid School Products

Baker Office Products

Total Office Solution of West Texas

SUPPLIES NOW

Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies
Teacher Store

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC.

Unit Price  Alternate Specification

$0.29
$0.36
$0.36
$0.49
$0.53

$0.57
$0.64
$1.94
No Bid

Note to Buyer
"School Smart" School Specialty #032400

GENERAL BC50
PYRAMID #1199660 ** 3/4" **
UNIVERSAL 10210

As Specified-UNIVERSAL-Medium Binder Clips, Steel
Wire, 5/8" Cap., 1-1/4" Wide, Black/Silver, Dozen.
UOM=DZ MFG#-10210

Line 13

Discs, CD-RW Re-writable Discs

Name
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO
Baker Office Products

SUPPLIES NOW

Total Office Solution of West Texas
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC.

School Specialty

Unit Price  Alternate Specification

$0.52
$7.29

$7.36
$9.51
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Note to Buyer
SAFE STORE CD-RW

As Specified-IMATION-CD-RW Discs, 700MB/80min, 4x,
w/Slim Jewel Cases, Silver, 10/Pack. UOM=PK MFG#-
IMN40955

Line 14

Eraser, Pink Pearl, large, 12/bx[

Name

STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO
Pyramid School Products

School Specialty

SUPPLIES NOW
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies

Unit Price  Alternate Specification

$3.52
$3.86
$4.28

$4.68
$4.69

Note to Buyer
PAPERMATE 70521

As Specified School Specialty #000828
As Specified-PAPER MATE-Pink Pearl Eraser, Large,
12/Box. UOM=BX MFG#-PAP70521



Baker Office Products

$4.75

Total Office Solution of West Texas $5.79
Teacher Store $7.86
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. No Bid
Eraser Caps for pencils, 12/pkgd
Line 15
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $0.11 EASY ERASE 7107-RD
As Specified-PAPER MATE-Arrowhead Eraser Caps,
144/Box. UOM=BX MFG#-PAP730150
O
Please Note: Price is per DZ but must order box of 144
SUPPLIES NOW $0.34 caps at a time. Box of 144 is $4.08
Total Office Solution of West Texas $0.75
Teacher Store $0.83
LEONARD #807990]
Pyramid School Products $0.89 * ARROWHEAD DISCONTINUED BY PAPERMATE **
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. No Bid
Baker Office Products No Bid
School Specialty No Bid
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
Eraser, Clic Eraser
Line 16
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty $0.87 As Specified School Specialty #
Baker Office Products $0.89
As Specified-PENTEL-Clic Eraser Pencil-Style Grip
SUPPLIES NOW $1.26 Eraser, Black. UOM=EA MFG#-PENZE22A
Total Office Solution of West Texas $1.48
Teacher Store $1.82
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. No Bid
File Folders, Letter, Manila, 2 ply, 1/3 cut,
100/bx0O
Line 17
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer




School Specialty $5.59 "School Smart" School Specialty #015741
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $6.48 OXFORD R752 1/3
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $6.53 OXFORD# R752-1/3
Baker Office Products $9.29 UNIVERSAL 16113
Pyramid School Products $9.60 OXFORD #R752-1/3
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $9.86 Stock Number UNV 16113
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-File Folders, 1/3 Cut Assorted,
Two-Ply Top Tab, Letter, Manila, 100/Box. UOM=BX
SUPPLIES NOW $10.58 MFG#-UNV16113
Total Office Solution of West Texas $15.44
Folder, Pocket w/fasteners, 25/bx, asst.
colors{d
Line 18
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARDS 125A0
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $3.54 ALT: AMPAD 36150 @ $3.77
School Specialty $4.85 "School Smart" School Specialty #084901
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $6.08 OXFORD# 57713
Pyramid School Products $6.90 FILE E-Z #80128AST
Total Office Solution of West Texas $7.06
As Specified-OXFORD-Twin Pocket Folder, Tang Clip,
Ltr, 1/2" Capacity, Assorted Colors, 25/Box. UOM=BX
SUPPLIES NOW $10.59 MFG#-ESS57713
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
Baker Office Products No Bid
Markers, Dry Erase, 4 color set, chisel,
EXPOO
Line 19
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $2.27 LIQUIMARK# 25040 (Order in multiples of 72)
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $2.36 SANFORD
Baker Office Products $2.91
Pyramid School Products $2.99
Sanford Expo Low Odor #80174 School Specialty
School Specialty $3.03 #175136
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $3.04




As Specified-SANFORD-Expo Dry Erase Markers, Chisel

SUPPLIES NOW $3.80 Tip, Assorted Colors, 4/Set. UOM=ST MFG#-SAN83074
Total Office Solution of West Texas $3.99
Teacher Store $6.01
Paper, Notebook Filler Paper, 10.5 x 8,
whiteld
Line 20
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products $1.43 MEAD 15200
ROSELLE# MMK09250 (pack of 150) (Order in
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $1.47 multiples of 24)
As Specified-MEAD-Notebook Filler Paper, 16Lb., Wide
Ruled, 10.5" x 8", White, 200 Sheets/Pack. UOM=PK
SUPPLIES NOW $1.62 MFG#-MEA15200
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $2.12 APC 900P
School Specialty $2.39 "School Smart" School Specialty #085283
Total Office Solution of West Texas $2.78
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
Pen, Highlighter, yellow, 12/bx[
Line 21
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $1.35 EMPHASIZER 814-YW
School Specialty $1.43 "School Smart" School Specialty #1298146
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $2.47 LIQUIMARK# 16128 (Order in multiples of 36)
Total Office Solution of West Texas $2.52
Baker Office Products $2.99 SANFORD 64326
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-Pocket Clip Highlighter, Chisel
Tip, Fluorescent Yellow Ink, 12/Pack. UOM=DZ MFG#-
SUPPLIES NOW $3.32 UNV08851
Teacher Store $5.56
Pyramid School Products $5.98 SANFORD "MAJOR ACCENT" #25005
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
Pen, Highlighter, 6 color setd
Line 22
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty $0.71 "School Smart" School Specialty #1298145



STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO

$0.74

EMPHASIZER 814-6

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $1.34 LIQUIMARK# 16006 (Order in multiples of 144)
Total Office Solution of West Texas $1.74
As Specified-AVERY-Fluorescent Highlighter, Chisel Tip,
Assorted Colors GN/OE/PK/PE, 2-YW, 6/Set. UOM=ST
SUPPLIES NOW $2.19 MFG#-AVE23565
Teacher Store $2.76
Pyramid School Products $2.99 SANFORD "MAJOR ACCENT" #25076
Baker Office Products No Bid
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
Pencil, #2 w/eraser, 12/bx0
Line 23
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
School Specialty $0.41 "School Smart" School Specialty #083276
LIQUIMARK 664210
ALT: MUSGRAVE PROSPECTOR Il @ $.430
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO $0.42 ALT: DIXON 14402 @ $.522
Baker Office Products $0.49 UNIVERSAL 55400
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $0.49 Stock Number UNV 55400
As Specified-UNIVERSAL-Economy Woodcase Pencil,
HB #2, Yellow Barrel, Dozen. UOM=DZ MFG#-
SUPPLIES NOW $0.52 UNV55400
Total Office Solution of West Texas $0.58
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. $0.67 LIQUIMARK# 66421 (Order in multiples of 120)
Pyramid School Products $0.69 DIXON #14402
Teacher Store $1.48
Power Strip, 4 ft., 6 output
Line 24
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products $4.14 KENSINGTON 50688
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies $9.89 Stock Number KMW 62130
Pyramid School Products $9.90 TRIPP-LITE #TLP606
School Specialty $11.25 "School Smart" School Specialty #1118396
Total Office Solution of West Texas $14.30
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. No Bid
BELKIN-Power Strip, 6 Outlet, 4Ft Cord. BELKIN-Power Strip, 6 Outlet, 4Ft Cord. QTY-1
SUPPLIES NOW (Alt 1) $6.29 QTY-1 UOM=EA MFG#-BE10600004 UOM=EA MFG#-BE10600004



Surge Protector, 10 ft., 6 output Clamp-

ond
Line 25
Name Unit Price  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

As Specified-BELKIN-Clamp On Surge Protector, 6

SUPPLIES NOW $27.85 Outlet, 10Ft Cord. UOM=EA MFG#-BE10600010
School Specialty $30.95 "School Smart" School Specialty #1308576
Total Office Solution of West Texas $32.41
Hester?s Office Furniture and Supplies No Bid
AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. No Bid

Baker Office Products No Bid



