
Project: 2019 PAVING WORK

Owner: PROSPECT HEIGHTS SCHOOL DISTRICT 23

Project No.: 18102

Bid Date/Time: on January 31, 2019 at 10:30 AM 

CONTRACTOR BID BOND ADDENDUM BASE BID
ALTERNATE A-1 (Southeast Sidewalk 

Replacement)

ALTERNATE A-2    (Patch and 

Sealcoat Pedestrian Walkway)
TOTAL

1 Allstar Asphalt
Y 1, 2 $168,700.00 $9,600.00 $1,000.00 $179,300.00

2 A Lamp Concrete
Y 1, 2 $179,809.00 $11,340.00 $1,500.00 $192,649.00

3 Schroeder Asphalt
Y 1, 2 $178,477.90 $13,768.00 $1,650.00 $193,895.90

4 Briggs Paving
Y 1, 2 $195,750.00 $9,835.00 $650.00 $206,235.00

5 Murphy Paving
Y 1, 2 $239,815.00 $9,600.00 $900.00 $250,315.00

6 Abbey Paving
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7 Accu-Paving
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 Arrow Road Construction
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9 Maneval Construction
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 Maul Asphalt
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

11 Orange Crush, LLC
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

12

13
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