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ek o b bt veride ey corrc o an e thatcan b ol oo wil provide ok for s nas | 40 Fom Offctse for TagteFeeanan s | ———
pricing. A PO sttached withthe spcial quote P, " provide s uotefor necded bais tobe attached to PO when placing o
veauired o enter order. © e order.
oA .| QURCATALG S ALEADY Markeo WA s 1-Wedohrgeasnie teeand bty e | adl s s e b o[l st dpendnt g s ey mey st e . - Weater manufactrersvarranty.
echnican. ach aition hou per ourly ate of $1800 per hour. hourly ate of $180.00 per hour. isbeng nsalled,and the cos o st
per tacsich Leigh. ey
N THE CUFF NoBid T-Percentage taken offin rovps o1 12 o Nobid Nobid NoBid o bid Nobid o Bid Nobid NoBid
550000 Tor 3 Tl Gay () & 53,00000 or3 | 5 o & 531 e oS0
ORIGO Education osid No Bid 1 e e e obid Nosid oid No Bid NoBid Nosid
oticon ne preng s setin olos o gid 1 Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid No 8id Nosid '
Pathveay 10% 1 3 57300 515000 520000 1 o 3 3 o 1
-1 you are ot enirely stsied with any of
PleasecontactChistopher Wil for our products, within one year, you may retrn
PearsontAZLeamI0E | scounting opportunies basd on specc Noid o o o 0 3 0 3 3 o al materisl st n saleabie condiion fora
purchase creditor repacement (allmateras i sets or
packages must be returned complete s sold).
FENNSTATE
vt ox 1 NoBid osid Nosid osid Noid osid Nogid No Bid oBid 1
T T G T G T T [TET] NoB NoB Wou T
200 of Nt Price Plus shipping WITH 1-Shipping Fees:50.00 10 $79.99 = $7.95580.00
PERPOLE, INC EXCEPTIONS. Peripole Exceptions are n Noid NoBid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid 10$199.99 = $10%52000010 849999 = Nosid Noid Nosid 1
Response Attachments. 9%5500.00 0 $999.99 = 8%0ver $1,000.00 7%
Feruna Giass e DB
1 We charge hourly rate for total of wht it wil sl » the
e~ Rosi perion b 0 sese0 s soacn e o et oo Roni Hosi vieain o el o, ovan e g
PIKES PEAK OF DALLAS VARIES. COLLD BE ON A WEEKLY
(PIKES PEAK OF TEXAS) | SPECIAL/PREBOOK; COULD BE BY THE CASE. ° Noeid Noeid Noeid NoBid $1500 $1500 ° ° NoBid

1=YES/0=NO/ No Bid = NOT APPLICABLE
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and are able to offe the best rates to our

Vendor DISCOUNT BY PERCENTAGE -Doyou offera | ocoun o vore 0o Vo oferavalume | ger ices, |0 - A . || INSTALLFEE - Do you charge an nstall fee? Truck HAUL AWAY
percentage off MSRP discount? g s repairs and/or maintenance calls? and/or maintenance cals performed on you chare Delivery fee? Delivery fee? Tailgate Delivery fee? fee? ‘warranty on any of your products?
tine? maintenance? clls prformed afterhours oron the
aholiday?
ead
W offer 2 5%-75% discount off of SR 1-We ofer oo e o | R 1 We do offer warranty based on manufacturer
product and e 53000 $12000 s2000 sour . warrany. We also
on auantty p on auentty o based on the sevices needet and scope of the projec. & » © oo the project. most of ur products.
piseo Eduction the discount. Our bid # 742760 must be o Nosid o Nosia Tosid Nosia Tosia vosid osia 1-Reference the document attached t the
referenced onall purchase orders o be response; deviations pge.
Machines, nc. (M, Nosid Nosid Noid
tne)
Preciion Concrete Nosid Noid 1 Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nogid Nosid
rint World % NoBid Nobid NoBid Nobd NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nobd NoBid
P Do arret osid 1-Call forquote NoBid NoBid Nosid Nosid NoBid oBid ogid No Bid Nosid Nosid
rocom, . 1-ouron 1 ProComputing Warrants s workmanship for
rocomputog x ot : 500 susco suso ” » i e . . osi
" cprode prcestprocomputing com domestcshping ates by thei speciic manufactrer
PR A T oBid No gid 1 Nosid NoBid Nosid Noid Nosid NoBid No Bid Nosid 1
Reding Advertsing o5 NoBid Nobid NoBid Nobid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nobid NoBid
. 10% Noid Nogid Nosid Nosid Nosid Noid 1 1 1 Nosid 1
Corporation
Varies by item, 0 25%,forDSISourceboo,
Style Plu, Augusta-Hollowsy Sprtswear, Pepco
Sports,and ather caologs Custom made dance
REYNOLDS UNIFoRws | P01 10 other atalogs, Custom made do Noid Nogid Nosid Nosid Nosid Noid Nosid 3 3 Nosid 1
reynaldsunforms.com websit ar aready
iscounted and have no additonsl discount.
Riddellwil offer 3 discount of 1 40% rom our 1 iddeloffers Recondiloning &
. ican | otalog prices on altems i aur 2019 el y
Fiddel (N American | ¢ootballAl sport catalog and on all tems on Nosid ApparelSenice. We willoffe dscount f 1 Nosid Nosid Nosid NoBid Nosid Nosid Nogid Nogid )
our webite at el com Please see
attached for more nfo attached tothe response for more info.
Romans Piza 0% F] Woua Nou Tow T T G G [TET]
- Turey sttt estin nd escher - Mproducs warandesre hnores Fomeo
aiing are temized and priced according to e workingrelatonship
1. Discount picng s indidually negotiated g e femied anapre technology companies providing exceptional
Romeo Music " etween product company and Romeo Muslc Notid Nosid Nosid Nosid profesional Romeo Muslc nstallaton team Nosid NoBid Noid Notid and expedient product support sevies,
vepresentativ to btain best possible school warranty contac,action and fllow-up; Romeo
along withtesting and teacher traiing. lso
prcing based on quantity ordere 15 it tesing and teacher e s willasistecucators and distitin
" g ® resoluton ofany warranty.reated product
instlaton.
ose Costumes NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBd o5 NoBd NoBid NoBid NoBid [TET) Nouid
SehoolTee Factory
(Custom Sportswear, NoBid 1 Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Noid o Noid Nogid Nogid Nosid
inc)
Sewuch Fu NoBia NoB G Now Wowa Nou T T T G Tow Nou
SO o gros retal pricng Tocted ot
1-Varies Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid '
rer;
1-Our discounts vary based on volume of
purchase. The first volume i from 3010 50
student books no discount), th second volume.
s from 6010 100 student books (frs discount),
and thethird book voume purchase s for
i Education 110+ student ook (lrgest discour). e also
e ox have combos that combine similr procucts for Noid Nosid Nogid Nosid Noid Nosid 3 3 Nosid Nosid
. discounts a every volume. We ofer products
for3-Bth grade STAAR preparation, and EOC
AAR preparaton. Please see
9/ fw srusecucationsolution,com/wp-
content/uploads/Siius_ Orderform paf for
volume and combo pricing.
Stec,inc DISCOUNT ON PARTS ONLY No Bid IS0 sefee o oTHERTAAN NoBid Nosid osid Nosid Nogid No Bid Nosid 112 MONTHS PART + LABOR
ispecrion]
smart group systems 1TV instalation - $295.00 each Desktop PC
(BeEesmART 0% 1-30% Volume Discount. 1+845.00 Per Hour/ er Technican / MINTWT | 2 00 per echrician / Minimum 2 Hours. | $45.00 Per Technician / Minimum 2 Hours. | $65.00 Per Technican/ Minimum 2 g N PR s NoBid Notid 1-We honer Manufacturer Worranty.
COMMUNICATION INe) Ceiling Mourt -$295.00
S o NoB Nobd Nobd Nobd Nowd NoBd Nowd NoBd NoBi Nobd T
Sy’ R Covering osid NoBid NoBid Nosid NoBid Nosid osid Nosid osid o Bid NoBid Nosid
Sonova USA Inc. offers Denton 1SD our 53, 0 Please refer o Pages 10 and 11 of our 1 Please refer o Pages 10 and 11 of our
Noid Education rice and Poiiy catalog atached to Nosid Noid Nosid Nosid Nosid Noid Nogid Nosid Education rice and Poliy catalog atached to
Policy catalo attached to RFP response. the response for detled sevie nformation. th response or dtailed warranty iformation.
Speech Comer (1C o
Spirit Monkey, LLC o 60 NoBid Nobid NoBid Nobid NoBid oBid NoBid oBid NoBid Nobid NoBid
Spors importsinc Nobid o bia Nosia Nobid Nosia o bid o big Nobid o big o bia Nosia Nosid
STAGE ACCENTS on NoBig NoBia NoBia NoBia NoBia o Big o sia NoBia NoBia NoBia
T w52 T 27
7 |, I an , . . o 15 yearmited manufactorer warranty on new|
FtWorth /Plano (The | New Boston & Essex piancs No discountson | 1 DP€Oued defberyfor multple pine . piibir a 530000 Cal for quote o mikosgs ° o 1-Callfor quote Stenway pianos, 10 yearimited manufactuer
ClvierGroup, Inc.) servies or accessories o hour/ o hours wartany on new Soston and Essex pancs.
Studica E7) NoBi Tow X Wow X o i o id NoB YT Now
STYROUTE CHATR LLC o 50 No Bid Nosid o 5id Nosid o 5id No5id o 5id o Bid NoBid T
SULLIVAN SUPPLY INC 3 3 o o o o o o o 3 o o
TS Spcille Dt 15% NoBid Nosid NoBid Nosid NoBid 1 55000 NoBid No Bid Nosid 1
Teachers Discovery il s o Nosid o Nosid Nosid o o o o 1
Terminix o bid NoBid Nobd S0 S350 7500 Nobid NoB Nobid NoBid Nobd o B
Toms /G s hatia TS T ey s Resporoe sas00 notia hotia hosia Notia hosia hotia notia ST Gt o
exoma Fire Equipment 10% 1 1 osid NoBid osid Nosid 54500 ogid No 8id Nosid 1
Drcount o Burmax ems oy See Fached
THE BURMAX 1-See warrany information attached tothe
e e | exceton e, Ltteris atached tohe > Noid Notid B
response)
Weare s promotional products and logowear |1 We are  promotiona productsand logowear
" Noid Nosid Nosid Nosid Noid Nosid Noid Nogid Nosid Nosid
the quant the quanti
The Learning Together
Pl 10% Noid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nogid Nosid Nosid
The Marachi s No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nosid Noid NoBid Noid No Bid NoBid NoBid
13 customer s notsatsfed with any
roduct, heor she must contactus within 45
oy of the purchase foran exchange, refund,or
TheMastrTocher | MO Eernce promocode OENTONSO. | st varis by procuc, e o o o o o o e msccount merchandi rt it smoun of
ior o placing order the purchaseprce. Ifthe retur s a reslt of
our ertor, contactus and we wil arrangereturn
shipping at nocost.
The Grginal oey 05 oo
The Playwell Group,Inc % s NoBid Nosid Nosid osid Nosid ogid o Bid
TKPRINTSHOP £ T T Nou Tou Now [T T T G Tou [TET]
Tommys RiTech auto 10% o parts oy o gid 59500 59500 59500 o 52500 o o o 1
student travel. Due o the volume o groups we
Tourificof Texas | book,we get discounted rates from our vendors Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid NoBid Nosid Nosid Noid Nosid

1=YES/0=NO/ No Bid = NOT APPLICABLE
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Vendor oscountavpescantace-vovouoters |40 IO, R S e - " pou a ate for service, repa || INSTALLFEE - Do you charge an nstal fee? Tk HAdLAAY
percentage off MSRP discount? g s repairs and/or maintenance calls? ind/or maintenance calls performed on you chare Delivery fee? Delivery fee? fee? ‘warranty on any of your products?
tine? maintenance? clls prformed afterhours oron the enance
ead W
1 Freigh charges areprepaid and added to the 17 the | 1o aldel d
inicic. Sigingchrgesar based onweigt | ™7 -
Trinity Ceramic Supply, and cstance, no total cost. Please vt our " "
e Nosid 1 Nosid Nosid NoBid Nosid Nosid ete o o e 1431 | Wb e, st orwelte | dtnce vt s, el o Nosid
0540or  shippingrate quote when calulting
purchs orders when calculti orders,
Triple-C Fence, LLC 002 002 ! o 59950 512500 $185.00 1-Pending styeoffence and footage 515000 osid No gid 1 a 1 v
Toxedo Conneet
(Tuxedo ComnectLLe) Gl ° °
Uriform Destinaton
10% Noid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Noid o 3 3 Nosid
of Texas)
Unipak Corp. 2 D““’“"‘ﬂ:“;:;f;?;“:gs" tiners} 7% NoBid No gid No gid No gid Nogid NoBid Nosid Nogid NoBid NoBid 1
Austin,Charles A.Dana ox 3 Nosid Nosid Noid Nosid Noid Nosid Noid Nogid NoBid Nosid
center
1 Delvery feesfo new generator/ransfe
1-Yes,fo procucts we distrbute. This would | 1-Yes, we can ofer st fe lyfor susso. switchpurchases can be ncucde nthe totl 1-We would oy charge csposal fees for
We can offer o cample, fyou aenerators and pricefor the equipment. For part orders, WPl generators/ransie switches we remove from
kDR | e or hrse youour ot 15%an |  uamed 0 prchas e gnerator, ot | e e, We wouneed the el | | SEE I perer Wecould sy fer o Chares e fes depcin o how iy Nosia Nosia Vourtocatons o o [1eve, s idelns
the pice of equipr suerh e cuerh e customer wants the parts delivered. WPI generators(uch asengines, generator ends,
market would be happy o provide picng. has accouns with UPS, ect etc). Typcal there would be no disposa ees
companies, Hotshot
Tesas (Wistron
Pt Nosid Noid 1 Nosid NoBid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nosid Nogid 1 Nosid
orporation]
1 Shouldyou discover any manufacturer’s
defect e to materas o workmanship Wood
. il repace theproduct under the
manactures warranty. No oher warranty or
e guaranty otherthan thatofthe manufacture of
dependent on manufacturer and items. 0% PN —
Wood bt co, | Di€ourt on WebSie Pricing. Curent On-Line Nosid Notid Nosid Notid Nosid Nosid : ! i Notid Manufactures warcanties are lsted o linked on
Pricng Reflectsdiscounts. Shiping cos il be finalinvoice finalinvoice. finalinvoice. factures warrntes e it p
prepeid nd added o inal invoie. Instalaton ourweb it on the manufactres pages fyou
isnotncluded inprce of ems. fave sy questons cr need helpwith 8
probiem, lease email mai@woodetcco.com. n
faimess o 3l ourvalued customers, Wood ELc.
uarantee does not cover damage caused by
misuse, abuse,or mistreatment of our products.
i 1 material re deivered using UPS, we wil
Woodard Builders | 30% OFF OF MANUFACTURERS CATALOG LsT Nosid Notid Nosid Notid Nosid Nosid Nosid chargethe rates indicated by UPS on their NoBid Notid - We waranky our products per the
PRicE manufactrers guidelnes.
websie atthe ime ofprocesingthe deivery
TS0 G055 SAVE S ST 00500
Youthight, Inc. ox SAVE 10% $1,000.00-52,499.99 SAVE 15% NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nogid NoBid Nosid
+DNQ - Unable to a
SELFOR Property p p p -
1 2019 | 1 ponse; 2019 | 1 2019 | 1 ponse; 2019 ponse; 2019
Foseraon lonion Noaid Noid BELFOR Rate Sheet.” BELFOR Rate Sheet.” BELFOR Rate Sheet.” BELFOR Rate Sheet.” BELFOR Rate Sheet” Nogid o No i B
Our discounted pricing rovided o the Texas
Region 20 5C Cooperative ineudes adiscount
which we canhonr for Denton T 5D 25 3 TX
uc|  Region 20 member Nosid
stye,but rangesfrom 5-25% per syl We also
provde iered volume dscounts for rewGuard
overshoes based on volume of pais purchased
Sun Const Resources, Nosid 150515000+ parts and time on location see 57500+ prts Work,please Work, Nosd on 1-price s dependent on Scope of Work,pease osia
nc. L olidays. it w suncoasresources com
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