AMPHITHEATER GOVERNING BOARD AGENDA ITEM
Fublie Sekweks AMPHITHEATER UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 10

DATE OF MEETING: June 6, 2017

TITLE: Award of Contract for Diesel Fuel Bio Diesel B-5 Blend and Unleaded Gasoline
Based Upon Responses to Request for Bid (RFB) 05-23-2017

BACKGROUND:

Request for Bid (RFB) 05-23-2017 was e-mailed to eleven vendors, published on the District’s website, and a
notice of the RFB was issued on the ProcureAZ website. Five vendors responded with responsive bids. The
results are below:

Mansfield Oil
Arizona Company of | Petroleum Supreme
Petroleum Gainesville Traders Pro Oil

Item Description Products Inc. Corporation | Petroleum | Company
B-5 Diesel Phoenix OPIS 1.6021 1.5889 1.5872 1.5872 1.5872
B-5 Diesel Tucson OPIS No Bid 1.8488 No Bid No Bid No Bid
B-5 Diesel Phoenix Differential +0.05 +0.0343 +0.0412 -0.0064 +0.0225
B-5 Diesel Tucson Differential No Bid -0.0383 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unleaded Phoenix OPIS 1.7787 1.7649 1.7787 1.7787 1.7787
Unleaded Tucson OPIS No Bid 1.8513 1.8607 1.8607 1.8607
Unleaded Phoenix Differential +0.04 +0.0534 +0.0334 +0.0025 +0.025
Unleaded Tucson Differential No Bid -0.0157 -0.0525 -0.0365 +0.025

RECOMMENDATION:

It is the recommendation of the Administration that the Governing Board award a contract to Pro Petroleum
based on their bid response to RFB 05-23-2017 for the B-5 Diesel Phoenix OPIS (Oil Price Information
Service) pricing and the Unleaded Phoenix OPIS pricing. This contract will begin on July 1, 2017 and expire
on 6/30/18 with the option to renew for four additional fiscal years.
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