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AGENDA ITEM
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B) X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200106 FOR JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD
DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE

LATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD
POLICY CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

(D) Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

Hasked fro Tecellence

MEMORANDUM

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Luis A. Vélez

From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director ) 2019.07.17 20:04:58
-05'00'

Date: Tuesday, July 16, 2019

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 200106 for

Janitorial Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that Sealed
Proposal Number 200106 for Janitorial Supplies be awarded in accordance with the
specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please contact me at
the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EaGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @  TeL (830) 773-5181 @  wWwW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

AN EquaL OrrorruntTy EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200106 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

Suf

1 JOO5|ANT KILLER NO BID

2 | J020|BELT, RUBBER B 15 NOBID | NOBID NOBID NO BID _ NOBID NOBID |

3 JO21|BELT, SAFETY 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 7.98 NO BID NO BID

4 1022 |BELT, SAFETY 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 7.98 NO BID NO BID

5 J023 |BELT, SAFETY 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7.98 NO BID NO BID

6 JO24 [BELT, SAFETY 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7.98 NO BID NO BID

7 J025|BLEACH, GERMICIDAL 3,800 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 2305

8 J039|BROOM, PLASTIC (ANGLE) 200 NO BID NO BID $ 4.99 $ 3.68 | $

9 J040|BROOM, STRAW 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 8.80 | S

10 | J055|BRUSH, COMMODE 130 NO BID NO BID S 2.18 S 1.80 | §

11 | J068|BRUSH, UTILITY (FOOD SERVICE 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S

12 | J070|BRUSH, PAVEMENT 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID §11.50** | S ;
13 | JO75[BRUSH,SCRUB 5 ~_NOBID NOBID | NOBID | ) | NOBID |$§ @ 478

14 | J078|BUCKET AND WRINGER 5 NO BID NO BID S 41,19 5 52.90 | § 115.92

15 | J080|CABINET, ROLL TOWEL 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ‘

16 | JOB5|CAN, GARBAGE(STEEL) 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID 5 :

17 | J086|CAN, GARBAGE (PLASTIC) 80 NO BID NO BID S 34.25| $2098** | 4524 | $ 19.80 | $ 31.94

18 | J095|CAN, GAS SAFETY 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 48.67

19 | J100|CART, JANITORIAL 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID 576.98** |[§ 30112 |§  86.00 S 135.91

20 | J110|CLEANER, CARPET 180 NO BID | S 3.69 NO BID $ S

21 | J116|CLEANER, CHALKBOARD 530 NO BID $ 4,75 NO BID $1.88 ** $

22 | J120|CLEANER, DISINFECTANT 400 NO BID $ 31.77 NO BID NO BID

23 | J121|CLEANER, DISINFENCTANT 150 NO BID $ 31.77 NO BID NO BID

24 | J123|CLEANER, DRAIN 100 NO BID $ 3.27 NO BID $

25 | J125|CLEANER, GENERAL PURPOSE 410 NOBID |S§ 8.39 NO BID S

26 | J130|CLEANER, GLASS 200 NO BID $ 6.66 NO BID S

27 | J135|CLEANER, HAND 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

28 | J140|CLEANER, BOWL 1 NO BID S 9,13 NO BID

29 | J145|CLEANER, FLOOR 560 NOBID |§S | S 7.11 NO BID S

30 | J150|{CLEANER, PORCELAIN AND 100 NO BID S 1.97| $ 2.51 NO BID

31 | J160|CLEANER, STAINLESS STEEL 300 NOBID NO BID 5 3.99| $210** |$

32 J165|CLEANER, OVEN & GRILL 170 NO BID S 395| S 249 S

33 | J170|CLEANSER, POWDER 150 NO BID a5 S 0.98( % 1.34| %

34 | J195(DEODORANT, BLOCK 120 NO BID NO BID S 10.20 $6.98 **

35 | J197|DEODORANT, CARPET 70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.89 ** $

36 | J200{DEODORANT, GRANULES 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID §2.04 **

37 | J201|DEODORANT, URINAL SCREEN 35 NO BID NO BID $ 924/ % 7.08| S

38 | J204|DEODORIZER, SPRAY 770 NO BID S 2.76[ 5 4.67| S52.24**

39 | J210|DETERGENT, LAUNDRY 5 NO BID $ 31.84( $ 47.75 NO BID

40 | J220|DISINFECTANT, SPRAY 460 NO BID NO BID $ 3.95| $1.90**

41 | 1222|DISINFECTANT, FOAMY 1,600 NO BID s 289 S 3.13| $1.74**

42 | J224|DISINFECTANT, TOTAL RELEASE 350 NO BID S 3.79 NO BID NO BID

43 | 1255|DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 65.96 **

44 | J260|DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.92 **

45 | J265|DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.38 **

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200106 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

ducts
DUSTMOP, FRAME/HANDLE S 1.00| $ 11.85 NO BID NO BID S 11.95| $9.91 **
HEAD, DUSTMOP ~ 500| NOBID NOBID |§ 946($ 398 NOBID | NOBID NO BID 86,28 **
HEAD, DUSTMOP 320 NO BID NO BID S 1445|5 5.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.14 **
HEAD, DUSTMOP 55 NO BID NO BID S 17.15| $ 7.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.59 ** NO BID
HEAD, DUSTMOP 55 NO BID NO BID 5y 28.57| $ 13.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.78 ** NO BID
HOSE, RUBBER (GARDEN) 30 NO BID NO BID S 27.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAMP, FLUORESCENT 1 NO BID NO BID S 59.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAMP, FLUORESCENT 30 NO BID NO BID S 63.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAMP, FLOOD 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAMP, INCADESCENT 1 NO BID NO BID e D NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAMP, INCADESCENT 1 NO BID NO BID s 18.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAMP, INCADESCENT 25 NO BID NOBID | - 16. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 | J395(LAMP, INCADESCENT - 5| NOBID _NOBID |5 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID ~ NOBID | NOBID
59 | J415[LUBRICANT, MULTIPURPOSE 40 NO BID NO BID s NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID :
60 | J420|LINER, CAN 3,000 | $ 8.90| 17.17| $ S 12.79 | § | NOBID S 14.30 NO BID $ 35,99
61 | J421[LINER, CAN 600 | § 13.80| $ 22.82| $ s 22.31} NO BID S 19.29 NO BID $ 74.99
62 | J424|LINER, CAN 750 | $ 18.80| $ 30.43[ $ S 26.34 | NO BID $ 2211 NO BID $ 38.42
63 | J425|MAT, FLOOR 1 NO BID NO BID S NO BID NO BID NO BID $§11.98** |3 35.24
64 | J430|MAT, FLOOR 40 NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.98** | S 67.14
65 | J435/MOP, BOWL 150 NO BID NO BID S $ 0.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.55 ** S 09785
66 | J440|MOP, HANDLE (WET) 100 NO BID NOBID |S $ 8.41 NO BID NO BID 5 875| $7.61** |$§ 18.47 | $
67 | Ja4a1|MOP, HANDLE (WOOD) 75 NO BID NOBID |S s 7.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.34** |$ 17.29 | §
68 | J445|MOP, HEAD (24 oz.) 560 NO BID NO BID $ 3.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.99** | S 9.19 | §
69 | J446|/MOP, HEAD (16 oz.) 530 NO BID NO BID 1B 2.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.03** | § 6.18 | $
70 | J460|PADS, CLEANING 50 NO BID NO BID S 031] 5% 0.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.18** | § 132§
71 | J470|PAD, POLISHING 5 NO BID NO BID 3 3.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 2.49| S 191 % 465 |85
72 | J472|PAD, POLISHING 175 NO BID NO BID S 5.60| $ 2.87 NO BID NO BID $ $2.21** | § 7.21 [§5EE
73 | J480|PAD, STRIPPING 50 NO BID NO BID 5 3.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID S $1.91** | § 525§
74 | 1482|PAD, STRIPPING 190 NO BID NO BID S 2.87 NO BID NOBID |$§ $221** | $ 11.20 | $
75 | J485|PAN, DUST 85 NO BID NO BID S 2.01 NO BID NO BID $6.39** | S 19.34 | §
76 | J495|PLUNGER, TOILET BOWL B 25 NO BID ~ NOBID |§ 371 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $299** NOBID | $
77 | 1500|POLISH, FURNITURE 135 NO BID NO BID S 2.39 NO BID NO BID $ 295 $2.18** | 459 | §
78 | J505|RAGS, CLEANING 600 NO BID NOBID |§ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 14.99| $ 24.49 | $
79 | J510|RAKE, GARDEN 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 11.20
80 | J515|RAKE, LAWN 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 14.99
81 | J520|REMOVER, GUM 60 NO BID NO BID S 3.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 465| $2.00** |§ 4,51
82 | J522|REMOVER, MILDEW STAIN 55 NO BID NO BID $ 4.90 NO BID NOBID |[S = 228|% 3.99 NO BID 3 6.71
83 | J525/REMOVER, VANDALISM MARK 20 NO BID NO BID s 5.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 469 $3.26** NO BID
84 | J550|{SHOVEL, FLAT HEAD 5 NO BID 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 J557|SIGN, CAUTION (WET FLOOR) 5 NO BID S S 7.00 NO BID NO BID S 6.57 54,59 ** S 11.70
86 | J558|SANITIZER, DISPENSER 1 NO BID = NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S
87 | J559|SANITIZER, REFILL 20 NO BID 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $
88 | J560|SANITIZER, HAND ANTISEPTIC 375 NO BID $ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 | 1562|SOAP, HAND 1,300 NO BID S NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
90 | 1565|SOAP, HAND 165 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider. TABULATION SHEET PAGE 2 OF 4
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200106 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

Item Estimated | Central Poly | Gulf Coast e  Safeway | .
' No. Quantity |  Corp. .Pfd:ief. .N.“'a"'s: A5 ~ Supply. sl gyicea 's-l.'pp_"
136 | M262|TRAY, SCHOOL LUNCH 2,700 NO BID S 26.50| $ 33.15 $ T4 NO BID NO BID S
137 | M426|GLOVES, RUBBER _ 20| NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID ;| noeD |S
138 | M427|GLOVES, RUBBER 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 55
139 | M428|GLOVES, RUBBER 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID - NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID it
140 | M429|GLOVES, DISPOSABLE 150 NO BID NO BID S 10.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID S
141 | M442|SANITARY NAPKINS 10 NO BID NO BID S 38.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 37.00 $27.98 ** s
142 | M446|RIBBON, TIME CLOCK 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Proposal Notes:

Prices are per unit cost
* Not bid as specified

** minimum order quantity/weight requirement on orders

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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