
                                             ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

                                 Bid #12-018

                     Classroom Technology Bid

                      Open 7/16/2012 2:00 PM

EPSON PROJECTOR

Name QTY Unit Price

Abacus Computers Inc.* 1 $388.22

CDWG 1 $394.00

Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 $398.59

OM Office Supply Inc 1 $400.00

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 $402.00

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 $403.65

ACP Direct 1 $407.00

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS 1 $413.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 $415.73

B&H Photo Vido 1 $416.00

Tech Depot 1 $422.02

GovConnection, Inc 1 $432.87

Technology for Education 1 $434.79

TipsBizSupplies 1 No Bid

Line 2 Projector Ceiling Mount

Name QTY Unit Price

CDWG* 1 $68.46

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 $69.00

OM Office Supply Inc 1 $72.00

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 $72.85

Tech Depot 1 $73.88

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 $74.00

B&H Photo Vido 1 $75.00

GovConnection, Inc 1 $75.31

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 $76.08

Technology for Education 1 $76.85

Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 $77.00

ACP Direct 1 $85.00

TipsBizSupplies 1 No Bid

Line 3 Document Camera

Name QTY Unit Price

CDWG* 1 $375.00

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 $408.00

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 $454.00

OM Office Supply Inc 1 $460.00

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 $463.65

ACP Direct 1 $475.00

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 $481.75

Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 $482.40

Tech Depot 1 $484.78

GovConnection, Inc 1 $506.99

Technology for Education 1 $507.98



HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS 1 $587.00

TipsBizSupplies 1 No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 No Bid

Line 4 Replacement Lamp for Infocus

Name QTY Unit Price

CDWG* 1 $146.50

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 $153.95

B&H Photo Vido 1 $154.00

OM Office Supply Inc 1 $155.00

GovConnection, Inc 1 $155.62

Abacus Computers Inc. 1 $156.66

Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 $157.21

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 $158.00

Tech Depot 1 $158.28

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 $158.66

Technology for Education 1 $159.25

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS 1 $169.00

ACP Direct 1 $214.00

TipsBizSupplies 1 No Bid

Line 5 Teacher Amplifier System

Name QTY Unit Price

Abacus Computers Inc.* 1 $828.00

Troxell Communications, Inc. 1 $961.06

OM Office Supply Inc 1 $1,120.00

HOWARD TECH SOLUTIONS 1 $1,275.00

Tech Depot 1 No Bid

TipsBizSupplies 1 No Bid

Technology for Education 1 No Bid

AUDIO VISUAL AIDS CORP 1 No Bid

B&H Photo Vido 1 No Bid

Checkpoint Services, Inc 1 No Bid

ACP Direct 1 No Bid

GovConnection, Inc 1 No Bid

CDWG 1 No Bid

Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. 1 No Bid

*Awarded Vendor


