Bid Request Number

Bid #10-34

Title School Store Supplies
Open Date 8/27/2010 8:00:01 AM Central
Close Date 9/10/2010 2:00:00 PM Central
Responding |Suppliers
Name City State Note to Buyer Response Submitted
Baker Office Products Lubbock TX 9/10/2010 8:32:00 AM Central
Buffalo Business Products assumes that
when UOM shows EA but specs indicate
12/bx or 6 color set, pk, etc, that UOM EA
equals bx, set, pk, etc.(
Please see notes on ltems #12 and
#13.0
Items #18 and #23 offer better bid price
with minimum order amount.d 9/10/2010 10:14:40 AM
Buffalo Business Products Fort Worth TX I Central
PHILADELPH
QUILL CORPORATION 1A PA 9/2/2010 8:28:34 AM Central
S & T Enterprises MIDLAND X 9/8/2010 4:01:08 PM Central
School Specialty Greenville Wi 9/8/2010 8:47:57 AM Central
MANUFACTURER MINIMUMS:O
APC: 800 PKGO
ACCO: $1000.000
DIXON: $500.0001
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO WHEELING |IL RAY O VAC: $525.00 9/10/2010 1:00:18 PM Central
Batteries, AAA 8/PKO
Line 1 DUR MN2400B8Z
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Migr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
per
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/8/pk $1.60 $1.60 ALT: RAY O VAC AL-AAA
DUR BIDMN2400B4z0
USAGE: 16000
per ***SOLD PER 4 PACK @ 1.80
QUILL CORPORATION 1/8/pk $3.60 $3.60 PACK ##*xxx
per
Buffalo Business Products 1/8/pk $9.60 $9.60
per
S & T Enterprises 1/8/pk No Bid
per
Baker Office Products (Alt 1)* 1/8/pk $5.90 $5.90 EVEREADY |E92BPS8 BATTERIES, AAA, 8PK




NOTE: BATTERY
ENERGIZER MAX AAA

per SSI # 0901650 12PK0O
School Specialty (Alt 1) 8/pk $8.75 $8.75 ENERGIZER |E92FP-12
Batteries, AA 8/PK O
Line 2 DUR MN1500B8Z
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
per
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 8/pk $1.53 $1.53 ALT RAY O VAC AL-AA
DUR BID MN1500B4z0
USAGE: 12000
per ***SOLD PER 4 PACK @ 1.80
QUILL CORPORATION 8/pk $3.60 $3.60 PACK  #¥¥xxk
per
Buffalo Business Products 8/pk $8.29 $8.29
per
S & T Enterprises 8/pk No Bid
SSI #0901660 NOTE: BATTERY
per 0 ENERGIZER MAX AA 4 PK[
School Specialty (Alt 1) 8/pk $3.24 $3.24 ENERGIZER |E91BP-4
per
Baker Office Products (Alt 1)* 8/pk $5.90 $5.90 EVEREADY |E91BP8 BATTERIES AA, 8PK
MN1400VR8 |Batteries, C 8/PKO
Line 3 DUR Z
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfqgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
per
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 8/pk $2.47 $2.47 RAY O VAC AL-C, 6\PK
per DUR BIDMN14RT8Z[
QUILL CORPORATION 8/pk $6.10 $6.10
per
Buffalo Business Products 8/pk $15.36 $15.36
per
S & T Enterprises 8/pk No Bid
BATTERY ENERGIZER MAX
per SSI #0901680 C 2 PACKO
School Specialty (Alt 1) 8/pk $3.24 $3.24 ENERGIZER |090168
per
Baker Office Products (Alt 1)* 8/pk $10.89 $10.89 EVEREADY |E93FP8 BATTERIES, C, 8PK
MN1300VR8 |Batteries, D 8/PKO
Line 4 DUR Z
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer




STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY

EA
per
8/pk

$3.37

$3.37

ALT RAY O VAC AL-D, 6\PK

QUILL CORPORATION

EA
per
8/pk

$6.10

$6.10

DUR BIDMN13RT8Z

Buffalo Business Products

per
8/pk

$15.51

$15.51

S & T Enterprises

EA
per
8/pk

No Bid

School Specialty (Alt 1)

EA
per
8/pk

$3.24

$3.24

ENERGIZER

E95BP-2

SSI #0901690

BATTERY ENERGIZER MAX
D 2 PACKO

Baker Office Products (Alt 1)*

EA
per
8/pk

$10.89

$10.89

EVEREADY

E95FP8

BATTERIES, D, 8PK

Line 5

DUR

MN16RT4Z

Batteries, 9-Volt 4/PKO

Name

oTY

UOM

Unit Price

Extended

Mfar

MfgNo

Alternate Specification

Note to Buyer

STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY

EA
per
4/pk

$4.93

$4.93

ALT RAY O VAC AL-9V, 6\PK

QUILL CORPORATION

EA
per
4/pk

$6.10

$6.10

DUR BIDMN16RT4Z

Buffalo Business Products

EA
per
4/pk

$15.51

$15.51

S & T Enterprises

EA
per
4/pk

No Bid

Baker Office Products (Alt 1)*

EA
per
4/pk

$10.89

$10.89

EVEREADY

522FP4

BATTERIES, 9V, 4PK

School Specialty (Alt 1)

EA
per
4/pk

$0.00

$0.00

ENERGIZER

522BP

SSI1#0901720

BATTERY ENERGIZER MAX
9VOLTO




Binder, 1" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whited
Binder, 1" D-ring, non stick Vue,

20742, BlackO
Line 6 UNV 20741
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
WHITE: QUILL BID7582130
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $1.51 $1.51 BLACK: QUILL BID758201
Baker Office Products* 1|EA $2.09 $2.09
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $3.14 $3.14
School Specialty 1/ EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whiteld
Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
20744,2074 |BlackO
Line 7 UNV 3
Name OTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
WHITE: QUILL BID7583130
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $2.15 $2.15 BLACK: QUILL BID758301
Baker Office Products* 1/EA $2.44 $2.44
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $4.19 $4.19
School Specialty 1|EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Binder, 2" D-ring, non stick Vue, White
Binder
Binder, 2" D-ring, non stick Vue, Black
20746,2074 |Binderd
Line 8 UNV 5
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $2.75 $2.75
Baker Office Products 1|EA $2.89 $2.89
WHITE: QUILL BID7584130
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $3.04 $3.04 BLACK: QUILL BID758401
School Specialty 1/EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue,
WhiteO
Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue,
20748,2074 |BlackO
Line 9 UNV 7
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer




Baker Office Products* 1|EA $3.47 $3.47
WHITE: QUILL BID7585130
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $3.94 $3.94 BLACK: QUILL BID758401
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $5.60 $5.60
School Specialty 1/EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1/ EA No Bid
Binder, 4" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whited
Binder, 4" d-ring, non stick Vue,
20994,2099 |BlackO
Line 10 UNV 5
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products* 1/EA $4.37 $4.37
WHITE: QUILL BID7585540
QUILL CORPORATION 1|EA $5.93 $5.93 BLACK: QUILL BID758551
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $10.78 $10.78
School Specialty 1/EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1|EA No Bid
Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whitel
Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
20997,2099 |BlackO
Line 11 UNV 8
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Migr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products* 1|EA $8.17 $8.17
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $12.32 $12.32
WHITE: CARDINAL
BID2635000
QUILL CORPORATION 1|EA $16.00 $16.00 BLACK: CARDINAL BID26351
School Specialty 1/ EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Clips, 5/8" Binder, 12/bxO
Line 12
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
QUILL BID7201000
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $0.12 $0.12 MINI: 5/8 X 1/4
SCHOOL SMART MED 1 1/4"
BLACK PACK OF 12. 5/8"
CAPACITY. SSI#0O
0324000
School Specialty* 1/EA $0.29 $0.29




STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/EA $0.38 $0.38
Baker Office Products 1|EA $0.49 $0.49 UNIVERSAL 10210
Item bid - UNV10210 - 12/box.
Price bid is for box, not ea.[]
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $0.57 $0.57
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Discs, CD-RW Re-writable Discs
Line 13 IMA 40955
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/EA $0.52 $0.52 SAFE STORE CD-RW
IMA40955 is a 10 pack.
ECISD UOM is EA. Buffalo's
bid price is based on each. 10
Buffalo Business Products 1EA $0.76 $0.76 pack bid price is $7.58/pk.
IMATION BID173320
USAGE: 250
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $3.36 $3.36 ****SOLD PER 10 PACK****
Baker Office Products* 1|EA $7.27 $7.27
School Specialty 1/EA $8.93 $8.93 DISC CD-RW 4X JWL 10/PK
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Eraser, Pink Pearl, large, 12/bx0
Line 14 Papermate 70521
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Migr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
PINK PEARL 705210
ALT: STANDARDS G100 @
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/BX $3.53 $3.53 $.684
QUILL CORPORATION 1/BX $4.02 $4.02 PAPERMATE BID70521Q
ERASER LARGE PINK
PEARL PACK OF 12. SSI
#0008280]
O
School Specialty* 1/BX $4.19 $4.19
Baker Office Products 1|BX $4.59 $4.59
Buffalo Business Products 1/BX $5.93 $5.93
S & T Enterprises 1/BX No Bid
Eraser, Clic Eraserd
Line 15 PEN ZE22
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products* 1|EA $0.88 $0.88
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $1.60 $1.60




ERASER CLIC GRIP BLUE.
SSI#1100708.0

O
School Specialty 1/EA $1.69 $1.69
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA No Bid
File Folders, Letter, Manila, 2 ply, 1/3
cut, 100/bx0
Line 16
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SCHOOL SMART LTR 1/3-
CUT TAB PACK OF 100. SSI
#015741.0
O
School Specialty 1|EA $5.48 $5.48
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $6.47 $6.47 QUILL BID750137
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/EA $6.49 $6.49 OXFORD R752 1/3
Baker Office Products* 1/EA $9.37 $9.37 UNIVERSAL 16113
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $11.90 $11.90 Item bid: UNV16113
S & T Enterprises 1|EA No Bid
Folder, Pocket w/fasteners, 25/bx,
asst. colorsOd
Line 17
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Migr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
PORTFOLIO SCHOOL
SMART 2PKT HVY DTY
W/FASTNRS ASST PK OF25.
SSI #0
084901.0
School Specialty* 1EA $4.75 $4.75
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/EA $4.86 $4.86
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $6.45 $6.45 QUILL BID7128AD
Baker Office Products 1|EA $7.68 $7.68 SPARCO 71440
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Markers, Dry Erase, 4 color set, chisel,
EXPOO
Line 18 Sanford 80074
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SANFORD EXPO 800740
ALT: WHITEBOARD WIZARD
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/EA $2.50 $2.50 WB80-4 @ $.984




QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $2.81 $2.81 EXPO BID80074Q
Baker Office Products* 1/EA $2.91 $2.91
MARKER DRY ERASE LOW
ODOR 4-CLR SET CHISEL
SET OF 4. SSI #175136.0
0
School Specialty 1|EA $2.94 $2.94
Order minimum of 375 sets
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $4.71 $4.71 and bid price is $2.95/ea.
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Paper, Notebook Filler Paper, 10.5 x 8,
whiteld
Line 19
Name OTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Baker Office Products* 1/EA $1.41 $1.41 MEAD 15200
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $1.53 $1.53
ROARING SPRINGS
BID200200
200 PACK/ WIDE RULEDO
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $2.02 $2.02 ****SOLD 200 PER PACK****
PAPER FILLER 8X10.5 16#
3/8 RULE -REAM. SSI
#085283.0]
O
School Specialty 1EA $2.34 $2.34
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/EA $2.52 $2.52 APC 130P, 10 PK\CS
S & T Enterprises 1/ EA No Bid
Pen, Highlighter, yellow, 12/bxO
Line 20
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1/EA $1.38 $1.38
HIGHLIGHTER SCHOOL
SMART YELLOW PACK OF
12. SSI#1298146.0
0
School Specialty* 1|EA $1.43 $1.43
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $2.65 $2.65 BIC BIDBL11YW
Baker Office Products 1/EA $2.69 $2.69 UNIVERSAL 08861
Item Bid: SAN250050]
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $5.28 $5.28
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid




Pen, Highlighter, 6 color setd

Line 21
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
HIGHLIGHTER SCHOOL
SMART ASST COLORS SET
OF 6. SSI #1298145.00
O
School Specialty* 1|EA $0.71 $0.71
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1EA $0.77 $0.77
BIC BIDBL11ADO
6 YELLOW, 2PINK, 1: BLUE,
ORANGE, GREEN, AND
QUILL CORPORATION 1|EA $2.65 $2.65 PURPLE
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $2.72 $2.72 Item Bid: SAN25076
S & T Enterprises 1|EA No Bid
Baker Office Products 1|EA No Bid
Pencil, #2 w/eraser, 12/bx0
Line 22
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
PENCIL #2 SCHOOL SMART
PACK OF 12. SSI #083276.00
O
School Specialty* 1/EA $0.41 $0.41
LIQUIMARK 664210
ALT: MUSGRAVE
PROSPECTOR Il @ $.4290
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1EA $0.42 $0.42 ALT: DIXON 14402 @ $.519
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $0.46 $0.46 Item Bid: UNV55400
Baker Office Products 1|EA $0.48 $0.48 UNIVERSAL 55400
QUILL CORPORATION 1|EA $0.55 $0.55 QUILL BIDT7112
S & T Enterprises 1/ EA No Bid
Power Strip, 4 ft., 6 outputO
Line 23 Kensington
Name QTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1EA $3.63 $3.63 ALT: ACCO 5068805
Baker Office Products* 1|EA $4.47 $4.47 KENSINGTON 50688
KENSINGTON KMW50688.
School Specialty 1/EA $6.86 $6.86 SSI #1079456.
Item Bid: FEL990000
Order 252 one order - bid
Buffalo Business Products 1|EA $7.55 $7.55 price is $4.46 ea.




QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $8.40 $8.40 TRIPP LITE BIDTLP604TEL
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid
Surge Protector, 10 ft., 6 output Clamp-
ond
Line 24 Belkin
Name OTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY| 1/EA $10.39 $10.39 ALT: ACCO 62668US
BELKIN BLKBZ10600010
SURGE PROTECTOR W/
CLAMP. SSI #1308576.01
g
School Specialty* 1|EA $30.31 $30.31
S & T Enterprises 1|EA No Bid
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA No Bid
Baker Office Products 1/EA No Bid
Laser Labels, 1 x 2 5/8" white, 30
Line 25 labels/sheet
Name QOTY |UOM Unit Price Extended |Migr MfgNo Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SCHOOL SMART LASER-INK
ADDRESS LABELS 1X2-5/8
3000 LABELS. SsSI
#084936.0]
a
School Specialty 1EA $4.48 $4.48
MACO ML30000
ALT: SHUR STICK 5160 @
$4.430
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY 1|EA $5.13 $5.13 ALT: AVERY 5160 @ $16.72
Baker Office Products* 1/EA $5.49 $5.49 UNIVERSAL 80102
Item Bid: MAC ML30000
Alternate Item: PAP30600
Bid Price: $6.90 - requires
ordering minimum of 175 bx
(PAP is Avery's economy
Buffalo Business Products 1/EA $14.61 $14.61 label)
QUILL CORPORATION 1/EA $20.21 $20.21 AVERY BID5160
S & T Enterprises 1/EA No Bid

*Awarded Vendor




