
Proposal Project: Natatorium Pool General Services, Maintenance & Chemicals
Proposal #: 0509-53
Proposal Date: September 13, 2005

Item Description Aqua-Rec Leslie's Wender
Poolmart Supply

Service/maintenance visit per specs: $125.00/visit no bid no bid
(see info)

Chemicals:
Pulsar Briquettes (per 100lb. container) $160.00 no bid no bid

(Arch Pulsar)

Sodium Bicarbonate (per 50lb. container) $26.00 $10.89 no bid
(Generic) (Leslie's)

HRR Enhancer (per 50lb. container) $120.00 no bid no bid
(US Filter)

Muriatic Acid (per 55 gallon drum) no bid $121.30 $150.00
(Brenntas) (Univar)

Muriatic Acid (per 1 gallon container) $3.00 $6.00 no bid
(TransChem) (Brenntas)

Soda Ash (per 50lb. container) $17.00 $12.41 no bid
(Generic) (Leslie's)

Clean & Perfect (per 20oz. spray bottle) no bid $3.69 no bid
(Nat. Chem)

Pool Perfect Enzyme (per 5 gallon container) no bid $102.19 no bid
(Nat. Chem)

Sea Kleer (per gallon container) $50.00 $19.99 no bid
(Vanston) (Leslie's Ultra Brite)
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Stainless Steel Cleaner (per 32oz. bottle) no bid no bid no bid

Taylor Reagent # 3 (per 2oz. bottle) $8.00 $3.52 no bid
(Taylor) (Taylor)

Taylor Reagent # 4 (per 2oz. bottle) $6.00 $2.51 no bid
(Taylor) (Taylor)

Taylor Reagent # 7 (per 2oz. bottle) $5.00 $2.33 no bid
(Taylor) (Taylor)

Taylor Reagent # 8 (per 2oz. bottle) $6.00 $2.34 no bid
(Taylor) (Taylor)

Taylor Reagent # 9 (per 2oz. bottle) $5.00 $2.19 no bid
(Taylor) (Taylor)

DPD Titrating Reagent (per 2oz. bottle) $12.00 $4.22 no bid
(Taylor) (Taylor)

FAS Powder (per 10 grams) $9.00 no bid no bid
(Taylor)

Additional Information:

Aqua-Rec:
service/maintenance visit does not include vacuuming & brushing
delivery fee: $25.00

Leslie's Poolmart:
will deliver 5-7 days after receipt of purchase order
ship time is based on order size and availability
Ultra Brite is being proposed instead of Sea Kleer (see MSDS for chemical composition)


