AGENDA ITEM 15

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop Regular Special

(A)

Recognition

Report Only

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B)

©

(D)

X Action Item ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPT. FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 231506 ON SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE
SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES

OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.
SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




2\ FAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DiIsTRICT

MEMORANDUM
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance

/ Luis A. Vélez
From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director _2(;);&96'30 151027
Date: Thursday, June 30, 2022
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 231506 for Speech

and Related Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal 231506 for Speech and Related Services be awarded in
accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per
the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® EacLE Pass, TExas 78852 @ TeL (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EqQuaL OprrorTUNITY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 231506 - SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
DESCRIPTION Crssmort ) (SR TR S Lot MisaleYl S LauraH. Interpreters MRDZSpeech | PresenceLearning,
(price per hour unless otherwise noted): ent, LLC Gonzalez Hernandez, PhD Unlimited, Inc. Services PLLC Inc. |
X _San Antonie, TX. ten, M1 Lot UY Tagle Pass, TX. Lagle Pase, TX. Lareds, TX __SanDiege,CA Fagle Pass, TX Newvort Ny |
1 |SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION NOT BID AS SPECIFIED* NOBID $ 80.00 | worswasseeanios NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 NO BID
2 |SPEECH THERAFY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED* NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $90.00 * NOT D AS SPECIFIED®
3 |SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NOT B0 AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 80.00 | wormoassranso NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | $ 75.00
4 |SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 80.00 | wormwassreanen: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | $ 75.00
5 |SPEECH ASSISTANT DIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 80.00 NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |SPEECH ASSISTANT INDIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID $ 80.00 | normoassrecinen NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |BILINGUAL SPEECH EVALUATION NOT DID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 80.00 | wormwassecaneo: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED"
8 |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)" NOT 0D AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPLCIFIED* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED*
9 |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPLCIFIED" NO BID $ 80.00 | wormwasseraneo” NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00
10 {BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 80.00 | orswassrecmiens NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 90.00
11 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 80.00 NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)" NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NOBID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECTFIED® NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED®
13 | OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID S 80.00 | wormoasserarn NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 75.00
14 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES KOT 81D AS SPECIFIED® NO BID S 80.00 | noremassrearen- NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00
15 | PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION | NOTED ASSPECIFIED® NO BID i s 80.00 | wormmasseeanto: 85.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 | PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® NOT 81D AS SPECIFIED* NO BID | $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 | PHYSICAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NOBID 1 $ 80.00 | woremassreaneo 85.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 |PHYSICAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID S 80.00 | worsmasseearnios 85.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (0&M) EVALUATION NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID S 80.00 NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (0&M) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECIFIED* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE DIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED* NO BID $ 82.00 | normmassearneor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE INDIRECT SERVICES NOT DID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 82.00 | wormmasseecinient NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 |LICENSED SPECIALIST IN SCHOOL PSYCHOLOGY (LSSP) PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID | $ 80.00 | woromasserario NO BID $ 55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 75.00
24 |FULL INDIVIDUAL EVALUATION (FIE) BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID s 850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED®
25 |FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID S 80.00 | worswasseecinien- NO BID $ 55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 |FUNCT AL (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 850.00 | $ 500.00 NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED®
27 |FIEWITH PSYCHOLOGICAL BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00 NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $ 850.00 | $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED®
28 |BILINGUAL EVALUATION BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* | vormoasseecmeor NO BID $80.00* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECITIED®
29 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF AUTISM (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NOBID $80.00 * NOT 81D AS SPECIFIED* NO BID $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED®
30 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF EMOTIONAL DISTURBANCE (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 850.00 | $ 850.00 NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED"
31 HOURLY) NOT BID AS SPECIFILD® NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID $ 600.00 | $ 850.00 NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED"
32 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF INTELLECTUAL DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID $80.00 * NOT BID AS SPECINIED* NO BID $ 800.00 | $ 850.00 NO BID NO BID NOT WID AS SPECIFIED*
33 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF A SPECIFIC Y (PRICE PER HOURLY)' NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00 * NOT B1D AS SPECITIED™ NO BID $ 650.00 | $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID NOT DID AS SPECIFIED®
34 |BOARD CERTIFIED BEHAVIOR ANALYST (BCBA) SERVICES normoasseecriien” | $ 150.00 | $§ 60.00 | woremassreaneo NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 |DIAGNOSTICIAN SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID S 80.00 | wormoasseecinso NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED"
36 |FIE BY DIAGNOSTICIAN (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00 * NOT 1D AS SPLCIFIED® NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED*
37 |CERTIFIED INTERPRETER FOR THE DEAF/HARD OF HEARING NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 56.00 NOT B1D AS SPECIFIED® NO BID NO BID NO BID 125.00 NO BID NO BID
38 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID s 80.00 | wormoasseeaneo: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY]* NOT 11D AS SPECIFIED® NO BID $80.00* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED DIRECT SERVICES NOT BID ASSPECIFIED* NO BID $ 80.00 | wormoassrcarnen NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED INDIRECT SERVICES NOT BID AS SPECIFIED* NO BID S 80.00 NOT BID AS SPECIFIED® NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 |15 THE VENDOR ABLE TO PROVIDE ON-SITE SERVICES ONLY, ONLINE SERVICES ONLY, OR BOTH?* BOTH "$80" ONLINE ONLY
43 |NUMBER OF STAFF AVAILABLE TO RESPOND TO REQUEST FOR IN-PERSON SERVICES IN THE EAGLE PASS. TIAREA™  PENDS ON SCHOOL YEAR™ 10-25
44 | APPROXIMATELY, WHAT PERCENTAGE OF SERVICES DO YOU PERFORM IN-PERSON VS ONLINE?* 90% IN PERSON 100% 20%-40% ONLINE 100% ONLINE
BID NOTES: u
PROPOSAL CALLS FOR EPISD SELECTING AT LEAST TWO (2) PROVIDERS PER SERVICE. THE REVIEW COMMITTEE RECOMMENDED THREE (3) PROVIDERS FOR SERVICE #29,30,31,and 34, o
*NOT BID AS SPECIFIED R & f-\
¢ VENDOR DID NOT PROVIDE PROOF OF GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE I Approdil: Mr. Samdel Mijares, Superintendent'of Schoold

*** VENDOR REPORTED INVOLVMENT IN LITIGATION IN THE PAST § YEARS

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED SERVICE PROVIDER(S)
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 231506 - SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
DESCRIPTION Michelle Roiz | Solfant Health, LLC Az,;:l:::& s"‘"‘ﬁi"m‘" m?;i:?l’l’"‘ T Hrh L ’l'x-s’anpe;c:;'
(price per hour unless otherwise noted): Consulting, LLC B LLC Corporation
Tagle Pase TX Peachrs o OpresTx | Odemargi | Adaa, A st ntonta, TX

1 |SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 85.00 | § 7250 | § 80.00 | § 85.00 | § 68.00
2 |SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® NO BID $80.00 * $ 45000 | $ 300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 [SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 80.00 | § 85.00 | $ 7250 | § 80.00 | $ 85.00 | § 68.00
4 |SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 70.00 | $§ 85.00 | $ 7250 | § 80.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 68.00
5 |SPEECH ASSISTANT DIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 70.00 | § 65.00 | § 6550 | § 62.00 NO BID $ 55,00
6 |SPEECH ASSISTANT INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 70.00 | $ 65.00 | § 65.50 | § 62.00 NO BID S 55.00
7 [BILINGUAL SPEECH EVALUATION NO BID $ 85.00 | $ 90.00  $ 75.00 | § 85.00 | § 85.00 | $ 73.00
8 [BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $85.00* $ 850.00 | $ 400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Q |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 85.00 | § 90.00 | § 75.00 | § 85.00 | § 85.00 | § 73.00
10 [BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 85.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 73.00
11 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION $ 75.00 § 82.00 | § 85.00 | $ 72.50 | § 68.00 | § 85.00 | § 75.00
12 {OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $75.00* $82.00* $85.00* $ 640.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 75.00 | § 82.00 | § 85.00 | $§ 7250 | § 68.00 | $ 85.00 | § 75.00
14 | OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 7500 | § 82.00 | § 85.00 | § 7250 | § 68.00 | § 85.00 | § 75.00
15 | PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION NO BID S 82.00 | § 85.00 | § 72.50 | $ 70.00 NO BID S 75.00
16 | PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT] EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® NO BID $82.00 * $ 550.00 | $ 640.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 | PHYSICAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NO BID S 82.00 | § 85.00 | § 7250 | § 70.00 NO BID s 75.00
18 | PHYSICAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 82.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 72.50 | $ 70.00 NO BID $ 75.00
19 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (O&M) EVALUATION NO BID $ 70.00 | § 125.00 | § 7250 | § 65.00 | NO BID $ 110.00
20 | ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (0&M) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $70.00 * NO BID $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
271 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE DIRECT SERVICES NO BID $ 70.00 | $ 125.00 | § 7250 | $ 65.00 NO BID $ 110.00
22 | ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID S 70.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 7250 |$ 6500 | NO BID $ 110.00
23 |LICENSED SPECIALIST IN SCHOOL PSYCHOLOGY (LSSP) PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES NO BID 77.00 | $ 85.00 | § 75.00 | $ 85.00 | § 130.00 | § 75.00
24 | FULL INDIVIDUAL EVALUATION (FIE) BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)" NO BID $77.00* $ 935.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 | FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT NO BID $ 77.00 | § 85.00 | § 75.00 | § 85.00 | § 130.00 | $ 80.00
26 | FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $77.00 * NO BID $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 |FIE WITH PSYCHOLOGICAL BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)" NO BID $77.00 * $ 935.00 | § 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 | BILINGUAL EVALUATION BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $77.00 % $ 1,350.00 | § 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF AUTISM (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $77.00* $ 935.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3() | FIE FOR SUSPICION OF EMOTIONAL DISTURBANCE (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $77.00* $ 935.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
31jm tow Fox HOURLY NO BID $77.00* $ 935.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF INTELLECTUAL DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® NO BID $77.00* DT BID AS SPECIFII $ 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 | FIE FOR SUSPICION OF A SPECIFIC LEARNING DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $70.00 * $ 935.00 | § 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 |BOARD CERTIFIED BEHAVIOR ANALYST (BCBA) SERVICES NO BID $ 70.00 | $ 125.00 | § 70.00 | § 85.00 NO BID $ 90.00
35 1CIAN SERVICES NO BID S 70.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 70.00 NO BID $ 65.00
36| FIE BY DIAGNOSTICIAN (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID $70.00* s 935.00 | $ 540.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 |CERTIFIED INTERPRETER FOR THE DEAF/HARD OF HEARING NO BID S 70.00 | § 65.00 | § 63.00 | § 65.00 NO BID $ 110.00
38| TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 NO BID $ 65.00 NO BID s 110.00
39 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NO BID DT BID AS SPECIFI NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED DIRECT SERVICES NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 NO BID $ 65.00 NO BID $ 110.00
41 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 NO BID $ 65.00 NO BID $ 110.00
42 1S THE VENDOR ABLE TO PROVIDE ON-SITE SERVICES ONLY, ONLINE SERVICES ONLY, OR BOTH?* ! BOTH BOTH BOTH BOTH BOTH ONLINE ONLY BOTH
43 STAFF AVAILASLE QUEST FOR IN-PERSON SERVICES IN THE EAGLE PASS, TX AREAT" 1 AS NEEDED 0 100+ s many as req 0 5-10
44 | APPROXIMATELY, WHAT PERCENTAGE OF SERVICES DO YOU PERFORM IN-PERSON VS ONLINE?" 90% IN PERSON 80% IN PERSON 95% IN PERSON 70/30 90vs 10 100% ONLINE 95% IN PERSON

BID NOTES:

PROPOSAL CALLS FOR EPISD SELECTING AT LEAST TWO (2) PROVIDERS PER SERVICE. THE REVIEW COMMITTEE RECOMMENDED THREE (3) PROVIDERS FOR SERVICE #29,30, 31, and 34,

* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED
** VENDOR DID NOT PROVIDE PROOF OF GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE
**¢ VENDOR REPORTED INVOLVMENT IN LITIGATION IN THE PAST S YEARS

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED SERVICE PROVIDER(S)

: Mr. Samuel MT]ures. Superintendent of Schools
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