Camera Bid

June 9, 2010 @ 1:00 p.m.

Bidder: IBT Video Precison American Liquid Alarm DJ Sweeney ITR Kwasigroch ADT Lighthouse Matrix McWilliams Acamard CDW
Systems Control Building Serv. Campus Detection Sys. Electrical Systems Electric Electric Systems Electric Technologies
2204 US Hwy 41 1980 University 953 Seton Ct. 3 Riverway 1111 Church Rd. 6813 Hobson 2737 Curtiss 10719 163rd 111 Windsor 828 N. Stone 1041 Byers 1401 Rodenburg 2385 Hammond 120 S. Riverside
Schedeville, IN Lyle Wheeling Houston, TX Aurora Woodridge Downers Grove Orland Park Oak Brook LaGrange Pk Miamisburg, OH Schaumburg Schaumburg Chicago
Forms: X X X X X X X
Bid Bond: X X Ck. # 40850982 Ck. #584241 X X X
Qualifications: X X X X Not included X Not included
BASE BID: No Bid S 83,430.00 | S 61,288.00 | $ 74,138.00 | S 106,744.00 No Bid No Bid S 78,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 41,529.00 No Bid S  56,664.00
Brooks & Julian
(24 cameras per Site, installed
& connected to existing cable)
ALTERNATE BID: $ 165,485.00 | S 173,077.00 | $ 118,000.00 No Bid $ 132,500.00 S 69,407.00 S 114,410.20
Brooks: 34 additional cameras
Julian: 33 additional cameras
(Includes cabling, connections,
& installation)
TOTAL.: $ 248,915.00 | $ 234,365.00 | $ 192,138.00 $ 211,250.00 $  110,936.00 $ 171,074.20




