AGENDA ITEM

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

(A)

(B)

©

(D)

Workshop Regular Special

Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE

Presenter(s): ROLANDO SALINAS, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR DISTRICT OPERATIONS
: MARIO GARCIA, FOOD SERVICE DIRECTOR

LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 251607 FOR NON-CARBONATED BEVERAGES AND THE
BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY
TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER

BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




A\ EAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DiISTRICT

MEMORANDUM
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
/ Luis Vélez
From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director 2024.08.14 17:03:24
-05'00'
Date: Tuesday, August 6, 2024
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number

251607 for Non-Carbonated Beverages

Based on the submitted proposals and recommendation from the Food Service
Director, the Department of Purchasing recommends that Sealed Proposal 251607
for Non-Carbonated Beverages be awarded in accordance with the specifications
and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® FEaGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @ Ter (830) 773-5181 @  wWwWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

An Equar OprrorTUNITY EMPLOYER
F-280



P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHoOL DISTRICT

HHarted fro Cecellence
MEMORANDUM
TO: Luis Velez, Purchasing Director
FROM: Mario E. Garcia, Food Service Directo
DATE: August 14, 2024
SUBJECT: NON-CARBONATED BEVERAGES BID RECOMMENDATION

This is to make the following product award recommendations based on the bids submitted
under proposal No. 251607 and cost/price analyses conducted.

e Bottled Water (80z) Awarded to Venados Distribution Srvs

e Bottled Water {16.90z) awarded to Venados Distribution Srvs
e Fruit Flavored Beverages (120z) to Venados Distribution Srvs
e Sports Drinks {Various Flavors) to Venados Distribution Srvs

Please feel free to contact me regarding this matter.

Thank You

APPROVED: M(ﬁ\- DATE: Y" { ¢"&(/

Rolando Salinas, Deputy Superintendent of District Operations

587 Madison Strcet ® EAGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @ TevL (830) 773-518] @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

An Equal OrrorTUNITY EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 251607 - NON-CARBONATED BEVERAGES
TABULATION SHEET

Description: VENADOS VENADOS VICCO SUPPLY LLC
DISTRIBUTION SRVS | DISTRIBUTION SRVS
EAGLE PASS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX
1 |Bottled Water (8 Fl. 0z)
Brand: NIAGARA NO BID 0ZARKA
Size (0z.): 80Z NO BID 80Z
Count per case: 24 NO BID 48
Total cost (per case): $ 429 NO BID 12.00
Unit Cost (per container): $ 0.1788 NO BID| $ 0.2500
Cost per Oz.: $ 0.0223 NOBID| $ 0.0313
2 |Bottled Water (16.9 Fl. 0z)
Brand: NIAGARA NO BID PURE LIFE
Size (0z.): 16.9 0Z NO BID 16.9 0Z
Count per case: 24 NO BID 40
Total cost (per case): $ 4.39 NO BID 10.00
Unit Cost (per container): $ 0.1829 NO BID| § 0.2500
Cost per 0z.: $ 0.0108 NOBID| $ 0.0148
3 |Lemonade
Brand: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Size (0z.): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Count per case: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total cost (per case): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Cost (per container): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cost per 0z.: NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 |Orange Juice
Brand: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Size (0z.): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Count per case: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total cost (per case): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Cost (per container): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cost per 0z.: NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |Apple Juice
Brand: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Size (0z.): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Count per case: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total cost (per case): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Cost (per container): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cost per 0z.: NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |Iced Tea
Brand: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Size (0z.): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Count per case: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total cost (per case): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Cost (per container): NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cost per 0z.: NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |Fruit-Flavored Beverages
Brand: TRUVIA OCEAN SPRAY NO BID
Size (0z.): 12 0Z 12 0Z NO BID
Count per case: 8 4 NO BID
Total cost (per case): $ 8.80| $ 5.96 NO BID
Unit Cost (per container): 1.1000 1.4900 NO BID
Cost per 0z.: 0.1375 0.1863 NO BID
8 |Sports Drinks (Various Flavors)
Brand: GATORADE ZERO NO BID NO BID
Size (0z.): 12 0Z NO BID NO BID
Count per case: 18 NO BID NO BID
Total cost (per case): 19.80 NO BID NO BID
Unit Cost (per container): 1.1000 NO BID NO BID
Cost per 0z.: 0.0917 NO BID NO BID

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED PRODUCT

PAGE 1 OF 1



		2024-08-14T17:03:24-0500
	Luis Vélez




