Dr. Jieun Pando

Ector County ISD Director of School Nutrition (432) 456-9741
1120 W 10th St Odessa, TX
Odessa, TX 79763
lieun.Pando@ectorcountyisd.org



IFB #24-07SN – Additional Food Items & Paper Goods

- **Purpose:** The School Nutrition Department is seeking to purchase additional food and paper items to continue the current menus preferred by students.
- **Background Info:** The School Nutrition Department continues to seek and procure the best-priced food and paper items.
- Estimated Cost: \$557,260.00
- Funding Source: Federal Funds 240
- Recommended Supplier/Service Provider: Epalett.com

National Food Group Empire Paper Company

Board Approval	Date



Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Epalett.com	2000	Cases	\$97.82	\$195,640.0	0 Branding Iron (Rochester Meats) item #813628 4/5# Bulk Ground Beef 85/15. Order minimum is 5 pallets (360 cs.), Lead time is approx. 20 days.		
Suena Vista Foods (Sterling BV	2000	Cases	No Bid				
Albie's Food Products, LLC	2000	Cases	No Bid				
Empire Paper Company	2000	Cases	No Bid				
(ALT1) Albie's Food Products, L	2000	Cases	\$147.20	\$294,400.0	D GROUND SEEF	Albie's Food P	rodi 27987
(ALT1) Churchfield trading COm	2000	Cases	\$148.67	\$297,340.0	D PACKED 4/3# BAG160 SERVINGS PER CASE MIN ORDER 240 CASES	ALBIE'S	27987

2	GROUND BEEF									
Supplier	Criteria 1	Criteria 2	Criteria 3	Criteria 4	Criteria 5	Criteria 6	Criteria 7	Criteria 8	Total	Additional Information
Epalett.com		60	5	5	5	5	5	5	10	100
Buena Vista Foods (Sterling BV Inc. dba Buena Vista Foods)		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Albie's Food Products, LLC		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Empire Paper Company		0	0	0	0	.0	0	0	0	0
[ALT1] Albie's Food Products, LLC	1	55								55
[ALT1] Churchfield trading COmpany		50								50

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated Unit Price	Extended Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
palett.com	1500	Cases	\$30.43	\$45,645.00 Barilla item #1000440041 2/10# Elbows. Order minimum is 7 pallets (280 cs.), Lead time is approx. 33 days.	SARRILLA	1000440041
uena Vista Foods (Sterling BV	11500	Cases	No Bid		BARRILLA	1000440041
Ibie's Food Products, LLC	1500	Cases	No Bid		BARRILLA	1000440041
mpire Paper Company	1500	Cases	No Bid		BARRILLA	1000440041
Churchfield trading COmpany	1300	Cases	No Bid		BARRILLA	1000440041

3	ELBOW MACA	ELBOW MACARONI PASTA										
Supplier	Criteria 1	Criteria 2	Criteria 3	Criteria 4	Criteria 5	Criteria 6	Criteria 7	Criteria 8	Total	Additional Information		
Epalett.com		60	5	5	5	5	5	5	10	100		
Buena Vista Foods (Sterling BV Inc. dba Buena Vista Food	5)	0	0	0	0	0	0	0.	0	0		
Albie's Food Products, LLC		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		
Empire Paper Company		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		
Churchfield trading COmpany		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		



Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated Unit Price	Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer Manufacturer #
National Food Group	3000	Cases	\$80.00	\$240,000.00	NATIONAL FOOD (NFG #1998
Fasty Brands	3000	Cases	\$89.49	\$268,470.00	NATIONAL FOOD (NFG #1996
Albie's Food Products, LLC	3000	Cases	No Bid		NATIONAL FOOD (NFG #1998
palett.com	3000	Cases	No Bid		NATIONAL FOOD (NFG #1998
Empire Paper Company	3000	Cases	No Bid		NATIONAL FOOD (NFG #1998
ALT1] Albie's Food Products, L	L 3000	Cases	\$46.37	\$139,110.00 CALZONE	Albie's Food Produ 813
ALT1) Churchfield trading COn	m 3000	Cases	\$47.29	\$141,870.00 48/502 PER CASE MIN ORDER 240 CASES SAMPLE SENT	ALBIE'S 813
[ALT1] Buena Vista Foods (Ster	1í 3000	Cases	\$87.20	\$261,600.00 WG Calzone Turkey Pepperoni and Cheese, Bulk, 80/3.5oz, 2.5 grain and 2 M/MA contribution	Buena Vista Food: 50711

4	CALZONE									
Supplier	Criteria 1	Criteria 2	Criteria 3	Criteria 4	Criteria 5	Criteria 6	Criteria 7	Criteria 8	Total	Additional Information
National Food Group		60	5	5	5	5	5	5	10	100
Tasty Brands		55	5	5	5	5	5	5	5	90
Albie's Food Products, LLC		0	0	0	.0	0	0	0	0	0
Epalett.com		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Empire Paper Company	m	0	0	.0	0	0	0	0	0	0
[ALT1] Albie's Food Products, LLC		50	5	5	5	5	5	5	5	85
[ALT1] Churchfield trading COmpany	U	45	5	5	5	5	5	5	5	80
[ALT1] Buena Vista Foods (Sterling BV Inc. dba Buena Vista Foods)		40	5	5	5	5	5	5	5	75

WRAP-RED CHECKERED							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Empire Paper Company	250000	EACH	\$0.1019	\$25,475.0		BAGCRAFT	300827 UPC#100721810082
Churchfield trading COmpany	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300827 UPC#1007218100827
Epalett.com	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300827 UPC#1007218100827
Buene Vista Foods (Sterling BV	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300827 UPC#1007218100827
Albie's Food Products, LLC	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300827 UPC#1007218100827

		FOIL WRAP-RE	D CHECKERED	v.5.5c-5111.0.5111					11140 5 7 7 1 1 1 1 1		
Supp	plier	Criteria 1	Criteria 2	Criteria 3	Criteria 4	Criteria 5	Criteria 6	Criteria 7	Criteria 8	Total	Additional Information
Empi	ire Paper Company		60	5	5	5	5	5	5	10	100
Chun	rchfield trading COmpany		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Epale	ett.com		0	0	0	.0	0	0	0	0	0.
Buen	na Vista Foods (Sterling BV Inc. dba Buena Vista Foods)		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Albie	e's Food Products, LLC		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0



6 FOIL WRAP-BLUE CHECKERED-NO AWARD

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Estimated Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Empire Paper Company	250000	EACH	\$0.1019	\$25,475.0	9	8AGCRAFT SAGCRAFT	300828 UPC#10072181008
Churchfield trading COmpany	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300828 UPC#10072181008
Epalett.com	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300828 UPC#10072181008
Buena Vista Foods (Sterling BV	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300828 UPC#10072181008
Albie's Food Products, LLC	250000	EACH	No Bid			BAGCRAFT	300828 UPC#10072181008

0.000	7	FOIL WRAP-YELL	FOIL WRAP-YELLOW CHECKERED								
Supplier	900	Criteria 1	Criteria 2	Criteria 3	Criteria 4	Criteria 5	Criteria 6	Criteria 7	Criteria 8	Total	Additonal Informatio
Empire Pape	r Company		60	5	5	5	5	5	5	10	100
Churchfield t	trading COmpany		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Epalett.com			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Buena Vista	Foods (Sterling BV Inc. dba Buena Vista Foods)		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Albie's Food	Products, LLC		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

IL WRAP-PLAIN	5000 1 00000	- Service Discovering	- 10-1-1-0W	300 = 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	or a supply of the
Supplier	QTY UOM	Estimated Unit Price	Extended Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Empire Paper Company	250000 EACH	\$0.1001	\$25,025.00	BAGCRAFT :	300809 UPC#100721810080
Churchfield trading COmpany	250000 EACH	No Bid		BAGCRAFT	300809 UPC#100721810080
Epalett.com	250000 EACH	No Bid		BAGCRAFT	300809 UPC#100721810080
Buena Vista Foods (Sterling BV	1250000 EACH	No Bid		BAGCRAFT :	300809 UPC#1007218100809
Albie's Food Products, LLC	250000 EACH	No Bid		BAGCRAFT	300809 UPC#1007218100809

8 Supplier	FOIL WRAP-PLAIN									
	Criteria 1	Criteria 2	Criteria 3	Criteria 4	Criteria 5	Criteria 6	Criteria 7	Criteria 8	Total	Additional Information
Empire Paper Company	60)	5	5	5	5	5	5	10	100
Churchfield trading COmpany)	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Epalett.com	()	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Buena Vista Foods (Sterling BV Inc. dba Buena Vista Foods)	();	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Albie's Food Products, LLC	- ()	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

