AGENDA ITEM
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X H ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPT. FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
(B) Action Item LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 250806 ON SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE
SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES

OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.
SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM

(D)




2\ FAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM
To: Mr. [smael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance

/ Luis A. Vélez
From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director _2(?52,3'(?6'27 IEaEs
Date: Thursday, June 27, 2024
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 250806 for Speech

and Related Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal 250806 for Speech and Related Services be awarded in
accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per
the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® EacLE Pass, TExas 78852 @ Ter (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EquaL OrrorTuNiTY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 250806 - SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
MARIAELENA MRDZ SPEECH
s prscurTION o BIRCH AGENCY ESPINOSA ST | ASHLEY GONZALEZ Liins it THERAPY SERVICES N e o | mtHeLLE RO
WLLIAMSTON, M1 TAGLE PASS, TX PARIS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX LAREDO, TX FAGLE PASS, TX MENA AR PEACHTREE CORNERS, GA EAGLE PASS, TX
1 |SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
2 |SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $102.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 270.00 NO BID $ 600.00 NO BID
3 |SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
4 [SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
5 [SPEECH ASSISTANT DIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID ASSPECIFIED | § 55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 68.00 NO BID
6 |SPEECH ASSISTANT INDIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED | $§ 45.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 68.00 NO BID
7 [BILINGUAL SPEECH EVALUATION $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 NO BID
8 |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $102.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
9 |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 NO BID
10 | BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 NO BID
11 [OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00 | § 80.00
12 | OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $102.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 562.50 $80.00 *
13 |0CCUPATIONAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00 | $ 80.00
14| OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00 | $ 80.00
15 | PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 90.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
16 |PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $102.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 600.00 NO BID
17 | PHYSICAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 90.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
18| PHYSICAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 90.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
19 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (0&M) EVALUATION $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | $ 75.00 NO BID
20 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (O&M) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $102.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 400.00 | $ 562.50 NO BID
21 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE DIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | § 75.00 NO BID
22 [ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE INDIRECT SERVICES $ 102.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | § 75.00 NO BID
23 |LICENSED SPECIALIST IN SCHOOL PSYCHOLOGY (LSSP) PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES $ 95.00 | $ 85.00 | NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 NO BID
24 |FULL INDIVIDUAL EVALUATION (FIE) BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * $ 700.00 | NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
25 | FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT $ 95.00 | § 85.00 | NOTBID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 NO BID
26 | FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 500.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
27 | FIEWITH PSYCHOLOGICAL BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * $ 1,500.00 | NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 2,500.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
28| BILINGUAL EVALUATION BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® $95.00 * $ 1,600.00 | NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
29 [FIE FOR SUSPICION OF AUTISM (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * $ 800.00 | NOTBID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,000.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
30 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF EMOTIONAL DISTURBANCE (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * $ 800.00 | NOTBID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,000.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
31 | FIE FOR SUSPICION OF OTHER HEALTH IMPAIRMENT (0111 FOR ADID) (PRICE FER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * $ 800.00 | notsip ASSPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,000.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
32 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF INTELLECTUAL DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * $ 700.00 | NOT BID ASSPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,200.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
33 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF A SPECIFIC LEARNING DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * $ 700.00 | NOTBID ASSPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
34| EVALUATION TO DETERMINE/RULE OUT SECOND/THIRD DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $250 EA ADDL DX NO BID NO BID $ 637.50 NO BID
35 | BOARD CERTIFIED BEHAVIOR ANALYST (BCBA) SERVICES $ 95.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
36| DIAGNOSTICIAN SERVICES $ 95.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 NO BID
37 |FIE BY DIAGNOSTICIAN (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 600.00 NO BID
38| CERTIFIED INTERPRETER FOR TIIE DEAF/IARD OF HEARING $ 70.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00 NO BID
39 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION $ 95.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | $ 75.00 NO BID
40 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* $95.00 * NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 600.00 | $ 562.50 NO BID
41 |TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED DIRECT SERVICES $ 95.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | $ 75.00 NO BID
42 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED INDIRECT SERVICES $ 95.00 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 90.00 | $ 75.00 NO BID
43|15 THE VENDOR ABLE TO PROVIDE ON SITE AND IN PERSON SERVICES? (Y/N) Y Y Y N Y
BID NOTES:
* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED
“* SUBMITTED DEVIATION INDICATING THEY CANNOT AGREE TO TERMINATION FOR CONVENIENCE AS INDICATED ON PROPOSAL. Approval: Mr. Samuel Mijares, Superintendent of Schools

++4+ SUBMITTED DEVIATION ASKING THAT LIMITATION OF LIABILITY LANGUAGE BE INCLUDED IN CONTRACT.
DUE TO EXPECTED WORKLOAD FOR NEXT SCHOOL YEAR, THE SELECTION COMMITTEE RECOMMENDS SELECTING 4 PROVIDERS FOR THE FOLLOWING SERVICES: 1,2, 3,5,7, 8,9, 28, 29, 30, 31.
DUE TO EXPECTED WORKLOAD FOR NEXT SCHOOL YEAR, THE SELECTION COMMITTEE RECOMMENDS SELECTING 3 PROVIDERS FOR THE FOLLOWING SERVICES: 13, 14, 23, 24,27,

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED SERVICE PROVIDER(S) PAGE 10F 2

N



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 250806 - SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
DESCRIPTION m:&%?&siig A::Eg::’éﬁi spztsi:i‘:gs OF s:ﬁ;'ﬁ'fg"nﬂ" so:g::;:l:'ms n::;:gl,{w msm:”\‘rcs.ouncz.
(price per hour unless otherwise noted): ! CONSULTING SAN ANTONIO, P.C. HEALTH PSYCHOLOGY.
ROUND ROCK, TX CYPRESS, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX. SAN ANTONIO, TX EAGLE PASS, TX OLDSMAR, fL PLYMOUTH MEETING, PA

1 |SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION $ 100.00 | worsinasspecipien | § 78.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 $400.00 *

2 |SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 300.00 | § 450.00 | $ 400.00
3 |SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 100.00 | NormibasspEciFiED | $ 78.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 82.66
4 |SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 100.00 | notmipasseeciFien | § 78.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 82.66
5 [SPEECH ASSISTANT DIRECT SERVICES $ 90.00 | noteipasspeciFiED | $ 64.00 NO BID NO BID $ 65.00 | § 67.12
6 |SPEECH ASSISTANT INDIRECT SERVICES $ 90.00 | worsiasseeciriep | $ 64.00 NO BID NO BID $ 65.00 | $ 67.12
7 |BILINGUAL SPEECH EVALUATION $ 115.00 | normipasseeciFiep | § 80.00 NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 $438.42 *

8 |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID s 450.00 | $ 438.42
Q |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 115.00 | norsipasseeciFien | § 80.00 NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 | § 88.75
10 | BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 115.00 | notmmpasseeciFiEd | § 80.00 NO BID NO BID $ 85.00 | $ 88.75
11 |[OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION $ 95.00 | normibasseeciFied | $ 75.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 $400.00*

12 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED $75.00 * NO BID NO BID $ 450.00 | $ 400.00
13 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 95.00 | norinasspECIFiED | § 75.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 81.65
14 |0CCUPATIONAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $ 95.00 | notmipasspeciFied | $ 75.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 81.65
15 | PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED | $ 75.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 $400.22*

16| PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED $75.00 * NO BID NO BID $ 450.00 | $ 400.22
17 |PHYSICAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES NO BID NOT BID ASSPECIFIED | § 75.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | § 87.55
18 |PHYSICAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID NOT BID ASSPECIFIED | $ 75.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 87.55
19 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (O&M) EVALUATION NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00 $564.18 *
20 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (O&M) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 500.00 | $ 564.18
21 [ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE DIRECT SERVICES NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00 | § 96.11
22 [ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75.00 | $ 96.11
23 |LICENSED SPECIALIST IN SCHOOL PSYCHOLOGY (LSSP) PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES $ 115.00 | norsipasseeciFien | $ 80.00 NO BID $ 70.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 90.12
24 |FULL INDIVIDUAL EVALUATION (FIE) BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,250.00 | $ 990.00
25 [FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT $ 115.00 | norsipasspeciFiED | § 80.00 | $ 125.00 NO BID $ 90.00 $805.12*

26| FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)" NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $80.00 * $ 900.00 | $ 805.12
27 |FIE WITH PSYCHOLOGICAL BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 850.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 910.40
28 |BILINGUAL EVALUATION BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 950.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,350.00
29 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF AUTISM (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 850.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,550.00
3() | FIE FOR SUSPICION OF EMOTIONAL DISTURBANCE (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 850.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,550.00
31 | FIE FOR SUSPICION OF OTIER HEALTH IMPAIRMENT (0111 FOR ADIID) (PRICE I'ER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 700.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,550.00
32 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF INTELLECTUAL DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 700.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,550.00
33 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF A SPECIFIC LEARNING DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 700.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,550.00
34 |EVALUATION TO DETERMINE/RULE OUT SECOND/TILIRD DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 1,275.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,550.00
35 | BOARD CERTIFIED BEHAVIOR ANALYST (BCBA) SERVICES $ 115.00 | NOTBID ASSPECIFIED NO BID $ 125.00 NO BID $ 85.00 | $ 105.14
36| DIAGNOSTICIAN SERVICES $ 115.00 | notmipasspecieiEn | § 80.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | § 75.84
37 [FIEBY DIAGNOSTICIAN (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 900.00 | $ 427.80
38 [CERTIFIED INTERPRETER FOR THE DEAF/HARD OF HEARING NO BID NOT BID ASSPECIFIED | $ 80.00 NO BID NO BID $ 65.00 | $ 72.48
39 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 $480.12 *
4() | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 900.00 | $ 480.12
41| TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED DIRECT SERVICES NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 96.11
42 | TEACHER OF THE VISUALLY IMPAIRED INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 80.00 | $ 96.11
43|15 THE VENDOR ABLE TO PROVIDE ON SITE AND IN PERSON SERVICES? (Y/N) Y Y Y

BID NOTES:

“ NOT BID AS SPECIFIED

** SUBMITTED DEVIATION INDICATING THEY CANNOT AGREE TO TERMINATION FOR CONVENIENCE AS INDICATED ON PROPOSAL.

¢4 SUBMITTED DEVIATION ASKING THAT LIMITATION OF LIABILITY LANGUAGE BE INCLUDED IN CONTRACT.
DUE TO EXPECTED WORKLOAD FOR NEXT SCHOOL YEAR, THE SELECTION COMMITTEE RECOMMENDS SELECTING 4 PROVIDERS FOR THE FOLLOWING SERVICES: 1,2,3,5,7,8,9,28, 29,30, 31.
DUE TO EXPECTED WORKLOAD FOR NEXT SCHOOL YEAR, THE SELECTION COMMITTEE RECOMMENDS SELECTING 3 PROVIDERS FOR THE FOLLOWING SERVICES: 13, 14, 23, 24,27,

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED SERVICE PROVIDER(S)

Approval: Mr. Samuel Mijares, Superintendent of Schools



