CENTENNIAL

SCHOOL DISTRICT 12

CONNECTING. ACHIEVING. PR

CENTENNIAL HS STADIUM SITEWORK IMPROVEMENTS

Bid Tabulation

Thursday, February 20, 2025 @ 11:00 am

nNexXus

SOLUTION S*

o ALT. #03: In
- ® Liew of Base
~N
a ALT. #02: ;
° ° ALT. #01: - Bid Turf Type;
E|E| B [s3 A Replace Field YPE/ [ yNIT PRICE:
] S o o X . . Installation of L Provide
Contractor c c 0 -] Single Contract Base Bid - - Lighting " Replace Notes
o ] = s o< Fiber / WiFi WS| _. Blended Slit- N
o - = 2= Fixtures WS - Nailer Boards
] S o | ® g- #03 #03 Film &
< < o Monofilament
o Type
WORKSCOPE #01: EARTHWORK / UTILITIES / FENCING / CONCRETE
Dimke Excavating X X X X $ 649,800.00 no bid no bid no bid X
Peterson Companies X X X X $ 788,620.00 | $ 2,500.00 no bid no bid X
Veit Companies X X X X $ 842,015.00 no bid no bid no bid X
Urban Companies X X X X $ 1,099,000.00 no bid no bid no bid X
Pember - Concrete - SHOULD HAVE BEEN SUBMITTED TO GC X X X X $ 25,700.00
'WORKSCOPE #02: ATHLETIC TURF
Astro Turf X X X X $ 476,646.00 no bid no bid $ (23,452.00) X
FiedTurf X X X X $ 488,852.00 no bid no bid $ 14,718.56 X
WORKSCOPE #03: ELECTRICAL
NAC x X x X $ 127,000.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 239,000.00 no bid x
Honda Electric X X X X $ 128,000.00 | $ 37,600.00 | $ 281,000.00 no bid X




