No.

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCcHOOL DISTRICT

FAIXE AGENDA ACTION ITEM

TOPIC: CONSIDERATION FOR APPROVAL OF AWARDING OF BIDS, PROPOSALS AND QUALIFICATIONS

SUBMITTED BY: MS. CORDELIA FLORES-JACKSON oF: PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
APPROVED FOR TRANSMITTAL TO SCHOOL BOARD: SEPTEMBER 19, 2007
RECOMMENDATIONS:

STAFF RECOMMENDS THE UISD BOARD OF TRUSTEES APPROVE THE FOLLOWING BIDS, PROPOSALS, &
QUALIFICATIONS AS PRESENTED:

BIDS/PROPOSALS/QUALIFICATIONS
DISTRICT WIDE:
RFP 048-2007 INCENTIVES

MAINTENANCE AND OPERATIONS:

CSP 026-2007 JOB ORDER CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDINGS, ADDITIONS, AND ALTERATIONS

RFP 019-2007 INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE EXTINGUISHERS AND ANSUL
SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

RFP 035-2007 ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS

RFP 053-2007 WINDOW REPLACEMENT & REPAIRS

TRANSPORTATION DEPT:
RFP 059-2007 BUS/VEHICLE REPAIRS & SERVICES

RENEWALS:
RFP 057-2005 LONG DISTANCE SERVICES

RATIONALE:

STAFF HAS COMPLIED WITH ALL APPLICABLE FEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL PURCHASING POLICIES AND
PROCEDURES IN OBTAINING PRICING INFORMATION FOR THE ITEMS LISTED ABOVE. STAFF IS
RECOMMENDING THE AWARDS BASED ON BEING THE BEST VALUE TO THE DISTRICT.

BUDGETARY INFORMATION:
THE BUDGET INCLUDES THE FUNDS FOR THESE PURCHASES

BOARD POLICY REFERENCE AND COMPLIANCE
CH LOCAL — Purchasing and Acquisition
Texas Education Code 44.031




BIDS/ PROPOSALS/ QUALIFICATIONS

DISTRICT WIDE
RFP 048-2007
INCENTIVES

CSP 026-2007

RFP 035-2007
ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS

RFP 053-2007
WINDOW REPLACEMENT & REPAIRS

|TRANSPORTATION DEPT
RFP 059-2007
BUS/VEHICLE REPAIRS & SERVICES

RENEWALS
RFP 057-2005
LONG DISTANCE SERVICES

MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT

SUMMARY OF RECOMMENDATION(S)

RECOMMENDED VENDORS

RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)
ADAMS PRINTING
A & E OFFICE PRODUCTS
BAUDVILLE INC
BIG BOB'S TROPHIES
CASA BETO
DIGITAL PLUS
ELAINE'S INVITATIONS & MORE
FUNDRAISERS INC
GARZA'S FLORAL & GIFT SHOP
IMAGESTUFF.COM
LA PELUQUITA/CASA GUERO
LITHO BUSINESS FORMS
MY BROTHERS KEEPER
NU TECH IMAGE
PROFORMA RGV
POSITIVE PROMOTIONS
SMART PROMOTIONAL
4 IMPRINT
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

RECOMMENDED CONTRACTOR (S)

JOB ORDER CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDINGS, ADDITIONS, AND KIVA BUILDING & DESIGN
ALTERATIONS LEYENDECKER CONSTRUCTION INC
PRADA CONSTRUCTION
PUMA BUILDERS CO.
ZERTUCHE CONSTRUCTION
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION
IrRFP 019-2007
INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE EXTINGUISHERS AND ANSUL RECOMMENDED VENDOR (S)
SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS SECTION |
A & C FIRE EQUIPMENT
SECTION .

AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEMS LLC (AFSCO)
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

RECOMMENDED VENDOR (S)
VULCAN SIGNS
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

RECOMMENDED VENDOR (S)
SAFETY GLASS CO. INC
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)

ANDY'S AUTO AIR & SUPPLY, INC.
RUSH TRUCK CENTER
GARCIA'S AUTO GLASS

SAFETY GLASS CO., INC.
RANKIN AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION
FLEETPRIDE
FREIGHTLINER

D RODRIGUEZ AUTO INSPECTION
LAREDO QUICK TRACK

SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

" RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)
CAPITAL TELECOMMUNICATIONS INC
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 19, 2007

RFP NO. 048-2007 INCENTIVES

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S) OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

APPROVED VENDORS

ADAMS PRINTING

A & E OFFICE PRODUCTS
BAUDVILLE INC

BIG BOB’S TROPHIES

CASA BETO

DIGITAL PLUS

ELAINE’S INVITATIONS & MORE SEE TABULATION
FUNDRAISERS INC

GARZA’S FLORAL & GIFT SHOP
IMAGESTUFF.COM

LA PELUQUITA/CASA GUERO
LITHO BUSINESS FORMS

MY BROTHERS KEEPER

NU TECH IMAGE

PROFORMA RGV

POSITIVE PROMOTIONS
SMART PROMOTIONAL

4 IMPRINT

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED SIXTY (60) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON JULY 1, 2007 AND
JULY 8,2007. NINETEEN (19) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON JULY 19, 2007 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 DISTRICT WIDE

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




Roberto J. Santos

Superintendent
TO: UISD Board of Trustees
FROM: Mr. Hector Cavazos — Purchasing Manager M
THRU: Mr. Mike Garza — Director of Support Services
DATE: September 4, 2007
RE: Recommendation of RFP 048-2007

Staff is recommending RFP 048-2007 “Incentives” for the 2007-2008 schoo! year to the lowest and best vendors
meeting specifications as follows:

Adams Printing A & E Office Products
Baudville Inc. Big Bob’s Trophies
Casa Beto Digital Plus

Elaine’s Invitations & More Fundraisers Inc.
Garza’s Floral & Gift Shop Imagestuff.com

La Peluquita/Casa Guero Litho Business Forms
My Brothers Keeper Nu Tech Image
Proforma RGV Positive Promotions
Smart Promotional 4 Imprint

The purpose for this contract is to provide suppliers of incentives for our campuses and departments. If you have any
questions, please do not hesitate to call me at 473-7921. Thank you.

Purchasing Department

Cordelia Flores, Director
3501 E. Saunders Rd. - Laredo, Texas 78041 - (956)473-7921 - Fax (956) 473-7950
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

MAILING LIST:

ABC CUSTOM ADVERTISING
1006 S 10TH STE 4
MCALLEN, TX 78501

PHONE: 956-631-3131

FAX: 956-631-3150

MART!I MILLER

“ ADAMS PRINTING
406 SURREY RD
LAREDO, TX 78045
PHONE: 956-724-5412
EAX: 956-717-9906
KELLY PEREZ
adams printing@vahoo.com

@LLEN EMBROIDERY

1603 CALLE DEL NORTE STE 106
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-726-1035

FAX: 956-726-9663

ALMA NARVAEZ

AMSTERDAM PRINTING
166 WALLINS CORNER RD
AMSTERDAM, NY 12010
PHONE: 800-833-6231

FAX: 518-843-7518

SCOTT DUESLER
sduesler@taylorcorp.com

ARAMARK EMBROIDERY
141 LONGWATER DR
NORWELL, MA 2061
PHONE:877-272-1144
FAX: 781-763-2834
LEWIS MCCONKEY

ARNOLDS ZONE

2201 MARKET

LAREDO, TX 78043
PHONE: 956-753-9663
FAX: 956-724-6846
ARNOLD CANTU
arnodszone@sbcgiobal.net

BAUDVILLE

5380 52ND ST

S.E. GRAND RAPID, MI 48512-9764
PHONE: 800-728-0888

FAX: 616-698-0554

INCENTIVES
RFP 048-2007

BIG BOB'S TROPHIES

109 KANSAS ST

LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-729-0233

FAX: 956-729-0233

MARISSA & ROBERTO BENDAVIDES
bigbopstrophies@sbcglobal.net

BIG PROMOTIONS

607 BROOKSIDE PASS
CEDAR PARK, TX 78613
PHONE: 512-249-9234
FAX: 512-250-2419
bigproimprints@cs.com

CARSON DELLOSA
PUBLISHING CO. INC
P.O. BOX 35665
GREENSBORO, NC 27425
PHONE: 800-321-0943
FAX: 800-535-2669

CASA BETO

303 SALINAS AVE

LAREDO, TX 78040

PHONE: 956-722-2522

FAX: 956-724-2827
FERNANDO MONTEMAYOR
casabeto@sbcglobal.net

CASA GUERO/LA PELUQUITA
1224 ZARAGOZA

LAREDOQ, TX 78040

PHONE: 956-722-0211

FAX: 956-722-3640

LANCE VILLARREAL
guero@grandecom.net

C SANDERS EMBLEMS INC
12965 ARROYO ST

SAN FERNANDO, CA 91340
PHONE: 800-336-7467

FAX: 818-361-8472

CRESTLINE

P.O. BOX 2027
LEWISTON, ME 04241
PHONE: 800-221-7797
FAX: 800-242-8290
info@crestline.com
www crestline.com




CONT. MAILING LIST

D & L ASSOCIATES
P.O. BOX 64784

ST PAUL, N 55164-0784
PHONE: 800-328-0307
FAX: 800-352-9501

DAYTIMER

ONE DAY TIMER PLAZA
ALLENTOWN, PA 19195-115
PHONE: 800-225-5005

FAX: 800-452-7392

DISCOUNT UNIFORMS

4501 MCPHERSON RD
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-791-5757

FAX: 956-791-5757

MR. TABRIZY

[}

DISCOUNT SCHOOL SUPPLY
P.O. BOX 60000

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94160-3847

PHONE: 800-637-2829
FAX: 800-879-3753

ELAINE'S INVITATIONS

120 BISCAYNE LOOP
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-568-0264
BONNIE MATA
elainesinvitations@stx.rr.com
elainesinvitations@msn.com

GMA STITCHES

5901 MCPHERSON RD STE 7A
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-725-8243

FAX: 956-725-7962
GUILLERMO VELA
gmavela@hotmail.com

FUNDRAISERS ETC

2643 MOSSROCK

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78230
PHONE: 210-223-2000

FAX: 210-223-8558

ANNA CAVAZOS GONZALES
anna@fundraisersete.com

FUSION EMBRIODERY
213 VILLAGE BLVD STE 7
LAREDO,TX 78045
PHONE: 956-727-5100
FAX: 956-727-9813

BERT KIELER
laredo@fusionemb.com

GA ADVERTISING
5804 GALE CT
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-727-3354
FAX: 956-727-3354
LORENA LOZANO

flozano1@stx.ir.com

IGUANA'S SCREEN & PRINTING
RR3 RT 26R

LAREDO, TX 78043

PHONE: 956-795-8724

IMAGESTUFF.COM
17021 SEVEN PINES DR
SPRING, TX 77379
PHONE: 877-773-7705
FAX: 877-563-3616
STACEY STAPLETON
stacey@imagestuff. com
www.imagestuff com

IMAGINE

6910 MCPHERSON
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-706-6105
FAX: 956-726-1331

INCENTIVES & MORE
802 E SAUNDERS STE A
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-791-9290
FAX: 956-791-9980

IT'S ELEMENTARY

P.O. BOX 1151

MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55440-1151
PHONE: 800-229-3258

FAX: 651-426-0275

www itselementarypins.com

JJ ENTERPRISES

1136 PASEO DE DARUBIO
LAREDO, TX 78046
PHONE: 956-319-4284
FAX: 956-729-1284

JIM LILES
i_liles@hotmail.com

KWIK KOPY

616 W CALTON RD #8
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-723-1367
FAX: 956-723-5870
REBECCA DE LEON

velar@stx.rr.com




CONT. MAILING LIST

LAREDO STITCH GALLERIA

9114 MCPHERSON RD STE 2516

LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-726-0803

FAX: 956-726-0556

MARIO OBREGON/MARGARITA OBREGON

LITHO BUSINESS FORMS

5904 WEST DRIVE #5

LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-727-7593

FAX: 956-727-8456

DIANA GOMEZ/ELIAS MENDIOLA
eliasmendiola@stx.rr.com

MARK A REQUENA

DBA SMART PROMOTIONAL
2065 QUITO LOOP

LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-645-9423
JOSEFINA REQUENA
smartpromo@sbcglobal.net

MORALES ENTERPRISES

HWY 358 RT 3 BOX 20 MMS

LAREDO, TX 78043

PHONE: 956-724-1109

FAX: 956-722-5406

IRMA MORALES
moralesenterprises@moralesmachineshop.com

NATIONWIDE ADVERTISING SPEC CO INC
2025 S COOPER

ARLINGTON, TX 76010

PHONE: 817-275-2678

FAX: 817-274-4301

JOHN NEWBERN
sales@nationwideadvenriising.net

NEFF MOTIVATION

645 PINE ST
GREENVILLE, OH 45331
PHONE: 800-232-6333
FAX: 800-544-9030
BETSY HESSON
bhesson@neffco.com

NEWBART PRODUCTIONS
10424 ROCKLEY RD
HOUSTON, TX 77099
PHONE: 800-777-2003
FAX: 281-561-0518

HEIDI WOOD

heidi wood@newbart.com

NU TECH IMAGE

201 W HILLSIDE STE 14
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-725-4100
FAX; 956-725-4418
LUCY QUINTANILLA
sales@nu-techimage.com

ORIENTAL TRADING

5455 S 90TH ST

OMAHA, NE 68127

PHONE: 800-526-7400

FAX: 800-869-2351

JODI GIPSON/TROY FLORANCE
tflorance@oriental.com

PAPER DIRECT

P.O. BOX 2970

COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80901-2970
PHONE: 800-272-7377

FAX: 800-443-2973

www . paperdirect.com

PICHARDOS LLC

5601 SAN BERNARDO STE 2A
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-717-2700

FAX: 956-717-2702

JOSE LUIS PICHARDO
pichardosmens@yahoo.com

POSITIVE PROMOTIONS

15 GILPIN AVE

HAUPPAUGE, NY 11788
PHONE: 877-258-1225

FAX: 877-258-1226

MICHAEL TAXEL
michaelt@positivepromoticns.com

PRINTEX EXPRESS

754 N ALAMO RD STE A
ALAMO, TX 78516
PHONE: 210-781-2029
FAX: 210-781-2096
printexexpress@aol.com

PRINTING SOLUTIONS
418 FALLOW LANE
LAREDO, TX 78045
PHONE: 956-286-9203
FAX: 956-753-3486
ALBERTO BALDERAS
balderas.a@sbcglobal net




CONT. MAILING LIST

PROFORMA

940 ANZALDUAS DR

SAN BENITO, TX 78586

PHONE: 888-399-4446

FAX: 956-399-4434

TRESA JACKSON/BOB JACKSON
tresa.jackson@proforma.com

PROMEGA SIGNS INC
1605 JACAMAN RD
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-723-2110
FAX: 956-723-2111

NORA FLORES
promegasigns@hotmail.com

QUALITY AWARDS & PRINTING
902 CALTON RD STE 203
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-523-0383

IVAN QUINTANILLA
printawards@msn.com

RAYMOND GEDDES & CO.
8901 YELLOW BRICK RD
BALTIMORE, MD 21237
PHONE: 888-431-1722

FAX: 800-533-3359
service@raymondgeddes.com
www, raymondgeddes.com

SEW LAREDO

920 VIDAURRI
LAREDO, TX 78040
PHONE: 956-236-1129
ADRIENNE GONZALEZ
aagonza¥20@yahoo.com

SCHOOL HOUSE RIBBONS
4417 MCPHERSON
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-724-7244

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

W6316 DESIGN DR
GREENVILLE, Wi 54942
PHONE: 888-388-3224

FAX: 800-675-1775

JIMMIE WILSON
aiverson@schoolspecialty.com

SIGN A RAMA

9114 MCPHERSON STE 2509
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-725-4495

FAX: 956-725-4445

OSCAR MARTINEZ
laredo@signarama.com

SIGNS PLUS

4242 MCINTOSH LANE
SARASOTA, FL 34232
PHONE: 800-848-4262
FAX: 941-378-4062
info@signsplussigns.com
www_signsplussigns.com

SHINDIGZ

ONE PARTY PLACE

P.O. BOX 305

SOUTH WHITLEY, IN 46787-0305
PHONE: 800-314-8736
www.shindigz com

SOLO PLAYERAS

2904 E FROST

LAREDO, TX 78043
PHONE: 956-324-8862
FAX: 956-753-5855
ROGELIO BASURTO
soloplayeras@hotmail.com

SUCCESSFUL EVENTS
P.O. BOX 64784

ST PAUL, MN 55164-0784
PHONE: 800-896-9221
FAX: 800-352-9501
SUSAN KUBISUWSKI

TEX PLUS

3020 N. ARKANSAS
LAREDO, TX 78043
PHONE 956-724-4005
FAX: 956-726-0666
ROGELIO BASURTO
texplus@sbcglobai.net

VISUAL GRAPHIC A2
216 RIVERBANK DR.
LAREDO, TX 78045
PHONE: 956-237-0524
LUCIO SISO

lasisc@yahoo.com

WALKER ADVERTISING INC
85 NE LOOP 410 STE 405
SAN ANTONIOQ, TX 78216
PHONE: 210-342-4960

FAX: 210-340-1059

JEFF WALKER
jeffwalker@walkerpromo.com

4IMPRINT

P.O. BOX 320

OSHKOSH, WI 54903-0320
PHONE: 877-446-7746
FAX: 800-355-5043




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 19, 2007

CSP NO. 026-2007 JOB ORDER CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDING ADDITIONS ALTERATIONS AND
REHABILITATIONS

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

RECOMMENDED CONTRACTOR (S)
KIVA BUILDING & DESIGN
LEYENDECKER CONSTRUCTION INC
PRADA CONSTRUCTION

PUMA BUILDERS CO.

ZERTUCHE CONSTUCTION

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED FORTY EIGHT (48) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON MAY 20,
2007 AND MAY 27, 2007. SIX (6) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON JUNE 12, 2007 @ 10:30 AM. AT THE
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATION DEPARTMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

JUAN DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




Juan A. Davila
Maintenance and Operations Director

Memorandum
TO: Ms. Cordelia Jackson Flores, Director of Purchasing
FROM: Juan A. Davila, Director of Maintenance & Operations

DATE: September 4, 2007

SUBJECT:  CSP 026-2007 JOB ORDER CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDING
ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS, & REHABILITATIONS

After careful review of the bidders’ qualifications and reference information provided to me
by your staff, for CSP 026-2007, I recommend, for your consideration, based on ability to
perform or provide the needed services and materials to the district, in no particular order:

Kiva Building & Design
Leyendecker Construction Inc.
Prada Construction

Puma Builders Co.

Zertuche Construction

for the 2007-2008 fiscal year. Awarding of this bid does not constitute or guarantee that
work or contracts will be given to the vendor/s mentioned above. This simply means that, if
awarded, they may be called upon during the award period to provide services or materials
to the district.

All awarded vendors will be put in an approved contractor pool. Any projects issued to the
awarded vendors will be assigned on a rotation basis and may be reoccurring so long as the
vendors remain in good standing with the district.

Please insure that these vendors have met all procurement and bid requirements and that all
references have been checked. If any reference checks identify conflict with the district or its

policies in any way please notify me to discuss these issues.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

3501 E Saunders — Laredo, TX 78041 - (956)473-7934 - Fax (956)473-7951
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UNITED INDEPENDENT-SCHOOL DISTRICT
JOB ORDER CONTRACT FOR GENERAL BUILDING
ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS, AND REHABILITATIONS

MAILING LIST:

A.VASQUEZ CONSTRUCTION CO. INC

6227 W. COMMERCE ST.
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78237
PHONE: 210-436-2299
FAX: 210-436-2290
ARTURO VASQUEZ

AMERICAN CONTRACTING CORP.
4507 E. SAUNDERS #1

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956. 724.5453

FAX: 956. 717.9551

CELL: 956. 455.4849

LUPE ESCOBEDO
stang1523@yahoo.com

ADVANTAGE USA ROOFING
13350 REBECCA CREEK RD.
SPRING BRANCH, TEXAS 78070
PHONE: 830. 885.2951

FAX: 830. 885.2961

AET GARCIA ROOFING
116 S. MEADOW AVE.
PHONE: 956.723.5335
FAX: 956.723.5484

garcia-roofing@sbceglobal.net

ADMIRAL BUILDERS
7511 MCPHERSON RD.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956.722.2746
FAX: 956.722.6230

ALLISON HASSINGER
GOVERNMENTAL REPORTER
800.872.7878 X 2454
aghassinger@cdcnews.com

BANES GENERAL CONTRACTORS
6040 LUCKETT CT.

EL PASO, TX 79932

PHONE: 915.584.0404

FAX: 915.584.2432

CHARLEY HECKER

chkr@juno.com

BASIC INDUSTRIES, INC.
P.0.BOX 840
3998 . C HWY 290 EAST

DRIPPING SPRINGS, TEXAS 78620

PHONE: 512. 894.4669
FAX: 512. 894 4670
raiph.young@basic-ind.com

CSP 026-2007

CAVAZOS & ASSOCIATES ARCHITECTS
1505 CALLE DEL NORTE #200

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 724.8123 EXT. 11

FAX: 7248377

GUILLERMO J. CAVAZOS AIA
gcavazos{@biziaredo.rr.com
rnshade@biziaredo.rr.com

CB&1 CONSTRUCTION, INC.
ONE CB&I PLAZA

2103 RESEARCH FOREST DRIVE
THE WOODLANDS, TX 77380
PHONE: 18325131650

FAX: 18325131655

CG CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1808 COMMERCE #2
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 753.8689

FAX: 753.6097

DAVID J. CANTU
david@c.gconstruction-ing.com

C.F. JORDAN, LP

702 E. CALTON RD., STE. 202, RM. 102
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956. 7563.1515

FAX: 956. 753.1504

PAUL BAUER

DON KRUEGER CONSTRUCTION CO.
P.0.BOX 3613

VICTORIA, TEXAS 77903

PHONE: 361.573.5291

FAX: 361.573.0162

DON KRUEGER
kkrueger@donkruegerconstruction.com

DBR ENGINEERING CONSULTANTS, INC.
8700 TESORO DRIVE, STE 850
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217
PHONE: 713.914.0888

FAX: 713.914.0886

SHEA DUNN

sdunn@dbrinc.com

E GARZA CONSTRUCTION
1812 COMMERCE DR STE #1
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-727-8697




CONT. MAILING LIST

FAULKNER USA
1700 RIO GRANDE
AUSTIN, TX 78701
PHONE: 512.652.4000
FAX: 512.652.4001
info@faulknerusa.com

FRANK ARCHITECTS, INC.
920 SAN BERNARDO
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956.725.7418
FAX:956.122.8258

FRANK ROTNOFSKY

frankfai@biziaredo.rr.com

GERLOFF COMPANY, INC.
14955 BULVERDE RD.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78247
PHONE: 210. 490.2777

FAX: 210. 494.0610

tboales@gerloffinc.com

HUNT BUILDING COMPANY, LTD
P.O. BOX 12220

EL PASO, TEXAS 79913-0220
PHONE: 915.533.1122

FAX: 915.545 2631

CATHY

kathyb@huntbuilding.com

ICN CONSTRUCTION
2319 O KANE
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-723-4956

ICE CONTRACTORS, INC.
103 GROSS ROAD
MESQUITE, TEXAS 75149
PHONE: 972.288.8700
FAX: 972.288.8715
ice@icecontractors.com

KIVA BUILDING & DESIGN INC
1303 CALLE DEL NORTE
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-796-0218

LA MANSION CONSTURCTION INC
315 CALLE DEL NORTE

LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-722-8855

LAREDO DISCOUNT METALS
1708 O.W.K. RD.

LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: 956. 712.0039

FAX: 956. 728.1463

MARSHALL CONTRUCTION
1001 2ND ST

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX
PHONE: 361-883-4369

MODERN CONSTRUCTION
2120 BLAINE

LAREDO, TX 78040
PHONE: 956-724-9001

MITCHELL ENTERPRISES, LTD.
112 E. COTTAGE

SHERMAN, TEXAS 75090
PHONE: 903. 893.6593

FAX: 903. 868.0679
steve@mitchelige.com

MAHONE ROOFING CO.

P.O. BOX 790069

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78279
PHONE: 210. 494.3443

FAX: 210. 494.3477
mahoneroofingeco@aol.com

SAMUEL DEAN CO.

P.O. BOX 5400

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78201
PHONE: 210.734.4219

FAX: 210. 734.0422
tblack2011@aol.com

J.M. FLORES ROOFING & CONSTRUCTION, INC.
5003 MAHER

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956.728.1611

PEREZ ROOFING

604 CAMBRIDGE LOOP
LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
PHONE: 956. 726.4239
FAX: 956. 726.4239

LEYENDECKER CONSTRUCTION CO.
P.O. BOX 1827

LAREDO, TEXAS 78044-1827
PHONE: 956. 722.0531

FAX: 956.722.8215

GARY A. LEYENDECKER
leycon@netscorp.net
cortes@leycon.net

MARSHALL COMPANY GENERAL CONTRACTORS
PO. BOX 4995

CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78469

PHONE: 361.883.4369

FAX: 361.883.6265

DON BOYD

donboyd@marshallcompanyinc.com




CONT MAILING LIST

MW BUILDERS

1701 N. GENERAL BRUCE DR.
TEMPLE, TEXAS 76504-2474
PHONE: 254.778.4241

FAX: 254.778.9492

RHONDA NEBGEN
_nebgen@mmccorps.com
fkeeney@mmccorps.com

MODERN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
2000 BLAINE STREET
LAREDO, TEXAS 78044
PHONE: 956.724.9001

FAX: 956.722.3262
GERARDO GARCIA
carlosg@modern-laredo.com

O'CONNELL ROBERTSON & ASSOCIATES, INC.
811 BARTON SPRING RD. STE 900
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78704

PHONE: 512.478.7286

FAX: 512.478.7441

ANDREA EXTER

aexter@oratexas.com

PRADA CONSTRUCTION
600 PRADA MACHIN
LAREDO, TX 78046
PHONE: 956-722-4911
MR. PORTUGAL

leprada45@hotmail.com

PU-MA BUILDERS CO.

1505 CALLE DEL NORTE STE 410
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-724-4454

FAX: 956-723-0333

RHINO BUILDERS, LTD.
6414 MCPHERSON, STE. 8
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956. 724.4442
FAX: 956. 796.9977
MIGUEL A. GOMEZ
rhino@rhinobuilders.net

SEPULVEDA ASSOCIATES ARCHITECTS, INC.

1820 HOUSTON, ST.
LAREDOQO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956.725.1985
FAX: 956.725.2396
ROBERT SEPULVEDA
saainc@saarchitects.net

SHW GROUP, INC.

8200 N. MOPAC EXPWY. STE 280
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78759

PHONE: 512.795.0088

FAX: 512.795.0106

JO ANN TURNER

MR. OEHLER'S
troehler@shwgroup.com
imturner@shwgroup.com

THE BUILDERS EXHANGE OF TEXAS, INC.
4047 NACO PERRIN, STE 100

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217

PHONE: 210.564.6900

FAX: 210.564.6902

JONNETTA REDMOND

jonnetta@bxtx.com

THE TURNER CORP
2001 N. LAMAR STE 100
DALLAS, TEXAS 75202
PHONE: 214.721.8400
FAX: 214.721.8493

DAN PEARSE
Dpearse@tcco.com

TURNER HICKEY & ASSOCIATES
919 VICTORIA ST.

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: 956.722.8186

VISION CONSTUCTION COMPANY
6017 MCPHERSON STE. A
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956. 337.2375

PHONE: 956. 206.3979

FAX: 956. 723.8782
visonconstruction@birch.net

WHITESTONE CONSTRUCTION
9901 MCPHERSON RD
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-795-1202

ZACHRY CONSTRUCTION CO.
527 LOGWOOD

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78227
PHONE: 210.475.8000

FAX: 210.475.8060
marketingsales@zachry.com

ZERTUCHE CONSTRUCTION, LLC
107 CALLE DEL NORTE 1C
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956. 727.3112

FAX: 956. 727.0092
rz2@zertucheconstruction.com




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMER 19, 2007

RFP NO. 019-2007 INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE EXTINGUISHERS & ANSUL
SUPPESSION SYSTEMS

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

SECTIONI EST. TOTAL PER YEAR
A & C FIRE EQUIPMENT SEE TABULATION
SECTION IL

AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEMS, LLC (AFSCO)

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED TWENTY TWO (22) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON MAY 6, 2007
AND MAY 13, 2007. THREE (3) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON MAY 23, 2007 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATION DEPARTMENT
2007-2008 FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

ADALBERTO RAMIREZ, DIRECTOR OF FOOD SERVICE

JUAN DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER
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Juan A. Davila
Maintenance and Operations Director

Memorandum
TO: Ms. Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
FROM: Juan A. Davila, Director of Maintenance & Operations

DATE: August 6, 2007

SUBJECT: RFP 019-2007 INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE
EXTINGUISHER AND ANSUL FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

After careful review of bids submitted for RFP 019-2007 INSPECTION AND
MAINTENANCE OF FIRE EXTINGUISHER AND ANSUL FIRE SUPPRESSION
SYSTEMS. I recommend that Section I on the request for proposals be awarded to the
following company, for the 2007-2008 school year, to service our fire extinguisher needs:

A & C FIRE EQUIPMENT
This company has excellent references, highly qualified and experienced staff and

has met all requirements set forth in the bid specifications. In addition, we have worked with
this company in the past and they have successfully met all contractual agreements.

If you need further information, please let me know.

3501 E Saunders — = Laredo, TX 78041 - (956)473-7934 - Fax (956) 473-7951
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Adalberto Ramirez
Director of Food Service

MEMORANDUM

TO : Ms. Cordelia Flores
Director of Purchasing

FROM : Adalberto Ramirez
Director of Foo

SUBJECT : RFP NO. 019-20¢7
INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE
EXTINGUISHER AND ANSUL FIRE SUPPRESSION
SYSTEMS

DATE : September 5, 2007

We have reviewed the tabulation of RFP No. 019-2007 Inspection and Maintenance of
Fire Extinguisher and Ansul Fire Suppression Systems. Based on the tabulation sheet
provided by the Purchasing Department, we recommend that Section II on the Request
for Proposal be awarded to Automatic Fire Systems (AFSCO) as the lowest bidder

meeting specifications.

This proposal is for three years renewable annually. Next year will be the first year of the
proposal.

The justification for this purchase is that the City of Laredo requires that automatic fire
suppression systems be installed wherever there is the possibility of grease fires.

Purchases for these services are in the 2007-2008 budget.
If you have any questions, please contact us.

xc¢: Mr. Eduardo Zuiiiga, Assoc. Supt. For Student Support Services

5201 Bob Bullock Loop — Laredo, Texas - 78041 — (956) 473-6556— Fax (956) 473-6595




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE EXTINGUISHER AND ANSUL FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

RFP 019-2007
VENDORS ARGUS
P SECURITY SYSTEMS
INVENTORY REPORT N/C
SECTION .
10 LBS.
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $13.75 NO BID $14.33
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID $9.20
TOTAL COST $23.75 NO BID $25.88
5LBS.
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $8.75 NO BID $8.83
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID $9.20
TOTAL COST $18.75 NO BID $20.38
6 LB.
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $8.75 NO BID $9.95
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID $9.20
TOTAL COST $18.75 NO BID $21.50
"K" TYPE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS
AX-260
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $75.00 NO BID $66.75
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID $9.20
TOTAL COST $85.00 NO BID $78.30
25 LBS.
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $6.50 NO BID $8.45
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID $9.20
TOTAL COST $16.50 NO BID $20.00
17 LBS. HALON
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $125.00 NO BID N/A
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID N/A
TOTAL COST $135.00 NO BID $2.35
14 LBS. HALON
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $95.00 NO BID N/A
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID N/A
TOTAL COST $105.00 NO BID $2.35
5 LBS. HALON
INSPECTION COST $2.50 NO BID $2.35
RECHARGE COST $45.00 NO BID N/A
HYDROTEST COST $7.50 NO BID N/A
TOTAL COST $55.00 NO BID $2.35
SECTION Il
1. INSPECTION AND CERTIFICATION OF
SYSTEM TO INCLUDE A WRITTEN REPORT
FOR EACH SYSTEM SERVICE CALL PER
LOCATION FUSIBLE LINKS CHANGED GAS
VALVE AND OR MICROSWITCH TESTED $65.00 FOR REPORT/
FOR PROPER FUNCTION INSPECT KITCHEN $9.50 FUSIBLE LINK
FIRE EXTINGUISHER $65.00 $51.30 CHANGED
2. RECHARGE DRY CHEMICAL CYLINDER $80.00 $31.40 N/A IN 2008
3. RECHARGE 3 GALLON WET CYLINDER $100.00 $112.70 $185.00
4. HYDROSTATIC TESTING AS NEEDED $25.00 $23.60 $195.00
IF EXISTING HALON
EXTINGUISHERS ARE
1211 HALON THEY
CAN BE INSPECTED,
BUT {F NEED TO BE
RECHARGED THEY
SEE PROPOSAL |WILL NEED TO BE
FOR FURTHER |REPLACED TO
BREAKDOWN OF |HALOTRON (CLEAN
NOTES: CHARGES AGENT)




VENDORS:

AAA FIRE & SAFETY EQUIPMENT
1212 BASSE RD.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78212-1006
PHONE: 210.732.9754

aaafire@netzero.net

ABSOLUTE FIRE & SAFETY
5566 AYERS ROAD STE 71
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78415
PHONE: 361.853.4525

JOE CORTEZ

A & C FIRE EQUIPMENT

4822 NEPTUNE ST.

CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78405-3604
PHONE:361.887.1030
FAX:361.887.6103

JANET EDDIAS
customerservice@acfireequipment.com

AFSCO FIRE PROTECTION SALES & SERV.
P.O.BOX 1419

ARANSAS PASS, TX 78335

PHONE: 361.758-7333

FAX: 361-7568-7333

DALE RENSBERGER

ALL STATE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS
P.O. BOX 420314

LAREDO, TEXAS 78042

PHONE: 956.723.0332

ARGUS SECURITY

314 ASH AVE
MCALLEN, TX 78501
PHONE: 956.682.6344
FAX.956.686.2427
STACEY GONZALEZ
sgonzalez@argusinc.com

AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEMS
354 N. COMMERCIAL
ARANSAS PASS 78336
PHONE:800.248.1333
FAX:361.758.7333

CELL 361.319.2214

BAY FIRE & SAFETY EQUIPMENT
131 ALLEN DR.

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE:956.727.5542

FAX: 361.851.1886

MIKE WILZZYNSKI
rickbayfire@aol.com

BEXAR FIRE & SAFETY EQUIPMENT
4220 S. FLORES

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78214-1253
PHONE: 210.534.1411

FAX: 210.533.3438

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
INSPECTION AND MAINTENANCE OF FIRE EXTINGUISHER AND ANSUL
FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM
RFP NO. 019-2007

BORDER FIRE & SAFETY EQUIP.
131 ALLEN DR

LAREDOQ, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-791-1176
borderfiresafety@yahoo.com

FASTENAL COMPANY
5320 ST MARIA
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956.729.7975
FAX: 956.729.7998
MARTIN REYES
tlar@stores.fastenal.com

GUARD MASTER

3617 APOLLO RD.

CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78413-1906
PHONE: 361.854.1763

FAX: 361.854.3084

catka@aol.com

HORN FIRE & SAFETY

354 N. COMMERCIAL TX
CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78336
PHONE:361.758.3830

INDUSTRIAL FIRE & SAFETY CO.
7235 UP RIVER RD.

or P.O. BOX 4952 CC,TX 78469
CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78409-2817
PHONE: 361.854.1763

FAX: 361.854.3084

MUTUAL SPRINKLERS INC
12000 CROWNPOINT #175
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78233
PHONE: 210.946.5803

FAX: 210.946.5807
rod@safemutual.net

PENA’S FIRE EXTINGUISHER
P.O. BOX 440151

LAREDO, TEXAS 78044-0151
PHONE:956.791.1513

FAX: 956.791.1513

RAUL PENA

PROFIRE PROTECTION INC.
455 LANTANA

CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78408
PHONE: 361.299.5100
FAX:361.299.5400

profire01@acl.com

SIEMENS BUILDING TECHNOLOGIES
12001 NETWORK BLVD #318

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78249

PHONE: 210.663.5559

FAX: 210.641.2922

GEORGE FERNANDEZ

george.ifernandez@siemens.com




CONT. MAILING LIST RFP 019-2007

SIMPLEX/GRINNEL

1070 UNION CIRCLE SUITE 102
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216
PHONE: 210.402.6311
FAX:210.402.6195

SONIA HUERTA

shuerta@tycoini.com
jzambrano@tycoint.com

U.S. FIRE & SAFETY EQUIPMENT
7860 MAINLAND

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78250
PHONE:210.680.8811
FAX:210.680.8897

LESLIE or BRUCE

storyi@gintas.com

VOLUNTEER SECURITY INC
6202 MCPHERSON #10
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-712-3331

WEST TEXAS WAREHOUSE
1258 FLECHA LANE
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-753-0722

FAX: 956-753-0744

LETTY CAMPBELL
westiexaswhse@yahoo.com




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 19, 2007

RFP 035-2007 ARCHITECHTURAL SIGNS

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

VENDOR AMOUNT

VULCAN SIGNS SEE TABULATION

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED TWENTY (20) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON MAY 20, 2007
AND MAY 27,2007. SIX (6) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON JUNE 13, 2007 @ 2:00 P.M. AT THE UISD
SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 FACILITIES & OPERATIONS

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

JUAN A. DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




Juan A. Davila
Maintenance and Operations Director

Memorandum
TO: Ms. Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
FROM: Juan A. Davila, Director of Maintenance & Operations

DATE: August 6, 2007

SUBJECT: RFP 035-2007 ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS

After careful review of bids submitted for RFP 035-2007 ARCHITECTURAL
SIGNS. I recommend that Section I (Indicative Aluminum Signs) on the request for
proposals be awarded to the following company, for the 2007-2008 school year, to service
our signage needs:

VULCAN SIGNS
This company has excellent references, highly qualified and experienced staff and

has met all requirements set forth in the bid specifications. In addition, we have worked with
this company in the past and they have successfully met all contractual agreements.

If you need further information, please let me know.

3501 E Saunders - Laredo, TX 78041 - (956)473-7934 - Fax(956)473-7951
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

ARCHTECTURAL SIGNS
RFP 035-2007

MAILING LIST:

CORPUS CHRISTI STAMP WORKS
109 N CHAPARRAL ST

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78401
PHONE: 361-884-4801

FAX: 361-884-1038

MICHELLE MIRABAL

michelle. mirabal@ccstampworks.com

C & S SAFETY SUPPLY
820 E. WHITEWING

P.O. BOX 4527
MCALLEN, TEXAS 78501
PHONE: (956) 687-4852
FAX: (956) 682-6096

HALL SIGNS, INC.

P.O. BOX 515
BLOOMINGTON, IN 47402
PHONE: 1-800-284-7446
FAX: 1-888-329-7446
BRITTANY WALTERS

bids@hallsigns.com

HAMILTON JEWERLY & TROPHY HOUSE
1320 GARDEN

LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: (956) 724-9990

INNERFACE ARCHITECTURAL SIGNAGE INC
ATLANTA, GA

PHONE: 800-445-4796

GENDAY CANNON/CHIP FLOYD
clloyd@innerfacesiqn.com

JJJ INTERNATIONAL IMPORTS, INC.
5411 MCPHERSON RD., STE. 301
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: (956) 744-2877

FAX: (956) 795-0559

JUAN SANCHEZ

j safety@myway.com

KONCEPT SAFETY
7811 B. FORTURNE DR.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78250
PHONE: (210) 521-1980

FAX: (210) 704-8399

JILL FREEBURN

NEVCO SCOREBOARD CO
EDWARDSVILLE, iL
PHONE: 618-664-0360
PHONE il 618-6640371
DAN PHALEN

dphalen@nevco.com

QUALITY SIGNS

310 CHIHUAHUA
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956-728-9524

ROBSON CORP.

2231 WHITFIELD PARK LOOP
SARASOTA, FL 34243
PHONE: 800-770-8585

FAX: 941-756-8912
richardr@robsoncorp.com
www.robsoncorp.com

ROCAL, INC.

P.O. BOX 640
FRANKFORT, OH 45628
PHONE: (740) 998-2073
FAX: (740) 998-2073
DAVID R. LIGHTLE
dlightle@rocal.com

SIEMENS BUILDING TECHNOLOGIES
12001 NETWORK BLVD. #318

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78249

PHONE: (210) 663-5559

FAX: (210) 841-2922
george.i.fernandez@siemens.com

STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS
3100 HAMILTON AVE
CLEVELAND, OH 44114

PHONE: (800) 782-2436

FAX: (888) 771-9670

JIM VINSON
vinson@stateindustrial.com

SIGN A RAMA

9114 MCPHERSON STE 2509

LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-725-4495

FAX: 956-725-4445

OSCAR MARTINEZ JR/MICHELLE WHITLOCK

laredo@signarama.com

SIGNS PLUS

4242 MCINTOSH LANE
SARASOQTA, FL 34232

PHONE: 800-848-4262

FAX: 941-378-4062

SHAWN KLINGER
info@signsplussigns.com
shawnklinger@signsplussigns.com
www signsplussigns.com

SPECTRUM CORP
10048 EASTHAVEN BLVD
HOUSTON, TX 77075
PHONE: 713-944-6200
FAX: 713-944-1290
JASON BISHOP
_ason@specorp.com
WWW,SDeccorp.com

STEWART SIGNS

2201 CANTU CT STE 2156

SARASOTA, FL 34232

PHONE: 800-237-3928

CHIP GOUDREAU/PAMELA SCHAETZEL
pschaetzel@stewartsigns.com
cgoudreau@stewartsigns.com

www. stewartsigns.com




CONT. MAILING LIST

VULCAN, INC. (DBA VULCAN SIGNS)
P.O. BOX 1850

FOLEY, AL 36536-18500

PHONE: 1-800-833-6845

FAX: (251) 943-1544

ERICK L. CROSBY/DAVID B BEVIACQUA
vulcan3@vulcaninc.com

WEST TEXAS WAREHOUSE EQUIP. & SUPPLY
125B FLECHA LANE

LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: (956) 753-0722

FAX: (956) 753-0744

LETTY CAMPBELL

wesitexaswhse@yahoo.com

W. W. GRAINGER

1400 LOMA LAND

EL PASO, TEXAS 79935
PHONE: (915) 598-1180
FAX: (915) 598-1170
JAMES VELASUEZ




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 19, 2007

REP 053-2007 WINDOW REPLACEMENT & REPAIRS

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

VENDOR AMOUNT
SAFETY GLASS CO. INC SEE TABULATION

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED TWELVE (12) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON JUNE 16, 2007
AND JUNE 17, 2007. ONE (1) PROPOSAL WAS RECEIVED ON JULY 3, 2007 @ 10:30 AM. AT THE UISD
SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 FACILITIES & OPERATIONS

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

JUAN A. DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




Juan A. Davila
Maintenance and Operations Director

Memorandum
TO: Ms. Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing\
FROM: Juan A. Davila, Director of Maintenance & Operations

DATE: August 6, 2007

SUBJECT:  RFP 053-2007 WINDOW REPLACMENT AND REPAIRS

After careful review of bids submitted for RFP 053-2007 WINDOW REPLACMENT AND
REPAIRS and after verification of information and references submitted. I recommend
award of RFP 053-2007 WINDOW REPLACMENT AND REPAIRS, for the 2007-2008

school year, to the only company, having met all bid requirments:
SAFETY GLASS CO. INC.
This company has excellent references, highly qualified and experienced staff and has met

all requirements set forth in the bid specifications. In addition, we have worked with this
company in the past and they have successfully met all contractual agreements.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

3501 E Saunders — Laredo, TX 78041 - (956)473-7934 - Fax(956)473-7951
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
WINDOW REPLACEMENT & REPAIR
RFEP 053-2007

MAILING LIST:

DISCOUNT AUTO GLASS, INC.
1900 JUSTO PENN
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: (956) 727-7807 OR (956) 723-8778

FAX: (956) 727-7907
windstex@msn.com

DR. LOUIE'S STONE DAMAGE REPAIR

702 NORTHSTAR DR.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 724-1327
FAX: (956) 724-9831

FELIPE'S

214 E. SUANDERS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 723-4832
alfredo1214@hotmail.com

GATEWAY GLASS & MIRROR CO.

502 GUADALUPE
LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: (956) 723-2016
FAX: (956) 723-2564

GARCIA'S AUTO GLASS
403 W. SAUNDERS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 725-8300
FAX: (956) 725-0322

JESSE MARTINEZ DEL NORTE
555 W. HILLSIDE

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 722-7574

FAX: (956) 723-5957
parts@hilisideauto.nst

LA GLASS

1219 CLARK BLVD.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: (956) 723-6152
FAX: (956) 723-5185
la-glass@hotmail.com

QUALITY GLASS

2306 CEDAR

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: (956) 725-3966

SAFELITE AUTO GLASS
612 AMISTAD DR.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 726-0477
FAX: (956) 726-9310

SAFETY GLASS

1601 MARKET

LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: (956) 723-5593
FAX: (956) 723-8693
safety@sbcqlobal net

SAN RAMON GLASS & MIRROR SHOP
3101 HWY 359

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: (956) 723-8666

VIRLAR'S AUTO BODY PARTS & AUTO GLASS
2315 SAN DARIO

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: (956) 723-5144

FAX: (956) 723-6224

FAX: (956) 717-0008

virfar@hotmail.com




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 19, 2007

RFP NO. 059-2007 BUS/VEHICLE REPAIRS AND SERVICES

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

SERVICE
A/C SERVICE & INSTALLATION
ANDY’S AUTO AIR

RADIATOR REPAIR
ANDY’S AUTO AIR & SUPPLY, INC.

BODY REPAIR & COLLISON
RUSH TRUCK CENTER

WINDSHIELD REPAIRS
GARCIA’S AUTO GLASS SEE TABULATION
SAFETY GLASS CO., INC.

TRANSMISSION REPAIR
RANKIN AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION

GASOLINE, DIESEL, ELECTRICAL SERVICES
RUSH TRUCK CENTER

FLEET PRIDE

FREIGHTLINER

INSPECTION STICKERS
D. RODRIGUEZ AUTO INSPECTION
LAREDO QUICK TRACK

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED FORTY THREE (43) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON JULY 1,
2007 AND JULY 7,2007. NINE (9) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON JULY 18,2007 @ 3:30 P.M. AT THE
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

JOE E. ARANDA, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR OF TRANSPORTATION
DANNY TREVINO, NORTH TRANSPORTATION MANAGER
CLAUDIA PEREZ, SOUTH TRANSPORTATION MANAGER
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




FOR CMILDREN

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Roberto J. Santos

Superintendent
To: Mrs. Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing
: ¢
From: Mr. Joe Aranda, Executive Director of Transportation
Subject: Bus Vehicle Repairs and Services

Date: August 8, 2007

The Department is recommending the following vendors for RFP 059-2007 Bus
Vebicle Repairs and Services. The Departient is recommending the following vendors
based on the lowest responsible price quotes or best available percentage (%) discount,
and their excellent service record with the district.

AJC Service & Installation Radiator Repair
Andy’s Auto Air Andy’s Auto Air
Body Repair & Collision Windshield Repairs
Rush Truck Center Garcia’s Auto Glass
Safety Glass Co.
Transmission Repair
Rankin Auto
Inspection Stickers
D. Rodriguez Auto Inspection
Gasoline, Diesel, Electrical Services Laredo Quick Track
Rush Truck Center
Fleet Pride
Freightliner

RECEIVED @8-07-°07 086:05 FROM- 4736260 TO- UISD Purchasing Poo1/001
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS/VEHICLE REPAIRS AND SERVICES
RFP 059-2007

MAILING LIST

A-1 AUTO SHOP
3410 E SAUNDERS
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-725-8119

A& S ELECTRIC

3719 SANTA MARIA
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 723-0541
FAX: 722-5095
GILBERT GARCIA

ADRIANS AUTO MACHINE
1503 PARK ST.

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: (956) 723-2856
FAX: 723-2856

MIGUEL HERNANDEZ

ANDY'S AUTO AIR AND REPAIR
4617 SAN EDUARDO

LAREDOQO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 722-7329
ROBERT ROSAS
robert@andys-air.com

AUTOBODY PRO COLLISION REPAIR
1015 SANCHEZ

LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-795-8789

ANGEL DELUNA

BORDER TRANSMISSION PARTS
1419 SPRINGFIELD

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: (956) 726-0171

FAX: 726-3018

JAIME RODRIGUEZ

CARQUEST AUTOMOTIVE REFINISH SUPPLY

4100 SAN BERNARDO
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-728-7001

CITY RADIATOR

" 1715 SAN BERNARDO
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 723-3312

COMMERCIAL REBUILD INC.
P.0. BOX 4806

808 EAST RIO GRANDE
VICTORIA, TEXAS 77803
361-578-0210
1dn333@yahoo.com

DISCOUNT AUTO GLASS
1900 JUSTO PENN
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956.727.7807
FAX: 956.727.7907
ANTONIO VIDAL
windstex@msn.com

D & D AUTOMOTIVE PAINTS
1914 MARKET

LAREDO, TX 78043

PHONE: 956-722-6688

FAX: 956-725-8804

DAVID MENDIOLA

rehino28@hotmail.com

D. RODRIGUEZ AUTO INSPECTION
1301 LAFAYETTE

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: (956) 712-4335

DIESEL INJECTION SALES & SERVICE
1050 S.E. LOOP 410

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78220

PHONE: 210.648.4500

FAX: 210.648.0015

MICHAEL EICHMAN

disa@dieselinjection.com

FLEETPRIDE

123 FLECHA LANE
LAREDO, TX 78045
PHONE: 956-722-0761
TOMAS STAGG

thomas. staga@fleetpride com

FREIGHTLINER
12002 FM 1472
LAREDO, TX 78045
PHONE: 956-723-7473
FAX: 956-723-6530
JAIME SOTO

i soto@opuskane.com

www.opuskane.com
L. MALDONADO, GM

FRENCH ELLISON
8402 MILO RD
LAREDO, TX 78045
PHONE: 956-727-7886
FAX: 956-727-7114
LUIS PEREZ JR

GATEWAY AUTO GLASS
502 GUADALUPE
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 723-2016

GARCIA'S AUTO GLASS

403 W. SAUNDERS

LAREDO, TEXAS 78044
PHONE: (956) 725-8300

FAX: 725-0322

RICARDO OR JUANITA GARCIA

JAMES AUTOMOTIVE
3212 ARKANSAS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: (956) 722-3653

JESSE MARTINEZ AUTO PARTS
1301 SAN BERNARDO

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: (956) 723-4722

JESSE MARTINEZ

555 W. HILLSIDE
LAREDO, TEXAS 78042
PHONE: (956) 722-7574
FAX: 723-5957
ROBERTO MARTINEZ

JESSE MARTINEZ (SOUTH) AUTO SALES

520 ZAPATA HWY 83
LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: (956) 722-5812




CONT. MAILING LIST RFP 058-2007

LAREDO AUTO PAINT
1718 SAN BERNARDO AVE
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-722-2

LAREDO MUFFLER SHOP
1520 SAN BERNARDO
LAREDQ, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: (956) 722-1522

L. & R TRANSMISSION
1001 SAUNDERS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 722-3042

LAREDO QUICK TRACK
LUBE & CAR WASH
2522 HWY 83 South
LAREDO, TX 78048
OSCAR SALINAS

augia_71@hotmail.com
www laredoquicktrackhub.com

MAACO AUTO PAINTING
609 AMISTAD DR
LAREDC, TX 78041
PHONE: 856-785-0101

MIKE'S PAINT PLACE
6410 POLARIS DR
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 856-729-8080

MORALES MACHINE SHOP
801 N. ARKANSAS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: {956) 722-4485
iessem@imtonltine.com

OSCAR' S GARAGE & INSPECTION
205 W. SAUNDERS

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: (956) 722-4132

PAUL YOUNG AUTO MALL
3701 £E. SAUNDERS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (856) 727-1192

PEP BOYS

4401 SAN DARIO
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 726-9795

POWELL WATSON MOTOR, INC.
IH 35N AT MANN RD

LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: (956) 722-5182

FAX: 717-2447

ARNOLDO SANCHEZ

PRONTO MUFFLER SHOP
910 MADISON

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956-722-5572
FAX: 956-722-7624
ARMANDO ESPARZA
pshops@sbcalobal.net

RANKIN TRANSMISSION

1502 SANTA URSULA

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: (956) 722-0044

CONT. MAILING LIST RFP 017-2007

RUSH TRUCK CENTER

10216 UNION PACIFIC BLVD
LAREDO, TX 78045

PHONE: {856) 724-7383

FAX: (956) 717-1709

LEWIS WOODUL
woodull@rush-enterprises.com
JAIME VASQUEZ
vasquezi@rush-enterprises.com

SAFETY GLASS

1601 MARKET
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 723-5593
FAX: 723-8693

R.J. GARCIA

SALAZAR RADIATOR SHOP
316 W. SAUNDERS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE:(956) 724-5216

SAMES MOTOR CO.
$001 SAN DARIO
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 721-4700

SAMES COLLISION CENTER
7100 SANTA MARIA
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-721-4740

SANTEX TRUCKS

1380 ACKERMAN RD
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78219
PHONE: 210-661-8371
FAX: 210-661-0226

SOUTH TEXAS AUTO REBUILDERS, INC

2714 GUADALUPE ST.

LAREDO, TEXAS

PHONE: 956-723-8711

FAX: 856-723-1768
southtexasautorebuilders@amait.comn

TEXAS CORRECTIONAL IND.
P.0. BOX 4013

HUNTSVILLE, TX 77342
PHONE: 936-437-8960

FAX: 936-437-6126

EDWARD MASSEY

edward massey@tdej. state tx.us




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
SEPTEMBER 19, 2007
RENEWAL

RFP 057-2005 LONG DISTANCE SERVICES

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S) OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

VENDOR AMOUNT

CAPITAL TELECOMMUNICATIONS, INC SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED EIGHT (8) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON MAY 15™, 2005 AND
MAY 22"P 2005. THREE (3) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON JUNE 157, 2005 @ 11:00 AM. AT THE
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 TECHNOLOGY DEPARTMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

HECTOR J. PEREZ EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR OF TECHNOLOGY
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




Executive Director of Information Technology

MEMORANDUM

To: Mrs. Cordelia Flores Jackson
Director of Purchasing

From: Mr. Hector J. Perez  « [
Executive Director of Information Technology

Date: July 31, 2007
Subject: Recommendation to renew RFP number 057-2005

The following is to recommend renewing Request for Proposal (RFP) number 057-2005
on long distance services to Capital Telecommunications, Inc. They have provided
excellent service to the school district in the past. In addition, there are no additional
charges for the district’s toll free numbers.

Please see the attached price tabulation for more information, and do not hesitate to call
me at extension 6370 if you have any questions.

201 Lindenwood Drive - Laredo, Texas 78045 - (956) 473-6370 - Fax (956) 473-6411 - E-Mail: hperez@uisd.net
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
LONG DISTANCE SERVICE
RFP NO. 057-2005

MAILING LIST

CTI

9830 COLONNADE BLVD. STE 165

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78230
PA PHONE 1-800-864-3517
PHONE: 210-579-4603

FAX: 1-800-884-6177

ATTN: KARI L. SCHWAB
kschwab@captel.com

WESTEL

10010 SAN PEDRO

STE 100

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78216
PHONE: 210-349-5272
MITCH HATHAWAY
mitch.hathaway@westel.net

SOUTH WESTERN BELL
902 SAN EDURARSO #203
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956-727-6880
FAX: 956-727-6776
JERRY CASTRO
ernesto.castro@sbe.com

NTS COMMUNICATION
4501 INDIAN RD.
STE G-104

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87110
PHONE: 505-266-5830
FAX: 505-266-5221

BOB THRRINGTON
bobh1@niscom.com

UsLD

9311 SAN PEDRO #300

STE 100

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78216
PHONE: 210-525-9009

QWEST COMMUNICATION
9311 SAN PEDRO AVE
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78216

SPRINT

10100 REUNION PLACE
STE 230

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216
PHONE: 210-442-6000
CAROL RUBY

LDDS WORLDCOM
100 TAYLOR ST.
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78205




