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BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop X Regular Special

Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 161806 FOR JUICE AND NON-CARBONATED BEVERAGES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE

SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES
OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

Fhasted, fro Tecellence
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Digitally signed by Luis
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director A.Vélez
Date: 2015.06.19
15:48:41 -05'00'
Date: Monday, June 29, 2015
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 161806 for Juice and

Non-Carbonated Beverages

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 161806 for Juice and Non-Carbonated Beverages be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and
as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 161806 - JUICE AND NON-CARBONATED BEVERAGES
TABULATION SHEET

Description: Labatt Food Service Laredo Coca-Cola
San Antonio, TX Laredo, TX
1 |Bottled Water
Brand: NESTLE DASANI
Size (0z.); 16.9 16.9|
Count per case: 24 24
Total cost (per case): $ 4.14 | § 6.09
Unit Cost (per container): $ 0.1725 | $ 0.2538
Cost per Oz $ 0.0102 | § 0.0150 |
2 |Lemonade
Brand: TRUE BREW MINUTE M LIGHT
Size (Oz.): 12.0 12.0
Count per case: 24 24
Total cost (per case): $ 1758 | $ 8.00
Unit Cost (per container): 3 07325 | $ 0.3333
Cost per Oz.: 0.0610 | $ 0.0278
£ arahge Juice a
Brand: TROPICANA MM JUICE
Size (Oz): 10.0 10.0
Count per case: 24 24
Total cost (per case): 1792 | $ 12.70
Unit Cost (per container): 0.7467 | § 0.5292
Cost per Oz 0.0747 | $ 0.0529
4 |Apple Juice
Brand: TROPICANA MM JUICE
Size (Oz.): 10.0 10.0
Count per case: 24 24
| Total cost (per case): $  1792|$ 12.70
Unit Cost (per container): $ 0.7467 | § 0.5292
Cost per Oz.: 3 0.0747 | § 0.0529
5 [Iced Tea
Brand: TRUE BREW FUZE TEA
Size (Oz.): 12.0 12.0
Count per case: 24 24
Total cost (per case): $ 1716 | $ 8.00
Unit Cost (per container): $ 0.7150 | $ 0.3333
Cost per Oz.: $ 0.0596 | $ 0.0278
6 |Fruit-Flavored Beverages
Brand: TRUE BREW| NO BID|
Size (Oz.): 12.0 NO BID|
Count per case: 24 NO BID |
Total cost (per case): $ 19.66 NO BID|
Unit Cost (per container): $ 0.8192 NO BID
Cost per Oz $ 0.0683 NO BID
7 |Sports Drinks (Various Flavors)
Brand: GATORADE POWERADE ZERO
Size (Oz.): 12.0 12.0
Count per case: 24 24
Total cost (per case): $ 1213 [ $ 11.32
Unit Cost (per container): 0.5054 | § 0.4717
Cost per Oz.: 00421 | $ 0.0393

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED PRODUCT
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