Item 1103B
Cenveo
ClearVisions Nolans Office San Antonio Litho Press ARC
1 $ 2,529.00 $ 2,380.00 $ 2,186.94 $ 1,255.00 no bid
$ 3,581.00 $ 4,480.00 $ 2,483.34 $ 2,401.00 no bid
2 $ 1,375.00 $ 661.00 $ 794.12 $ 677.00 no bid
$ 2,395.00 $ 2,346.00 $ 1,784.31 $ 2,276.00 no bid
3 3 513.00 $ 159.00 $ 1,319.07 $ 181600 | $ 103.25
$ 553.00 $ 236.00 $ 2,221.16 $ 16,703.00 | $ 212.64
$ 853.00 $ 707.00 $ 9,486.86 $ 82,907.00 | $ 750.16
4 $ 689.00 $ 279.00 $ 355.54 $ 250.00 | $ 226.65
$ 753.00 $ 409.00 $ 408.82 $ 500.00 | $ 39257
5 $ 1,037.00 $ 409.00 $ 910.34 $ 250.00 | $ 287.72
$ 1,897.00 $ 2,225.00 $ 2,079.15 $ 500.00 | $ 471.80
6 $ 508.00 $ 113.00 $ 399.17 $ 12400 | $ 95.60
$ 555.00 $ 195.00 $ 421.30 $ 175.00 | $ 177.00
7 $ 1,868.00 $ 692.00 no bid $ 250.00 no bid
$ 1,869.00 $ 844.00 no bid $ 500.00 no bid
8 3 367.00 $ 69.00 no bid 3$ 250.00 | $ 45.00
$ 409.00 $ 126.00 no bid $ 500.00 | $ 58.75
9 3 356.00 $ 72.00 no bid 3$ 170.00 | $ 128.00
$ 388.00 $ 202.00 no bid 3$ 171.00 | $ 178.75
10 $ 331.00 $ 51.00 no bid $ 156.00 | $ 17.70
$ 335.00 $ 111.00 no bid $ 159.00 | $ 59.00
11 3 588.00 $ 156.00 no bid $ 169.00 | $ 99.75
$ 656.00 $ 238.00 no bid $ 180.00 | $ 214.60
$ 657.00 $ 282.00 no bid $ 184.00 | $ 233.25
12 3 370.00 $ 66.00 no bid $ 151.00 | $ 36.50
$ 406.00 $ 134.00 no bid $ 186.00 | $ 126.60
13 3 344.00 $ 56.00 no bid $ 76.00 | $ 15.00
$ 368.00 $ 98.00 no bid $ 128.00 | $ 67.95
$ 416.00 $ 103.00 no bid $ 80.00 | $ 30.00
$ 452.00 $ 167.00 no bid $ 168.00 | $ 113.85
14 $ 491.00 $ 350.00 no bid $ 390.00 no bid
$ 594.00 $ 528.00 no bid $ 700.00 no bid
15 $ 954.00 no bid no bid $ 1,500.00 | $1,019.80
$ 2,209.00 no bid no bid $ 2,500.00 | $1,927.20
16 $ 2,029.00 $ 2,055.00 $ 1,255.77 $ 1,140.00 no bid
$ 2,232.00 $ 2,625.00 $ 1,439.06 $ 1,370.00 no bid
17 $  483.00 $ 128.00 no bid $ 500.00 | $ 95.15
$  699.00 $  347.00 no bid $ 1,000.00 | $ 317.25
$ 522.00 $ 161.00 no bid $ 750.00 | $ 139.50
$ 873.00 $  499.00 no bid $ 1,250.00 | $ 470.50
$ 567.00 $  209.00 no bid $ 1,000.00 | $ 178.00
$ 1,059.00 $ 638.00 no bid $ 1,500.00 | $ 597.50
18 $ 2,159.00 $ 2,409.00 $ 1,441.84 $ 2,150.00 | $2,089.30
$ 2,190.00 $ 2,545.00 $ 1,462.36 $ 2,200.00 | $2,143.00
$ 2,298.00 $ 3,187.00 $ 1,384.34 $ 2,100.00 | $3,575.50
$ 2,313.00 $ 3,345.00 $ 1,404.86 $ 2,200.00 | $3,685.00
40 40.00 38.40 14.40 40.00 32.00
40 30.00 40.00 40.00 40.00 40.00
20 20.00 20.00 - -
100 90 98.4 54.40 80 72




