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GOVERNING BOARD AGENDA ITEM  
AMPHITHEATER UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 10 

________________________________________________________________________ 
 
DATE OF MEETING:    June 7, 2011 

 
TITLE: Approval of Out of State Travel  
_______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

BACKGROUND:    

 

 

STAFF 

 

 
Jon Lansa, Michael Capizzi, Denise Heagle, David Humphreys, Gwen Kane, Marty Roth, John 
Willis, and Jessica Winter from Amphitheater High School request permission to attend the AVID 
Summer Institute in San Diego, California, July 26-29, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is 
$12,871 and will be paid for by federal funds designated for staff development.   

 
Tassi Call, Gordon Gower, Michael Powers, Jennifer Queiruga, Peter Salazar, Theresa Eckley, Ron 
Pierce, and Tanya Wall from Amphitheater Middle School request permission to attend the AVID 
Summer Institute in San Diego, California, July 26-29, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is 
$12,169 and will be paid for by federal funds designated for staff development.   
 
Clara Estey from Amphitheater High School requests permission to attend the AP Summer Institute 
in San Marcos, California, July 31-August 4, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is $1,700 and will 
be paid for by site maintenance and operations funds.   

 
Donna Olson Shreve from Holaway Elementary School requests permission to attend the People-to-
People Citizen Ambassador Programs Supervision and Curriculum Development Delegation 
traveling to China, November 26-December 5, 2011.  There is no cost to the district. 

 
Patrick Nelson from the District Offices requests permission to attend the Superintendency Institute 
of America Summer Conference in Indianapolis, Indiana, July 19-23, 2011.  Approximate cost of the 
travel is $2,449 and will be paid for by federal funds designated for staff development.   

 
Travel was previously approved at the February 8, 2011 Board meeting for Jeremy Woodward from 
Canyon del Oro High School to attend the International Baccalaureate Training in Montezuma, New 
Mexico, July 11-15, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel was $1,394 and is now $1,634 and will be 
paid for by federal funds designated for staff development.   

 

 

STUDENTS 

 
Ron Pierce from Amphitheater Middle School requests permission to take 4 students from the MESA 
Club to the MESA USA National Design Competition in Seattle, Washington, June 23-27, 2011.  
Approximate cost of the travel is $1,150 and will be paid for by student activity funds.  No school 
days will be missed and a substitute is not required. 
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Ben Hurley, Marty Roth, Pat Derksen, and Sohaib Fellah from Amphitheater High School request 
permission to take 14 students from Boys Basketball to the Summer Basketball Tournament in San 
Diego, California, June 16-19, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is $4,250 and will be paid for by 
student activity funds and tax credit donations.  No school days will be missed and a substitute is not 
required. 
 
Yvonne Bernino and Jennifer Atteberry-Pierpont from Canyon del Oro High School request 
permission to take 3 students from FCCLA Early Childhood and Culinary Arts to the FCCLA National 
Leadership Conference in Anaheim, California, July 7-14, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is 
$10,045 and will be paid for by JTED funds, state funds, student activity funds and tax credit 
donations.  No school days will be missed and a substitute is not required. 

 
Tim Berrier and Jeff Hannan from Ironwood Ridge High School request permission to take 20 
students from Wrestling Club to the ASICS SC Wrestling Tournament in Santa Ana, California, June 
24-26, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is $2,057 and will be paid for by student activity funds 
and tax credit donations.  No school days will be missed and a substitute is not required. 

 
Rob Clouse, Gary Forrest, Krystal Wilsinson, and Eric Wilkinson from Ironwood Ridge High School 
request permission to take 36 students from Cross Country to the Cross Country Meet in San Diego, 
California, September 16-18, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is $7,384 and will be paid for by 
student activity funds, gifts and donations, and tax credit donations.  One school day will be missed 
and a substitute is required. 

 
Mark Hodge, Rachelle Hodge, John Dorer, Paula Dorer, Sharon Singer, Kim Meyer, Brian Mecham, 
Glenn Singleton, Gloria Singleton, Lee Smith, Freci Smith, Paul Kraft, and Tina Gillette from 
Ironwood Ridge High School request permission to take 85 students from Marching Band to the 
White House Elipse in Washington D.C., October 8-12, 2011.  Approximate cost of the travel is 
$94,905 and will be paid for by student activity funds and tax credit donations.  No school days will 
be missed and a substitute is not required. 

 

 BUDGET 

CODE 

KEY 

 

100-11-100-2210-281-6360 Title I Staff development, AHS, registration 

100-11-100-2210-281-6582 Title I Staff development, AHS, staff travel 

100-12-100-2210-166-6360 Title I Staff development, AMS, registration 

100-11-100-2210-166-6582 Title I Staff development, AMS, staff travel 

100-12-100-2210-166-6582 Title I Staff development, AMS, staff travel 

001-00-100-2210-281-6360 M&O Staff development, AHS, registration 

001-00-100-2210-281-6582 M&O Staff development, AHS, staff travel 

140-11-100-2210-510-6360 Title II Staff development, Wetmore, registration 

140-11-100-2210-510-6582 Title II Staff development, Wetmore, staff travel 

850-00-100-1001-166-6892 Student Activities  Classroom instruction, AMS, student travel 

850-00-100-3400-281-6892 Student Activities Bookstore, AHS, student travel 

526-00-100-3400-281-6519 Tax Credit Bookstore, AHS, student transportation 

400-11-270-2190-282-6360 CTE Student Support Svcs., CDO, registration 

596-00-270-2190-282-6892 JTED Student Support Svcs., CDO, student travel 

400-11-270-2190-282-6582 CTE Student Support Svcs., CDO, staff travel 

400-11-270-2190-282-6519 CTE Student Support Svcs., CDO, student travel 

526-00-100-3400-282-6892 Tax Credit Bookstore, CDO, student travel 

850-00-100-3400-282-6892 Student Activities Bookstore, CDO, student travel 
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526-00-100-3400-280-6892 Tax Credit Bookstore, IRHS, student travel 

850-00-100-3400-280-6892 Student Activities Bookstore, IRHS, student travel 

526-00-100-3400-280-6519 Tax Credit Bookstore, IRHS, student transportation 

850-00-100-3400-280-6519 Student Activities Bookstore, IRHS, student transportation 

530-00-100-3400-280-6113 Gifts & Donations Bookstore, IRHS, substitutes 

 
________________________________________________________________________ 
INITIATED BY:                                                             

                                                                                
_______________________________________________________________________ 
Patrick Nelson, Associate Superintendent                                    Date:   May 25, 2011 

______________________________________ 
                                                                                   Vicki Balentine, Ph.D., Superintendent 


