
Bid Request Number Bid #10-31

Title Classroom and Office Furniture

Open Date 7/29/2010 8:01:01 AM Central

Close Date 8/19/2010 3:00:00 PM Central

Line 1

STUDENT DESKS


Regular 22" to 29"


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $49.81

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $41.30 Artco Bell R90D

Artco Bell #R90D Open Front Desk


Specify laminate and frame color

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $45.89 Virco

785 standard 

colors

Desk, 785 Series, Student Desk, 4-Leg, Open Front Plastic Book Box, 18" 

X 24" X 5/8" High-Pressure Laminate Top, Steel Frame, 22"-30" 

Adjustable Height, Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $47.95 Scholar Craft SC2900FBBK

$47.95 valid for 1-50 units,


$46.73 valid for 51-100 units,


$45.02 valid for 100+ units

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 2)1 $41.45 Scholar Craft SC2200FBBK

$41.45 valid for 1-50 units,


$40.41 valid for 51-100 units,


$38.93 valid for 100+ units

Line 2

STUDENT DESKS


Wheel Chair Accessible


26" - 34"


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $66.06

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid



Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $90.37 Virco

482448W/UB

OOK 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Wheelchair Legs, 24" X 48" X 1-1/8" 

High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-

Mold Edge Banding, 26"-34" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-

Base Swivel Glides.





Book Box, plastic book

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $105.94 Scholar Craft SC2100SP

$105.94 for 1-50 units, 


$103.25 for 51-100 units, 


$99.48 for 100+ units.  

Line 3 11" STACKING CHAIRS - POWDER COAT

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $17.44

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $17.44 Artco Bell D10D

Artco Bell #D10D 11 1/2" Stacker Chair Powder Coat


Specify Frame color and shell color

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $19.70 Scholar Craft SC121

$19.70 valid for 1-50 units,


$19.20 valid for 51-100 units,


$18.50 valid for 100+ units

U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $20.86

SMITH 

SYSTEMS 002003 CC-2003 - 11 1/2" STACKING CHAIR

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $23.65 Virco

2012 

standard 

colors

Chair, 2000 Series, 4-Leg, Stackable, 12" Seat Height, Plastic Seat, Steel 

Frame, Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

Line 4 11" STACKING       CHAIRS - CHROME

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $18.24

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $18.24 Artco Bell D10D

Artco Bell #D10D 11 1/2" Chrome frame Stacker Chair


Specify Shell Color

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $19.70 Scholar Craft SC121

$19.70 valid for 1-50 units,


$19.20 valid for 51-100 units,


$18.50 valid for 100+ units



Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $23.65 Virco

2012 

standard 

colors

Chair, 2000 Series, 4-Leg, Stackable, 12" Seat Height, Plastic Seat, Steel 

Frame, Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $32.26

SMITH 

SYSTEMS

2007 

NVY/CHR CC-2008N - 11 1/2" STACKING CHAIR

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 2)1 $16.97 Scholar Craft SC1011

$16.97 valid for 1-50 units,


$16.54 valid for 51-100 units,


$15.94 valid for 100+ units

Line 5 13" STACKING CHAIRS - POWDER COAT

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $17.44

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $17.44 Artco Bell D10C

Artco Bell #D10C 14" Stacker Chair Powder Coat


Specify frame color and shell color

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $21.13 Scholar Craft SC123

$21.13 valid for 1-50 units,


$20.59 valid for 51-100 units,


$19.84 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $23.65 Virco

2014 

standard 

colors

Chair, 2000 Series, 4-Leg, Stackable, 14" Seat Height, Plastic Seat, Steel 

Frame, Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $23.90

SMITH 

SYSTEMS 002002 CC-2002 - 13 1/2" STACKING CHAIR

Line 6 13" STACKING          CHAIRS - CHROME

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $18.24

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $18.24 Artco Bell D10C

Artco Bell #D10C 14" Chrome Frame Stacker Chair


Specify Shell Color

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $21.13 Scholar Craft SC123

$21.13 valid for 1-50 units,


$20.59 valid for 51-100 units,


$19.84 valid for 100+ units



Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $23.65 Virco

2014 

standard 

colors

Chair, 2000 Series, 4-Leg, Stackable, 14" Seat Height, Plastic Seat, Steel 

Frame, Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $35.11

SMIHT 

SYSTEMS

2007 

NVY/CHR CC-2007N - 13 1/2" STACKING CHAIR

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 2)1 $17.62 Scholar Craft SC1013

$17.62 valid for 1-50 units,


$17.18 valid for 51-100 units,


$16.55 valid for 100+ units

Line 7 15" STACKING CHAIRS - POWDER COAT

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $20.13

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $23.13

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $26.47

U S TOY CO INC 1 $33.21

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Line 8 15" STACKING          CHAIRS - CHROME

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $21.10

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $23.13

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $26.47

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Line 9 17"-18" STACKING CHAIRS - POWDER COAT

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $22.23

U S TOY CO INC 1 $35.11

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $22.23 Artco Bell D10A

Artco Bell #D10A 18" Stacker Chair Powder coat


Specify frame and shell color



Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $23.97 Scholar Craft SC127

$23.97 valid for 1-50 units,


$23.37 valid for 51-100 units,


$22.51 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $28.24 Virco

2018 

standard 

colors

Chair, 2000 Series, 4-Leg, Stackable, 18" Seat Height, Plastic Seat, Steel 

Frame, Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

Line 10 17"-18" STACKING          CHAIRS - CHROME

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $23.32

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $23.32 Artco Bell D10A

Artco Bell D10A 18" Chrome frame stacker chair


Specify shell color

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $23.97 Scholar Craft SC127

$23.97 valid for 1-50 units,


$23.37 valid for 51-100 units,


$22.51 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $28.24 Virco

2018 

standard 

colors

Chair, 2000 Series, 4-Leg, Stackable, 18" Seat Height, Plastic Seat, Steel 

Frame, Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 2)1 $23.32 Scholar Craft SC1017

$23.32 valid for 1-50 units,


$22.73 valid for 51-100 units,


$21.90 valid for 100+ units

Line 11 17" STACKING CHAIRS/CASTERS POWDER COAT

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $37.29

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $34.39 Scholar Craft SC127C

$34.39 valid for 1-50 units,


$33.52 valid for 51-100 units,


$32.29 valid for 100+ units




Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $44.12 Virco

2050 

standard 

colors

Chair, 2000 Series, Mobile Task Chair, 4-Leg, 18" Seat Height, Plastic 

Seat, Steel Frame, 2" Dual- Wheel Hooded Swivel Casters. Standard 

With Chrome Frame Only.

Line 12 17" STACKING          CHAIRS/CASTERS    CHROME

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $34.39

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $39.13

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $44.12

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Line 13 13 1/2" COMBINATION CHAIR/DESK  Powder/Chrome COAT

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $57.90

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $60.71 Artco Bell 7453 or D75C

Artco Bell #7453 or D75C 14" Combination Desk Chrome Frame


Specify shell color

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $71.99 Scholar Craft SC623-FB

$71.99 valid for 1-50 units,


$70.16 valid for 51-100 units,


$67.60 valid for 100+ units

Line 14 15 1/2" COMBINATION   CHAIR/DESK CHROME/Powder coat

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $60.71

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $71.99

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid



Line 15

17 1/2" COMBINATION CHAIR/DESK -Chrome POWDER COAT


SPECIFICATIONS


These combination units shall be self-supporting and non-tilting of 

16 gauge swaged steel front legs and 18 gauge back legs.  The top 

support tube shall be of 1 1/8" 14 gauge steel.  A 3/

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $64.81

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $71.99

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $91.43

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Line 16 18 1/2" COMBINATION CHAIR/DESK - CHROME/Powder

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $69.96

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $91.43

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $142.23

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Line 17 30" x 72" RECTANGLE TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $92.84

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $98.79 Scholar Craft

FS949RE307

2-2140

$98.79 valid for 1-50 units,


$96.29 valid for 51-100 units,


$92.77 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $100.25 Virco

483072 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 30" X 72" X 1-1/8" High-

Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-Mold 

Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-Base 

Swivel Glides.



U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $176.69

SCHOLARCR

AFT

FS849RE307

2 SLR-3072MR

Line 18 48" x 72" KIDNEY TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $141.79

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $137.56 Scholar Craft

FS949KD487

2-2140

$137.56 valid for 1-50 units,


$134.05 valid for 51-100 units,


$129.15 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $180.74 Virco

48KID72 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 48" X 72" Kidney X 1-

1/8" High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And 

T-Mold Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, 

Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $255.54

SCHOLARCR

AFT

FS849KD487

2 #SLR4872MR - 48" X 72" STUDENT CENTER TABLE

Line 19 60" X 66" HORSESHOE TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $170.45

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $183.23 Scholar Craft

FS949HS606

6-2140

$183.23 valid for 1-50 units,


$178.59 valid for 51-100 units,


$172.06 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $204.03 Virco

48HORSE60 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 60" X 66" Horseshoe X 

1-1/8" High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet 

And T-Mold Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, 

Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

Line 20 42" ROUND TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $80.63

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid



Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $89.31 Virco

4842R 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 42" Round X 1-1/8" 

High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-

Mold Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-

Base Swivel Glides.

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $100.78 Scholar Craft

FS949RD42-

2140

$100.78 valid for 1-50 units,


$98.23 valid for 51-100 units,


$94.63 valid for 100+ units

U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $142.49

SCHOLARCR

AFT FS849RD36 SLR-36MR - 36" ROUND TABLE

Line 21 60" ROUND TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $126.44

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $141.00 Scholar Craft

FS949RD60-

2140

$141.00 valid for 1-50 units,


$137.43 valid for 51-100 units,


$132.40 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $145.79 Virco

4860R 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 60" Round X 1-1/8" 

High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-

Mold Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-

Base Swivel Glides.

Line 22 24" x 24" x 48" TRAPEZOIDAL TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $73.30

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid



Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $66.36 Virco

48TRAP48 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 24" X 48" Trapezoid X 

1-1/8" High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet 

And T-Mold Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, 

Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $69.97 Scholar Craft

FS949TR244

8-2140

$69.97 valid for 1-50 units,


$68.20 valid for 51-100 units,


$65.71 valid for 100+ units

Line 23 30" x 30" x 60" TRAPEZOIDAL TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $86.28

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $87.35 Scholar Craft

FS949TR306

0-2140

$87.35 valid for 1-50 units,


$85.14 valid for 51-100 units,


$82.02 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $104.49 Virco

48TRAP60 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 30" X 60" Trapezoid X 

1-1/8" High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet 

And T-Mold Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, 

Nylon-Base Swivel Glides.

Line 24 30" x 72" RECTANGLE (FOLDING) TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $109.48

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $185.14 Correll CFA3072PX

$185.14 valid for 1-50 units,


$171.07 valid for 51-100 units,


$128.66 valid for 100+ units

U S TOY CO INC (Alt 1) 1 $207.00 ROYAL 2638A-GOK RY-2638 - ADJUSTABLE HEIGHT FOLDING TABLE

Line 25 36" x 72" RECTANGLE (FOLDING)TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $115.69



Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $203.89 Correll CFA3672PX

$203.89 valid for 1-50 units,


$189.07 valid for 51-100 units,


$142.33 valid for 100+ units

Line 26 30" x 72" RECTANGLE TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $92.84

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $100.25 Virco

483072 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 30" X 72" X 1-1/8" High-

Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-Mold 

Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-Base 

Swivel Glides.

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $105.65 Scholar Craft

FS949RE307

2-2140

$105.65 valid for 1-50 units,


$101.43 valid for 51-100 units,


$96.29 valid for 100+ units

Line 27 36" x 72" RECTANGLE 

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $99.34

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $105.90 Virco

483672 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 36" X 72" X 1-1/8" High-

Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-Mold 

Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-Base 

Swivel Glides.



Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $118.92 Scholar Craft

FS949RE367

2-2140

$118.92 valid for 1-50 units,


$114.16 valid for 51-100 units,


$108.38 valid for 100+ units

Line 28

42"x 60" RECTANGLE TABLE


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $109.17

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $131.15 Scholar Craft

FS949RE426

0-2140

$131.15 valid for 1-50 units,


$125.91 valid for 51-100 units,


$119.53 valid for 100+ units

Line 29

36" x 60"RECTANGLE  TABLE


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $92.45

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $101.66 Virco

483660 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 36" X 60" X 1-1/8" High-

Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-Mold 

Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-Base 

Swivel Glides.

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $111.49 Scholar Craft

FS949RE366

0-2140

$111.49 valid for 1-50 units,


$107.03 valid for 51-100 units,


$101.61 valid for 100+ units

Line 30 Flower   60" TABLE

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $144.52

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid



Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $160.36 Scholar Craft

FS949FL60-

2140

$160.36 valid for 1-50 units,


$153.95 valid for 51-100 units,


$146.15 valid for 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $213.92 Virco

48FLOW60 

standard 

colors

Table, 4000 Series, Activity Table, Standard Legs, 60" Flower X 1-1/8" 

High-Pressure Laminate Particleboard Top With Backing Sheet And T-

Mold Edge Banding, 22"-30" Adjustable Height, Tubular Steel Legs, Nylon-

Base Swivel Glides.

Line 31 MOBILE FOLDING STOOL TABLE (Cafeteria Table)

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $937.61

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $1,074.88 Virco

MTS1729101

2 standard 

colors

Mobile Table, Stool Table series, 17 high stools, 29 H x 30 W x 10 L table, 

12 stools, high-pressure laminate top, t-mold edge banding, up- and down-

lock mechanisms, torsion bars for smooth operation, opening and closing 

safety device.

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $1,087.29 AmTab

MST1012DR

C

$1087.29 valid for 1-10 units,


$1078.23 valid for 11-50 units,


$1016.83 valid for 50+ units

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 2)1 $1,277.13 BioFit 10F1229C

$1277.13 valid for 1-10 units,


$1264.47 valid for 11-50 units,


$1199.91 valid for 50+ units

Line 32

STUDENT/LAB


ADJ. HEIGHT 18" - 27" FRAME: CHROME


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $49.72

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid



Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $70.91 Scholar Craft SC300

$70.91 valid for 1-50 units,


$68.32 valid for 51+ units

Line 33

STUDENT/LAB STOOL


ADJ. HEIGHT 21" - 30" FRAME: CHROME





Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $51.51

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $75.00 Scholar Craft SC301

$75.00 valid for 1-50 units,


$72.26 valid for 51+ units

Line 34 ARTCO 7990

TEACHER STOOL


HEIGHT ADJUSTABLE


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $65.06

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $69.08 Scholar Craft SC110

$69.08 valid for 1-50 units,


$66.55 valid for 51+ units



Line 35

	FOLDING CHAIRS


?	f" steel frame


?	Heavy gauge tubular steel frame


?	Polyethylene leg caps


?	Leg supports are riveted to front and back legs for added lateral 

support


?	Embossed 14-gauge link straps 


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $14.08

Buffalo Business Products 1 $77.29

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $20.83 Virco

162 standard 

colors Folding Chair, Steel, Front And Rear Leg Braces

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $40.99

National 

Public 

Seating 200

Minimum order 25.


$40.99 valid for 25-50 units,


$33.39 valid for 51-100 units,


$29.73 valid for 100+ units.

Line 36

		FOLDING CHAIR WITH VINYL UPHOLSTERY


?	f" steel frame


?	Heavy gauge tubular steel frame


?	Polyethylene leg caps


?	Leg supports are riveted to front and back legs for added lateral 

support


?	Embossed 14-gauge link straps 


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $19.25

Buffalo Business Products 1 $95.45

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $30.00 Virco

168 standard 

colors

Folding Chair, Steel, Vinyl Upholstered Seat And Back, Front And Rear 

Leg Braces



Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $45.82

National 

Public 

Seating 1200

Minimum order 25.


$45.82 valid for 25-50 units,


$38.05 valid for 51-100 units,


$34.39 valid for 100+ units.

Line 37

	CHAIR TRUCK


	(42 CHAIR CAPACITY)


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $163.87

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $237.54

National 

Public 

Seating DY50

$237.54 valid for 1-25 units,


$186.91 valid for 26+ units.

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $243.57 Virco

HCT8 

standard 

color Chair truck, storage cart for folding chairs, 42 chair capacity.

Line 38

	    CHAIR TRUCK


	(84 CHAIR CAPACITY)


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $248.88

Buffalo Business Products 1 $493.59

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $318.48

National 

Public 

Seating 84

$318.48 valid for 1-25 units,


$261.52 valid for 26+ units.

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $410.89 Virco

HCT6072 

standard 

color Chair truck, storage cart for folding chairs, rack style, 84 chair capacity.

Line 39 Workstation Computer Tables



Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $367.93

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $297.77 Scholar Craft FS8793060

Minumim Order 10.


$297.77 valid for 10-50 units,


$282.70 valid for 50+ units.

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $405.23 Virco

873060/(2)TK

BMT27/TWM

P60 standard 

colors

Table, 8700 series, computer table, cantilever leg, 30 x 60 x 1-1/8 high 

pressure laminate particleboard top with backing sheet, adjustable height 

from 22 to 30.





Keyboard Tray, keyboard and mouse tray, for use with half round or 

trapezoidal tables, 27L

Line 40

ArtCo 

Teacher 

Desk D500 	TEACHER DESK

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $415.26

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 1) 1 $93.11 Artco Bell Keyboard tray Optional Keyboard tray for Double pedestal Teacher Desk

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $506.29 Hon 34962

Minimum order 5.


$506.29 valid for 5-10 units,


$476.65 valid for 11-25 units,


$443.00 valid for 26-50 units,


$426.79 valid for 51-100 units.


Call Dan Irons at 432-528-1573 for pricing on 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $1,387.28 Virco

PR3060DP/T

KBMT24 

standard 

colors

Parameter Series, Double-Pedestal Desk, 30" X 60"; 1-1/8 Laminated Top 

W/Vinyl Banding, 1 Rectangular Grommet At Center And A Round 

Grommet At Either End Of Top (Total 2), And Perforated Modesty Panel; 

Adjustable Glides; Box/Box/File And File/File Pedesta



Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 2) 1 $22.48 Artco Bell 3" Casters Optional 3" Casters for Double pedestal teacher desk

Indeco Sales,Inc. (Alt 3) 1 $344.82 Indeco TD3060

Indeco #TD3060 Double Pedestal Teacher Desk. No Casters, No 

Keyboard. Black Frame, medium oak top only

Line 41 HON 5901, 5991 TASK CHAIR

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $101.33

Buffalo Business Products 1 $130.73

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $189.29

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $204.74

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Line 42 HON 5901, 5991 TASK CHAIR

Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $77.16

Buffalo Business Products 1 $101.16

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $160.80

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $204.74

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Line 43 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	2 door - letter


	28 1/2"D w/lock


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $223.45

Buffalo Business Products 1 $274.04

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $326.80

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $192.03 Virco

53VF152D 

standard 

colors File, Vertical, 2-drawer, letter size, with lock, 15W x 26 1/2D x 28H



Line 44 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	3 door - letter


	28 1/2"D w/lock


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Line 45 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	4 door - letter


	28 1/2"D w/lock





Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $290.44

Buffalo Business Products 1 $356.20

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $405.80

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $263.34 Virco

53VF154D 

standard 

colors File, Vertical, 4-drawer, letter size, with lock, 15W x 26 1/2D x 52H

Line 46 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	5 door - letter


	28 1/2"D w/lock


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $389.66

Buffalo Business Products 1 $477.88

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $522.80

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid



Line 47 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	2 door - legal


	28 1/2"D w/lock


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $255.25

Buffalo Business Products 1 $313.04

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $364.29

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $229.45 Virco

53VF182D 

standard 

colors File, Vertical, 2-drawer, legal size, with lock, 18 1/8W x 26 1/2D x 28H

Line 48 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	3 door - legal


	28 1/2"D w/lock


Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Line 49 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	4 door - legal


	28 1/2"D w/lock





Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $325.21

Buffalo Business Products 1 $398.84

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $446.80

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid



Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $304.64 Virco

53VF184D 

standard 

colors File, Vertical, 4-drawer, legal size, with lock, 18 1/8W x 26 1/2D x 52H

Line 50 HON 210 Series

Vertical File Cabinets


	5 door - legal


	28 1/2"D w/lock





Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $434.60

Buffalo Business Products 1 $532.99

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $575.80

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Line 51 HON 400 Series

Lateral File Cabinets


	2 drawer/locking


	Conventional








Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $253.14

Buffalo Business Products 1 $257.92

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $336.29 Hon 572L

Minimum order 5.


$336.29 valid for 5-10 units,


$309.40 valid for 11-25 units,


$301.36 valid for 26-50 units,


$273.00 valid for 51-100 units.


Call Dan Irons at 432-528-1573 for pricing on 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $467.37 Virco

53LF422D 

standard 

colors File, Lateral, 2-drawer with lock, counter weight, 42W x 18 5/8D x 27 3/4H



Line 52 HON 400 Series

Lateral File Cabinets


	3 drawer/locking


	Conventional





Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Virco Sales Corporation 1 No Bid

Line 53 HON 400 Series

Lateral File Cabinets


	4 drawer/locking


	Conventional





Name QTY Unit Price Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Buffalo Business Products 1 $350.48

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $433.33

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 No Bid

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC (Alt 1)1 $521.29 Hon 574L

Minimum order 5.


$521.29 valid for 5-10 units,


$519.07 valid for 11-25 units,


$469.90 valid for 26-50 units,


$458.00 valid for 51-100 units.


Call Dan Irons at 432-528-1573 for pricing on 100+ units

Virco Sales Corporation (Alt 1) 1 $756.48 Virco

53LF424D 

standard 

colors File, Lateral, 4-drawer with lock, counter weight, 42W x 18 5/8D x 52H

Line 54

Catalog bid for Classroom furniture not specifically listed in the 

"line" item  bid section of this bid.

Name QTY Percent Off Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $64.70



Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $30.00

Buffalo Business Products 1 $15.00

Brodhead Garrett 1 $10.00

U S TOY CO INC 1 $5.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 $5.00

Highsmith 1 $5.00

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $0.00

Line 55

Catalog bid for Office furniture not specifically listed in the "line" 

item  bid section of this bid.  The district is requesting bids for HON 

office furniture but will accept bids from other manufacturers.

Name QTY Percent Off Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification

Virco Sales Corporation 1 $64.70

Indeco Sales,Inc. 1 $57.60

Buffalo Business Products 1 $15.00

Long?s Electronics, Inc. 1 $5.00

Lone Star Furnishings, LLC 1 $0.00

Highsmith 1 No Bid

Brodhead Garrett 1 No Bid

U S TOY CO INC 1 No Bid

See Award Summary for Awarded Vendors.


