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Description

Aldinger Company

P/M Serv/Calibration for |

Spectrophotometers

P/M Serv/Calibration |

and Cleaning
Balances and Scales

P/M Serv/Calibration for |

Micropipettors
single channel

P/M Serv/Calibration for |

Multi-channel, 8 channels,
Micropipettors

P/M Serv/Calibration for |

Multi-channel, 12 channels,
Micropipettors

Preventative Maint. Service for
Compound Light
Microscopes

Preventative Maint. Service for
Dissection Scopes

Paintenance Maint. Service for
Stereoscopes

Preventative Maint. Service for
Inverted Scopes

Preventative Maint. Service for |

pH meters

Round Trip Travel Charge
for P/M Service, if any

Midwest Bioservice

Hourly charge for Repair of

Lab Equipment

Round Trip Travel Charges for |

Dallas, TX Kingfisher, OK
Unit Price Unit Price
$60.00 | No Bid
$14.00 | No Bid
$23.00 | No Bid
$80.00| No Bid
$120.00| No Bid
$20.00 | $17.00 |
$20.00 | $17.00 |
$25.00 | $17.00 |
$25.00 | $25.00 |
$45.00 | No Bid
$0.00 $0.00
$136.00] [$ 60.00 |
charged in 15 min.
increments for
actural work time
$204.00| [$ 75.00 |

repair of Lab Equipment, if any

Courier available for
pick-up & delivery for
$30.00




