Fieldhouse Bid Summary

Aluminum Ath. Equp. BSN Sport
Qty Item/Description Price Per |Total Price |Price Per |Total Price
Unit Unit
1 MACH-2/PKG-8
$4,563.75 |$4,563.75 $1,639.86| $1,639.86
STARTING BLOCK PACKAGE (8
Bl OCKS+CART)
48 XLAH-HS-BK
$182.00 $8,736.00 $288.44| $13,845.12
HURDLE, BLACK TUBES
CZ-HURDLE
no bid no bid $110.00| $5,280.00
48 CZ-HURDLE
HURDLE CUSTOMIZATION
5 LHD-XLAH
$520.00 $2,600.00 $287.62| $1,438.10
LANE HURDLE DOLLY,HOLDS 10 XLAH
HIIRDI ES
1 BC-B
$944.00 $474.24 $474.24
BELL-LAP COUNTER W/BASE
8 CcO-4
$5.10 $40.80 $6.43 $51.44
HEAVY-DUTY TRAFFIC CONE, 4"
55 CO-6
$10.60 $561.00 $2.77 $152.35
HEAVY-DUTY TRAFFIC CONE, 6"
4 GAR-36
$100.00 $400.00 $42.07 $168.28
GREAT ALUMINUM RAKE, 36" WIDE
1 IAP-28-O/PKG
$10,177.50 |$10,177.50 | $12,379.02| $12,379.02
HIGH JUMP PACKAGE, 2" TOP PAD,
NDRANGF
Package includes:
(1) IAP-28 Landing Pad with Skirted 2"
Ton
Pad, Orange
(1) IWC-28 Gray Weather Cover
(1 Pair) MJS Mega High Jump Standards
(2) XG4 High Jump Crossbars




BX-HJ/PV
BUNGEE CROSSBAR (HJ/PV)

$61.63

$246.50

$13.32

$53.28

SPV-32XL-O-

HS/PKG

HIGH SCHOOL POLE VAULT PACKAGE,
ORANGE

Package includes:

(1) SPV-32XL Landing Pad with Skirted
2" Ton

Pad

(2) PVB-32XL Side Pads

(1) SWC-32XL Gray Weather Cover

(1) VBC-S Vault Box Safety Collar

(1 Pair) PVS-HSX Pole Vault Standards

(2) XG5 Pole Vault Crossbars

$25,668.75

$25,668.75

$35,891.72

$35,891.72

APT
ALUMINUM POLE TREE

$360.00

$360.00

no bid

PIP

PREMIER INDOOR THROWING
Pl ATEQORM

$5,733.25

$5,733.25

no bid

STB
SYNTHETIC TOE BOARD (LEVEL PAD)

no bid

no bid

no bid

SLT
SECTOR LINE TAPE W/REEL

$318.75

$318.75

$196.72

$196.72

S$S-60

SHOTSTOPPER SYSTEM
(60"l ONG/S"HIGH)

$1,882.75

$1,882.75

no bid

1 Set

LM-8
LANE MARKERS (SET OF 8)

$1,258.00

$1,258.00

$1,998.86

$1,998.86

OF-YW
OFFICIAL'S FLAG, YELLOW/WHITE

$27.37

$82.11

$19.16

$57.48




2 OF-RW
$31.45 $62.90 $19.16 $38.32
OFFICIAL'S FLAG, RED/WHITE
1Set |OMTH-4
$63.54 $63.54 $58.78 $58.78
OFFICIAL'S MEASURING TAPE
HF| PER(AISET)
4 PF30
$29.33 $117.30 $7.63 $30.52
FIBERGLASS TAPE (30M/100")
4 PF60
$38.12 $152.49 $14.66 $58.64
FIBERGLASS TAPE (60M/200')
1 CLI
$743.75 $743.75 $983.44 $983.44
CROSSBAR LOCATION INDICATOR (PV)
2 Pl-B-4
$990.25 $1,980.50 $1,114.03| $2,228.06
PERFORMANCE INDICATOR W/BASE (4-
DIGITS)
8 4 row 15' Pref. Tip-N-Roll Bleacher
$3,950.00 |$31,600.00 | $2,322.34| $18,578.72
1 Scorers Table 10ft
no bid no bid no bid
1 Scores Table 5ft extension
no bid no bid no bid
1 Scores Table 10ft
no bid no bid no bid
1 Scores Table 10ft extension
no bid no bid no bid
Subtotal $56,715.89| $98,293.64| $57,870.27| $95,602.95
Installation none $24,500.00
Delivery $2,750.00 $1,050.00




Wellness Room Bld Summary

Total Fitness y Dog Total Fitness MidWeit Commarclal Fitness | Fitness ritore Johnson Hualth Fitnets | Tha Fitness Connaction: Diewet Hitness
Qty Description Price Per Unit Total Price Prica Per | Total Prica |Price Par | Vatal Prica |Price Per Unit |Total Price Price Per  [Towl Price |Price Per [TowiPrice  |Price Par |[TomalPrice (Pr+V7:AA2 |Total Price |Price Par  |Total Price |Price Per  |Total Price
Unit unit Unkt Unit unit
Powered Treadmills with:
$8.00
P, (] Il
§ $7. $5,420.14) $10,8402 § $6.250.00) ﬂ.ssszd $4,798.40] $4.235.00] $8,470.00 5.00| $4.350.00} $2.899.00] $5738.00/ $2,899.00) $5,798 $2.897. 85,798,
$2.00
Eowsred Eflipticals with;
$5.000.00, §: $3.60450] $14.418 $3.410 $13,640. 9 24 5 $5ea5.00)  $2338000f $209500 0.6 07.6¢ 230.7€| $3.99900]$1599500| $4795.00] $19.180.00|
$4.00
$4.00 Bikos with: SL,050.00 s2.60000] $10.40000] $205950] $8.238 s2.178 1.916.30) $767680| $1.560. 4000) $169500] $6780.00] $1,692.31) $676924| $2 § $ 58,540
Recumbent Bikes with:
$2.00 e 52.250.00 $4,50000 $300000) §6,000.00) $2,368. 4,737, .00 sao0000| $1915.30) $3mama0| S1ms0) J0000) $189500] $37 $2.000.00| $4000.00] §2. 4.7 52.3 4,
Stal with:
52,00 RETFSRE o Foil 57,150,00 $14,500.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00] $6,179.50{ $12,3590d 5,625,00 $11,25000| $3,03520| $6,078.40] $570000]  $11,40000] & $7, $3,955. $7.99 3161237626 $6.68013] $13376.2
00 10,000.00
$6.00 Rowars: $1.200.00 57200.00
Sel! Pownred FanBikes with;
$4.00 56, $2,720.00
LED acreen autputs: Watts - RPM — Calorles - SE0 00 52,400.00
Standard Double - Bolt Down Connected
100 o Eoom Ceama it € it atoucnsun bratcn 2 15522500 53,395.00 572000 $s72000| $514030 $s514036]  $4,990.00] $9.9%0.00) $3251.21) $325121] $20m500]  $2.98500) $4395.00| $4.30500| $3.22931) $322031) §322031| $322031] $322031) $322031
$2.00 |2 Tlor Saddis Rack :

$500.00 .00 $1,050.00 40.00% $391.20 $7BZ 0 5551111 $1,180.00)| 1,487.82] 743.911  $1.487.8)

ls T I
[ 0 [P0 AR marher o 0P omoo  lssamooo | 6 sl eed sl wsol sl e

ST [Poneor M s Bonoh om0 M-MM‘_”MMMM

SubTolal 570,932.00 227,085 00 540,470.00 5133 mm 3133 $13709204 92935000 0,634,649 2080337 3121500 £109.455.00 $23,290.00 57223500 0 | 5105 854 59
Installation 53, 500.00 53,950,060 54,272,396 55,H50.00 D0 53,200 00| 00,00 ? BA5.00 52,985.00]
Dalivery 5400000 | | | _s330043] | ss¥sno0 | .00 | 5180000 | $2.80000 | $268500 | 1 | s3.695.00] 1
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