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WIRING DEVICES (1)

1 SWITCH, MOM CON SPDT COOPER 1895 10 HUBBELL HBL1556I EACH 18.27 182.70 Hubbell HBL1556 93169174 1 23.63 236.30 Hubbell HBL1556-
C SAME EACH 29.79

2 SWITCH, MOM CON SPDT LOCKING COOPER 1895L 10 HUBBELL HBL1556L EACH 22.10 221.00 Hubbell HBL1556L 93169167 1 32.25 322.50 NO BID

3 LOCKING SWITCH, SP 20A COOPER AH1221L 10 HUBBELL HBL1221L EACH 11.16 111.60 Hubbell HBL1221GY 93169224 1 19.25 192.50 Hubbell HBL1221L SAME EACH 31.52

4 KEY, FITS LOCKING SWITCH COOPER AH2000 10 HUBBELL HBL1209 EACH 1.93 19.30 Hubbell HBL1209 93164413 1 2.66 26.60  NO BID

5 CAP, 2P 3W 5-20P COOPER 5366N 30 HUBBELL HBL5366C EACH 9.41 282.30 Hubbell HBL5366C 95005498 1 17.55 526.50 Hubbell HBL5366C SAME EACH 20.61

6 CORD BODY, 2P 3W 5-20R HUBBELL HBL5369C 20 HUBBELL HBL5369 EACH 19.46 389.20 Hubbell HBL5369C 95005496 1 28.96 579.20 Hubbell HBL5369C SAME EACH 34.00

7 CAP, 2P 3W 5-15P ANGLE COOPER 6265 1 HUBBELL HBL5266CA EACH 11.46 11.46 Hubbell HBL5266CA 95005505 1 16.72 16.72    NO BID  

8 BODY, 2P 3W 60-20R COOPER 6869 10 HUBBELL HBL5469C EACH 22.35 223.50 Hubbell HBL5461 88127209 1 22.17 221.70 Hubbell HBL5462 SAME EACH 33.74

9 EXTENSION, HANDY SWITCH & SWITCH TO 4SQ 1/2" & 3/4" KO'S STEEL CITY 531511234UB 50 EACH 2.35 117.50 T&B 531511234UB 90094208 100 1.78 89.00 NO BID

10 250V 15A RECEPTICLE (1X994) HUBBLEL HUBBELL HBL5662 25 EACH 11.46 286.50 Hubbell HBL5662 95005487 1 22.56 564.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 27.55

11 250V 15A CORD CAP (1Z995) HUBBELL HUBBELL HBL5666C 25 EACH 8.40 210.00 Hubbell HBL5666C 95005487 1 15.59 389.75 SAME SAME SAME EACH 18.67

12 SWITCH, QUIET LOCKING LEVITON 1121-2L 10 HUBBELL HBL1221L EACH 11.16 111.60 Hubbell HBL1221L 93169218 1 26.55 265.50 NO BID

13 SWITCH, 20A SP 277V IVORY SIDE LEVITON 1121-2L 10 HUBBELL CS120I EACH 2.75 27.50 Hubbell HBL1221LI 25398262 1 26.55 265.50 NO BID

14 SWITCH, 20A DBL POLE SIDE WIRE LEVITON 1122-2L 10 HUBBELL CSB220I EACH 8.23 82.30 Hubbell HBL1222L 93169210 1 30.02 300.20 Hubbell HBL1221L SAME EACH 31.52

15 SPEC GRADE 20 AMP DUPLEX RECEPTICLE IVORY LEVITON 100 HUBBELL CR20-I EACH 1.74 174.00 Hubbell CR20I 88128229 1 1.35 135.00 Hubbell CR20I SAME EACH 1.73

16 SPEC GRADE 20 AMP DUPLEX RECEPTICLE BROWN LEVITON 100 HUBBELL CR20 EACH 1.82 182.00 Hubbell CR20 88128226 1 1.35 135.00 Hubbell CR20B SAME EACH 1.73

17 SWITCH, SPEC GRADE 3-WAY 20 AMP IVORY LEVITON 100 HUBBELL CS320 EACH 3.96 396.00 Hubbell CS320I 88128291 1 3.18 318.00 Hubbell CS320I SAME EACH 4.39

18 SWITCH, SPEC GRADE 3-WAY 20 AMP BROWN LEVITON 100 HUBBELL CS320-2 EACH 4.06 406.00 Hubbell CS320 88128288 1 3.18 318.00 Hubbell CS320B SAME EACH 4.60

19 SWITCH, Q/L, 20 AMP 120/277V IVORY LEVITON 10 HUBBELL 1221-2I EACH 5.08 50.80 Hubbell HBL1221LI 25398262 1 26.55 265.50    NO BID  

20 SWITCH, Q/L, 20 AMP 120/277V BROWN LEVITON 10 HUBBELL 1221-2 EACH 5.32 53.20 Hubbell HBL1221L 93169218 1 26.55 265.50    NO BID  

21 SWITCH, 20A DBL POLE SIDE WIRE LEVITON 1122-21 10 EACH 0.00 Hubbell 1222I 88126006 1 7.06 70.60 NO BID

22 SPEC GRADE 20A DUPLEX RECEPT BROWN LEVITON 200 HUBBELL CR20 EACH 1.82 364.00 Hubbell CR20 88128226 1 1.35 270.00 Hubbell CR20B SAME EACH 1.73

23 SPEC GRADE 20A DUPLEX RECEPT IVORY LEVITON 200 HUBBELL CR20-I EACH 1.74 348.00 Hubbell CR20I 88128229 1 1.35 270.00 Hubbell CR20I SAME EACH 1.73

24 SPEC GRADE 20A SWITCH, 3-WAY IVORY LEVITON 100 HUBBELL CS320-2I EACH 3.96 396.00 Hubbell CS320I 88128291 1 3.18 318.00 Hubbell CS320I SAME EACH 4.39

25 SPEC GRADE 20A SWITCH, 3-WAY BROWN LEVITON 100 HUBBELL CS320-2 EACH 4.06 406.00 Hubbell CS320 88128288 1 3.18 318.00 Hubbell CS320B SAME EACH 4.60

26 SPEC GRADE 20A SWITCH, 3-WAY LOCKING IVORY LEVITON 50 HUBBELL 1223-2IL EACH 13.51 675.50 Hubbell HBL1223LI 25479018 1 29.27 1,463.50 Hubbell HBL1203L
I SAME EACH

27 SPEC GRADE 20A SWITCH, 3-WAY LOCKING BROWN LEVITON 50 HUBBELL 1223-2L EACH 13.51 675.50 Hubbell HBL1223 93169205 1 20.40 1,020.00 NO BID

28 SWITCH, Q/L, 20A, 120/277 IVORY LEVITON 10 HUBBELL 1221-2I EACH 4.71 47.10 Hubbell HBL1221LI 25398262 1 26.55 265.50 NO BID

29 SWITCH, Q/L, 20A, 120/277 BROWN LEVITON 10 HUBBELL 1221-2 EACH 4.71 47.10 Hubbell HBL1221L 93169218 1 26.55 265.50 NO BID

30 SOCKETS, END (FOUR/TUBE) LEVITON 13353-N 50 EACH 1.21 60.50 Leviton 13353-N 99951844 1 1.08 54.00 Hubbell RL325 SAME EACH 1.92

31 BULB HOLDER, FLOURESCENT (LONG) LEVITON 13357 50 EACH 1.89 94.50 Leviton 13357 96001323 1 2.39 119.50 Hubbell RL320 SAME EACH 1.92

32 RECEPT, 50A 125/250V 3P 3 WIRE LEVITON 5206 10 EACH 3.51 35.10 Hubbell HBL7962 88127690 1 23.69 236.90 Hubbell RR330F SAME EACH 6.44

33 SWITCH, STACKED LEVITON 5224-2L 1 EACH 8.07 8.07 Leviton 5224-2L 88156593 1 7.16 7.16 Hubbell RC101 SAME EACH 6.21

34 COMBO, SWITCH & RECEPT LEVITON 5225 1 EACH 8.30 8.30 Leviton 5225 88156598 1 9.98 9.98 Hubbell RC108 SAME EACH 6.33

35 CORD CAP (MALE) 15A 115V LEVITON 5266N 100 EACH 3.87 387.00 Leviton 5266N 88156691 1 3.84 384.00 Hubbell HBL5266C SAME EACH 15.25

36 BODY, FEM CAP LEVITON 5269C 100 EACH 7.29 729.00 Leviton 5269C 92044549 1 17.91 1,791.00 Hubbell HBL5269C SAME EACH 25.97

37 DUPLEX RECEPT W/ISOLATED GROUND LEVITON 5362-1G 1 EACH 8.81 8.81 Leviton 5362-1G 88156810 1 8.20 8.20 Hubbell IG20CR SAME EACH 6.53

38 RECEPT, 50A 250V (WELD) FL MT LEVITON 5374 1 EACH 11.63 11.63 Leviton 5374 25880611 1 10.31 10.31 Hubbell HBL9367 SAME EACH 36.24

39 KEY FOR LEVITION LOCKING SWITCH LEVITON 55500-PRT 10 EACH 2.90 29.00 Leviton 55500-PRT 88156955 1 2.57 25.70 Hubbell HBL1209 SAME EACH 3.19

40 RECEPT, DUPLEX 20A 125V 2P3WIR LEVITON CR201 10 HUBBELL CR20-I EACH 1.83 18.30 Leviton CR201 88157144 1 1.71 17.10 Hubbell CR20I SAME EACH 1.73

41 RECEPT, SINGLE 2P 3W SIDE WIRE LEVITON 5801-1 1 EACH 2.71 2.71 Leviton 5801-1 88157152 1 2.41 2.41 Hubbell RR151I SAME EACH 1.95

42 RECEPT CFCI 2 AMP 120V IVORY LEVITON 6599-1 100 HUBBELL GFRST15I EACH 14.80 1,480.00 Leviton GFRST20I 25712101 1 14.89 1,489.00 Hubbell GFRST20I SAME EACH 18.23

43 RECEPT CFCI 2 AMP 120V BROWN LEVITON 100 HUBBELL GFRST15I EACH 14.80 1,480.00 Leviton GFRST20 25712102 1 14.89 1,489.00 Hubbell CFRST20 SAME EACH 18.23

44 COVER,  SWITCH SINGLE GANG SS LEVITON 84001 300 EACH 1.21 363.00 Leviton 84001-40 88158366 1 1.30 390.00 Hubbell SS1 SAME EACH 1.40

45 COVER, RECEPT SINGLE GANG DUPLEX S/S LEVITON 84003 250 EACH 1.21 302.50 Leviton 84003-40 90087592 1 1.30 325.00 Hubbell SS8 SAME EACH 1.40

46 COVER, SW & RECEPT COMBO SS LEVITON 84005 50 EACH 3.79 189.50 Leviton 84005-40 88158372 1 4.09 204.50 Hubbell SS18 SAME EACH 3.70

47 COVER, RECEPT & SWITCH SS LEVITON 84007 75 EACH 4.66 349.50 Leviton 84007-40 88158374 1 5.90 442.50 NO BID

48 COVER, 2 GANG SWITCH STAINLESS LEVITON 84009 50 EACH 2.44 122.00 leviton 84009-40 88158376 1 2.60 130.00 Hubbell SS2 SAME EACH 2.89

49 COVER, BLANK 1 GANG SS LEVITON 84014 300 EACH 1.21 363.00 leviton 84014-40 88158384 1 1.30 390.00 Hubbell SS1 SAME EACH 1.40

50 COVER, RECEPT 2 GANG SS LEVITON 84016 50 EACH 2.44 122.00 leviton 84016-40 88158386 1 3.74 187.00 Hubbell SS82 SAME EACH 2.82

51 COVER, 2 GANG BLANK STAINLESS LEVITON 84025 25 EACH 3.79 94.75 leviton 84025-40 88158400 1 2.50 62.50 Hubbell SS23 SAME EACH 4.53

CRESCENT ELECTRIC SUPPLY COMPANYGRAYBAR ELECTRICBORDER STATES ELECTRIC
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52 COVER, DRYER RECEPT SS LEVITON 84026 1 EACH 4.66 4.66 leviton 84026 88158401 1 4.14 4.14 Hubbell SS703 SAME EACH 4.82

53 COVER, GFCI RECEPT SS HUBBELL SS26 35 EACH 1.14 39.90 hubbell SS26 25081045 1 1.19 41.65 SAME SAME SAME EACH 1.40

54 G.F.I. OUTLET COVER RAINPROOF TAYMAC MX 1200 25 0.00 t&b CCSV 88220252 100 225.03 5,625.75 NO BID

55 TOGGLE SWITCH SPST ON-OFF HUBBELL HBL11SP 10 EACH 2.74 27.40 hubbell HBL11SP 88125909 1 4.05 40.50 SAME SAME SAME EACH 7.28

56 SUPPRESSOR, SURGE 5JK48 TRIPPLITE STRIKER 10 HUBBELL HBL7PS1050A EACH 50.00 500.00 tripplite STRIKER 92124062 1 16.29 162.90 NO BID

57 KEY FOR LOCKING HUBBELL SWITCH HUBBELL HBL 1209 10 EACH 1.80 18.00 hubbell HBL1209 93164413 1 2.66 26.60 SAME SAME SAME EACH 3.19
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OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED

MFG 
PART#

VENDOR 
PART #

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

UNIT 
COST

58 RECEPT COVER, 1-GANG DUPLEX RED DOT CCDV 1 EACH 2.43 2.43 Red Dot (T&B) CCDV 88220233 100 214.93 214.93 SAME SAME SAME 100 3.13

59 RECEPT COVER, 4-SQ 2 GANG RED DOT 2CCD 25 EACH 6.60 165.00 Red Dot (T&B) 2CCD 88219811 100 586.15 146.54 SAME SAME SAME 100 9.57

60 COVER, BLANK 2 GANG W/T RED DOT 2CCB 25 EACH 1.23 30.75 Red Dot (T&B) 2CCB 88219809 100 114.14 27.86 SAME SAME SAME 100 1.56

61 COVER, BLANK 1 GANG W/T RED DOT CCB 100 EACH 0.56 56.00 Red Dot (T&B) CCB 88220226 100 55.59 55.59 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.77

62 COVER, 1 GANG DUPLEX 2DOOR W/T RED DOT CCD 25 EACH 2.09 52.25 Red Dot (T&B) CCD 88220228 100 195.58 48.90 SAME SAME SAME 100 2.92

63 BOX, 1 GANG 3 EA 1/2" KO'S RED DOT IH3-1 50 EACH 1.88 94.00 Red Dot (T&B) IH3-1 88220999 100 233.57 116.79 SAME SAME SAME 100 3.02

64 BOX, 1 GANG 4 EA 1/2" KO'S RED DOT 1H4-1 50 EACH 2.14 107.00 Red Dot (T&B) IH4-1 88221003 100 172.58 86.29 SAME SAME SAME 100 2.14

65 BOX, 1 GANG 5 EA 1/2" KO'S SIDE OPEN RED DOT IH5-1 100 EACH 2.68 268.00 Red Dot (T&B) IH5-1 88221007 100 336.88 336.88 SAME SAME SAME 100 4.41

66 OUTLET BOX, 3-3/4" HOLE I GANG RED DOT IH3-2 10 EACH 2.32 23.20 Red Dot (T&B) IH3-2 88221001 100 271.38 27.14 SAME SAME SAME 100 3.67

67 BOX, 1 GANG 4 EA 3/4" KO'S RED DOT IH4-2 10 EACH 2.22 22.20 Red Dot (T&B) IH4-2 88221005 100 319.48 31.95 SAME SAME SAME 100 4.14

68 BOX, 2 GANG 4 EA 3/4" KO'S RED DOT 2IH4-2 10 EACH 5.45 54.50 Red Dot (T&B) 2IH4-2 88220065 100 732.37 73.24 SAME SAME SAME 100 8.75

69 CLUSTER COVER RED DOT LC31 1 EACH 2.19 2.19 Raco 5189-0 88218732 100 1,014.56 10.15 NO BID

70 BOX EXTENSION, 1 GANG 1/2" 3LUG RED DOT IHEF652-1 1 IHEF6S2-1 EACH 13.89 13.89 Red Dot (T&B) IHEF6S2-1 92126307 100 513.81 5.14 NO BID

71 COVER, WP SINGLE SWITCH RED DOT CCSV 50 EACH 2.48 124.00 red dot (T&B) CCSV 88220252 100 225.03 112.52 SAME SAME SAME 100 3.77

72 COVER, BLANK HANDY BOX STEEL CITY 58 C 1 10 EACH 0.53 5.30 Steel City T&B 58 C 1 88254875 100 56.30 5.63 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.59

73 COVER, RECEPT HANDY BOX STEEL CITY 58 C 7 1 EACH 0.56 0.56 Steel City T&B 58 C 7 88254882 100 56.36 0.56 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.64

74 BOX, 2-1/8"W X 1-7/8D 1/2"KO STEEL CITY 58361 1/2 1    EACH 0.98 0.98 Steel City T&B 58361 1/2 88254885 100 93.50 0.94 SAME SAME SAME 100 1.01

75 EXTENSION 2-1/8"W X 1-7/8"D STEEL CITY 59361 1/2 1    EACH 2.22 2.22 Steel City T&B 59361 1/2 88254892 100 275.38 2.75 SAME SAME SAME 100 4.29

76 BOX, 4SQ x 2-1/8"D 1/2" & 3/4" KO STEEL CITY 132-W-SPL 200 EACH 5.14 1,028.00 Steel City T&B 132-W-SPL 88037392 100 294.51 590.00 SAME SAME SAME 100 3.97

77 COVER, BLANK 4" SQUARE STEEL CITY 52 C 1 100 EACH 0.29 29.00 Steel City T&B 52 C 1 88254740 100 28.27 28.27 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.34

78 COVER 1/2"KO 4" SQUARE STEEL CITY 52 C 6 1 EACH 0.57 0.57 Steel City T&B 52 C 6 88254772 100 49.03 0.49 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.60

79 PLASTER RING SQUARE/FLT 2GNG STEEL CITY 52 C 00 1 EACH 1.89 1.89 Steel City T&B 52 C 00 88254739 100 162.58 1.63 SAME SAME SAME 100 2.34

80 COVER, 4SQ 2-RECEPT 1/2" RAISED STEEL CITY RS 8 60 EACH 1.27 76.20 Steel City T&B RS 8 88255106 100 114.61 68.77 SAME SAME SAME 100 1.39

81 COVER, 4SQ 1-RECEPT 1/2" RAISED STEEL CITY RS 12 30 EACH 1.04 31.20 Steel City T&B RS 12 88255097 100 96.92 29.10 SAME SAME SAME 100 1.18

82 COVER, 4SQ 1-TGL SW 1/2" RAISED STEEL CITY RS 9 1 EACH 1.26 1.26 Steel City T&B RS 9 88255107 100 112.75 1.13 SAME SAME SAME 100 1.37

83 BOX, 4 SQUARE 1/2" KO DEEP STEEL CITY 521711234E 150 EACH 1.25 187.50 Steel City T&B 521711234E 90087148 100 94.05 141.07 SAME SAME SAME 100 1.13

84 BOX, 4" SQUARE 1/2" KO STEEL CITY 521511234EW 1 EACH 0.78 0.78 Steel City T&B 521511234EW 90061855 100 61.93 0.62 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.82

85 EXTENSION, 4 SQUARE 1/2" KO'S STEEL CITY 53151 1/2 200    EACH 2.65 530.00 Steel City T&B 53151 1/2 88254818 100 179.75 360.00 SAME SAME SAME 100 2.39

86 BOX, 2 GANG 1/2" & 3/4" KO'S STEEL CITY 52151 1/2 3/4 150 EACH 0.78 117.00 Steel City T&B 52151 1/2 3/4 88254780 100 68.70 103.50 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.87

87 BOX, TIGER 1/2" KO'S STEEL CITY CDOWTG-25 100 EACH 5.88 588.00 Steel City T&B CDOWTG-25 90009638 100 347.96 347.96 SAME SAME SAME 100 4.63

88 REDUCING WASHER 2" X 1-1/4" STEEL CITY WA164 1 EACH 0.30 0.30 Steel City T&B WA 164 88254612 100 32.24 0.32 DOTTIE RW64 SAME 100 0.63

89 REDUCING WASHER 3/4" X 1/2" STEEL CITY WA121 50 EACH 0.07 3.50 Steel City T&B WA 121 88254599 100 7.39 3.70 DOTTIE RW21 SAME 100 0.13

90 SNAP IN SEAL 1/2" STEEL CITY BL111 50 EACH 0.17 8.50 Steel City T&B BL 111 88253810 100 13.37 6.69 DOTTIE K050 SAME 100 0.36

91 SANP IN SEAL 3/4" STEEL CITY BL112 50 EACH 0.20 10.00 Steel City T&B BL 112 88253811 100 18.41 9.21 DOTTIE KO75 SAME 100 0.46

92 SNAP IN SEAL 1" STEEL CITY BL113 1 EACH 0.40 0.40 Steel City T&B BL 113 88253812 100 34.97 0.35 DOTTIE KO100 SAME 100 0.77

93 COUPLING, RIGID 1/2" ANY 500 EACH 0.84 420.00 any 1/2-GALV-COUP 88273103 100 69.54 350.00 PICOMA CESCO 8944 100 1.21

94 COVER, BRASS DUPLEX RECEPT HUBBELL S3825 25 EACH 82.91 2,072.75 hubbell S3825 88128993 1 69.76 1,744.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 81.94

95 COVER, BRASS ROUND HUBBELL S3925 10 EACH 79.29 792.90 hubbell S3925 88128994 1 65.94 659.40 SAME SAME SAME EACH 77.44

96 PLUG, 1/2" RAINTITE ANY 1 HOFFMAN AS050 EACH 8.10 8.10 hoffman AS050 88132455 1 7.18 7.18 HOFFMAN AS050 SAME EACH 8.25

97 PLUG, 3/4" RAINTITE ANY 1 HOFFMAN AS075 EACH 10.20 10.20 hoffman AS075 88132457 1 9.04 9.04 HOFFMAN AS075 SAME EACH 10.35

98 BOX 12" X 12" X 4" SCI ANY 1 HOFFMAN ASE12X12X4 EACH 24.22 24.22 hoffman ASE12X12X4 88132482 1 19.12 19.12 HOFFMAN ASE12X12
X4 SAME EACH 22.00

CONDUIT & FITTINGS (3) MFG 
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PART #
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UNIT OF 
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99 1/2" UNISTRUT CLAMP (HANGER) ANY 300 TNB 700-1/2-STR EACH 1.18 354.00 Bline B2208PAZN 88035506 100 47.28 141.84 UNISTRUT P1112ASE
G SAME 100 1.47

100 HANGER, 3/4" PIPE, UNISTRUT ANY 300 TNB 700-3/4-EG EACH 1.30 390.00 Bline B2209PAZN 88035509 100 49.39 148.17 UNISTRUT P1212ASE
G SAME 100 0.46

101 1" UNISTRUT CLAMP (HANGER) ANY 300 TNB 700-1-EG EACH 1.52 456.00 Bline B2210PAZN 88035515 100 56.26 168.78 UNISTRUT P1213ASE
G SAME 100 0.56
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102 2" UNISTRUT CLAMP (HANGER) ANY 100 TNB 700-2-STR EACH 2.01 201.00 Bline B2213PAZN 88303126 100 82.00 82.00 UNISTRUT P1217ASE
G SAME 100 0.87

103 HANGER, 3/4" COPPER UNISTRUT ANY 1 0.00 No Bid n/a 0.00 NO BID

104 LOCK NUT, 1/2" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 101 100 TNB LN101SC EACH 0.09 9.00 Arlingotn 401 90095763 100 6.16 6.16 DOTTIE LN50 SAME 100 0.11

105 LOCK NUT, 3/4" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 102 100 TNB LN102 EACH 0.10 10.00 Arlingotn 402 90095764 100 8.12 8.12 DOTTIE LN75 SAME 100 0.14

106 LOCKNUT, 1" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 103 50 TNB LN103 EACH 0.22 11.00 Arlingotn 403 90095766 100 13.94 6.97 DOTTIE LN100 SAME 100 0.24

107 CHASE NIPPLE, 1/2" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 1102 25 TNB HA-201 EACH 0.41 10.25 Arlingotn 501 90082646 100 17.85 4.46 DOTTIE CN50 SAME 100 0.39

108 CHASE NIPPLE, 3/4" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 1103 25 TNB HA-202 EACH 0.61 15.25 Arlingotn 502 90082647 100 35.28 8.82 DOTTIE CN75 SAME 100 0.64

109 BUSHING, 3/4" X 1/2" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 1161 100 TNB RB121 EACH 0.65 65.00 Dottie R352 90009848 100 59.02 59.02 DOTTIE R352 SAME 100 0.77

110 BUSHING, 1" X 3/4" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 1163 50 TNB RB132 EACH 1.05 52.50 Dottie R354 90009843 100 102.76 51.38 DOTTIE R354 SAME 100 1.34

111 NIPPLE, OFFSET 1/2" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 1520 50 TNB HO-221 EACH 3.01 150.50 Arlingotn 6A3 90082665 100 116.77 58.39 DOTTIE ON50 SAME 100 1.21

112 NIPPLE, OFFSET, 3/4" BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 1521 30 TNB HO-222 EACH 3.43 102.90 Arlingotn 6A4 90082666 100 143.38 43.01 DOTTIE ON75 SAME 100 1.60

113 COMPRESSION STEEL CONNECTOR 1/2" EMT COMP R/T BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 250 1 CROUSE 

HINDS 1650RT EACH 0.70 0.70 t&b TC711A 22052477 100 31.98 31.98 KONKORE CCR50 SAME 100 0.68

114 CONNECTOR, 3/4" EMT R/T BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 251 500 CROUSE 

HINDS 1651RT EACH 0.88 440.00 t&b TC712A 22047124 100 45.71 228.55 KONKORE CCR75 SAME 100 0.99

115 CONNECTOR, 1" EMT R/T BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 252 500 CROUSE 

HINDS 1652RT EACH 1.37 685.00 t&b TC713A 22052486 100 77.94 389.70 KONKORE CCR100 SAME 100 1.57

116 COUPLING, 1/2" EMT COMP R/T BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 260 500 CROUSE 

HINDS 660RT EACH 0.59 295.00 t&b TK1110A-RT 25250065 100 444.66 222.33 KONKORE CKR50 SAME 100 0.78

117 COUPLING 3/4" EMT R/T BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 261 500 CROUSE 

HINDS 661RT EACH 0.78 390.00 t&b TK112AN-RT 25723841 100 92.70 463.50 KONKORE CKR75 SAME 100 1.05

118 COUPLING, 1" EMT COMP R/T BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 262 10 CROUSE 

HINDS 662RT EACH 1.48 14.80 t&b TK113AN-RT 25723842 100 157.12 15.71 KONKORE CKR100 SAME 100 1.46

119 ADAPTOR, 3/4" RIGID TO 3/4" EMT BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 291 10 TNB HT-222 EACH 5.75 57.50 Bridgeport 291-DC 88031632 100 229.61 22.96  NO BID

120 CONNECTOR, 3/8" LIQUID TITE BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 429 250 TNB LT38T-SC EACH 2.46 615.00 Crouse Hinds LT38 88073419 100 249.60 624.00 T&B 5331 SAME 100 3.79

121 CONNECTOR, 1/2" STRAIGHT L/T BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 430 250 TNB LT50T-SC EACH 1.95 487.50 Crouse Hinds LT50 88073425 100 249.61 624.02 T&B 5332 SAME 100 3.41

122 CONNECTOR, 3/4" L/T FLEX STRAIGHT BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 431 100 TNB LT75T-SC EACH 2.68 268.00 Crouse Hinds LT75 88073432 100 356.46 356.56 T&B 5333 SAME 100 5.00

123 ELBOW, 1/2" X 90 FLEX L/T CONNECTOR BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 470 150 TNB LT950T-SC EACH 2.73 409.50 Crouse Hinds LT5090 88073428 100 386.00 579.00 T&B 5352 SAME 100 6.25

124 ELBOW, 3/4" X 90 FLEX L/T CONNECTOR BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 471 150 TNB LT975T-SC EACH 3.18 477.00 Crouse Hinds LT7590 88073434 100 589.28 883.92 T&B 5353 SAME 100 9.43

125 CONNECTOR, 1/2" FLEX SCREW IN BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 520 1 TNB XC241 EACH 0.73 0.73 arlington GF50 90095771 100 20.71 20.71 ARLINGTON GF50 SAME 100 0.47

126 CONNECTOR, 3/4" FLEX SCREW IN BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 521 1 TNB XC242 EACH 1.98 1.98 arlington GF75 91028696 100 37.94 37.94 ARLINGTON GF75 SAME 100 0.95

127 CONNECTOR, 3/8" STRAIGHT FLEX BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 565 300 TNB XC400 EACH 1.03 309.00 arlington GF38 90082717 100 29.37 88.11 ARLINGTON GF38 SAME 100 0.52

128 CONNECTOR, ROMEX 1/2" (3/8') BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 650 300 TNB NC301 EACH 0.39 117.00 arlington 841 90095752 100 20.48 61.44 ARLINGTON 841 SAME 100 0.35

129 ANGLE CONNECTOR 1/2" FLEX SQUEEZE BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 804 200 TNB XC491 EACH 1.88 376.00 arlington 851 90082691 100 71.32 142.64 T&B XC491 SAME 100 2.34

130 ANGLE CONNECTOR, 3/4" FLEX SQUEEZE BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 806 200 TNB XC492 EACH 2.68 536.00 arlington 852 90082693 100 128.61 257.22 T&B XC492 SAME 100 3.27

131 PULL ELBOW, 1/2" X 90 BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 81 200 TNB HL601 EACH 2.92 584.00 arlington HL5000 97099091 100 260.17 520.34 T&B HL601 SAME 100 8.70

132 PULL ELBOW, 3/4" X 90 BRIDGEPOR
T FITTINGS 82 10 TNB HL602 EACH 4.53 45.30 arlington HL7500 97099092 100 309.75 30.97 T&B HL602 SAME 100 13.14

133 ALUMA FLEX 1/2" 100' ANY 1 100' 37.88 37.88 any ALUM 1/2-100FT 88272960 100 36.52 36.52 ALLIED 727 SAME 100FT 44.55

134 ALUMA FLEX 3/4" 100' ANY 1 100' 52.19 52.19 any ALUM 3/4-100FT 88272965 100 50.22 50.22 ALLIED 728 SAME 100FT 60.93

135 CONDUIT, EMT 1/2" 10' ANY 2000 10' 3.94 788.00 any 1/2-EMT 88272937 100 40.34 806.80 ALLIED 8914 SAME 100FT 42.65

136 CONDUIT, EMT 3/4" 10' ANY 2000 10' 6.92 1,384.00 any 3/4-EMT 88272942 100 70.93 1,418.60 ALLIED 8915 SAME 100FT 74.99

137 CONDUIT, EMT 1" 10' ANY 10 10' 11.82 11.82 arlington 1-EMT 88272936 100 121.16 12.12 ALLIED 8916 SAME 100FT 128.08

138 HANGER, 1/2" EMT, MINNERALLAC ANY 10 CADDY CD0B EACH 0.62 6.20 arlington 2000 91029031 100 21.91 2.19 DOTTIE PH50B SAME 100 0.41

139 HANGER, 3/4" EMT, MINNERALLAC ANY 10 CADDY CD1B EACH 0.69 6.90 arlington 2010 91029030 100 23.78 2.38 DOTTIE PH75B SAME 100 0.48

140 HANGER, 1" EMT, MINNERALLAC ANY 1 CADDY CD2B EACH 0.91 0.91 arlington 2020 91029028 100 26.52 26.52 DOTTIE PH100B SAME 100 0.56

141 STRAP, 1/2" 2-HOLE (EMT) ANY 300 TNB TS901 EACH 0.13 39.00 arlington 360 91029178 100 4.15 12.45 STEEL CITY TS101 SAME 100 0.10

142 STRAP, 1/2" 2-HOLE (RIGID) ANY 1 TNB HS901 EACH 0.10 0.10 arlington 350 91029184 100 3.60 3.60 T&B HS901 SAME 100 0.09

143 STRAP, 3/4" 2-HOLE (EMT) ANY 300 TNB TS902 EACH 0.16 48.00 arlington 361 91029179 100 5.78 17.34 T&B TS902 SAME 100 0.25

144 STRAP, 1" 2-HOLE (EMT) ANY 200 TNB TS903 EACH 0.31 62.00 arlington 362 91029180 100 8.60 17.20 T&B TS903 SAME 100 0.41

145 STRAP, 1" 2-HOLE (RIGID) ANY 200 TNB HS903 EACH 0.16 32.00 arlington 352 91029186 100 7.33 14.66 T&B HS903 SAME 100 0.18

146 STRAP, 1-1/2" 2 HOLE (EMT) ANY 200 TNB TS905 EACH 0.47 94.00 arlington 364 91029182 100 17.83 35.66 T&B TS905 SAME 100 0.68

147 STRAP, 2" 2-HOLE (RIGID) ANY 1 TNB HS906 EACH 0.33 0.33 arlington 355 91029189 100 33.09 0.33 T&B HS906 SAME 100 0.42

148 STRAP, 2-1/2" 2 HOLE (EMT) ANY 1 TNB HS907 EACH 0.60 0.60 arlington 356 91029190 100 40.21 0.40  NO BID

149 HANGER 2" PIPE ANY 10 CADDY CD5B EACH 1.78 17.80 arlington 2050 91029025 100 60.39 6.04 DOTTIE PH200B SAME 100 1.29

150 STRAP, 1/4" 1-HOLE (TUBING) ANY 1 DOTTIE TW14 EACH 0.12 0.12 arlington 310 91029204 100 5.54 5.54 DOTTIE TW14 SAME 100 0.07

151 STRAP, 3/8" 1-HOLE (TUBING) ANY 1 DOTTIE TW38 EACH 0.19 0.19 arlington 311 93149726 100 3.88 3.88 DOTTIE TW38 SAME 100 0.08

152 STRAP, 1/2" 1-HOLE (JIFFY) ANY 1000 TNB TS101 EACH 0.08 80.00 T&B HS 100 SC 88254077 100 15.04 150.40 NO BID

153 STRAP, 3/4" 1-HOPE (EMT) ANY 1000 TNB TS102 EACH 0.14 140.00 arlington 371 91029173 100 6.66 66.60 NO BID
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154 STRAP, 3/4" 1-HOLE (RIGID) ANY 10 TNB HS102 EACH 0.15 1.50 arlington 341 91029195 100 11.32 1.13 NO BID

155 STRAP, 1" 1-HOLE (EMT) ANY 10 TNB TS103 EACH 0.25 2.50 arlington 372 91029174 100 10.70 1.07 NO BID

156 STRAP, 1-1/2" 1-HOLE (EMT) ANY 10 TNB TS105 EACH 0.65 6.50 arlington 374 91029176 100 32.68 3.27 NO BID

157 STRAP, 3/4" 1-HOLE (RIGID) ANY 1 TNB HS102 EACH 0.15 0.15 arlington 341 91029195 100 11.32 0.11 NO BID

158 STRAP, 1" 1-HOLE (EMT) ANY 1 TNB TS103 EACH 0.25 0.25 arlington 372 91029174 100 10.70 0.11 NO BID

159 STRAP, 1-1/2" 1-HOLE (EMT) ANY 1 TNB TS105 EACH 0.65 0.65 arlington 374 91029176 100 32.68 0.33 NO BID

160 LIQUID TIGHT 1/2" 100' METALLIC ANY 1000 100' 45.68 456.80 any 1/2 GRY 100FT C 95076749 100 80.02 800.20 NO BID

161 LIQUID TIGHT 3/4" 100' METALIC ANY 1000 100' 110.48 1,104.80 any 3/4 GRY 100FT C 95076751 100 108.92 1,089.20 NO BID

162 1/2 1-HOLE STRAP T&B ANY TS101 1 TNB EACH 0.08 0.08 T&B TS 101 88254493 100 7.73 0.08 SAME SAME SAME 100 0.10

163 1/2: EMT ANY 1 0.00 any 1/2-EMT 88272937 100 40.34 0.40 ALLIED 8914 SAME 10FT 4.26

FUSES (4) MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED

MFG 
PART#

VENDOR 
PART #

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

UNIT 
COST

164 FUSE, GLASS AGC4 PGK5 BUSSMANN AGC-4 40 LITTELFUSE 312004P EACH 0.86 34.40 Bussmann AGC-4 88049906 100 125.06 50.02 NO BID

165 FUSE, 10 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-10 35 LITTELFUSE FLNR010 EACH 6.31 220.85 bussmann FRN-R-10 88050650 1 5.21 182.35 SAME SAME SAME EACH 4.13

166 FUSE, 15 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-15 35 LITTELFUSE FLNR015 EACH 5.06 177.10 bussmann FRN-R-15 88050655 1 4.20 147.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 2.19

167 FUSE, 100 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-100 25 LITTELFUSE FLNR100ID EACH 22.06 551.50 bussmann FRN-R-100 88050651 1 17.30 432.50 SAME SAME SAME EACH 12.38

168 FUSE, 125 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-125 25 LITTELFUSE FLNR125ID EACH 48.51 1,212.75 bussmann FRN-R-125 88050654 1 38.07 951.75 SAME SAME SAME EACH 27.85

169 FUSE, 150 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-150 25 LITTELFUSE FLNR125ID EACH 48.51 1,212.75 bussmann FRN-R-150 88050657 1 38.07 951.75 SAME SAME SAME EACH 27.85

170 FUSE, 20 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FNR-R-20 25 LITTELFUSE FLNR020 EACH 5.06 126.50 bussmann FRN-R-20 88050665 1 4.20 105.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 2.91

171 FUSE, 200 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-200 20 LITTELFUSE FLNR200ID EACH 48.51 970.20 bussmann FRN-R-200 88050666 1 38.07 761.40 SAME SAME SAME EACH 27.58

172 FUSE, 25 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-25 25 LITTELFUSE FLNR025 EACH 5.06 126.50 bussmann FRN-R-25 88050668 1 4.20 105.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 2.94

173 FUSE, 30 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-30 50 LITTELFUSE FLNR030 EACH 5.06 253.00 bussmann FRN-R-30 88050674 1 4.20 210.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 2.91

174 FUSE, 40 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-40 50 LITTELFUSE FLNR040ID EACH 9.80 490.00 bussmann FRN-R-40 88050681 1 7.64 382.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 5.32

175 FUSE, 50 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-50 25 LITTELFUSE FLNR050ID EACH 9.80 245.00 bussmann FRN-R-50 88050687 1 7.64 191.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 5.32

176 FUSE, 60 AMP 240 VOLT BUSSMANN FRN-R-60 50 LITTELFUSE FLNR060ID EACH 9.80 490.00 bussmann FRN-R-60 88050692 1 7.64 382.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 5.32

177 FUSE, 10 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-10 50 LITTELFUSE FLSR010ID EACH 13.50 675.00 bussmann FRS-R-10 88050714 1 10.51 525.50 SAME SAME SAME EACH 7.42

178 FUSE, 15 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-15 50 LITTELFUSE FLSR015ID EACH 11.90 595.00 bussmann FRS-R-15 88050719 1 9.28 464.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 6.61

179 FUSE, 20 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-20 100 LITTELFUSE FLSR020ID EACH 11.90 1,190.00 bussmann FRS-R-20 88050729 1 9.28 928.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 6.61

180 FUSE, 200 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-200 50 LITTELFUSE FLSR200ID EACH 84.44 4,222.00 bussmann FRS-R-200 88050730 1 65.78 3,289.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 43.65

181 FUSE, 25 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-25 50 LITTELFUSE FLSR025ID EACH 11.90 595.00 bussmann FRS-R-25 88050732 1 9.28 464.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 6.74

182 FUSE, 3 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-3 50 LITTELFUSE FLSR003ID EACH 13.50 675.00 bussmann FRS-R-3 88050734 1 10.51 525.50 SAME SAME SAME EACH 7.49

183 FUSE, 30 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-30 100 LITTELFUSE FLSR030ID EACH 11.90 1,190.00 bussmann FRS-R-30 88050738 1 9.28 928.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 6.61

184 FUSE 8 AMP (BUSS KTK-R8) BUSSMANN KTK-R8 1 LITTELFUSE KLKR008 EACH 13.01 13.01 bussmann KTK-R-8 88052143 1 13.63 13.63 SAME SAME SAME EACH 12.21

185 FUSE, 35 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-35 1 LITTELFUSE FLSR035ID EACH 20.43 20.43 bussmann FRS-R-35 88050740 1 15.91 15.91 SAME SAME SAME EACH 11.15

186 FUSE, 40 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-40 100 LITTELFUSE FLSR040ID EACH 20.43 2,043.00 bussmann FRS-R-40 88050745 1 15.91 1,591.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 10.94

187 FUSE, 45 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-45 100 LITTELFUSE FLSR045ID EACH 20.43 2,043.00 bussmann FRS-R-45 88050747 1 15.91 1,591.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 11.15

188 FUSE, 5 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-5 1 LITTELFUSE FLSR005ID EACH 13.50 13.50 bussmann FRS-R-5 88050749 1 10.51 10.51 SAME SAME SAME EACH 10.94

189 FUSE, 50 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-50 100 LITTELFUSE FLSR050ID EACH 20.43 2,043.00 bussmann FRS-R-50 88050751 1 15.91 1,591.00 SAME SAME SAME EACH 10.94

190 FUSE, 60 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-60 50 LITTELFUSE FLSR060ID EACH 20.43 1,021.50 bussmann FRS-R-60 88050756 1 15.91 795.50 SAME SAME SAME EACH 10.94

191 FUSE, 80 AMP 600 VOLT BUSSMANN FRS-R-80 1 LITTELFUSE FLSR080ID EACH 42.21 42.21 bussmann FRS-R-80 88050765 1 32.89 32.89 SAME SAME SAME EACH 22.60

192 BLOCK, FUSE 15A 32V BUSSMANN 1DL30 BUSSMANN HRK 1 LITTELFUSE 150145 EACH 5.39 5.39 bussmann HRK 88051462 1 4.98 4.98 SAME SAME SAME EACH 7.26

193 FUSE, BUSSMANN 40 AMP 300V VFA BUSSMANN JJN40 1 LITTELFUSE JLLN040 EACH 14.59 14.59 bussmann JJN-40 88051681 1 16.80 16.80 SAME SAME SAME EACH 46.35

194 FUSE, BUSSMANN 60 AMP 300V VFA BUSSMANN JJN60 10 LITTELFUSE JLLN060 EACH 13.00 130.00 bussmann JJN-60 88051688 1 14.55 145.50 SAME SAME SAME EACH 11.26

195 FUSE, KTK-5 BUSSMANN KTK-5 1 LITTELFUSE KLK005 EACH 11.30 11.30 bussmann KTK-5 88052113 1 11.66 11.66 SAME SAME SAME EACH 7.10

PVC (5) MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
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MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
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196 ADAPTOR, 1-1/2" MALE ELECT PVC ANY 1 EACH 0.43 0.43 any TA-1-1/2 88285282 100 31.14 0.31 1-1/2 TA SAME SAME 100 0.53

197 ADAPTER, 1/2" FEMALE ANY 1 EACH 0.15 0.15 any FA-1/2 88285286 100 12.04 0.12 1/2 FA SAME SAME 100 0.16

198 ADAPTER, 3/4" FEMALE PVC/GREY ANY 10 EACH 0.22 2.20 any FA-3/4 88285287 100 18.65 1.87 3/4 FA SAME SAME 100 0.26

199 COUPLING, 1/2" ELECT PVC ANY 10 EACH 0.09 0.90 any COUP-1/2 88215632 100 7.85 0.79 1/2 COUP SAME SAME 100 0.10

200 COUPLING, 3/4" ELECT PVC ANY 10 EACH 0.12 1.20 any COUP-3/4 88215637 100 9.66 0.97 3/4 COUP SAME SAME 100 0.12

201 COUPLING, 1" ELECT PVC ANY 10 EACH 0.18 1.80 any COUP-1 88215633 100 14.67 1.47 1 PVC COUP SAME SAME 100 0.19

202 COUPLING, 1 1/4" ELECT PVC ANY 10 EACH 0.24 2.40 any COUP-1-1/4 88215631 100 17.54 1.75 1-1/4 PVC 
COUP SAME SAME 100 0.29

203 ELBOW, 1/2" X 90 ELEC PVC ANY 1 EACH 0.37 0.37 any ELL-90-1/2-EXP- 93172186 100 32.87 32.87 1/2 PVC 
Elbow SAME SAME 100 3.49
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204 ELBOW, 3/4" X 90 ELECT PVC ANY 10 EACH 0.40 4.00 any ELL-90-3/4-EXP- 93172187 100 37.13 3.71 3/4 PVC 
Elbow SAME SAME 100 3.49

205 ELBOW 1-1/4" X 90 ELECT PVC ANY 10 EACH 0.90 9.00 any LL-90-1-1/4-EXP 93172189 100 80.81 8.08 NO BID

206 CONDUIT, PVC 1/2" GREY 10' ANY 1 EACH 1.68 1.68 any PVC-1/2 88215680 100 18.67 18.67 1/2 PVC SAME SAME 100FT 21.33

207 CONDUIT, PVC 3/4" GREY 10' ANY 10 EACH 2.01 20.10 any PVC-3/4 88215685 100 22.43 2.24 3/4 PVC SAME SAME 100FT 25.50

208 CONDUIT, PVC 1" GREY 10' ANY 10 EACH 2.94 29.40 any PVC-1 88215681 100 32.75 3.28 NO BID

SWITCH GEAR & CIRCUIT BREAKERS (6) MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED

MFG 
PART#

VENDOR 
PART #

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

UNIT 
COST

209 NEMA 3 HD 3 PHASE/ 1PHASE DISCONNECT SWITCH 60A 
240V/RT SQUARE D D321NRB 35 EATON DG321NRB EACH 86.27 3,019.45 Square D D321NRB 88239381 1 91.33 3,196.55 NO BID

210 NEMA 3 HD 3 PHASE/ 1PHASE DISCONNECT SWITCH 30A 
240V/RT SQUARE D D322NRB 35 EATON DG322NRB EACH 106.41 3,724.35 Square D D322NRB 88239385 1 137.47 4,811.45 NO BID

211 SOCKET, RELAY 8PIN SER B SQUARE D 8501NR42 1 0.00 square d 8501NR42 91027837 1 30.68 30.68 NO BID

212 CONTACTOR, 3P,40A, 120V COIL SQUARE D 8910DPA43V0
2 15 0.00 square d 8910DPA43V02 89023642 1 97.29 1,459.35 NO BID

213 SWITCH, AUXILIARY FOR CONT. SQUARE D 9999D10 16 0.00 square d 9999D10 89024226 1 14.09 225.44 NO BID

214 FUSABLE PULLOUT SQUARE D FP222R 1 0.00 square d L211N 97105429 1 59.02 59.02 NO BID

215 CONTACTOR, TELEMECANIQUE SQUARE D LC1K0910F7 1 0.00 square d LC1K0910F7 95029094 1 67.58 67.58 NO BID

216 ADAPTOR BLOCK SQUARE D SS2PL 1 0.00 square d SS2PL 90078070 1 96.22 96.22 NO BID

217 NEMA 3 HD 3 PHASE 1 PHASE SAFETY SWITCH 30A 480/600 R/T SQUARE D H361RB 45 EATON DH361FRK EACH 259.13 11,660.85 square d H361RB 88240620 1 323.28 14,547.60 NO BID

218 NEMA 3 HD 3 PHASE 1 PHASE SAFETY SWITCH 60A 480/600 R/T SQUARE D H362RB 40 EATON DH362FRK EACH 312.26 12,490.40 square d H362RB 88240633 1 379.38 15,175.20 NO BID

219 BREAKER, 20A 1P STAB IN SQUARE D Q0120 25 0.00 square d QO120 88242626 1 9.03 225.75 NO BID

220 BREAKER, 20A PIGGY BACK SQUARE D QO2020 15 0.00 square d QO2020 88242745 1 49.58 743.70 NO BID

221 BREAKER, 40A PIGGY BACK SQUARE D QO240 15 0.00 square d QO240 88242806 1 19.80 297.00 NO BID

222 BREAKER, 25A 1P BOLT IN SQUARE D QOB125 25 0.00 square d QOB125 88243054 1 22.02 550.50 NO BID

223 BREAKER,, 30A 1P BOLT IN SQUARE D QOB130 15 0.00 square d QOB130 88243058 1 22.02 330.30 NO BID

224 BREAKER, 40A 2P BOLT IN SQUARE D QOB240 15 0.00 square d QOB240 88243100 1 49.24 738.60 NO BID

225 BREAKER, 50A 2P BOLT IN SQUARE D QOB250 1 0.00 square d QOB250 88243104 1 49.24 49.24 NO BID

226 RELAY, REM/CNTRL, 3WIR, 24V BUSSMANN RR9 1 0.00 no bid no bid n/a 0.00 NO BID

227 BREAKER, 25AMP 1POLE BOLT IN GOULD BQ1B025 15 0.00 no bid no bid n/a 0.00 NO BID

228 BREAKER, 1P 20A STAB IN GOULD Q120 10 0.00 no bid no bid n/a 0.00 NO BID

229 BREAKER, 1P 25A STAB IN GOULD Q125 10 0.00 no bid no bid n/a 0.00 NO BID

230 CONTACTOR, 30AMP 110V SQUARE D 8910DPA33V0
2Y122 1 0.00 square d 10DPA33V02Y12 97252463 1 87.30 87.30 NO BID

WIRE (7) MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED

MFG 
PART#

VENDOR 
PART #

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

UNIT 
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231 WIRE, STRANDED #10 GREEN 500' ANY 15 500' 87.71 2,631.30 any HN-10-STR-GRN- 88284538 1,000 167.28 2,509.20 SOUTHWIRE THHN-10-
GR SAME 1000 500.64

232 WIRE, STRANDED #10 ORANGE 500' ANY 15 500' 87.71 2,631.30 any HN-10-STR-ORN- 88284534 1,000 167.28 2,509.20 SOUTHWIRE THHN-10-
OR SAME 1000 500.64

233 WIRE, STRANDED #10 WHITE 500' ANY 15 500' 87.71 2,631.30 any N-10-STR-WHT- 88284526 1,000 167.28 2,509.20 SOUTHWIRE THHN-10-
WH SAME 1000 500.64

234 WIRE, SOLID 12BL THHN 500FT ANY 1 500' 53.54 107.08 any HN-12-SOL-BLK- 88284225 1,000 102.10 102.10 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
SOLID SAME 1000 61.12

235 WIRE, SOLID 12 GREEN 500FT ANY 5 500' 53.54 267.70 any HN-12-SOL-GRN- 88284232 1,000 102.10 510.50 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
GR SAME 1000 61.12

236 WIRE, SOLID 12 BROWN 500FT ANY 5 500' 53.54 267.70 any HN-12-SOL-BRN- 88284229 1,000 102.10 510.50 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
BR SAME 1000 61.12

237 WIRE, SOLID 12 ORANGE 500FT ANY 5 500' 53.54 267.70 any HN-12-SOL-ORN- 88284626 1,000 102.10 510.50 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
OR SAME 1000 61.12

238 WIRE, SOLID 12 RED 500FT ANY 5 500' 53.54 267.70 any HN-12-SOL-RED- 88284620 1,000 102.10 510.50 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
RD SAME 1000 61.12

239 WIRE, SOLID 12 BLUE 500FT ANY 5 500' 53.54 267.70 any HN-12-SOL-BLU- 88284228 1,000 102.10 510.50 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
BL SAME 1000 61.12

240 WIRE, SOLID 12 WHITE 500FT ANY 5 500' 53.54 267.70 any N-12-SOL-WHT- 88284618 1,000 102.10 510.50 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
WH SAME 1000 61.12

241 WIRE, SOLID 12 YELLOW 500FT ANY 5 500' 53.54 267.70 any HN-12-SOL-YEL- 88284616 1,000 102.10 510.50 SOUTHWIRE THHN-12-
YE SAME 1000 61.12

242 WIRE, STRANDED #14/3 SJTO 250FT ANY 10 250' 103.09 4,123.60 any OW-14-3-BLK-25 99745611 1,000 533.50 5,335.00  NO BID

243 WIRE, STRANDED #14 BLACK 500FT ANY 1 500' 35.95 71.90 any HN-14-STR-BLK- 88284592 1,000 68.56 68.56 SOUTHWIRE THHN-14-
BK SAME 1000 41.04

244 WIRE, SOLID #14 GREEN 500 FT ANY 1 500' 34.89 69.78 any HN-14-SOL-GRN- 88284209 1,000 66.55 66.55 SOUTHWIRE THHN-14-
GR SAME 1000 41.04

245 WIRE, SOLID #14 BLUE 500FT ANY 1 500' 34.89 69.78 any HN-14-SOL-BLU- 88284205 1,000 66.55 66.55 SOUTHWIRE THHN-14-
BL SAME 1000 41.04

246 WIRE, STRANDED #14 BLUE 500FT ANY 1 500' 35.95 71.90 any HN-14-STR-BLU- 88284590 1,000 68.56 68.56 SOUTHWIRE THHN-14-
STR-BL SAME 1000 41.04

247 WIRE, STRANDED #14 WHITE 500FT ANY 1 500' 35.95 71.90 any N-14-STR-WHT- 88284572 1,000 68.56 68.56 SOUTHWIRE THHN-14-
STR-WH SAME 1000 41.04

248 WIRE, STRANDED 14G SOLID 500FT ANY 1 500' 35.95 71.90 any HN-14-STR-GRN- 88284586 1,000 68.56 68.56 SOUTHWIRE THHN-14G-
STR SAME 1000 41.04

249 WIRE, STRANDED #14 YELLOW 500FT ANY 1 500' 35.95 71.90 any HN-14-STR-YEL- 88284570 1,000 68.56 68.56 SOUTHWIRE THHN-14-
YE SAME 1000 41.04

250 WIRE, STRANDED #6XHHW 500FT ANY 15 500' 245.92 7,377.60 any 2-6-STR-BLK-CU 22061603 1,000 499.59 7,493.85  NO BID

251 WIRE, STRANDED 8XHHW 500 FT ANY 15 500' 161.89 4,856.70 any 2-8-STR-BLK-CU 22061606 1,000 328.90 4,933.50  NO BID

252 12-2W M/C GROUND CABLE ANY 1 250' 103.55 414.20 any C ALUM 12/2 250 88321210 1,000 387.56 387.56  NO BID

MISCELLANEOUS (8) MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 MFG 
OFFERED

MFG 
PART#

VENDOR 
PART #

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

UNIT 
COST
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253 DUCT, POLYTRAK HUBBELL 10' HUBBELL FT2BK10 1 10' 18.40 18.40 hubbell FT2BK10 90096174 1 1.64 1.64 NO BID

254 WIRE NUT, GREY (SMALL) BOX 100 IDEAL 30-071 1000 100 7.36 70.36 ideal 30-071 88134891 1,000 67.11 67.11 SAME SAME SAME 1000 21.50

255 WIRE NUT, BLUE (SMALL) BOX 101 IDEAL 30-072 1000 100 8.11 81.10 ideal 30-072 88134892 1,000 71.93 71.93 SAME SAME SAME 1000 40.25

256 WIRE NUT, (ORANGE) BOX 100 IDEAL 30-073 1000 100 8.21 82.10 ideal 30-073 88134893 1,000 84.47 84.48 SAME SAME SAME 1000 47.28

257 WIRE NUT, YELLOW BAG 500 IDEAL 30-651 1 500 33.47 33.47 ideal 30-651 88134980 1,000 75.39 75.39 SAME SAME SAME 1000 43.81

258 WIRE NUT, RED BAG 500 IDEAL 30-652 1 500 43.98 43.98 ideal 30-652 88134982 1,000 80.68 80.68 SAME SAME SAME 1000 46.89

259 1/0 BUTT SPLICE PANDUIT SCSI/O 1 BURNDY YS25 EACH 5.09 5.09 panduit SCS1/0-X 88201008 100 527.03 5.27 SAME SAME SAME 1000 0.49

260 LIGHT EMERGENCY EXIT 4PH53 SIMKAR SLEDBRW 1 0.00 Lithonia EXR LED EL M6 25414726 1 19.89 19.89 LITHONIA ELM12 SAME EACH 53.57

261 FIXTURE, HPS 150W WALL PACK HUBBELL PVL3-150S-18-
BZ 1 EACH 250.03 250.03 hubbell VL3-150S-18-BZ 25232838 1 220.20 220.20 NO BID

262 LENS, 200-0180-9904 HUBBELL HUBBELL 200-0180-9904 1 EACH 129.64 129.64 hubbell 200-0180-9904 96093481 1 76.02 76.02 NO BID

263 500 WATT QUARTZ FIXTURE HUBBELL QL-505 1 EACH 44.48 44.48 hubbell QL-505 88125429 1 32.94 32.94 NO BID

264 IDEC RELAY 24VAC DPDT #RH2BULA IDEC RH2B-UL 1 0.00 IDEC RH2B-ULAC24V 90011385 1 17.74 17.74 SAME SAME SAME EACH 49.60

265 RELAY, IDEC 24V COIL A/C (RYS-SULC) IDEC RY2-SULC 1 0.00 IDEC RY2-SULC OF IDC INDCNTR 1 20.27 20.27    NO BID

266 SOCKETS FOR IDEC RELAY RH2BUL IDEC SH1B-05 1 0.00 IDEC SH1B-05 90011420 1 7.44 7.44 SAME SAME SAME EACH 5.60

267 BASE, IDEC RELAY (SY2S-05) IDEC SY2S-05 1 0.00 IDEC SY2S-05 25833565 1 7.68 7.68    NO BID

268 LUG, 2-14 GAUGE ILSCO TA-2 25 BURNDY KA2U EACH 0.61 15.25 ILSCO TA-2 88138291 1 1.63 40.75 SAME SAME SAME EACH 2.12

269 TIMER, 6HR SPDT W/O HOLDSPRING INTERMATI
C FF36H 1 EACH 59.97 59.97 Intermatic FF36H 90012742 1 43.33 43.33 SAME SAME SAME EACH 65.70

270 CLOCK, TIME INTERMATIC T-101 120/277 INTERMATI
C T101 25 EACH 61.71 1,542.75 Intermatic T101 88138684 1 57.91 1,447.75 SAME SAME SAME EACH 66.70

271 LENS, ACRYLIC PRISMATIC, 2"X4" MALCOLITE A233/4X473/4.
125 1 0.00 No Bid n/a 0.00 NO BID

272 PHOTOCELL, 110 VOLT INTERAMTI
C K4121C 60 EACH 12.26 735.60 Intermatic K4121C 88314051 1 10.37 622.20 SAME SAME SAME EACH 12.07

273 277V PHOTO CELL INTERAMTI
C K4123C 60 EACH 19.87 1,192.20 Intermatic K4123C 94010453 1 19.24 1,154.40 SAME SAME SAME EACH 16.92

274 BODY, LB 1/2" COMPLETE ANY 10 TNB DALB-1-CG EACH 4.51 45.10 Crouse Hinds LB15 CGN 96015890 100 957.69 95.70 LB50CG SAME SAME 100 3.22

275 LB, 3/4" COMPLETE ANY 10 TNB DALB-2-CG EACH 5.59 55.90 Crouse Hinds LB25 CGN 96015893 100 1,203.09 120.03 LB75CG SAME SAME 100 3.95

276 BODY, SLB 1/2" COMPLETE ANY 10 TNB DASLB-1 EACH 3.65 36.50 Crouse Hinds SLB1 88074707 100 878.65 87.87 SLB50 SAME SAME 100 5.10

277 BODY, SLB 3/4" COMPLETE ANY 10 TNB DASLB-2 EACH 4.05 40.50 Crouse Hinds SLB2 88074708 100 1,062.81 106.30 SLB75 SAME SAME 100 7.11

278 EMERGENCY LIGHT, LM1 SURELITES LM-1 10 0.00 Lithonia EU2L M12 26053821 1 19.45 194.50 NO BID

279 FUSION TAPE 1 x15' TYCO 1-608036-4 1 0.00 3M 130C-1X30FT 88175836 1 9.07 9.07 SAME SAME SAME EACH 22.89

280 WIRE STRIPPER KLEIN 
TOOLS 11045 10 EACH 13.79 137.90 Klein 11045 88152449 1 12.66 126.60 SAME SAME SAME EACH 14.21

WIREMOLD (9) MFG 
OFFERED MFG PART# VENDOR 

PART #
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST 0.00 0.00

281 RECEPT, BOX SGL WIREMOLD WIREMOLD 1546B 10 0.00 wiremold 1546B 88279147 1 13.88 138.80 NO BID

282 WIREMOLD BOX WIREMOLD 2348 10 0.00 wiremold 2348 88279322 1 5.06 50.60 NO BID

283 EXTENSION BOX WIREMOLD 2348S/51 10 0.00 wiremold 2348S/51 92140970 1 4.29 42.90 NO BID

284 ENTERANCE END FITTING WIREMOLD 810A2 10 0.00 wiremold 810A2 22056960 1 4.35 43.50 NO BID

285 ELBOW, FLAT WIREMOLD WIREMOLD 811 10 0.00 wiremold 811 88279481 1 1.74 17.40 NO BID

286 ELBOW, FLAT INTERNAL WIREMOLD WIREMOLD 817 10 0.00 wiremold 817 88279483 1 1.63 16.30 NO BID

287 ELBOW, FLAT EXTERNAL WIREMOLD WIREMOLD 818 10 0.00 wiremold 818 88279484 1 1.63 16.30

288 TOTAL COST $118,014.73 $135,686.54


