2013-14 magazines Ordered for 2014-15 Bid

Total

Blanton

Borman

CMS

RCMS

Cross Oaks

DHS

EPR

Evers

FMHS

GHS

Gin

HMS

Hawk

Hod

Hou

Lee

LA

MMS

McN
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NMS
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Sav

SMS

WSR
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American Girl
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Anmerican Theatre

Animal Wellness

Appleseeds Gr 2-4

Ask Magazine Ages 7-10

Avengers Comic

Barbie

Batman

Be Your Own You

Best Friends

Better Homes and Gardens

Bicycling

BMX Plus

Book Links

Booklist

Bookmarks

Bop
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Boy's Life
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Car and Driver

Cat Fancy

Chop Chop

Clifford

Cobblestone

Consumer Reports & Buying Guide

Cooking Light

Crafts N Things

Creative Kids

D Magazine

Dance

Dance Spirit

Dig (Archeology)

Dirt Bike

Discover
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Discovery Girls
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Dog Fancy

E: Environmental Magazine

Ebony

Entertainment Weekly

ESPN

Faces (World Cultures)

Fantacy and Science Fiction

Field and Stream

Fitness

Food Network Magazine

Game Informer

Girl's Life (9-14)

Great Activities Newspaper

Guitar World

Health

Highlights for Children

Horn Book Guide

Horse Illustrated

Hot Rod

In Style

Instructor K-8

Internet @ Schools

J-14, Just for Teens

Jet

Junior Baseball Magazine

Junior Scholastic

Justine

Justice League America
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Gin
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Laguana Magazine (Spanish Language)

[y

Latina Magazine

Learning & Leading

Library Media Connection

Library Sparks

Looney Tunes

Lucky

M Magazine

Mad

Mailbox (Kindergarten - Gr 1)

Mailbox (Primary Gr 2-3

Mailbox Intermediate Gr 4-6

Make: Technology on your Time

Mathmatics Teacher

Mental Floss

Mother Jones

Motor Trend

Mountain Bike Action

National Geographic
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National Geographic Kids
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New Avengers

New Yorker

Newsweek

Odyssey

Odyssey Ages 8-14

Outdoor Life

Outside

Oowl

Owl 9 & up

Parents Magazine

Parenting Early Years

PC Gamer

People
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People En Espanol

N

People Style Watch

Poder Hispanic Magazine

Pop Star

Popular Mechanics

Popular Science Monthly

Psychology Today

Ranger Rick

Ranger Rick Junior

Reading Teacher (K-12)

Road and Track

Rolling Stone

Runner's World

Scholastic Choices Dg 7-12

Scholastic News

School Arts

School Library Journal

School Library Monthly

Science and Children

Science World

Scientific American

Scooby Doo

Seventeen Magazine

Social Studies & Young Learner

Sophisticates Haristyles

Southern Living

Spider Ages 6-9

Sports Illustrated
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Sports lllustrated For Kids
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Storyworks/ Gr. 3-5

Strings

Taste of Home Simple and Delicious

Teacher Librarian

N (R |k |-




2013-14 magazines Ordered for 2014-15 Bid

Total

Blanton

Borman

CMS

RCMS

Cross Oaks

DHS

EPR

Evers

FMHS

GHS

Gin

HMS

Hawk

Hod

Hou

Lee

LA

MMS

McN

BMMS

NMS

NRZR

Pa

Pecan

Prov

RHS

Sav

SMS

WSR

WIL

Lib
Svc

Teacher's Helper (Grade 1)
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Teaching Children Mathematics

Technology & Learning

Teen Ink

Teen Vogue

Texas Highways

Texas Monthly

Texas Parks and Wildlife

The Magazine Not for Adults

The Magazine Not for Kids

Thrasher

Tiger Beat

Time

Time for Kids (3-4)

Transworld Skateboarding

Truckin

Twist

USA Today: The Nation's Newspaper

Voice of Youth Advocates (VOYA)

WWE Kids

Young Adult Library Services

Young Justice

Young Rider

Youth Runner

Zamoof
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Zoo Books
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2014 Proposal for Periodicals
TAB RFP 140226

Page 6

Alini Magazine Services LLC

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Magazine Subscriptions PTP

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason

American Girl 13 S 299.00 | $ 297.70 S 16.07 | S 208.91

Anmerican Theatre 1 35.00 | $ 35.00 S 38.25 | $ 38.25

Animal Wellness 1 24.00 | $ 24.00 S - 19.00 | $ 19.00
Appleseeds Gr 2-4 2 S 67.90 | S 66.00 S 3481 | S 69.62

Ask Magazine Ages 7-10 2 S 67.90 | S 66.00 S 34.81|S 69.62

Avengers Comic 1 S 30.00 | S 29.00 S 28.89 | $ 28.89

Barbie 1 S 28.00 | S 25.00 2399 | $ 23.99

Batman 1 S 34.00 | S 19.00 S 2549 | $ 25.49

Be Your Own You 2 36.00 | $ 36.00 S 15.30 | $ 30.60

Best Friends 2 50.00 | $ 50.00 S - 25.00 | $ 50.00

Better Homes and Gardens 1 S 22.00 | S 9.00 S 10.47 | § 10.47

Bicycling 1 S 19.98 | § 9.00 S 13.99 | $ 13.99

BMX Plus 9 S 179.82 | S 162.00 S 16.98 | $ 152.82

Only as supplement to

Book Links 1 Ceased S - Booklist
Booklist 5 73750 | $ 737.50 S - 147.50 | $ 737.50
Bookmarks 3 S 96.00 | $ 90.00 S - 3295 | S 98.85

Bop 3 75.00 | § 75.00 S - 25.00 | $ 75.00

Boy's Life 11 S 242,00 | $ 121.00 S 12.60 | $ 138.60

Car and Driver 4 $ 72.00 | $ 36.00 $ 1117 | $ 44.68




2014 Proposal for Periodicals
TAB RFP 140226

Page 7

Alini Magazine Services LLC

Magazine Subscriptions PTP

Discountable Non-Discountable Discountable Non-Discountable
Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
Cat Fancy 8 $ 22376 | $ 96.00 $ 11.05 | $ 88.40
Chop Chop 1 S 16.00 | $ 16.00 S 17.81 | $ 17.81
Clifford 1 S 15.00 | $ 14.50 S - 1499 | S 14.99
Cobblestone 6 S 203.70 | $ 198.00 S 3481 | S 208.86
Consumer Reports & Buying Guide 5 S 145.00 | S 118.75 S 2030 | S 101.50
Cooking Light 1 $ 49.50 | $ 18.00 $ 14.00 | $ 14.00
Crafts N Things 1 S 2499 | $ 24.75 $ 2462 | $ 24.62
Creative Kids 2 S 20.00 | S 20.00 S 16.96 | $ 33.92
D Magazine 1 S 18.00 | $ 11.00 $ 15.30 | S 15.30
Dance 1 S 34.95 | S 16.00 S 24.50 | S 24.50
Dance Spirit 1 S 16.95 | $ 10.00 S 11.87 | $ 11.87
Dig (Archeology) 2 $ 67.94 | $ 66.00 $ 3481 | $ 69.62
Dirt Bike 2 S 39.96 | $ 36.00 S 16.98 | S 33.96
Discover 5 $ 150.00 | $ 37.50 S 13.97 | $ 69.85
Discovery Girls 16 S 368.00 | $ 216.00 S 13.97 | S 223.52
Dog Fancy 9 $ 135.00 | $ 135.00 $ 11.05 | $ 99.45
E: Environmental Magazine 2 Ceased 19.95 | $ 39.90
Ebony 3 s 60.00 | $ 24.00 S 12.60 | $ 37.80
Entertainment Weekly 2 $ 139.80 | $ 119.80 $ 3497 | $ 69.94
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Alini Magazine Services LLC

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Magazine Subscriptions PTP

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
ESPN 1 $ 26.00 | $ 9.00 $ 18.20 | $ 18.20
Faces (World Cultures) 5 $ 169.75 | $ 165.00 $ 3481 |$ 174.05
Fantacy and Science Fiction 2 S 78.00 | S 48.00 S 2730 | $ 54.60
Field and Stream 1 S 1497 | $ 9.00 S 10.48 | $§ 10.48
Fitness 1 S 19.98 | $ 9.00 S 10.47 | $ 10.47
Food Network Magazine 1 S 30.00 | S 20.00 S 18.70 | $ 18.70
Game Informer 8 S 160.00 | S 160.00 S 2237 | S 178.96
Girl's Life (9-14) 4 $ 71.92 | $ 44.00 $ 1397 | $ 55.88
Great Activities Newspaper 2 S 56.00 | $ 50.00 $ 27.20 | $ 54.40
Guitar World 1 $ 15.00 | $ 12.00 $ 16.07 | $ 16.07
Health 4 S 79.88 | § 60.00 $ 13.98 | S 55.92
Highlights for Children 2 $ 70.00 | $ 66.00 S 3226 | $ 64.52
Horn Book Guide 3 S 180.00 | S 180.00 S 58.65 | $ 175.95
Horse Illustrated 1 S 24.00 | $ 10.00 S 34.00 | $ 34.00
Hot Rod 4 S 80.00 | $ 32.00 S 9.80 | S 39.20
In Style 2 S 95.76 | S 60.00 S 21.21 | S 42.42
Instructor K-8 3 S 44.85 | $ 30.00 S 838 |S 25.14
Internet @ Schools 2 S 112.00 | $ 112.00 $ 48.41 | S 96.82
J-14, Just for Teens 5 S 84.75 | $ 70.00 S 15.27 | $ 76.35
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Alini Magazine Services LLC

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Magazine Subscriptions PTP

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
Jet 1 $ 36.00 | $ 8.00 $ 2027 | $ 20.27
Junior Baseball Magazine 5 $ 119.75 | $ 80.00 $ 16.99 | $ 84.95
Junior Scholastic 2 S 60.00 | S 58.00 S 28.01 | $ 56.02
Justine 2 S 35.90 | $ 30.00 S 15.26 | $ 30.52
Justice League America 1 S 34.00 | S 18.00 S 21.24 | S 21.24
Kids Discover 10 S 269.50 | $ 240.00 S 20.27 | $ 202.70
KiKI 1 $ 28.00 | $ 28.00 $ - 28.00 | $ 28.00
Knowledge Quest 1 S 50.00 | $ 540.00 S 50.15 | $ 50.15
LA Teen 2 $ 34.00 | $ 34.00 $ - 16.95 | $ 33.90
Iguana Magazine (Spanish Language) 1 S 34.00 | S 34.00 S 3481 | S 34.81
Latina Magazine 5 S 59.85 | $ 40.00 $ 838 |5S 41.90
Learning & Leading 1 $ 92.00 | $ 92.00 $ 140.25 | $ 140.25
Library Media Connection 5 ) 345.00 | $ 345.00 S 67.15 | S 335.75
Library Sparks 6 S 360.00 | $ 360.00 S 57.80 | $ 346.80
Looney Tunes 2 S 50.00 | $ 26.00 S 9.09 | S 18.18
Lucky 1 $ 15.00 | $ 9.00 S 10.50 | S 10.50
M Magazine 1 $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 $ - 1497 | $ 14.97
Mad 3 $ 60.00 | $ 36.00 $ 13.99 | $ 41.97
Mailbox (Kindergarten - Gr 1) 2 $ 59.98 | $ 59.50 $ 28.86 | $ 57.72
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Alini Magazine Services LLC

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Magazine Subscriptions PTP

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
Mailbox (Primary Gr 2-3 2 S 59.90 | $ 59.50 S 28.86 | S 57.72
Mailbox Intermediate Gr 4-6 2 S 59.90 | $ 59.50 S 28.86 | S 57.72
Make: Technology on your Time 2 S 69.90 | $ 68.00 S - 29.95 | S 59.90
Mathmatics Teacher 1 108.00 | $ 108.00 $ 104.55 | $ 104.55
Mental Floss 8 224.00 | $ 240.00 S 2462 | S 196.96
Mother Jones 1 S 24.00 | S 12.00 S 16.80 | $ 16.80
Motor Trend 2 S 36.00 | $ 16.00 $ 8.40 | $ 16.80
Mountain Bike Action 1 S 19.98 | $ 18.00 S 16.98 | $ 16.98
National Geographic 3 S 117.00 | $ 78.00 S 23.80 | S 71.40
National Geographic Kids 18 $ 45000 S 342.00 $ 15.26 | $ 274.68
New Avengers 1 S 30.00 | $ 29.75 $ 28.04 | $ 28.04
New Yorker 1 $ 70.00 | $ 52.00 S 50.99 | $ 50.99
Newsweek 1 Ceased S 21.24 | S 21.24
Odyssey 1 S 3395 | S 33.00 S 3481 | S 34.81
Odyssey Ages 8-14 1 $ 33.95 | $ 33.00 $ 3481 S 34.81
Outdoor Life 3 S 59.91 | $ 30.00 S 10.48 | $ 31.44
Outside 3 S 54.00 | $ 27.00 S 13.97 | S 41.91
Owl 2 $ 70.00 | $ 58.00 $ 2450 | S 49.00
Owl 9 & up 2 S 70.00 | S 58.00 S 2450 | $ 49.00
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Alini Magazine Services LLC Magazine Subscriptions PTP
Discountable Non-Discountable Discountable Non-Discountable
Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason

Parents Magazine 1 S 1598 | $ 9.00 S 9.07 | $ 9.07

Parenting Early Years 1 Ceased S - Ceased
PC Gamer 2 S 40.00 | $ 40.00 S 25.46 | S 50.92

People 5 $ 105738 |$ 550.00 $ 85.40 | $ 427.00

People En Espanol 2 S 65.78 | S 40.00 S 18.18 | § 36.36

People Style Watch 2 S 79.80 | $ 39.90 S 22.00 | $ 44.00
Poder Hispanic Magazine 1 S 13.00 | $ 11.00 $ 10.50 | $ 10.50

Pop Star 1 $ 25.00 | $ 20.00 $ 24.64 | $ 24.64

Popular Mechanics 3 S 72.00 | $ 36.00 $ 15.38 | S 46.14

Popular Science Monthly 4 S 79.80 | $ 40.00 S 13.97 | $ 55.88

Psychology Today 2 $ 42,00 | $ 26.00 $ 13.97 | $ 27.94

Ranger Rick 5 $ 99.75 | $ 65.00 S 13.97 | S 69.85

Ranger Rick Junior 2 S 48.00 | $ 26.00 S 13.97 | S 27.94

Reading Teacher (K-12) 2 $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 S 155.00 | $ 310.00
Road and Track 2 S 44.00 | $ 18.00 S 12.60 | S 25.20

Rolling Stone 2 $ 51.88 | $ 18.00 $ 2097 | $ 41.94

Runner's World 1 S 24.00 | $ 13.00 S 16.80 | S 16.80

Scholastic Choices Dg 7-12 3 S 81.00 | S 78.00 S 2461 | S 73.83

Scholastic News 1 S 13.00 | S 13.00 S 1299 | S 12.99
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Alini Magazine Services LLC

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Magazine Subscriptions PTP

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
School Arts 3 72.00 | S 72.00 S 27.16 | $ 81.48
School Library Journal 4 S 548.00 | $ 532.00 S 135.15 | S 540.60
School Library Monthly 4 220.00 | $ 220.00 $ 51.85 | $ 207.40
Science and Children 1 95.00 | $ 95.00 $ 85.85 | $ 85.85
Science World 2 S 56.00 | $ 54.00 S 2461 | S 49.22
Scientific American 2 S 158.00 | $ 78.00 S 3141 | S 62.82
Scooby Doo 3 S 54.00 | $ 33.00 $ 14.00 | S 42.00
Seventeen Magazine 3 S 58.85 | S 27.00 S 838 |S 25.14
Social Studies & Young Learner 1 45.00 | $ 45.00 S 41.65 | S 41.65
Sophisticates Haristyles 2 88.00 | $ 88.00 S - S 51.50 | $ 103.00
Southern Living 1 S 19.95 | $ 19.00 $ 2097 | $ 20.97
Spider Ages 6-9 1 $ 33.97 | $ 33.00 $ 3481 | $ 34.81
Sports Ilustrated 4 156.00 | $ 156.00 $ 29.98 | § 119.92
Sports Illustrated For Kids 23 S 734.85 | $ 713.00 S 23.76 | $ 546.48
Storyworks/ Gr. 3-5 1 S 2595 | S 25.00 S 27.20 | $ 27.20
Strings 1 $ 40.00 | $ 20.00 S 2587 | $ 25.87
Taste of Home Simple and Delicious 1 S 24.00 | $ 13.00 S 15.30 | $ 15.30
Teacher Librarian 2 120.00 | $ 120.00 $ 56.95 | $ 113.90
Teacher's Helper (Grade 1) 1 S 2995 | S 24.50 S 2461 | S 24.61
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Alini Magazine Services LLC

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Magazine Subscriptions PTP

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason

Teaching Children Mathematics 3 108.00 | $ 108.00 S 104.55 | $ 313.65

Technology & Learning 2 S 48.00 | $ 30.00 S 33.11 | $ 66.22

Teen Ink 2 80.00 | $ 80.00 S - 35.00 70.00

Teen Vogue 4 S 60.00 | S 40.00 S 7.00 | S 28.00

Texas Highways 6 S 119.70 | $ 117.00 S 18.66 | § 111.96

Texas Monthly 1 S 18.00 | $ 9.00 S 840 | S 8.40

Texas Parks and Wildlife 2 S 39.90 | $ 28.00 $ 13.97 | $ 27.94

The Magazine Not for Adults 4 160.00 | $ 160.00 39.99 159.96

The Magazine Not for Kids 1 15.00 | $ 15.00 S - Cannot locate
Thrasher 1 S 18.50 | $ 12.00 S 1530 | $ 15.30

Tiger Beat 1 25.00 | S 25.00 25.00 25.00

Time 6 179.70 | $ 179.70 $ 2938 | $ 176.28

Time for Kids (3-4) 1 No single copy orders 29.95 29.95

Transworld Skateboarding 6 $ 119.82 | $ 60.00 S 10.48 | $ 62.88

Truckin 2 S 72.00 | $ 16.00 S 2121 |S 42.42

Twist 5 $ 74.85 | $ 72.50 S 16.97 | S 84.85

USA Today: The Nation's Newspaper 1 S 340.00 | $ 330.00 215.00 215.00

Voice of Youth Advocates (VOYA) 3 186.00 | S 186.00 62.00 186.00

WWE Kids 2 $ 59.90 | $ 58.00 29.95 59.90
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Alini Magazine Services LLC Magazine Subscriptions PTP
Discountable Non-Discountable Discountable Non-Discountable
Total List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
Young Adult Library Services 1 $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 $ 70.00 | $ 70.00
Ceased, fulfilling with
Young Justice 1 Not currently published Batman: Li'l Gotham
Young Rider 3 $ 4497 | $ 39.00 $ 12.72 | $ 38.16
Youth Runner 1 S 20.00 | $ 16.00 S 1397 | $ 13.97
Zamoof 1 S 33.00 | S 33.00 S 27.20 | $ 27.20
Zoo Books 14 S 419.30 | $ 224.00 S 2097 | $ 293.58
Zootles 2 $ 59.90 | $ 32.00 $ 2097 | $ 41.94
0
Grand Total of Lists:| 470 $  7,853.15|$ $ 535220 $1s 10,189.55 $|s 2,481.80
total per written bid form:| $ 8,197.15
Percentage Discount being offered: 1-65 % % % various %
Discount in Dollars being given: - - - -
Net Cost (equals total list price minus
discount in dollars) S $  8,197.15|$ $  4,862.20 $1S 10,189.55 $1S 2,481.80
Total All: $ 13,059.35 $ 12,671.35

The above quantity is estimated on
the number of magazines ordered in
the previous year.
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Magazine Subscription Service Agency

WT Cox

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Discountable

Non-Discountable

List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
American Girl S - S 2495 | S 324.35 S 2295 (S 298.35 S -
Anmerican Theatre S - S 32.00 | $ 32.00 S 35.00 | $ 35.00 S -
Animal Wellness S 2571 | §$ 25.71 S - S 24.00 | $ 24.00 S -
Appleseeds Gr 2-4 S - S 3395 | S 67.90 ) 3395 | S 67.90 S -
Ask Magazine Ages 7-10 S - S 3395 |$S 67.90 S 3395 |$S 67.90 S -
Avengers Comic S - S 3199 | § 31.99 S 29.99 | S 29.99 S -
Barbie S - S 29.95 | S 29.95 S 3499 | S 34.99 S -
Batman S 32.79 | S 32.79 S - S 3399 | S 33.99 S -
Be Your Own You S 14.29 | $ 28.58 S - S 17.97 | $ 35.94 S -
Best Friends S - S 27.00 | S 54.00 S 25.00 | S 50.00 S -
Better Homes and Gardens S 11.43 | §$ 11.43 S - S 22.00 | $ 22.00 S -
Bicycling S 12.84 | $ 12.84 S - S 19.98 | $ 19.98 S -
BMX Plus S - S 1798 | $ 161.82 S 19.99 | S 179.91 S -
Book Links $ - | included $ - S 147.50 | $ 147.50
Booklist S - S 157.00 | S 785.00 S - S 147.50 | $ 737.50
Bookmarks S - S 28.95 | S 86.85 S 2795 | S 83.85 S -
Bop S - S 25.00 | § 75.00 S 25.00 | S 75.00 S -
Boy's Life S 12.79 | $ 140.69 S - S 24.00 | S 264.00 S -
Car and Driver $ 11.36 | $ 45.44 $ - S 22.00 | $ 88.00 S -
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Magazine Subscription Service Agency

WT Cox

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Discountable

Non-Discountable

List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
Cat Fancy $ 2571 S 205.68 S - ) 24.00 | $ 192.00 S -
Chop Chop $ 2137 | $ 21.37 $ - $ 15.96 | $ 15.96 $ -
Clifford $ - s 9.25 | $ 9.25 S - S 9.99 | $ 9.99
Cobblestone S - S 3395 | S 203.70 S 3395 |$ 203.70 S -
Consumer Reports & Buying Guide | ¢ 25.64 | $ 128.20 S - S 29.00 | S 145.00 S -
Cooking Light $ 2571 S 25.71 S - S - S 20.00 | $ 20.00
Crafts N Things $ 3281 | 32.81 $ - $ 2199 | 21.99 S -
Creative Kids $ 21.36 | $ 42.72 $ - $ 19.95 | $ 39.90 $ -
D Magazine $ 1214 | $ 12.14 $ - $ 18.00 | $ 18.00 $ -
Dance $ 28.50 | $ 28.50 $ - $ 34.95 | $ 34.95 $ -
Dance Spirit $ 1357 | $ 13.57 $ - $ 17.70 | 17.70 S -
Dig (Archeology) $ - s 33.95 | $ 67.90 $ 33.95 | $ 67.90 $ -
Dirt Bike $ 24.26 | $ 48.52 $ - $ 19.99 | $ 39.98 $ -
Discover $ 12.79 | $ 63.95 $ - $ 19.95 | $ 99.75 S -
Discovery Girls $ 17.07 | $ 273.12 $ - $ 19.95 | $ 319.20 S -
Dog Fancy $ 25.71 | $ 231.39 $ - $ 24.00 | $ 216.00 $ -
E: Environmental Magazine S - S - |Ceased S - Suspended
Ebony $ 11.36 | $ 34.08 $ - $ 18.97 | $ 56.91 $ -
Entertainment Weekly $ - s 33.95 | $ 67.90 $ - /S 59.95 | $ 119.90
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Magazine Subscription Service Agency

WT Cox

Discountable

Non-Discountable

Discountable

Non-Discountable

List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason

ESPN $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 $ - $ 29.97 | $ 29.97 $ -

Faces (World Cultures) $ - ]S 3395 | $ 169.75 $ 33.95 | $ 169.75 $ -

Fantacy and Science Fiction S 3996 | $ 79.92 S - S 3697 | S 73.94 S -

Field and Stream $ 893 |$ 8.93 S - S 19.97 | S 19.97 S -

Fitness $ 10.71 | $ 10.71 $ - S 19.98 | $ 19.98 S -

Food Network Magazine $ 2571 | $ 25.71 S - S 30.00 | $ 30.00 $ -

Game Informer S 3283 | $ 262.64 S - S - S - |Must order direct
Girl's Life (9-14) $ 12.79 | $ 51.16 $ - $ 19.95 | $ 79.80 $ -

Great Activities Newspaper S - S 28.00 | $ 56.00 ) 32.00 | S 64.00 S -

Guitar World S 12.79 | $ 12.79 S - S 1495 | $ 14.95 $ -

Health $ 19.96 | $ 79.84 $ - S - $ 15.97 | $ 63.88

Highlights for Children $ 4850 | $ 97.00 $ - S 3495 | $ 69.90 $ -

Horn Book Guide $ - s 72.00 | $ 216.00 S 60.00 | $ 180.00 $ -

Horse Hlustrated $ 12.14 | $ 12.14 $ - $ 2397 |$ 23.97 $ -

Hot Rod $ 10.71 | $ 42.84 S - S 14.00 | $ 56.00 S -

In Style $ - s 22.00 | $ 44.00 $ - s 30.00 | $ 60.00

Instructor K-8 S 11.07 | $ 33.21 S - S 21.95 | $ 65.85 S -

Internet @ Schools S - S 4995 | S 99.90 S 49,95 | S 99.90 S -

J-14, Just for Teens S 14.24 | § 71.20 S - S 16.95 | $ 84.75 S -
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Discountable

Non-Discountable

Discountable

Non-Discountable

List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
Jet 13.93 | $ 13.93 $ - $ 34.00 | $ 34.00 $ -
Junior Baseball Magazine 19.99 | § 99.95 S - S 19.99 | § 99.95 S -
Junior Scholastic $ - s 29.95 | $ 59.90 $ - ]S 29.95 | S 59.90
Justine 15.64 | $ 31.28 S - S 1795 | S 35.90 S -
Justice League America 2850 | $ 28.50 $ - $ 33.99 | $ 33.99 S -
Kids Discover 2143 |S 214.30 S - S 26.95 | $ 269.50 S -
KiKI $ - s 26.00 | S 26.00 $ 28.00 | $ 28.00 $ -
Knowledge Quest S - S 51.00 | $ 51.00 S 50.00 | $ 50.00 S -
LA Teen $ - s 19.95 | $ 39.90 $ 16.95 | $ 33.90 $ -
Iguana Magazine (Spanish Language) S - S 3395 | S 33.95 S 3395 | S 33.95 S -
Latina Magazine 893S 44.65 $ - $ 11.97 | $ 59.85 $ -
Learning & Leading $ - $ 90.00 | $ 90.00 S - S 155.00 | $ 155.00
Library Media Connection S - S 69.00 | $ 345.00 $ 69.00 | $ 345.00 S -
Library Sparks $ -] 57.95 | $ 347.70 $ 59.95 | $ 359.70 S -
Looney Tunes 12.81| % 25.62 $ - $ 12.99 | $ 25.98 $ -
Lucky 1136 | $ 11.36 $ - $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 S -
M Magazine S - S 1497 | $ 14.97 S 1497 | S 14.97 S -
Mad 1421 | S 42.63 $ - S 19.99 | $ 59.97 S -
Mailbox (Kindergarten - Gr 1) $ - s 29.95 | $ 59.90 $ - S 29.95 | $ 59.90
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Non-Discountable

Discountable

Non-Discountable

List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason

Mailbox (Primary Gr 2-3 $ - s 29.95 | $ 59.90 S - ]S 29.95 | S 59.90

Mailbox Intermediate Gr 4-6 S - S 29.95 | S 59.90 S - S 29.95 | S 59.90

Make: Technology on your Time 47.07 | $ 94.14 $ - $ 3495 | $ 69.90 $ -

Mathmatics Teacher S - S 104.00 | $ 104.00 S - S 113.00 | $ 113.00

Mental Floss 27.07 | $ 216.56 S - S 2497 | S 199.76 S -

Mother Jones 1429 | S 14.29 S - S 24.00 | S 24.00 S -

Motor Trend 993 | S 19.86 S - S 10.00 | $ 20.00 S -

Mountain Bike Action S - S 1798 | $ 17.98 S 19.99 | $ 19.99 S -

National Geographic 27.14 | S 81.42 $ - $ 39.00 | $ 117.00 S -

National Geographic Kids 19.93 | $ 358.74 $ - S 24.00 | $ 432.00 S -

New Avengers 39.96 | $ 39.96 S - ) 29.99 | $ 29.99 S -

New Yorker $ - s 3997 | $ 39.97 $ 69.95 | $ 69.95 $ -

Newsweek S - S - |not available S - S - |Discontinued
Odyssey S - S 3395 | S 33.95 S 33.95 | S 33.95 S -

Odyssey Ages 8-14 S - S 33.95 | S 33.95 S 33.95 | $ 33.95 S -

Outdoor Life 821 5% 24.63 S - $ 19.97 | $ 59.91 S -

Outside 8219 24.63 $ - $ - $ 24.00 | $ 72.00

owl $ - s 35.00 | $ 70.00 S 35.00 | $ 70.00 S -

owl 9 & up $ - s 35.00 | $ 70.00 $ 35.00 | $ 70.00 $ -
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Discountable Non-Discountable Discountable Non-Discountable
List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason

Parents Magazine S 996 | $ 9.96 S - S 1598 | $ 15.98 S -

Parenting Early Years S - S - |Ceased S - S - |Ceased
PC Gamer $ 2850 | S 57.00 S - S 19.95 | $ 39.90 S -

People S - S 113.00 | S 113.00 S - S 116.07 | $ 580.35

People En Espanol $ - s 19.97 | $ 39.94 $ - ]S 19.97 | $ 39.94

People Style Watch $ - s 22.00 | $ 44.00 $ - S 22.00 | $ 44.00

Poder Hispanic Magazine S - ) - |Ceased S - S - |Ceased
Pop Star $ 2136 | $ 21.36 $ - S 19.99 | S 19.99 S -

Popular Mechanics $ 2143 | S 64.29 S - S 24.00 | S 72.00 S -

Popular Science Monthly $ 9.93 | S 39.72 $ - S 19.97 | $ 79.88 S -
Psychology Today $ 12.81| % 25.62 $ - $ 18.00 | $ 36.00 S -

Ranger Rick $ 17.07 | $ 85.35 $ - $ 24.00 | $ 120.00 $ -

Ranger Rick Junior $ 17.07 | $ 34.14 $ - $ 24.00 | $ 48.00 $ -

Reading Teacher (K-12) S - S 147.00 | $ 294.00 S - S 155.00 | $ 310.00

Road and Track $ 893S 17.86 $ - $ 22.00 | $ 44.00 $ -

Rolling Stone $ 17.86 | $ 35.72 $ - $ 39.96 | $ 79.92 $ -

Runner's World S 2214 | $ 22.14 S - S 24.00 | $ 24.00 S -
Scholastic Choices Dg 7-12 $ - s 2495 |$ 74.85 $ - S 26.95 | $ 80.85
Scholastic News $ - s 8.95|$ 8.95 $ - s 12.99 | $ 12.99
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List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason
School Arts $ - s 2495 | S 74.85 S 2495 | $ 74.85 S -
School Library Journal S - S 136.00 | S 544.00 S - S 136.99 | $ 547.96
School Library Monthly S - $ 55.00 | $ 220.00 $ 55.00 | $ 220.00 $ -
Science and Children $ - s 100.00 | $ 100.00 $ - ]S 95.00 | $ 95.00
Science World $ - s 2495 | S 49.90 S - S 27.75 | S 55.50
Scientific American $ 51.36 | $ 102.72 $ - $ 79.00 | $ 158.00 $ -
Scooby Doo $ 17.07 | $ 51.21 $ . $ 17.99 | $ 53.97 $ -
Seventeen Magazine S 853 |$ 25.59 $ - $ 20.00 | $ 60.00 $ -
Social Studies & Young Learner S - S 45,00 | $ 45.00 S 45.00 | $ 45.00 S -
Sophisticates Haristyles S - S 55.00 | $ 110.00 S 5150 | $ 103.00 S -
Southern Living $ RS 19.97 | $ 19.97 $ - ]S 19.95 | $ 19.95
Spider Ages 6-9 S - $ 33.95 | $ 33.95 $ 33.95|$ 33.95 S -
Sports Illustrated $ - s 4495 | $ 179.80 $ - s 88.95 | $ 355.80
Sports Illustrated For Kids S - S 2525 | S 580.75 S - S 3195 | S 734.85
Storyworks/ Gr. 3-5 $ - s 25.95 | $ 25.95 $ - ]S 2595 | $ 25.95
Strings $ 2567 | $ 25.67 $ - $ 39.95 | $ 39.95 $ -
Taste of Home Simple and Delicious | ¢ 15.00 | $ 15.00 S - S 1798 | $ 17.98 S -
Teacher Librarian S - S 60.00 | $ 120.00 S 60.00 | $ 120.00 S -
Teacher's Helper (Grade 1) $ - s 2495 | $ 24.95 $ - S 2495 | $ 24.95
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List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason List Price Total Price List Price Total Price If no-bid state reason

Teaching Children Mathematics S - S 113.00 | $ 339.00 S - S 113.00 | $ 339.00

Technology & Learning $ - $ 27.25| S 54.50 S 2995 | S 59.90 S -

Teen Ink $ - s 3750 | $ 75.00 S 35.00 | $ 70.00 S -

Teen Vogue 893S 35.72 S - S 12.00 | $ 48.00 S -

Texas Highways S - S 17.50 | $ 105.00 S 19.95 | $ 119.70 S -

Texas Monthly 10.71 | $ 10.71 $ - $ 12.00 | $ 12.00 S -

Texas Parks and Wildlife 993 | S 19.86 S - S 12.00 | $ 24.00 S -

The Magazine Not for Adults S - S 43.00 | $ 172.00 S 3562 | S 142.48 S -

The Magazine Not for Kids S - $ 4300 | $ 43.00 S 29.00 | $ 29.00 S -

Thrasher 1993 | $ 19.93 S - S 18.00 | $ 18.00 S -

Tiger Beat S - S 25.00 | $ 25.00 S 25.00 | $ 25.00 S -

Time $ - s 39.97 | $ 239.82 $ - s 76.13 | $ 456.78

Time for Kids (3-4) S - S 3295 | S 32.95 S - S 442 | S 4.42 |Must order 10 min
Transworld Skateboarding 1139 | $ 68.34 S - S 1697 | $ 101.82 S -

Truckin 16.07 | $ 32.14 S - S 2495 | S 49.90 $ -

Twist 18.50 | $ 92.50 $ - $ 1497 | $ 74.85 $ -

USA Today: The Nation's Newspaper S - S 225.00 | $ 225.00 S - S 264.00 | $ 264.00

Voice of Youth Advocates (VOYA) $ - ¢ 62.00 | $ 186.00 S 62.00 | $ 186.00 S -

WWE Kids 35.64 | $ 71.28 $ - $ 29.95 | $ 59.90 $ -
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Young Adult Library Services S - $ 72.00 | $ 72.00 $ 70.00 | $ 70.00 S -
Young Justice S - Ceased S - S - |Ceased
Young Rider 1071 | $ 32.13 ) - ) 19.97 | $ 59.91 S -
Youth Runner $ - s 1297 | $ 12.97 $ 9.95 | $ 9.95 S -
Zamoof 3286 | S 32.86 $ - S 3295 S 32.95 S -
Zoo Books 2136 | S 299.04 S - S 2595 | $ 363.30 S -
Zootles 25.64 | $ 51.28 $ - $ 25.95 | $ 51.90 $ -

Grand Total of Lists: Sl 5,047.92 S S|s 9,847.46 S|S$ 5,730.66
Percentage Discount being offered: 30% 28%| S 2,757.29 %
Discount in Dollars being given: -1S 1,514.36 - - -
Net Cost (equals total list price minus
discount in dollars) S|S 3,533.56 SIS 8,495.23 S|S 7,090.17 S|S 5,730.66

Total All: $ 12,028.79 $ 12,820.83

The above quantity is estimated on
the number of magazines ordered in
the previous year.




2014 Proposal for Periodicals Ranking RFP 140226

Magazine Magazine Subscription
Criteria Points Alini Subscriptions PTP Service Agency WT Cox

1 Proposed Fee 58 55 57 58 56
a. Is the cost within an
appropriate range?
2 References 5 5 5 5 5
a. Does proposer have K12
references?
3 Quality of Proposer's Goods
& Services 10 10 10 10 10
a. Did proposer supply all
magazines available?
4 Extent to which the services
meet the district's needs 10 10 10 10 10
5 Past relationship with the
district 10 10 10 10 10
a. Does the proposer have a past
relationship with the district?
6 HUB certified 2 0 2 0 0
7 Long term cost to the district
to acquire the vendor's services 5 5 5 5 5

Score 100 95 929 98 96

Rank 4 1 2 3




