Organization

Bid Request Number
Title

Open Date

Close Date

Ector County Independent School District
Bid #10-36

Glass

9/29/2010 8:01:00 AM Central
10/15/2010 2:00:00 PM Central

AWARDED VENDOR: Odessa Glass & Mirror

[Line 1 Glass, clear, DSB, 1/8"
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 1000 sq. ft. $2.55 $2,550.00

Acorn Glass 1000 sq. ft. $4,000.00 $4,000,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 1000 sq. ft. No Bid

[Line 2 Plate, clear, 1/4"
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 500 sq.ft. $3.27 $1,635.00

Acorn Glass 500 sq. ft. $1,875.00 $937,500.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 500 sq. ft. No Bid

[Line 3 Laminated, clear 1/4"
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 1000 sq. ft. $7.23 $7,230.00

Acorn Glass 1000 sq. ft. $6,500.00 $6,500,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 1000 sq. ft. No Bid

[Line 4 Laminated, bronze/grey,[01/4" 0
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 1000 sq. ft $8.08 $8,080.00

Acorn Glass 1000 sq. ft $7,500.00 $7,500,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 1000 sq. ft No Bid

|Line 5 Tempered safety, cleard01/4" [0
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 500 sq. ft. $6.38 $3,190.00

Acorn Glass 500 sq. ft. $2,000.00 $1,000,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 500 sq. ft. No Bid

|Line 6 Tempered safety, clear(1/8"
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 500 sq. ft. $5.53 $2,765.00

Acorn Glass 500 sq. ft. $1,250.00 $625,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 500 sq. ft. No Bid

[Line 7 Wire glass

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 100 sq. ft. $11.69 $1,169.00

Acorn Glass 100 sq. ft. $500.00 $50,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 100 sq. ft. No Bid

[Line 8 Mirror, 1/4"

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 100 sq. ft. $4.04 $404.00

Acorn Glass 100 sq. ft. $300.00 $30,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 100 sq. ft. No Bid



[Line 9 Insulated, clear 5/8"
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 1000 sq. ft. $7.86 $7,860.00

Acorn Glass 1000 sq. ft. $8,000.00 $8,000,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 1000 sq. ft. No Bid

[Line 10 Insulated, bronze/grey15/8" [
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 1000 sq. ft. $10.03 $10,030.00

Acorn Glass 1000 sq. ft. $8,500.00 $8,500,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 1000 sq. ft. No Bid

[Line 11 1" Insulated units

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 1000 sq. ft. $9.14 $9,140.00

Acorn Glass 1000 sq. ft. $9,500.00 $9,500,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 1000 sg. ft. No Bid

[Line 12 1" Mapespan/cork panels
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Odessa Glass & Mirror* 500 sq. ft. $55.25 $27,625.00

Acorn Glass 500 sq.ft. $16,750.00 $8,375,000.00

SHERWIN WILLIAMS COMPANY 500 sq. ft. No Bid



