
B-3961 Window Coverings for the District - Annual Contract 
 

Line 1 - SPRING CREEK CAMPUS PROJECT - enter pricing for the cost of materials to
replace approximately eight hundred eighty five (885) new Mecho/5 Manual Roller
Shades with Fascia Fabric: Thermo Veil 1519 Silver Birch with bead chain keepers.  The
Blackout on all shades with be 3% Openness. 
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 JOB $120,203.00 $120,203.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 JOB $405,548.25 $405,548.25
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Includes required freight

*Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors

Line 2 - SPRING CREEK CAMPUS PROJECT: enter pricing for removal of existing blinds,
installation and all labor costs for the approximate 885 Mecho/5 Manual Roller Shades
(in line item # 1)
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 JOB $22,745.00 $22,745.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 JOB $28,656.25 $28,656.25
*Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors

Line 3 - PRESTON RIDGE CAMPUS PROJECT: enter pricing for the cost of materials to
replace approximately five hundred eighty one (581) new Mecho/5 Manual Roller Shades
with Fascia Fabric: Thermo Veil 1519 Silver Birch with bead chain keepers.  The
Blackout on all shades will be 3% Openness.
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 JOB $91,312.00 $91,312.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 JOB $224,823.37 $224,823.37
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Includes required freight

Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors

Line 4 - PRESTON RIDGE CAMPUS PROJECT: enter pricing for removal of existing blinds,
installation and all labor costs for the approximate 581 Mecho/5 Manual Roller Shades
(in line item # 3)
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 JOB $15,075.00 $15,075.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 JOB $19,031.25 $19,031.25
Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors



B-3961 Window Coverings for the District - Annual Contract 
 

Line 5 - State Discount Percentage for all Bali items not already listed. 

Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 No Bid No Bid
Kenmark Interiors 1 No Bid No Bid

Line 6 - Bali Customizer, 8-gauge mini blind, color # 026, Smokey Gray, Size: 46"W x
44"L
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 EA $70.00 $70.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 EA No Bid No Bid
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Furnish Only, No installation

Line 7 - Bali Customizer, 8-gauge mini blind, color # 026, Smokey Grey. Size: 116"W x
76"L.

Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 EA $190.00 $190.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 EA No Bid No Bid
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Furnish Only, No installation

Line 8 - State Discount Percentage for all MechoSystems, Inc. products not already listed
in the bid.

Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 No Bid No Bid
Kenmark Interiors 1 No Bid No Bid

Line 9 - Mecho/5 Manual Shades with clean anodized Fascia Fabric: Midnight Blackout
0200 Series (Opaque), Color: 0202 Ice. Size: 46"w x 44"L.
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 EA $380.00 $380.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 EA $489.92 $489.92
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Including installation and 1 trip for measure and 1 trip for
installation
Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors

Line 10 - Mecho/5 Manual Shades with clear anodized Fascia Fabric: Midnight Blackout
0200 Series (Opaque), Color 0202 Ice. Size 116"W x 76"L.
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 EA $790.00 $790.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 EA $1,095.01 $1,095.01
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Including installation and 1 trip for measure and 1 trip for
installation
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Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors

Line 11 - Double Shades: Mecho/5 # 15 Double Shades with clear anodized Fascia
Fabric: Thermo Veil 1300 series and Blackout 0700 Series.  Size: 46"W x 44"L.
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 EA $530.00 $530.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 EA $790.00 $790.00
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Including installation and 1 trip for measure and 1 trip for
installation
Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors

Line 12 -Double Shades: Mecho/5 # 15 Double Shades with clear anodized Fascia Fabric:
Thermo Veil 1300 series and Blackout 0700 Series. Size: 116"W x 76'L.
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 EA $1,157.00 $1,157.00
Kenmark Interiors 1 EA $1,758.55 $1,758.55
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Including installation and 1 trip for measure and 1 trip for
installation
Kenmark Interiors Supplier Notes: Pricing based on Lutron manual roller shades per attached
proposal from Kenmark Interiors

Line 13 -State Discount Percentae for Levolor Products not already listed in this bid.

Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 No Bid No Bid
Kenmark Interiors 1 No Bid No Bid

Line 14 - Levolor horizontal blinds, Riviera Classic 8 gauge, color: Metallic-Galleria 1441,
Size: 72"W x 89"L.
Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 EA $245.79 $245.79
Kenmark Interiors 1 EA No Bid No Bid
*Blind Depot Supplier Notes: Furnish only, no installation

Line 15 - State Discount Percentage for all items not already listed in the bid line items.

Name QTY UOM Price Extended
Blind Depot 1 No Bid No Bid
Kenmark Interiors 1 25.00% 25.00%


