
ISD 363
Fuel Quotations, Milk Bids, 
Bread Quotations SY 22/23

FUEL School

Unleaded Gas
(Includes MN
tax)

Diesel
(Includes MN
tax) Heating Fuel Propane Wood Pellets info

Coop Service Inc. Indus School $4.031
#1 = $4.799
#2 = $4.495

#1 = $4.514
#2 = $4.210

Dividends do
apply on
gas/fuel/propane

Lakes Gas Compnay
Northome School
Indus School

$1.879 per
gallon Indus &
$1.979 per
gallon
Northome

Ferrellgas Northome and Indus School

Firm rate at
$2.049 per
gallon for Indus

Fisher Station Northome $3.956 See info

#1 Fuel Oil =
$4.27
#2 Fuel Oil =
$4.009

Purchase of fuel at the station will be @ current pump price,
less $.05 for diesel and $.05 for unleaded

Indeck Ladysmith Northome $185.00 per ton

MILK Sandstroms -  Northome Only
Land of Lakes
to Northome

Land Of Lakes
to Northome

Land of Lakes to
Indus

Land of Lakes
to Indus

No bid No bid No bid No bid
whole 
2%
1% $0.3000
Skim Fat Free 
Chocolate $0.3000
Choc Skim Fat Free
2/5# Sour Cream
2/5# Cottage Cheese
Dairy Ease $0.7200

BREAD
Hambuger buns 
Coney Bun
Hoagie buns 
White bread/loaf
Wheat bread/loaf


