
              ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Request Number Bid #11-14

Title Print Shop Paper Supplies

Open Date 5/16/2011 8:01:01 AM Central

Close Date 6/6/2011 3:00:00 PM Central

Line 1

8.5 x 11 - 20# Carbonless Reverse


2-Part (NCR or Imation only)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 48 cartons $57.00 $2,736.00

Western Paper Company 48 cartons $78.75 $3,780.00

Buffalo Business Products 48 cartons $99.63 $4,782.24

Copy Craft 48 cartons No Bid

Xerox (Alt 1) 48 cartons $96.95 $4,653.60 Xerox-3r12850

Line 2 8 1/2 x 11 - 67# White Vellum Bristol

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 80 cartons $33.08 $2,646.40

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 80 cartons $34.00 $2,720.00

Buffalo Business Products 80 cartons $38.91 $3,112.80

Copy Craft 80 cartons $47.12 $3,769.60

Xerox 80 cartons No Bid

Line 3

8.5 x 11 - 20# Salmon


(Hammermill, G.P., Colorsource)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 40 Cartons $39.35 $1,574.00

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 Cartons $40.25 $1,610.00

Buffalo Business Products 40 Cartons $45.32 $1,812.80

Copy Craft 40 Cartons $49.00 $1,960.00

Xerox (Alt 1) 40 Cartons $0.00 $0.00

5,000 sheets to a carton, 20lb paper..orders 

must be placed in 40 plus cartons in order to 

receive this price



Line 4

8.5 x 11 - 20# Pink


(Hammermill, G.P., Colorsource)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $39.35 $787.00

Xerox 20 Cartons $39.79 $795.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $40.25 $805.00

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons $45.32 $906.40

Copy Craft 20 Cartons $49.00 $980.00

Line 5 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Blue

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 20 cartons $36.86 $737.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 cartons $37.00 $740.00

Buffalo Business Products 20 cartons $38.91 $778.20

Copy Craft 20 cartons $52.00 $1,040.00

Xerox 20 cartons No Bid

Line 6 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Orchid

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 cartons $37.00 $740.00

Buffalo Business Products 20 cartons $38.91 $778.20

Western Paper Company 20 cartons $45.48 $909.60

Xerox 20 cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 cartons No Bid

Line 7 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Yellow

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 20 cartons $36.86 $737.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 cartons $37.00 $740.00

Buffalo Business Products 20 cartons $38.91 $778.20

Copy Craft 20 cartons $52.00 $1,040.00

Xerox 20 cartons No Bid

Line 8 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Green

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 20 cartons $36.86 $737.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 cartons $37.00 $740.00



Buffalo Business Products 20 cartons $38.91 $778.20

Copy Craft 20 cartons $52.00 $1,040.00

Xerox 20 cartons No Bid

Line 9

8.5 x 11 - 20# Canary(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 60 Cartons $39.35 $2,361.00

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 60 Cartons $40.25 $2,415.00

Buffalo Business Products 60 Cartons $45.32 $2,719.20

Copy Craft 60 Cartons $49.00 $2,940.00

Xerox (Alt 1) 60 Cartons $39.79 $2,387.40

5,000 sheets to a carton, 20lb paper..orders 

must be placed in 40 plus cartons in order to 

receive this price

Line 10

8.5 x 11 - 20# Green(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 40 Cartons $39.35 $1,574.00

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 Cartons $40.25 $1,610.00

Buffalo Business Products 40 Cartons $45.32 $1,812.80

Copy Craft 40 Cartons $49.00 $1,960.00

Xerox (Alt 1) 40 Cartons $39.79 $1,591.60

5,000 sheets to a carton, 20lb paper..orders 

must be placed in 40 plus cartons in order to 

receive this price

Line 11

8.5 x 11 - 20# Blue(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 60 Cartons $39.35 $2,361.00

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 60 Cartons $40.25 $2,415.00

Buffalo Business Products 60 Cartons $45.32 $2,719.20

Copy Craft 60 Cartons $49.00 $2,940.00

Xerox (Alt 1) 60 Cartons $39.79 $2,387.40

5,000 sheets to a carton, 20lb paper..orders 

must be placed in 40 plus cartons in order to 

receive this price



Line 12

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Lipstick

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid

Line 13

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Green

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid

Line 14

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Lime

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid

Line 15

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Lemon

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid



Line 16

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Blue

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid

Line 17

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Turquoise

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid

Line 18

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Grape

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid

Line 19

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Red

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid



Line 20

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Periwinkle

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid

Line 21

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover HOTS only


Orange

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 Cartons $61.38 $1,227.60

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $64.80 $1,296.00

Xerox 20 Cartons No Bid

Buffalo Business Products 20 Cartons No Bid

Copy Craft 20 Cartons No Bid


