
2025 -2026 Custodial Supply List

QUANTITY UNIT SPECIFICATIONS WAREHOUSE
DIRECT NO SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE STANDARD

COMPANIES NO SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE DISPOSE N SAVE SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE INTERBORO
PACKAGING CORP. SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE RAMROD

DISTRIBUTOS, INC BAG SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE PYRAMID SCHOOL  NO SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE QUILL NO SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE UNIPAK CORP. BAG SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE GARVEY'S OFFICE
PRODUCTS SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE BSA, LLC SAMPLES TOTAL PRICE

1200 CASE

Georgia-Pacific # 19375, Compact White Coreless 2-Ply, 1000
sheets per roll, 36 rolls per case.If toilet paper dispensers have to be
changed, vendor to supply any needed dispensers at no cost to the

District.  (No Substitutions)

$ 60.88 $ 73,056.00 $ 59.65 $ 71,580.00 NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 86.15 $ 103,380.00 $ 77.25 $ 92,700.00

400 CASE
Georgia-Pacific # 26480, SoftPull Brown High Capacity Roll Towels,

vendor to supply any needed towel dispensers at no cost to the
District.  (No Substitutions)

$ 67.88 $ 27,152.00 NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 73.37 $ 29,348.00 NO BID #VALUE! $ 86.90 $ 34,760.00 $ 79.50 $ 31,800.00

400 CASE
Black Liners 15 x 9 x 32, .55 mil minimum - For office garbage cans

with light waste.  Must send a manufacturer's letter stating the
thickness of the bag and a sample must accompany the bid.

$ 20.80 $ 8,320.00 $ 14.79 $ 5,916.00 30.82/1000 $ 12,328.00 13.34/1000 $ 5,336.00 $ 13.81 $ 5,524.00 NO BID #VALUE! $ 98.99 $ 39,596.00 $ 14.05 $ 5,620.00 $ 35.54 $ 14,216.00 $ 28.45 $ 11,380.00

1300 CASE

Black Liners 22 x 24 x 50, 1.5 mil minimum - Extra Heavy weight
bags for kitchen & janitor garbage cans.  For heavy waste, wet trash
and large cans from the kitchens.  Must send a manufacturer's letter
stating the thickness of the bag and a sample must accompany the

bid.

$ 29.65 $ 38,545.00 $ 24.38 $ 31,694.00 18.48/100 $ 24,024.00 20.32/100 $ 26,416.00 $ 30.67 $ 39,871.00 NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 18.18 $ 23,634.00 $ 19.58 $ 25,454.00 $ 31.75 $ 41,275.00

300 CASE

Kuto Brand Foaming Antibacterial Hand Soap, # 21341 for wall
dispensers.  If soap dispensers have to be changed, the vendor must
supply all dispensers at no cost to the District.  6 / 1000 ml packages

per case.

$ 60.22 $ 18,066.00 $ 41.50 $ 12,450.00 NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 43.00 #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 55.70 $ 16,710.00

100 CASES GLOVES-Powder Free Vinyl --- Size Large-Sample to accompany
Bid

2.24 per box,10 box
per case 22.40 $ 2,240.00 $ 25.00 $ 2,500.00 17.79/1000 $ 1,779.00 17.70/1000 $ 1,770.00 $ 20.95 $ 2,095.00 $ 29.90 $ 2,990.00 $ 34.17 $ 3,417.00 $ 34.17 #VALUE! 4.50 per box, 10 box

per case 45.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 33.60 $ 3,360.00

100 CASES GLOVES-Powder Free Vinyl --- Size Extra Large - Sample to
accompany the bid

2.24 per box,10 box
per case 22.40 $ 2,240.00 $ 25.00 $ 2,500.00 17.79/1000 $ 1,779.00 17.70/1000 $ 1,770.00 $ 20.95 $ 2,095.00 $ 29.90 $ 2,990.00 $ 33.56 $ 3,356.00 $ 33.56 #VALUE! 4.50 per box, 10 box

per case 45.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 33.60 $ 3,360.00

400 CASES White Multifold Towels $ 26.74 $ 10,696.00 $ 21.05 $ 8,420.00 NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 21.95 $ 8,780.00 NO BID #VALUE! $ 31.80 $ 12,720.00 $ 31.80 #VALUE! $ 29.30 $ 11,720.00 $ 27.95 $ 11,180.00

12 EACH Saintaire Traditional Upright Vacuums  # SC886E with magnets $ 334.12 $ 4,009.44 $ 280.15 $ 3,361.80 NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 329.98 $ 3,959.76 NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! $ 298.00 $ 3,576.00

Totals
Awarded:

WAREHOUSE DIRECT- $27,152.00
STANDARD COMPANIES- $95,811.80

RAMROD- $4,190.00
GARVEY- $39,670.00= $ 166,823.80
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