SSAISD BOARD AGENDA - ITEM SUMMARY

MEETING DATE: November 20, 2013
MEETING TYPE: [ X JREGULAR [ ISPECIAL

Consider approval for a multiple award for RFP#14-4 — Auxiliary Personnel
ITEM TITLE: . . .

Uniforms to Ameriform and H&M Uniforms.
PURPOSE: [ JRECOGNITION [ JREPORTONLY [ ] DISCUSSION  [x JACTION
PRESENTER(S): Andy A. Rocha, Director of Purchasing
REQUESTED BY: Andy A. Rocha, Director of Purchasing

|. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TO INCLUDE YOUR SPECIFIC REQUEST:

The Purchasing Department with the coordination and assistance of the Plant Operations Department
and Child Nutrition Department requested proposals for auxiliary personnel uniforms. The following
departments will be included in the uniform purchase: Child nutrition staff, custodial staff, maintenance
staff, transportation staff, textbook/records staff and warehouse staff.

Il. BACKGROUND INFORMATION (DOCUMENTATION):

Enclosed please find the tabulation for RFP#14-4. The uniforms will be utilized by approximately:
50 transportation workers, 50 maintenance/warehouse workers, 90 custodial staff and 130 child
nutrition workers.

lll. ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED (IF APPLICABLE):

To continue and not provide uniforms for auxiliary staff. J

IV. RECOMMENDATION AND IMPACT:

The recommendation is to consider approval of a multiple award to Ameriform and H&M Uniforms for
RFP#14-4 Auxiliary Personnel Uniforms.

V. DISTRICT GOAL AND CORRESPONDING DEPARTMENTAL INITIATIVE:

N/A

VI. FUNDING SOURCE-PROGRAM AND/OR BUDGET CODE:

Funding for the uniforms will come from the following accounts:
101-35-6299-00-XXX-499-000
199-51-6299-95-XXX-499-000
199-34-6299-00-XXX-499-000




CHILD NUTRITION

BRAND

1 HARTWELL

2 EDWARDS

3 HARTWELL

4 EDWARDS

5 EDWARDS

6 EDWARDS

7 DICKIES

8 RED KAP

9 FAME

10 RED KAP

RFP#14-4 BID TABULATION

STYLE # QUALITIES

505

5576

500

1576

8279

8897

F23

Aramark Embroider-ism H&M Ameriform
AS SPEC | SUBSTITUTIO AS SPEC AS SPEC AS SPEC | SUBSTITUTION
\L SIZE PRICE (Y/N) |N BRAND AND| PRICE (Y/N) SUBS PRICE (Y/N) SUBS
Moisture Management, V-
neck w/ side vents. 100%| S-XL | $ 1525 N WEARGUARD | $ 15.00 Y $ 1395 i
2XL+ | $ 16.25 N WEARGUARD | § 15.00 Y $ 1595 Y
100% poly, no v-neck. S-XL | $ 17.25 Y $ 13.75 Y $ 1395 Y
2L | § 18.25 Y $ 16.25 Y $  15.95 Y
3XL $ 19.25 Y S 18.25 Y S 16.95 Y
Moisture Management,
NO V-neck S-XL | § 15.25 N WEARGUARD | § 15.00 Y $ 13.95 Y
100% Poly 2XL+ 16.25 N WEARGUARD | § 15.00 Y S 15.95 Y
Dry-Mesh, Moisture
Wicking, 3-button S-XL | § 17.25 Y $ 13.75 Y $  13.95 Y
laundry friendly, shrink
and fade resistant 2XL | § 18.25 Y 5 16.00 Y $ 1595 Y
100% Poly 3XL 19.25 $ 18.00 Y $  16.95
axL 21.25 Y $ 19.00 Y 5  16.95
100% Poly, side pockets,
zipper and button closure| 4--20 | § 28.25 Y $ 23.00 Y § 2395 Y
22-24 | § 33.75 Y $ 27.50 Y $ 2795 Y
100% Spun Poly,
Reinforced elastic XS-XL | § 15.65 Y $ 15.25 Y S 14.95 Y
2XL $ 18.70 Y $ 17.25 Y S 16.95 vt
3XL-4XL| § 20.25 Y $ 19.25 Y $  17.95 Y
Industrial work pant
LP810BK Poly/ Cotton Blend 28-42 | S 18.40 Yl $ 21.00 Y S 18.95 Y
44-60 | § 20.25 Y $ 22.00 Y S 19.95 Y
Industrial work pant, easy
PT20BK fit, 65/35 Poly/Cotton 28-42 | § 13.95 Y $ 17.00 Y S 13.95 Y
44-54 | § 14.95 Y $ 19.00 Y $ 15.95 Y
56-60 | § 14.95 Y NO BID $ 18.95 Y
Black V-neck apron with UNCOMMO
pockets & adjustable N/A |$  7.25 N WEARGUARD | $§  7.00 N N THREADS | § 9.95 Y
80/20, 5 oz, loose fit,
button front. French
TP23 hemmed SS Wom. SHIRT. S-XL 15.99 WEARGUARD | $ 16.50 Y S 13.95 $ 14.00 Y
2X-4X 16.99 WEARGUARD [ $ 21.00 Y $  15.95 $ 18.00 Y




MAINTENANCE

11 RED KAP

12 RED KAP

13 CHEROKEE

14 RED KAP

15 RED KAP

16 RED KAP

RFP#14-4 BID TABULATION

STYLE # QUALITIES

SP65

PT61

4001

SP24

SP14

PT10

Aramark Embroider-ism H&M Ameriform
AS SPEC | SUBSTITUTIO AS SPEC AS SPEC AS SPEC | SUBSTITUTION
SIZE PRICE (Y/N) |N BRAND AND| PRICE (Y/N) SUBS PRICE (Y/N) SUBS PRICE (Y/N) BRAND AND
65/35, 4.25 oz, soft hand =
poplin, squared bottom
hem, left chest pocket.
Women's shirt. S-XL [$ 17.99 N WEARGUARD | $ 15.50 Y S 10.95 Y $ 10.50 Y
2X-4X | $ 18.99 N WEARGUARD | § 17.00 Y $ 12.95 ¥ $ 13.00 Y
65% poly, 35% cotton, 5
oz., half elastic
waistband, 2 side pocket.
Women's Pant 4-20 |$ 13.95 N WEARGUARD | NO BID $ 16.95 Y $ 15.50 Y
22-40 | $ 14.95 N WEARGUARD | NO BID $ 18.95 Y $ 20.00 Y
65% poly, 35% cotton, full
elastic, 2 pocket. 4-20 | NOBID Y $ 12.50 Y S 14.95 Y $ 11.00 Y
$15.95 - 2X
$16.95 - 3X
22-40 | NO BID Y $ 15.50 Y Y $ 13.00 Y
65% poly, 35% cotton,
4.25 oz, convertible collor
with stays, pockets with
pencil stall. Short sleeve
men's shirt S-XL [$ 12.95 WEARGUARD | $ 13.50 Y 10.95 10.00
2X+ $ 13.95 WEARGUARD | $ 15.50 h s 12.95 $ 12.00
65% poly, 35% cotton,
4.25 oz, convertible collor
with stays, pockets with
pencil stall. Long sleeve
men's shirt. S-XL | $§ 13.95 N WEARGUARD | $ 16.00 Y 5 13.95 Y $ 11.00 Y
2X+ $ 14.95 N WEARGUARD | $ 17.00 Y $ 15.95 Y $ 13.00 Y
65/35, 8 oz. front pockets,
Men's regular cut work
pant. 28-42 | § 13.95 N WEARGUARD | $§ 22.00 Y $ 16.95 Y $ 16.50 Y
44-54 | $ 14.95 N WEARGUARD | § 25.00 Y $ 1895 Y $ 20.00 Y
56-60 | § 15.95 N WEARGUARD | NO BID S 20.95 Y $ 25.00 Y
60/40% POLY 4.5 0Z, BOX
PLEATED BACK, BANDED
COLLAR. MLSLEEVE
SR70 EXECUTIVE SHIRT S-XL | $ 19.99 N WEARGUARD | § 22.00 Y $ 20.95 Y $ 17.50 Y
2X+ S 20.99 N WEARGUARD | § 23.50 Y $ 22.95 Y $ 19.50 Y




MAINTENANCE

BRAND

RED KAP

RED KAP

RED KAP

17 RED KAP

18 RED KAP

19 RED KAP

20
21

# of days after recievng purchase order to delivery of|

22

STYLE # QUALITIES

60% COMBINNED
COTTON, 40% POLY 4.5
0Z, BOX PLEATED BACK,
BANDED COLLAR,
DOUBLE PLEATED SLEEVE.
MEN'S SHORT SLEEVE
EXECUTIVE BUTTON

SR60 DOWN SHIRT.

60% COMBINNED
COTTON, 40% POLY 4.5
0Z, BOX PLEATED BACK,

SR71 BANDED COLLAR,

60COTTON, 40POLY 4.5
0Z, BOX PLEATED BACK,
BANDED COLLAR,
DOUBLE PLEATED SLEEVE.

SR61 W long sleeve executive

65/35 cotton twill, 8 oz.
frontier-style pockets,
patch hip pocket, Men's

PT50 regular cut work pant.

100% cotton denim twill,
13.75 oz., basic 5 pockets,
straight leg, metal button,

PD54 waistband closure.

65% poly, 35% cotton

JT50  twill 7.5 oz. Solid team

RFP#14-4 BID TABULATION

Price for Embroidered Logo
Price for Embroidered Name

Aramark Embroider-ism H&M Ameriform
AS SPEC | SUBSTITUTIO AS SPEC AS SPEC AS SPEC |SUBSTITUTION
SIZE PRICE (Y/N) |N BRAND AND| PRICE (Y/N) SUBS PRICE (Y/N) SUBS PRICE (Y/N) BRAND AND
S-XL | $ 18.99 N WEARGUARD | $ 21.00 Y 17.95 Y $ 17.00 Y
2X+ [$§ 19.99 N WEARGUARD | $ 24.00 Y 19.95 Y $ 19.00 Y
S-XL [S§ 19.99 N WEARGUARD | § 27.00 Y 20.95 Y $ 17.50 Y
2X+ |5 20.99 N WEARGUARD| § 23.50 Y 22.95 Y $ 19.50 Y
S-XL [$ 18.99 N WEARGUARD| $ 20.50 Y 17.95 Y $ 16.00 Y
2X+ [ $ 19.99 N WEARGUARD| § 23.00 Y 19.95 Y $ 18.00 Y
28-42 | § 15.95 N WEARGUARD| $ 22.00 16.95 Y $ 17.50
44-54 | § 16.95 N WEARGUARD| $ 24.50 18.95 $ 21.50 Y
56-60 | $ 16.95 N WEARGUARD| NO BID 20.95 Y $ 24.00 Y
28-42 | § 13.95 N WEARGUARD| $ 22.00 Y 16.95 Y $ 16.50 ¥
44-54 | § 13.95 N WEARGUARD| $ 25.00 Y 18.95 Y $ 20.00 Y
56-60 [ § 15.95 N WEARGUARD| NO BID 20.95 Y $ 24.00 Y
S-XL | $ 34.99 N ARAMARK $ 42.00 30.95 Y $ 29.00 Y
2%+ | § 36.99 N ARAMARK $ 47.00 32.95 Y $ 35.50 Y
S 2.50 | $ 3.00 NO CHARGE 5 3.25
S 2.50 | § 2.00 3.00| $ 2.00
T 30 DAYS WITH EMBROIDERY, 14 N ORK DAYS —

uniforms

DAYS WITHOUT




