Bid Category No.: Summary

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

Category Name: Bid Costs August 24, 2017 2:00 P.M.
Landscaping, Playground .
. General Structural & . . Casework & . Fire . .
Bid Category Total Building Misc. Steel Sseedlr]g & Equip. & Millwork Food Service Suppression Mechanical Electrical
odding Surfaces
J. R Kelly Indiana Steel Greenvision Recrlea\ion Stone(l:reek Lancaster-Schert . Ryan . Commercial Air || Huston Electric
Insights Interiors Fireprotection

Non-Collusion Affidavit yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Bid Bond yes yes yes no, certified check yes yes yes yes yes
Financial Statement yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
Base Bid $16,214,652.00 $9,984,000.00 $1,249,000.00 $128,855.00 $280,501.00 $387,400.00 $236,728.00 $189,525.00 $2,230,000.00 $1,528,643.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization $65,100.00 $65,100.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate $163,000.00|  $163,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface $86,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $86,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment $54,706.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $54,706.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) $281,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $281,500.00 $0.00
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alterate (Daikin Applied) HOA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $278,500.00 $0.00
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Altemate (Johnson-Controls - York) Huan $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Altemate (Carrier Corporation) MU $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) $231,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $231,000.00 $0.00
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $238,500.00 $0.00
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 0 $225,000.00 0
Total Including Alternates $17,096,458.00{ $10,212,100.00 $1,249,000.00 $128,855.00 $367,001.00! $387,400.00 $291,434.00 $189,525.00 $2,742,500.00 $1,528,643.00

$17,096,458.00




Bid Category No.: 1

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

Category Name: General Building Construction August 24, 2017 2:00 P.M.
Bl d ders J. R. Kelly Verkler J. C. Ripberger Mid-States Powers & Son

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Bid Bond

Financial Statement

Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires

Base Bid $9,984,000.00 | $10,450,000.00 || $10,868,700.00 | $11,674,000.00 || $11,925,000.00

Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization $65,100.00 $22,000.00 $93,600.00 $55,600.00 $244,635.00

Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate $163,000.00 $167,000.00 $167,900.00 $257,000.00 $173,800.00

Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A

Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) No Work N/A N/A $0.00 N/A




Bid Category No.: 2

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

Category Name: Structural & Miscellaneous Steel August 24, 2017 2:00 P.M.
. Indiana Steel || Geiger & Peters | Century Steel Structurgl Steel Almet Halvorsen

Bldders Services

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Bid Bond

Financial Statement

Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires

Base Bid $1,249,000.00 $1,255,000.00 $1,284,600.00 $1,399,900.00 $1,449,000.00 $1,800,000.00

Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00

Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A No Change $0.00




Bid Category No.: 3

Category Name: Landscaping, Seeding & Sodding

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

August 24, 2017

2:00 P.M.

Bl d ders Greenvision
Non-Collusion Affidavit
Bid Bond
Financial Statement
Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires
Base Bid $128,855.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization N/A
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate $0.00
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface N/A
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment N/A
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) N/A
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) N/A
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) N/A
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) N/A
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) N/A
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) N/A
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) N/A




Bid Category No.: 4

Category Name: Playground Equipment and Surfaces

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

August 24, 2017

2:00 P.M.

Recreation

Bidders| Insights
Non-Collusion Affidavit
Bid Bond
Financial Statement
Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires
Base Bid $280,501.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization $0.00
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate $0.00
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface $86,500.00
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment $0.00
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) $0.00
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) $0.00
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) $0.00
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) $0.00
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) $0.00
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) $0.00
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) $0.00




Bid Category No.: 5

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

Category Name: Casework & Millwork August 24, 2017 2:00 P.M.
Bl d ders Sﬁz?:r?(;fsek Lee Co. Deco
Non-Collusion Affidavit
Bid Bond
Financial Statement
Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires
Base Bid $387,400.00 $401,230.00 $414,900.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) $0.00 N/A No Change
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) $0.00 N/A No Change




Bid Category No.: 6

Category Name: Food Service

BID TABULATION

August 24, 2017

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

2:00 P.M.

. Lancaster-Schert| C&T Design Stafford-Smith Great Lakes
Bidders

Non-Collusion Affidavit
Bid Bond
Financial Statement
Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires
Base Bid $236,728.00 $257,315.00 $258,398.00 $271,394.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment $54,706.00 $52,760.00 $57,174.00 $68,690.00
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) No Change No Change $0.00 $0.00




Bid Category No.: 7

Category Name: Fire Protection

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

August 24, 2017

2:00 P.M.

Bl d ders Ryan Fire Dalmatian Geyer Fire
Non-Collusion Affidavit
Bid Bond
Financial Statement
Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires
Base Bid $189,525.00 $215,000.00 $238,800.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) No Change No Bid $0.00
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) No Change No Bid $0.00




Bid Category No.: 8

Category Name: Mechanical

BID TABULATION

August 24, 2017

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

2:00 P.M.

. Commercial Air D. A. Dodd QPH North Mechanical| Shambaugh
Bidders

Non-Collusion Affidavit
Bid Bond
Financial Statement
Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires
Base Bid $2,230,000.00 | $2,650,000.00 | $2,665,000.00 | $2,762,000.00 | $2,925,000.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization N/A N/A $0.00 N/A N/A
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate N/A N/A $0.00 N/A N/A
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface N/A N/A $0.00 N/A N/A
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment N/A $10,400.00 $5,000.00 N/A N/A
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) $281,500.00 $276,000.00 $290,000.00 $294,000.00 $278,250.00
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) $278,500.00 $283,000.00 $285,000.00 $295,600.00 $278,250.00
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) $231,000.00 $219,000.00 $234,000.00 $228,800.00 $231,000.00
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) $238,500.00 $236,000.00 $244,000.00 $236,000.00 $238,350.00
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) $225,000.00 $332,690.00 $230,000.00 $221,500.00 $223,650.00




Bid Category No.: 9

Category Name: Electrical

BID TABULATION

LSC Glen Acres Elementary School

August 24, 2017

2:00 P.M.

Bidders

Huston Electric

Long Electric

Electric Plus

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Bid Bond

Financial Statement

Principal & Subcontractor Questionnaires

Base Bid $1,528,643.00 | $1,695,800.00 | $1,876,700.00
Alt. #1 - Lime Stabilization N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #2 - Roof Alternate N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #3 - Upper Grade Playground Surface N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #4 - All Loose Kitchen Equipment N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #5 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Trane Company) N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #6 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Daikin Applied) N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #7 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Johnson-Controls - York) N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #8 - Mechanical Equipment Alternate (Carrier Corporation) N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #9 - Temperature Controls (Trane Company) N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #10 - Temperature Controls (Siemens) N/A N/A No Change
Alt. #11 - Temperature Controls (Automated Logic) N/A N/A No Change




