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Event Number 4202 Addendum 2 Organization Collin College
Purchasing

Event Title Printed T-shirts and Embroidered Polos,
Annual Contract

Workgroup CCCCD

Event Description ADULT SIZES ARE TO BE PRICED FOR ALL
ITEMS. Collin College plans to put in place
a contract for one (1) initial year, with
options to renew two (2)additional years.
Bids submitted with variances of the
specifications could result in
disqualification. Historical expenditures
through the last three (3) year contract
has been approximately $170,000 for t-
shirts and approximately $57,000 for
embroidered polos. Although past
expenditures are provided, there is no
guaranty the expenditures will be the
same in future years.

Event Owner Joy LaFon

Event Type ITB Email jlafon@collin.edu

Issue Date 10/29/2018 02:00:01 PM (CT) Phone (972) 758-3870
Close Date 11/12/2018 02:00:00 PM (CT) Fax (972) 758-3881

Responding Supplier City State Lines
Responded

Response Total

Groggy Dog Sportswear Denton TX 0 $0.00
EmbroidMe of McKinney
(Groovy Designs LLC)

MCKINNEY TX 4 $22.48

Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas,
Inc.

Houston TX 62 $232.62

Threads Traverse City MI 62 $263.28
Great Armadillo Printing Co.
LLC

AMARILLO TX 62 $267.10

SP Designs & MFG, Inc. Cape Coral FL 60 $295.93
Buffalo Specialties Houston TX 62 $347.90
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) Richardson TX 62 $399.04

PXP Solutions LLC Garland TX 62 $447.40
Bossier Embroidery & Screen
Printing (Guillory Enterprises of
Bossier LLC)

Bossier City LA 62 $448.45

SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND
MARKETING

Philadelphia PA 62 $488.30

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response
data is included.
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1 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.43 $2.43
Threads 1 EA $3.29 $3.29
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.40 $3.40
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.25 $4.25
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.49 $4.49
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.50 $4.50
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.15 $6.15
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.08 $7.08

2 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.43 $2.43
Threads 1 EA $2.84 $2.84
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.06 $3.06
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.95 $3.95
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.00 $4.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.16 $4.16
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.75 $5.75
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.95 $5.95

3 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.17 $2.17
Threads 1 EA $2.74 $2.74
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $2.88 $2.88
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.00 $3.00
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.75 $3.75
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $3.75 $3.75
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $3.77 $3.77
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.25 $5.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.74 $5.74
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4 For Quantity 1001+. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $1.99 $1.99
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $2.00 $2.00
Threads 1 EA $2.64 $2.64
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $2.78 $2.78
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.50 $3.50
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $3.58 $3.58
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $3.60 $3.60
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.37 $5.37

5 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.53 $2.53
Threads 1 EA $4.69 $4.69
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.75 $4.75
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.25 $5.25
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.24 $6.24
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.25 $6.25
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.40 $6.40
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $9.50 $9.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $9.73 $9.73

6 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.53 $2.53
Threads 1 EA $3.79 $3.79
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.36 $4.36
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.59 $5.59
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.60 $5.60
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.00 $6.00

Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.95 $6.95



4202 Addendum 2 - Page 4

7 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.47 $2.47
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.40 $3.40
Threads 1 EA $3.59 $3.59
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.84 $3.84
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.70 $4.70
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.70 $4.70
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.81 $4.81
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.75 $5.75
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.74 $6.74

8 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.27 $2.27
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $2.45 $2.45
Threads 1 EA $3.39 $3.39
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.58 $3.58
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.42 $4.42
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.45 $4.45
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.50 $4.50
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.12 $6.12

9 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.67 $2.67
Threads 1 EA $3.39 $3.39
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.65 $4.65
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.85 $4.85
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.07 $6.07
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.50 $6.50
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.30 $7.30
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.39 $7.39
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10 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.67 $2.67
Threads 1 EA $2.94 $2.94
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.06 $4.06
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.35 $4.35
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.45 $4.45
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.20 $5.20
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.74 $5.74
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.25 $6.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.35 $6.35

11 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.41 $2.41
Threads 1 EA $2.94 $2.94
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.88 $3.88
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.90 $3.90
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.00 $4.00
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.55 $4.55
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.35 $5.35
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.04 $6.04

12 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.23 $2.23
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $2.45 $2.45
Threads 1 EA $2.74 $2.74
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.75 $3.75
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.78 $3.78
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.16 $5.16
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.67 $5.67
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13 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 $2.97 $2.97
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 $4.66 $4.66
Threads 1 $4.79 $4.79
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 $5.10 $5.10
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 $5.50 $5.50
Buffalo Specialties 1 $6.70 $6.70
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 $7.82 $7.82
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 $9.69 $9.69
PXP Solutions LLC 1 $11.20 $11.20

14 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.97 $2.97
Threads 1 EA $3.89 $3.89
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.14 $4.14
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.85 $4.85
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.60 $5.60
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.00 $7.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.17 $7.17
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.56 $7.56

15 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.81 $2.81
Threads 1 EA $3.69 $3.69
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.87 $3.87
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.70 $4.70
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.70 $5.70
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.39 $6.39
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.10 $7.10
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16 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.53 $2.53
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $2.75 $2.75
Threads 1 EA $3.49 $3.49
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.52 $3.52
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.20 $4.20
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.45 $5.45
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.67 $6.67

17 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.51 $2.51
Threads 1 EA $3.29 $3.29
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.40 $3.40
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.25 $4.25
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.50 $4.50
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.71 $4.71
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.15 $6.15
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.10 $7.10

18 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.51 $2.51
Threads 1 EA $2.84 $2.84
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.06 $3.06
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.95 $3.95
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.00 $4.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.38 $4.38
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.25 $5.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.95 $5.95
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19 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.25 $2.25
Threads 1 EA $2.74 $2.74
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $2.88 $2.88
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.00 $3.00
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.75 $3.75
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $3.99 $3.99
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.00 $4.00
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.74 $5.74

20 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print colors,
1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $2.00 $2.00
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.07 $2.07
Threads 1 EA $2.64 $2.64
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $2.78 $2.78
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.50 $3.50
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $3.60 $3.60
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $3.80 $3.80
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $4.75 $4.75
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.37 $5.37

21 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.87 $2.87
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.66 $4.66
Threads 1 EA $4.69 $4.69
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.75 $4.75
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.40 $6.40
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.46 $6.46
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $9.10 $9.10
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $9.50 $9.50



4202 Addendum 2 - Page 9

22 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.87 $2.87
Threads 1 EA $3.79 $3.79
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.14 $4.14
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.25 $5.25
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.60 $5.60
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.81 $5.81
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.95 $6.95

23 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.63 $2.63
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.40 $3.40
Threads 1 EA $3.59 $3.59
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.87 $3.87
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.70 $4.70
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.70 $4.70
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.03 $5.03
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.74 $6.74

24 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, White, 50/50 blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print colors,
2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.35 $2.35
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $2.45 $2.45
Threads 1 EA $3.39 $3.39
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.52 $3.52
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.45 $4.45
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.50 $4.50
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.64 $4.64
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.12 $6.12
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25 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.67 $2.67
Threads 1 EA $3.39 $3.39
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.42 $4.42
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.65 $4.65
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.85 $4.85
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.82 $5.82
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.85 $6.85
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.49 $7.49

26 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print locations.Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.67 $2.67
Threads 1 EA $2.94 $2.94
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.05 $4.05
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.35 $4.35
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.45 $4.45
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.10 $5.10
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.49 $5.49
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.75 $5.75
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.44 $6.44

27 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.43 $2.43
Threads 1 EA $2.84 $2.84
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.84 $3.84
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.90 $3.90
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.00 $4.00
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.45 $4.45
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.10 $5.10
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.04 $6.04
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28 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print colors,
1 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.23 $2.23
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $2.55 $2.55
Threads 1 EA $2.74 $2.74
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $3.62 $3.62
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $3.75 $3.75
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.30 $4.30
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $4.91 $4.91
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.25 $5.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $5.67 $5.67

29 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.93 $2.93
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.75 $4.75
Threads 1 EA $4.79 $4.79
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.38 $5.38
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.70 $6.70
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.57 $7.57
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $9.94 $9.94
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $10.20 $10.20

30 For Quantity 100 - 500. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.93 $2.93
Threads 1 EA $3.89 $3.89
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.83 $4.83
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.60 $5.60
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $6.25 $6.25
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.70 $6.70
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.92 $6.92
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.44 $7.44
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31 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.77 $2.77
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.00 $3.00
Threads 1 EA $3.69 $3.69
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.54 $4.54
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.70 $4.70
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.40 $5.40
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.75 $5.75
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.14 $6.14
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.04 $7.04

32 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, short sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print colors,
2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $2.43 $2.43
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.00 $3.00
Threads 1 EA $3.49 $3.49
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.18 $4.18
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $4.20 $4.20
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $4.60 $4.60
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $5.25 $5.25
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.75 $5.75
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.42 $6.42

33 For Quantity 99 OR Less. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.39 $3.39
Threads 1 EA $4.39 $4.39
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.50 $4.50
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.81 $5.81
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.90 $7.90
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.95 $7.95
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $8.00 $8.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $8.41 $8.41
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34 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.39 $3.39
Threads 1 EA $3.94 $3.94
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.25 $4.25
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.19 $5.19
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.65 $5.65
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.20 $6.20
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.40 $7.40
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.67 $7.67
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.70 $7.70

35 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.17 $3.17
Threads 1 EA $3.84 $3.84
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.00 $4.00
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.79 $4.79
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.20 $5.20
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.55 $5.55
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.96 $6.96
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.28 $7.28
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.60 $7.60

36 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.01 $3.01
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.65 $3.65
Threads 1 EA $3.74 $3.74
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.56 $4.56
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.40 $5.40
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.58 $6.58
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.09 $7.09
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.50 $7.50
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37 For Quantity 99 or Less. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.71 $3.71
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Threads 1 EA $5.79 $5.79
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.48 $6.48
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.90 $7.90
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $8.15 $8.15
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $9.75 $9.75
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $10.25 $10.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $10.66 $10.66

38 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Groggy Dog Sportswear 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.71 $3.71
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.75 $4.75
Threads 1 EA $4.89 $4.89
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.67 $5.67
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.85 $6.85
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.80 $7.80
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.90 $7.90
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $8.40 $8.40
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $9.10 $9.10

39 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.47 $3.47
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
Threads 1 EA $4.69 $4.69
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.18 $5.18
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.20 $6.20
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.80 $6.80
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.50 $7.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.96 $7.96
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $8.32 $8.32
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40 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, White, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.29 $3.29
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.15 $4.15
Threads 1 EA $4.49 $4.49
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $4.91 $4.91
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.70 $5.70
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.15 $6.15
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.20 $7.20
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.33 $7.33
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.93 $7.93

41 For Quantity 99 or Less. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.27 $4.27
Threads 1 EA $5.39 $5.39
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $5.50 $5.50
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $7.18 $7.18
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $7.35 $7.35
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $9.41 $9.41
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $9.50 $9.50
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $9.79 $9.79
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $10.05 $10.05

42 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.27 $4.27
Threads 1 EA $4.94 $4.94
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $5.25 $5.25
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.45 $6.45
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.70 $6.70
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $8.00 $8.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $8.40 $8.40
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $9.25 $9.25
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $9.47 $9.47
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43 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.05 $4.05
Threads 1 EA $4.84 $4.84
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.30 $6.30
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.42 $6.42
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.30 $7.30
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.94 $7.94
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $9.00 $9.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $9.08 $9.08

44 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $3.89 $3.89
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.65 $4.65
Threads 1 EA $4.74 $4.74
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.05 $6.05
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.16 $6.16
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.20 $7.20
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.55 $7.55
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.75 $8.75
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $8.88 $8.88

45 For Quantity 99 or Less. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.53 $4.53
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
Threads 1 EA $6.79 $6.79
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $8.57 $8.57
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $9.25 $9.25
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $9.50 $9.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $11.41 $11.41
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $11.55 $11.55
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $14.00 $14.00
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46 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.53 $4.53
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $5.75 $5.75
Threads 1 EA $5.89 $5.89
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $7.50 $7.50
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $7.66 $7.66
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $9.25 $9.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $9.40 $9.40
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $9.75 $9.75
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $10.90 $10.90

47
For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen
print colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.33 $4.33
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.90 $4.90
Threads 1 EA $5.69 $5.69
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $7.09 $7.09
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $7.15 $7.15
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $8.45 $8.45
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $8.94 $8.94
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $9.00 $9.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $10.12 $10.12

48 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, Color, 6.2 oz. Ultra Cotton, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.15 $4.15
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.65 $4.65
Threads 1 EA $5.49 $5.49
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.77 $6.77
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.80 $6.80
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $8.25 $8.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $8.30 $8.30
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.75 $8.75
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $9.73 $9.73
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49 For Quantity 99 or Less. Gildan, White, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Threads 1 EA $4.34 $4.34
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.50 $4.50
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.69 $4.69
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.00 $6.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.87 $6.87
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $7.22 $7.22
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $8.40 $8.40
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.50 $8.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $8.61 $8.61

50 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, White, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Threads 1 EA $3.89 $3.89
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.25 $4.25
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.69 $4.69
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.65 $5.65
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.38 $6.38
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.54 $6.54
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.95 $6.95
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.40 $7.40
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.25 $8.25

51 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, White, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Threads 1 EA $3.79 $3.79
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.00 $4.00
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.47 $4.47
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.20 $5.20
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.86 $5.86
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $6.05 $6.05
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.15 $6.15
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.85 $6.85
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.00 $8.00
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52 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, White, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print colors,
1 screen print location.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $3.65 $3.65
Threads 1 EA $3.69 $3.69
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.31 $4.31
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $5.57 $5.57
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $5.90 $5.90
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.96 $5.96
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $6.47 $6.47
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.80 $7.80

53 For Quantity 99 or Less. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $5.07 $5.07
Threads 1 EA $6.75 $6.75
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $8.44 $8.44
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $8.62 $8.62
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.75 $8.75
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $9.25 $9.25
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $10.61 $10.61
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $12.10 $12.10

54 For Quantity 100-500. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.75 $4.75
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $5.07 $5.07
Threads 1 EA $5.85 $5.85
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $7.50 $7.50
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $7.54 $7.54
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.97 $7.97
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $8.45 $8.45
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.50 $8.50
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $8.60 $8.60
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55 For Quantity 501-1000. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print
colors, 2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.40 $4.40
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.87 $4.87
Threads 1 EA $5.65 $5.65
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.97 $6.97
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $7.15 $7.15
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $7.19 $7.19
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.30 $7.30
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.85 $7.85
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $8.25 $8.25

56 For Quantity 1000+. Gildan, Color, 50/50 Blend, no pocket, Long sleeve, 1 OR 2 screen print colors,
2 screen print locations.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $4.15 $4.15
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $4.59 $4.59
Threads 1 EA $5.45 $5.45
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $6.65 $6.65
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $6.80 $6.80
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $6.80 $6.80
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $7.05 $7.05
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $7.22 $7.22
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $7.90 $7.90

57 State mark up percentage range for plus sizes 2X or greater for basic t-shirt.

Supplier QTY UOM
Percent
Markup

Extended

EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA 12
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA 15
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA 20
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA 25
Threads 1 EA 30
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA 35
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA 45
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA 82
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58 State your screen set up fee.
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA No Bid
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $0.00 $0.00
Threads 1 EA $0.00 $0.00
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $0.00 $0.00
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $15.00 $15.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $15.00 $15.00
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $20.00 $20.00
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $25.00 $25.00
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $25.00 $25.00
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $25.00 $25.00

59
Embroidered Polo shirts, sizes Adult S-XL. Prices are to be good for all shirt colors. Prices are to be
based on one (1) embroidery location 10,000 stitch count. Minimum order six (6). Designs larger
than 10,000 stitch count to be priced individually. Quantities exceeding 96 to be priced individually
for a lower cost. Adult sizes S, M, L, XL.Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Threads 1 EA $9.75 $9.75
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $10.50 $10.50
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $12.00 $12.00
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $14.50 $14.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $15.24 $15.24
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $15.53 $15.53
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA $15.98 $15.98
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $19.75 $19.75
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $20.00 $20.00

60 State the percentage markup, over the basic shirt, for size 2X and greater.

Supplier QTY UOM
Percent
Markup

Extended

Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA 7
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA 12
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA 15
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA 15
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA 15
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA 20
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA 30
Threads 1 EA 30
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA 50
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61 State set up fee for additional embroidery (Department Name, Organization Name, etc.)
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 EA $0.75 $0.75
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 EA $2.00 $2.00
Buffalo Specialties 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 EA $5.00 $5.00
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 EA $6.50 $6.50
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 EA $7.50 $7.50
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 EA $15.00 $15.00
Threads 1 EA $25.00 $25.00
PXP Solutions LLC 1 EA $35.00 $35.00
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 EA $75.00 $75.00

62 State percent off catalog prices for other apparel.
Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off Extended
Great Armadillo Printing Co. LLC 1 40
Logotology (PK Promotion, LLC) 1 30
Buffalo Specialties 1 30
Threads 1 25
SP Designs & MFG, Inc. 1 20
Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc. 1 20
PXP Solutions LLC 1 15
EmbroidMe of McKinney (Groovy Designs LLC) 1 15
SCOOPS PROMOTIONAL AND MARKETING 1 8
Bossier Embroidery & Screen Printing (Guillory
Enterprises of Bossier LLC) 1 0


