
Amphitheater Public Schools
RFB 05-10-2018 Brake Parts Labor

Attachment A 1

STEMCO BRAND SEALS & KITS 
(NO SUBSTITUTE)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO     

PRICE
330-3067    GASKET 1.37 1.22 2.27 1.23 2.41 1.76
343-4024    OIL CAP 27.08 23.96 31.37 24.11 32.08 34.68
343-4095    OIL CAP 31.30 27.69 36.25 27.86 36.91 40.09
359-5912    WINDOW KIT 9.54 8.44 11.05 8.49 11.31 12.22
359-5990    WINDOW PLUG 2.67 2.36 7.69 2.38 4.28 3.42
359-5995    WINDOW KIT 5.75 5.14 6.66 5.12 7.94 7.36
382-8036    WHEEL SEAL 29.15 28.66 33.30 28.82 38.75 37.34
392-9099    WHEEL SEAL 34.15 33.58 43.94 33.77 45.39 43.74
392-9131    WHEEL SEAL 35.14 33.97 40.12 34.74 46.70 45.01
359-5999    WINDOW PLUG 6.01 5.32 6.97 5.36 8.33 7.70
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS

64% 40-80% 45% 0% 25% 47%

BENDIX BRAND 
MANUFACTURED OR BENDIX 
BRAND RE-MANUFACTURED 

BRAKE COMPONENTS          
(NO SUBSTITUTE)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

5004341X 52.62 53.82 55.40 51.37 78.05 57.06
278615N 23.83 24.68 29.85 23.28 27.23 24.56
276566N 30.70 31.78 33.40 29.98 35.06 31.63
107794X 24.14 23.66 25.41 23.57 26.11 26.18
801481 183.52 180.98 197.64 177.89 209.56 178.31
103385N 11.31 11.71 11.78 11.05 12.21 11.65
K1289120RX 138.11 142.99 No Bid 149.82 No Bid 149.77
276569X     30.72 17.22 33.59 30.16 27.34 17.51
286364X     67.71 60.11 75.95 112.15 106.44 62.96
800629 120.58 127.34 133.79 120.09 140.45 126.72
OR275491X 13.44 13.91 18.25 13.12 15.13 14.57
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS

60% 40-80% 40% 0% 25% 55%

ROCKWELL/ MERITOR BRAND 
(NO SUBSTITUTE)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

B31-3299-T-1554 68.11 72.95 68.00 68.12 75.48 80.03
B31-3299-U-1555 68.11 72.95 76.84 68.12 73.98 80.03
R810021 8.69 8.57 8.68 8.59 9.30 11.19
R801041 66.11 59.49 73.04 58.49 67.88 75.09
R801073 66.11 49.49 89.36 56.82 67.88 75.09
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS

67% 40-80% 35% 0% 25% 53%

 



Amphitheater Public Schools
RFB 05-10-2018 Brake Parts Labor

Attachment A 2

DRUMS WEBB OR GUNITE 
ONLY (NO OFF SHORE)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

66854B or 3807AX 213.59 139.72 217.82 158.37 163.11 199.20
8512 156.89 153.84 132.63 116.29 71.24 139.79
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS 59% 70-90% 30%

0% 25% 60-70%

SPRING HARDWARE KITS 
NORTH AMERICAN 

MANUFACTURED ONLY        
(NO OFF SHORE)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

2769SHD 8.41 3.49 35.39 13.92 7.86 9.85
9644 15.48 3.63 9.46 18.42 8.63 13.12
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS 62% 70-90% 40% 0% 25% 65%

 SHOES RELINED EXCHANGE 
(NO OFF SHORE)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

10844-F523 20.59 25.14 137.57 43.90 No Bid 26.61
10847-AR20P 19.03 13.16 123.99 58.90 No Bid 21.34
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS 64% 70-90% 30% 0% No Bid 68%

WILLIAMS BRAND AIR 
VALVES  (NO SUBSTITUTE)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

116697 NEW No Bid 113.28 No Bid 234.08 139.81 186.89
116714 NEW No Bid 11.23 No Bid No Bid 10.41 12.74
117830 NEW No Bid 61.92 No Bid 51.69 69.75 102.37
117888 NEW No Bid 125.10 No Bid 289.25 154.45 157.01
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS No Bid 40-80% No Bid 15% 25% 30%

DRUM & ROTOR LABOR        
(Drums will have wheels & tires 

mounted)

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

TURN DRUMS No Bid 30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00/Inch
TURN ROTORS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00/Inch

REMOVE AND REPLACE DRUMS, 
IF NEEDED ON WHEELS No Bid Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid

$24.50/Per 
Wheel



Amphitheater Public Schools
RFB 05-10-2018 Brake Parts Labor

Attachment A 3

BRAKE CHAMBERS NORTH 
AMERICAN MANUFACTURED 

NO OFF SHORE

UTILITY 
TRAILERS 

PRICE

FLEET 
PRIDE 
PRICE

RWC 
GROUP 
PRICE

RUSH 
TRUCK 
PRICE

THE WW 
WILLIAMS 

PRICE

TRUCK 
PRO PRICE

20/24 56.25 70.16 101.12 74.39 101.54 71.59
24/30 53.75 38.34 95.59 60.28 96.08 69.27
30/30 2.5" 40.74 29.00 78.94 44.06 64.23 51.31
30/30 3" 51.25 43.81 78.93 49.07 73.28 63.28
% DISCOUNT OFFERED ON 
SIMILAR ITEMS 60% 40-80% 38% 0% 25% 55%


