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February 3, 2022 

 

 

Mr. Alan Gaylor 

Red Wing Public Schools – ISD #256 

2451 Eagle Ridge Drive 

Red Wing, MN  55066 

 

Re: Contractor Recommendation   

2022 Track & Tennis Court Rehabilitation  

 Red Wing High School 

 LEI Project No: 12216168 

 

 

Dear Mr. Alan Gaylor: 

 

Based upon our review of the bid results for the above referenced projects, we recommend the 

apparent low bidder for the tennis court resurfacing, Upper Midwest Athletic Construction, be 

awarded the contract for this work in the amount of $50,745, and we recommend the apparent 

low bidder for the track resurfacing, Athletic Field Services, be awarded the contract for this 

work in the amount of $91,000. 

 

We have experience working with both Athletic Field Services on track projects and Upper 

Midwest Athletic Construction on tennis court projects and have found their overall performance, 

workmanship, scheduling, and quality control to generally be good.  Upper Midwest Athletic 

Construction has also previously performed tennis court related work for the Red Wing Public 

Schools several years ago.           

 

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact our office (651-481-9120). 

 

Sincerely, 
Larson Engineering, Inc. 

 
 

Greg A. Buchal, PE 

Project Manager 

 

 

Attachment:  Bid Tabulation Dated February 3, 2022 



Project:  2022 Track and Tennis Rehabilitation - Red Wing High School

Date:  February 3, 2022 @ 10:00am

Contractor Add #1 Add #2

Resp 

Contr 

Form Bid Bond

Bid Item #1 

Tennis Rehab

Bid Item #2 

Track Rehab

Tennis Unit 

Price #1 - 

Crack Sealing

Tennis Unit 

Price #2 Armor 

Cracks

Track Unit Price 

# 1  Surfacing

Track Unit 

Price #2  

Cracks

Upper Midwest Athletic Construction Yes Yes Yes Yes $50,745.00 $110,698.00 $3.00 $20.00 $30.00 $4.00

Athletic Field Services Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $91,000.00 No Bid No Bid $20.00 $10.00

Midwest Track & Tennis Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $105,500.00 No Bid No Bid $28.00 $6.70

Beynon Sports Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $273,300.00 No Bid No Bid $5,820.00 $4,850.00

Fisher Tracks Yes Yes Yes Yes No Bid $96,585.00 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $1.50

BID TABULATION


