AGENDA ITEM

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition
Presenter(s):
Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.
(B) X Action Item

Presenter(s):

ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 210606 FOR SECURITY SYSTEMS AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE

SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES
OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

(D) Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding

this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM
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:) FAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Luis A. Vélez

From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director ©2020.07.28
17:20:16 -05'00"'

Date: Thursday, July 23, 2020

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 210606 for Security

Systems

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal 210606 for Security Systems be awarded in accordance with the
specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached Tabulation
Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® FEacLE Pass, TExas 78852 @ TerL (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EquaL OrrorTUNITY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210606 - SECURITY SYSTEMS

Security Camera system/CCTV & Surveillance Systems
Analog, I.P. Cameras, DVR/NVR, and related equipment.
Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

Access Control Security Systems and related items and
equipment
Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

Fire control security systems

Sprinkler systems, fire suppression, and other
similar/related systems.

Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

Intrusion Detection and control systems
Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

System integration and design services
Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

Repair parts for systems
Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

Service/Maintenance Agreements
Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

All other fire and security related products
Percent of discount off catalog/pricelist

Hourly labor rate
For installation and or repair of equipment and products

10

Monthly monitoring fee
For security systems

11

Maintenance Support — Security System
Average response time from service call (in hours)




AGENDA ITEM

(A)

(B)

©)

(D)

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop Regular

Special

Report Only

Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X

Presenter(s):

Action Item

ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 210706 FOR STRUCTURAL PEST CONTROL SERVICES AND THE BOARD
DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED
BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification:
this item.

Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




\ EAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DIsTRICT

MEMORANDUM
To: Mr. [smael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Luis A. Vélez
From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director 2(?52.8-(37-28 17:30:40
Date: Thursday, July 23, 2020
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 210706 for
Structural Pest Control

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal 210706 for Structural Pest Control be awarded in accordance with
the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached
Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® FEacLE Pass, Texas 78852 @ TeL (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EquaL OrrorTUNITY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210706 STRUCTURAL PEST CONTROL SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET

DESCRIPTION BORDER PEST CONTROL
EAGLE PASS, TX
CAFETERIA (MONTHLY) $ 450.00
FOOD SERVICE WAREHOUSE (MONTHLY) $ 100.00
CAMPUSES AND DEPARTMENTS (PER CALL BASIS - ONLY AS NEEDED) $ 200.00
RECOMMENDED VENDOR: BORDER PEST CONTROL

PLEASE NOTE THAT SHADED AREA(S) REFLECTS THE RECOMMENDED VENDOR(S)



AGENDAITEM 8

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop Regular Special

(A)

Recognition

Report Only

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B)

X Action Item ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPT. FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 210806 ON SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE
SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES

OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

(€

(D)

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

'BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.
SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




: EAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance

/ Luis A. Vélez
From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director 2852'8697.30 la2t2
Date: Thursday, July 23, 2020

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 210806 for Speech
and Related Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal 210806 for Speech and Related Services be awarded in accordance
with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached
Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® EacLE Pass, Texas 78852 @ Ter (830) 773-5181 @  W\WW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

An EquaL OrrorTUNITY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 210806 - SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
oD
I\:ED::;::.:ED BEE SOCIAL N A ECOLE SREECH blashoslic EPIC HEALTH MICHELLEY. TRA':::I:G - HEALTHPRO LAURA H. M:zi:::5CH
DESCRIPTION PERSONNEL | NETWORK | Cor'NOSA | &LANGUAGE | ASSESSMEENT | qpoyices Nc. | GONZALEZ | WILLTRAVEL, | HERITAGE, LLC| HERNANDEZ |  SERVICES
(price per hour unless otherwise noted): SERVIGES! LG CARRANZA CENTER LP | SERVICES INC. INC. e
PORT ORANGE, FL SAN ANTONIO, TX EAGLE PASS, TX SPRING,TX DALLAS, TX DALLAS, TX EAGLE PASS, TX BOERNE, TX GREENVILLE, SC LAREDO, TX EAGLE PASS, TX
[ 1 |speeck THERAPY EvaLUATION $ 70| NOBID NOBID | $ 125 % 95  NOBID NO BID NOBID | § 81, NOBID |§ 75
| 2 SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURlY] - - J ot mDA;snclr}Eq NO BID | NO BID | NOBID $ 500 I $ 200 NQ BID NOBID | i I\{O BID ]JQ B!D | morsoasseeamneo ‘
'3 |speecH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES . $ 70| NOBID NOBID |$ 95§ 89§ 100 NOBID NOBID | § 81 NOBID |§ 75
4 |SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES $" 70 NO BID \ NO BID $ 125 $ 89 | NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 81| NOBID $ 75
"5 |speech asstsant oiRect seavices s 67 NOBID NOBD | NOBID |§ 790§ 85| NOBID | NOBID |[$ 61| NOBID NO BID
6 |SPEECH ASSISTANT INDIRECT SERVICES o $ 67 NOBID NOBID | NOBD |§ 79| NOBID NOBID | NOBID |$ 61 NOBD | NOBID
|7 |BunGUAL seeEcH vaLUATION $ 75| NOBID | NOBID [§  125] NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$§ 8| NOBD  NOBID
8 BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY® | wor s as seecinien | NOBID 'NOBD | NO BID NOBID $ 200 NO BID _NQ BID | NOBD | NOBD | Nm |
B [BLINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT ERvICes T3 75 NOBID | NOBID |$ 95| NOBID |$ 100 NOBID NOBID |§ 86| NOBID | NOBD |
10 |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES ' $ 75| NOBID NOBID |§ 125/ NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID |$ 86| NOBID NOBID |
| 17]OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY OD EVAWATION B 70, NOBD | NOBD |§ 125 NOBID NOBD | NOBID | NOBD |$§ 76| NOBD | NOBD
[ 12 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUAHON/NOT HOURLY)* 7 wygm;;sp’gcmur)' \7 T\jo Blb 77[110 B]D 7NC7) Blb 7 EJO BID NO BID ) @IE | M{? L ,NO BID 1‘7 NO Blpi 7{ NO BID
13 | OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 70 NOBID | NOBID $ 95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 76 | NOBID NO | BID
14 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES 7 i [ $ 70 NO BID NO BID $ 125 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NOJ?:_ID $ 76 NOBID | NO BID 1
15 PHYSICALTHERAPY (P EVALUATION B 70/ NOBD | NOBD |$§ 125 NOBID NOBID | § 85| NOBD |§ 76| NOBID | NOBID }
‘ 161PHVSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* | not sio as seecirien NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ‘ NOBID |
17 |pHvsicaL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES s 70| NOBID NOBID |§ 95/ NOBID | NOBD |§ 85| NOBD [§ 76 NOBD | NOBID '
|18 PHYSICAL THERAPYINDIRECT eRuces s 70| NoBD | NOBD | $ 125, NOBID NOBID |§ 85| NOBID |$ 76| NOBD | NOBD |
19 ORENTATION AND MO (08 VALLATION | nNosBD NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NoBID |§ 10($ 76/ NOBD | NOBD |
\ 20 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY (08M) EVALUATION(PRICE PER EVALUAnON/r«iL;TEOURL;)' J NO BID NO BID ~NO BID | NO BID l '7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NOBID 7.’77 7@7 ”j__NO BID 7}
| 21 |ORIENTATION AND MOBIITY SERVICE DIRECT SERVICES B | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 110 $ 76 } ~ NOBID J, NO BID i
[ 22 [ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID $ 110 $ 76 NOBID | NO BID
'23 LICENSED SPECIAUST IN SCHOOL PSYCHOLOGY (LSSF) PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES $ ) 80 7NO BID $ 70 . NO BID [ $ - 99 _NO}ID‘i [\I@ B NO BID $ ) 96 | NO BID | NO BID
24 |FULL INDIVIDUAL EVALUATION (FIE) BY LSSP (PRICEPER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY" | .:o, 81D AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 500 NO BID | $ —1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID I S 750 1 NO BIDW B
25 |FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT s 80| NOBID |$ 70! $ 125|  NOBID NO BID NOBD | NOBID NOBID | NOBID = NOBD |
26 FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT (PRICE ‘PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)" o 80 A5 SPECHED NO BID B NO BIDV N NO BID NO ED . E BID—; NOABHIB . NO BID NO BID S 500 NO BE)?H
27 |FIE WITH PSYCHOLOGICAL BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* | wormssssicnis, | NOBID $ 1,125 | NoBID $ 1,200 NOBID NQ BID v VﬁdBlD ~ NOBID $ 1400  NOBID
28 [ BIUNGUAL EVALUATION BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY® wrsossscro | NOBID  [[§600] NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | wrsoxsano | $ 850 NOBID
i 29 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF AUTISM (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID «S . 625 | NO BID : $ ],ZOO ~ NOBID NOBID NO BID | NO BID $ 815| ﬂlgi
30 FIE FOR SUSPICION OF EMOTIONAL DISTURBANCE (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT 81D AS SPECIFIED NOBID | § 625 NO BID $ 1,100 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID $ 815 NO BID
|31 [1e10r 05700 o v eATHMPANT 0 108 1 PRCE R EAUATONAOT R worsossseano | NOBID | § 625, NOBID | § 950/ NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBD |§ 815| NOBID |
32 FIE FOR SUSPICION OF INTELLECTUAL DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® s | | NOBID $ 500 NOBID $ ~700] NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID $ 750 NOBID |
33 FIE FOR SUSPICION OF A SPECIFIC LEARNING DISABILITY (PRICE P?RET/ALUATION/NDY HOURLY* NOT 81D AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 500 NO BID $ 850 NO BID NO BID ) BID | | NOBID $ 750 NO BD |
34/ BOARDCERTIF!EDBEHAVIORANALVST(BCBA) sskwcss $ ) 80| $ 150 NO BID ) $ 125 NOBID | @ID NO BID . - NO BID § - 93| NO BID | NﬁfD |
35 omanosnaa seavices ) - NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBD |$ 89| NOBID | NOBID | NOBD |§ 93| NOBID | NOBID
‘36 FIE BY DIAGNOSTICIAN (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLV)' ' NO BID _ NOBID NOBID NO BID $_ 850| NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | § 750 | ~ NOBID |
37, CERTIFIED INTERPRETER FOR THE DEAFHARD OF HEARING | NoBD | NOBD NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NOBID [§ 63| NOBID | NOBID |
‘ 38 15 THE VENDOR ABLE TO PROVIDE ON-SITE SERVICES ONLY, ONLINE SERVICES ONLY, OR BOTH? | BOTH | BOTH |  BOTH J BOTH | BOTH BOTH ~ BOTH | BOTH | BOTH BOIFi | _BOTH

BID NOTES:

PROPOSAL CALLS FOR EPISD SELECTING AT LEAST TWO (2) PROVIDERS PER SERVICE

THE REVIEW COMMITTEE RECOMMENDED THREE (3) PROVIDERS FOR SERVICE #19 AND #34
** VENDOR DID NOT PROVIDE PROOF OF GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE

*** VENDOR REPORTED INVOLVMENT IN LITIGATION IN THE PAST 5 YEARS

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED SERVICE PROVIDER(S) PAGE 1 OF 2



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 210806 - SPEECH AND RELATED SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

BID NOTES:

PROPOSAL CALLS FOR EPISD SELECTING AT LEAST TWO (2) PROVIDERS PER SERVICE
THE REVIEW COMMITTEE RECOMMENDED THREE (3) PROVIDERS FOR SERVICE #19 AND #34

** VENDOR DID NOT PROVIDE PROOF OF GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE
*** VENDOR REPORTED INVOLVMENT IN LITIGATION IN THE PAST 5 YEARS

PLEASE NOTE SHADED AREA(S) DENOTES RECOMMENDED SERVICE PROVIDER(S)

SPEECH TINYEYE TOTAL
pEscrpTION resecaiear | MU | o sz | e L1 |SToNES arouR| STAFANG,Lic | TECHNOIoSY | 2 CEC
(price per hour unless otherwise noted): NING, INC. PlC. CORPORATION INC.
NEW YORK, NY EAGLE PASS, TX LIVE DAK, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX OLDSMAR, FL LAFAYETTE, CO CORAL SPRINGS, FL CANADA SOUTH PASADINA, A
(1 |speeCH THERAPY EVALUATION NOT 81D AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID $ 65| % 80 NO BID $ 60 $ 80| $ 98 |
i SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)® | HOT 810 AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID NO BID [ $ 640 NO BID 7 ;V_ NoTEDASSPECIED | D 300 $ 475
3 |SPLECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES R 73 NO BID NO BID $ 65| $ 78 | $ B §9L $ ) 66| $ 80§ 98
4 |SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES - ED 73| NOBID | NOBD |$ 65/ $ 788 69 % 66 $ 80§ 98 |
"5 |SPEECH ASSISTANT DIRECT SERVICES - | NoBD NOBID | NOBID $ 55| $ 65, NOBID $ 56 NO BID $ 86 ';
6 |SPEECH ASSISTANT INDIRECT SERVICES a o NO BID NOélD Y BID B 55| $ 65 NO BID $ 56| NOBID $ 86 \
7 |siLNGUAL speecH EvaLuATION - —— ] BID | NOBID 0y 67 $ 83 NO BID $ 68| $ 80| $ 98 |
8 |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)" | voremas ssecimen I NO BID 7} NO BID NOBID |§ 664 NO BID NoTBID ASSPECIIED | B 3001 $ 475 |
| O |BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES o $ 73| NOBID | NOBID s 67| $ 83| ¢ 721 % 68| ¢ 80| $ o8
;ﬁ BILINGUAL SPEECH THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES ' o ' $ 73 ‘ A NO BID NO BID $ 67 _$ 83| % 721 % 68 $ 80| $ 93
|1 OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (OT) EVAWATION ' NoTBDASSPECIHED | B 75 NO BID $ 651 $ - 80 NOBID | § 68 7$ 80| $ 98
12 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY (O) EVALUATION (PRICE P;z EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOTBIOASSPECIFIED |  NOT 8D AS SPEQRIED NO BID NO BID $ 640 NO BID noteoassreaneo | $ 300 | $ 575
13 |OCCUPATIONAL THERAPY DIRECT SERVICES $ 731 ¢ 75 NO BID $ 65| $ 80| $ 68 % 65| % 80| $ 98
?occunno(mmsmwmomm SERVICES ' ] § S $ 75| NOBID $ 65| ¢ 80 " $ 68| $ 65 $ 80 $ 98
15 |PHYSICAL THERAPY (°) EVALUATON - NO BID NO BID NOBID |§ 65| $ 80 NOBID $ 65 NO BID $ 98
15 |PHYSICAL THERAPY (PT) EVALUATION (pmce PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)' 77777 = N(Tmp Né 'ﬁ)ﬁ 1 N67§|D NO BID $ 640 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 575
17 pwvsicaLTHERAPY DIRECT seRvces - NO BID NO BID NOBID |§ 65| $ 80/$ 69§ 65 NOBID |$ 98
18 |PHYSICAL THERAPY INDIRECT SERVICES NO BID NO BID NO BID S 65| $ 80| ¢ 69 % 65 NO BID $ 98
19 [ORIENTATION AND MOBIUTY (OBM) EVAWUATION - NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBD |$ 75| NOBD |$ 65| NOBID NOBID |
io 6R|ENTAn0N AND MOBIUTY (O&M) EVALUATION (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 600 Ng BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED T\fﬁID 3 NO BID
21 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE DIRECT SERVICES - - NO BID | i NO BID ~ NOBID | NO BID $ 75 % 63 (% 65 NO BID | NQ BID Wi
22 |ORIENTATION AND MOBILITY SERVICE INDIRECT SERVICES | NO BID [ NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 75| $ 63| $ 65 NO BID NO BID
23 |LICENSED SPECIAUST IN SCHOOL PSYCHOLOGY (LSSP) PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES worsoasseecres | NO BID NO BID NO BID | $ 78 | $ 74| % 80 NO BID NOBID
'24|FULLINDIVIDUAL EVALUATION (FE B LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY | sorsosssano | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | § 624| NOBID | worsomssamo | NOBID | NOBID
25 [FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT - ””7! mnmmo{c;; 7 NO BID ,WT) BID 7 NO BID $ 73 NO BID $ ;30 a N6 BliD* NO BID B
26 |FUNCTIONAL BEHAVIORAL ASSESSMENT (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO B]D [ NO BID NO BID $ 600 NO BID NOT BID AS SPECIFIED NO BID NO BID
| 27 FIE WITH PSYCHOLOGICAL BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* JW »; alr;srmnm NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 624 NOBID | wor o e NOBID | NO BID
28 BILINGUAL EVALUATION BY LSSP (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* | vor sio as seeciren NO BIDﬁ $ 700 NO BID $ 664 NOBID | woraoassseanto NO B.IDA i NO BID B
29 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF AUTISM (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* ' J (- NOBID |§ 2,000 NO BID $ 544 NOBID | worsomssxano | NOBID NO BID
30 mE FOR SUSPICION OF EMOTIONAL DISTURBANCE (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* [— NO BID $ 2,150 NO BID $ 544 NOBID | worsoasseeanen E\IO BID NOBID
?I-i“fm SUSPICION OF OTHER HEALTH IMPAIRMENT (OHI FOR ADHD) (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT 810 AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 800 NO BID | $ 544 NO BID | noreo assseame NOBID | NOBID
32 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF INTELLECTUAL DISABILITY (Pmct PER EVALUATION/NOT nounwiri o mn; KjoiBu) 1 $ 825 NO BID $ 544 NOBID | woreoas m:m;:',".ﬂ NO BID NO BID
33 |FIE FOR SUSPICION OF A SPECIFIC LEARNING DISABILITY (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLY)* NOT 81D AS SPECIFIED NO BID $ 875 ] NO BID $ ”544 *'-N—C—)-ED> E m,; a Né—BlD NO BID
34 [BOARD CERTIFIED BEHAVIOR ANALYST (BCBA) SERVICES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 73| $ 74 $ 80 NO BID NO BID
35 |DIAGNOSTICIAN SERVICES ) o NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID |$ 68| $ 69 % 80 NOBID NO BID
36 |FE 5 DIAGNOSTICIAN (PRICE PER EVALUATION/NOT HOURLYY | NoBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |[§ 544| NOBID | soreosssano | NOBID NO BID
37 CERTIFIED INTERPRETER FOR THE DEAF/HARD OF HEARING _NOT_ - -I\.JO”BVID N >m . VNO BID 7 $ 68 NO BID | $ 65 ﬁ07§I6 mD ) |
1 35&: \;;N;)OR ABLE TO PROVIDE on SITE SERVICES ONLY, ONLINE SERVICES ONLY, OR BOTH? _ONLINEV ONLY BOT};l {ON SiTé OiNLij BOTH BOTH | ) B,(ifHA 7‘ 7& BOTH ONLINE ON[_Y

PAGE 2 OF 2



AGENDA ITEM

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop X Regular Special

(A)

(B)

(©)

(D)

Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE

LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 FOR CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE
AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR

SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




\ EAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM
To: Mr. [smael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance

/ Luis A. Vélez
From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director 2852&;).8-04 17:21:36
Date: Thursday, July 23, 2020
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 210906 for Charter

Bus Transportation Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal 210906 for Charter Bus Transportation Services be awarded in
accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the
attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® EacLE Pass, TExas 78852 @ Ter (830) 773-5181 @  wWwWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EquaL OrrorTUNITY EMPLOYER
F-280



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

DATEOF  |BUS DEPARTURE Cougar Bus Ime:sr o Kerrville | OK Tours¥* | _ Regent |
TRIP QTY  TIME DESTINATION GROUP Lines * e Coach Line |
) Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX. | _ San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX _|
1 073120 | 1| 530AM |  LAREDO, TX. CCWINNTENNIS TRIP CANCELLED }
2 08/01/20 | 1 | 530AM |  LAREDO, TX. | CCWINNTENNIS TRIP CANCELLED B |
E 08/06/20 | 2 | 4:330AM LAREDO, TX. | EPHS CROSS COUNTRY TRIP CANCELLED -
4| 08/08/20 | 1 6:00AM UVALDE, TX. ~ EPHSVOLLEYBALL - TRIP CANCELLED -
5| 081120 | 1| 6:00AM LAREDO, TX. CC WINN VOLLEYBALL o - “TRIP CANCELLED i
' 6| 08/11/20 | 1 | 6:00AM CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. | EPHS VOLLEYBALL ) TRIP CANCELLED
| 7 | 08/13-14/2020 | 2 = 1:30PM ~ RIO GRANDE CITY, TX. EPHS CROSS COUNTRY - - TRIP CANCELLED B -
8 | 08/13-15/2020 | 1 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN VOLLEYBALL ~ TRIPCANCELLED
9 | 08/13-15/2020 1 = 6:00AM | ~ AUSTIN, TX. EPHS VOLLEYBALL TRIP CANCELLED |
10| 08/14/20 | 1 | 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. CC WINN VOLLEYBALL - ~ TRIP CANCELLED ]
11 08/14/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM UVALDE, TX. | EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL _ TRIP CANCELLED
(12 08/14/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM UVALDE, TX. EPHS JV FOOTBALL ) TRIP CANCELLED -
13| 08/14/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM UVALDE, TX. ~ EPHS FRESHMEN FOOTBALL ~ TRIPCANCELLED ‘
14 08/14-15/2020 | 1 | 5:00 AM LAREDO, TX. CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY | TRIP CANCELLED -
15 08/14-15/2020 = 1 = 6:00AM 'LAREDO, TX. EPHS VOLLEYBALL - ~ TRIP CANCELLED
(16| 08/1520 | 1 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. ~ CC WINN VOLLEYBALL TRIP CANCELLED —
17 08/15/20 1| 530AM UVALDE, TX. CC WINN TENNIS - o TRIP CANCELLED -
18| 08/19/20 l 1 | 10:00AM |  UVALDE, TX. EPHS TENNIS ' TRIP CANCELLED ]
19| 08/20-22/2020 | 1 | 6:00 AM ~ SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN VOLLEYBALL | ~ TRIPCANCELLED B
20 082120 | 2 | 6:00AM DEL RIO, TX. CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL - _ TRIP CANCELLED
21| 082120 | 2 | 6:00AM DEL RIO, TX. \ CC WINN JV FOOTBALL ‘ TRIP CANCELLED
[22 08/21/20 2| 6:00AM | DEL RIO, TX. | CC WINN FRESHMEN FOOTBALL | ) , TRIP CANCELLED o
23| 08/21-22/2020 | 1 | 6:00 AM FLORESVILLE, TX. EPHS VOLLEYBALL ~ TRIPCANCELLED
| 24| 08/21-22/2020 ’ 2 | 1:30PM | ZAPATA, TX. ~ EPHS CROSS COUNTRY ~ TRIP CANCELLED
25|  08/2220 | 1| 500AM | UVALDE, TX. CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY TRIP CANCELLED ‘
126 08/22/20 | 1 | 6:00AM UVALDE, TX. B EPHS VOLLEYBALL B - TRIP CANCELLED B ‘
27| 082520 | 1 | 6:00AM LAREDO, TX. CC WINN VOLLEYBALL ~ TRIPCANCELLED
| 28| 08/27-29/2020 1 | 6:00 AM LAREDO, TX. | CCWINN VOLLEYBALL ~ TRIP CANCELLED ]
29| ‘ 08/28/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM CRYSTAL CITY, TX. CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL i TRIP CANCELLED -
30| 08/28/20 | 5 | 12:00PM | CRYSTALCITY, TX. CC WINN BAND TRIP CANCELLED i
31| 08/28/20 | 5 | 3:00PM | SANANTONIO, TX. _EPHSBAND ~ TRIP CANCELLED -
32| 08/28/20 | 2 | 6:00AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL TRIP CANCELLED )
33| 08/28-29/2020 | 2 | 1:30PM | LAREDO, TX. - EPHS CROSS COUNTRY ~ TRIP CANCELLED -
34| 08/28-29/2020 | 1 | 600AM | LAREDO, TX. [ EPHS VOLLEYBALL ~ TRIP CANCELLED -
| 35 08/29/20 | 2 | 5:00 AM CASTROVILLE, TX. CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY i ~ TRIPCANCELLED
36| 08/29/20 | 2 | 6:00AM | UVALDE, TX. | EPHS CROSS COUNTRY TRIP CANCELLED -
37 09/01/20 | 1 | 2:30PM UVALDE, TX. EPHS TENNIS _ TRIP CANCELLED
38 09/01/20 1 | 6:00 AM SAN MARCOS, TX. EPHS VOLLEYBALL - TRIP CANCELLED ) i
139 09/02/20 | 2 | 6:00AM UVALDE, TX. ~ CC WINN JV FOOTBALL B TRIP CANCELLED
40| 09/02/20 | 2 | 8:00AM UVALDE, TX. ~ CC WINN FRESHMEN FOOTBALL | - TRIP CANCELLED -
41 09/04/20 | 1 | 600AM | UVALDE, TX. ~ CCWINN VOLLEYBALL - ~ TRIPCANCELLED
42 09/04/20 1 | 1:00PM | SANANTONIO, TX. EPHSTENNIS “TRIP CANCELLED i
43 09/04/20 | 1 | 6:00AM | RANDOLPH, TX. EPHS VOLLEYBALL - TRIP CANCELLED - }
44 | 09/04-05/2020 @ 2 | 500 AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY B TRIP CANCELLED 1
45  09/05/20 | 4  6:30AM | CRYSTAL CITY, TX. EPHS CROSS COUNTRY TRIP CANCELLED |

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

DATEOF  |BUS DEPARTURE Cougar Bus Imgpeﬂal Kerrville | OK Tourst* _ Regent

Bl oY TIME DESTINATION GROUP Lines * COm:;i i errville ours** | = ach Line

Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX. | _San Antonio, TX. | _San Antonio, TX | _ San Antonio, TX _|

46 = 09/08/20 1 | 6:00 AM ~ CRYSTAL CITY, TX. . CC WINN VOLLEYBALL '$ 1370 § 1850 $ 1,325 |$ 1,250 | & 1,230

47 | 09/08/20 1 | 6:00 AM LAREDO, TX. 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL |$ 1510/ ¢ 2200 $ 1,710 $ 1,590 | § 1,700
|48 09/09/20 | 1 1:00PM ~ LAREDO, TX. MJH VOLLEYBALL |$ 1510 $ 2200 $ 1,710 $ 1,590 | $ 1,700
49 09/11/20 1 | 6:00AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN VOLLEYBALL '$ 1545/ ¢ 2300 § 1,890 $ 1640 $ 1,900

50 09/11/20 | 1 | 1:30PM LAREDO, TX. EPHS TENNIS '$ 1510 ¢ 2,00 $ 1,710 $ 1,590 | ¢ 1,700
51 09/12/20 1 | 5:30 AM UVALDE, TX. CCWINNTENNIS | § 1370 $ 1,850 $ 1,715 ¢ 1290 | ¢ 1,323

52 09/12/20 1| 6:00 AM CASTROVILLE, TX. | CC WINN BAND | $ 1445 $ 1,850 $ 2,100 | $ 1,59 | $ 1,675 |

531 09/12/20 1| 6:00AM | DEL RIO, TX. MJH VOLLEYBALL $ 1370 $ 1,850 $ 1,725 $ 1,290 | $ 1,300
54| 09/12/20 1| 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. EPHS VOLLEYBALL '$ 1510 $ 200 $ 2180 $ 1,590 | § 1,700
55 09/12/20 1 | 6:00AM | DEL RIO, TX. EPJH VOLLEYBALL ' $ 1,370 $ 2,100 $ 1,725 $ 1,290 | $ 1,300 |
56|  09/13/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ EPHS JV FOOTBALL |$ 3090 | $ 4600 $ 3780 | $ 3240 $ 3,800

57 09/13/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS FRESHMEN FOOTBALL | ¢ 3,090 $ 4,600 | $  3780| $ 30240 | $ 3,800

58 | 09/17/20 2 | 6:00AM  JOURDANTON, TX. MJH 8TH GRADE FOOTBALL $ 3090 $ 4500 $ 438 | $ 3240 | $ 3,630

59 0917/20 | 2 | 6:00AM JOURDANTON, TX. 'MJH 7TH GRADE FOOTBALL $ 3090 $ 4500 $ 4380 | $ 3,240 | $ 3,630

60 09/17/20 | 5 | 3:00 PM SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND '$ 7725|$ 11,500 | $ 12300 $§ 8100 | $ 9,500 |

61 09/17/20 | 2 | 6:00AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL | § 3,090 | s 4 600 | $ 4920 § 3,240 | § 3,800

62 09/17/20 | 1 | 6:00AM LAREDO, TX. ‘ EPJH VOLLEYBALL |$ 1510/ ¢ 2100|$ 2125 $ 1590 | $ 1,700

63 09/18/20 | 1 1:30PM ~ LAREDO, TX. | EPHS TENNIS '$ 1510 $ 2,100 $ 2,125 | $ 1590 | $ 1,700 |

64 09/18/20 | 2 6:00 AM JOURDANTON, TX. . CCWINNVARSITYFOOTBALL | ¢ 3090 $ 4500 $ 4380 $ 3,600 | $ 3,630

65| 09/18/20 | 1 2:00 PM JOURDANTON, TX. . CCWINNSTUCO |$ 1545/ ¢ 2250 $ 2,90 | $ 1,800 | $ 1,815

66 09/18/20 | 1 3:00PM | JOURDANTON, TX. | ~ CC WINN SILVERLINE '$ 1545/ ¢ 2250 ¢ 2190/ ¢ 1,800 | § 1,815
| 67 09/18/20 | 5 | 12:00PM | JOURDANTON, TX. | CC WINN BAND '$ 7725 ¢ 11,250 ' $ 10950 | $ 9,000 | § 9,075
| 68 09/18-19/2020 © 1 | 5:00AM | CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. CCWINNCROSSCOUNTRY | ¢ 2420 $ 3500 $ 3000 $ 2600 $ 2,600
69 09/18-19/2020 | 2 | 1:30 PM ~ MISSION, TX. ‘ EPHS CROSS COUNTRY ' $ 4940 $§ 8000 $ 8OO0 $ 6400 $ 6200
70 09/19/20 | 1 | 530AM | UVALDE, TX. i _CCWINNTENNIS ~ |$ 1370 $ 1,85 $ 1,715 ¢ 1325 ¢ 1,323
71 09/19/20 | 1 6:00AM | SANANTONIO, TX. CC WINN BAND $ 1545 § 2300 $ 2460 | $ 8950 | $ 1,900

72| 09/1920 | 1 | 6:00 AM | UVALDE, TX. MJH VOLLEYBALL '$ 1,370 $ 1,85 ¢ 1,715 §  1,325| ¢ 1,323

73] 09/19/20 | 1 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. | EPHS VOLLEYBALL $ 1510 $ 2,400 $ 2125 ¢ 1590 | $ 1,700
74 09/21/20 | 1 6:00AM | DEL RIO, TX. ‘ ~ EPJH VOLLEYBALL '$ 1370 $ 180 $ 1375, $ 1,300 $ 1,300

(75| 09/22/20 | 1 | 6:00AM | SANANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNVOLLEYBALL | ¢ 1545 ¢ 2,300| ¢ 1,890 $ 1,630 $ 1,900
76 09/24120 | 2 | 6:00 AM LAREDO, TX. ‘ CC WINN JV FOOTBALL ' $ 302 $ 4200 $ 4250 $ 3,200 § 3,400
77 09/24/20 | 2 8:00 AM LAREDO, TX. | CCWINN FRESHMEN FOOTBALL | § 3,020 § 4,200 $ 4250 | § 3,200 $ 3,400
78| 09/2420 | 1 | 5:30AM UVALDE, TX. CC WINN TENNIS |$ 1370 $ 1850 $ 1,715| ¢ 1,300 |4 1,323
79 09/2420 | 1 L 2:00PM DELRIO, TX. ~ MJH VOLLEYBALL % 1,370 § 1,850 $ 1690 | $ 1,290 $ 1,300
80 09/24/20 | 5 | 3:00PM ~ LAREDO, TX. 'EPHS BAND $ 755 $ 10500 $ 10,625 $ 9,000 | $ 8,500
‘81. 09/24/20 | 2 | 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. _EPHSVARSITY FOOTBALL | § 3,020 $ 4200 $ 425 $ 3,600 $ 3,400
82 09/24/20 | 1 | 6:00AM | DEL RIO, TX. EPJH VOLLEYBALL 0 $ 1,370 § 1,80 $ 1690  $  1,325| $ 1,300
83 09/2520 | 1 1:30PM |  LAREDO,TX. ‘ EPHS TENNIS '$ 1,510 $ 2,100 $ 2,125 % 1,600 $ 1,700
| 84| 09/25-26/2020 | 1 | 5:00 AM | McNEAL,TX. | CCWINNCROSSCOUNTRY | § 2550 | $ 4,000 $ 3410 ¢ 3,00 | $ 2,750
| 85| 09/25-26/2020 | 2 | 10:00 AM |  COLLEGE STATION, TX. | EPHS CROSS COUNTRY |$ 7400 $ 9000 $ 8180 | $ 7800 $§ 6460
86 09/26/20 | 2 | 5:00AM DILLEY, TX. | CCWINNCROSSCOUNTRY  § 2740 | $ 3900 $ 3810 $ 3,000 $ 3,000
87| 09/26/20 5 | 9:30 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. | EPHS BAND ' $ 7725 11,500 | $ 12,300 | $ 9,000 | $ 9,500
Lsi ~09/26/20 1 | 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. | EPHSVOLLEYBALL | § 1510 $ 2,00 $ 2125 |$ 1,590 | § 1,700
' 89 09/26/20 | 1 | 6:00AM | UVALDE, TX. ‘ EPJH VOLLEYBALL | ¢ 1370| ¢ 1,850 $ 1715 ¢ 1,325 [RENN1393
190 09/26/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM DILLEY, TX. EPHS CROSS COUNTRY '$ 2740 $ 3900 $ 3810 $ 3,000 $ 3,000

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

| DATEOF  |BUS DEPARTURE SoUgapBie Imgperial Kerrville | OK Tours*| _ Regent
i i orY|  TIME DESTINATION GROUP Lines * COmi;Sa s errville ours** | - ach Line
| LB Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
191 09/29/20 | 1 | 8:00AM | CASTROVILLE, TX.  CC WINN VOLLEYBALL |$ 1445| ¢ 2075|$ 1,750| $ 1,500 | & 1,675
|92 10/01/20 | 2 | 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. | EPHSJVFOOTBALL | ¢ 3020 § 4200 $ 4250 $ 3,200 $ 3,400
193 10/01/20 | 2 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. ~ EPHSFRESHMEN FOOTBALL | ¢ 3,020 | § 4200 $ 4250 | $ 3,200 | $ 3,400
94| 10/01/20 1| 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. EPJH VOLLEYBALL $ 1510 $ 2100 $ 2125 $ 1,600 | $ 1,700
95|  10/0220 | 2 | 6:00AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNVARSITY FOOTBALL | ¢ 3,090 | $§ 4600 $ 4920 $ 3400 | $ 3,800
96 10/02/20 1 | 2:00PM | SANANTONIO, TX. CC WINN STUCO $ 1545 \ $ 2300 $ 2460 $ 1,700 | § 1,900
97 10/02/20 1| 3:00PM = SANANTONIO, TX. ~ CC WINN SILVERLINE $ 1,545 ¢ 2300 $ 2460 $ 1,700 | § 1,900
98| 10/0220 | 5 | 12:00PM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. \ CC WINN BAND $ 7725 % 11,500 | $ 12,300 $ 9,000 | § 9,500
99| 10/02-03/2020 | 1 | 5:00 AM SEGUIN, TX. | CCWINNCROSSCOUNTRY | ¢ 2400 | $ 3,400 $ 3,120 $ 2950 | $ 2217
1100] 10/02-03/2020 @ 2 | 1:30PM | SANANTONIO, TX. | EPHSCROSSCOUNTRY | ¢ 4290 | $ 6600 $ 5880 | $§ 5200 $ 4,234
1101 10/03/20 5 | 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. CC WINN BAND |$ 7550|$% 10,500 | $ 10,625 $ 10,000 | § 8,500
1102]  10/03/20 5 | 830AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND ~|$ 7725|$ 11,500 ¢ 11,400 $ 11,500 | $ 9,500
103| 10/03/20 | 2 | 430AM | LAREDO, TX. _ EPHSCROSSCOUNTRY | § 3,020 $ 4200 $ 4250 $ 3400 | § 3,400
1104 ’ 10/06/20 | 2 | 6:00AM |  CRYSTALCITY, TX. MJH 8TH GRADE FOOTBALL | ¢ 2,740 | ¢ 3,700 | $ _ 2,650 $ 3,000 | $ 2,460
105/  10/06/20 2 | 6:00AM CRYSTAL CITY, TX. MJH 7TH GRADE FOOTBALL | ¢ 2,740  $§ 3,700 | $ 2,650 $ 3,000 | § 2,460
106 10/07/20 | 2 | 6:00AM |  UVALDE, TX. ~ EPJH8THFOOTBALL $ 2740 $ 3700 $ 2800 $ 2,600 | § 2,646
107, 10/07/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM UVALDE, TX. | EPJH7THFOOTBALL '$ 2740 | $ 3,700 $ 2,800 $ 2,600 | $ 2,646
1108 10/08/20 | 2 | 6:00AM |  SANANTONIO, TX. ; ~ CC WINN JV FOOTBALL '$ 3,09 $ 4600 $ 4560 $ 3240 | § 3,800
109 10/08/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM SANANTONIO, TX. | CCWINN FRESHMEN FOOTBALL | ¢ 3,09 | $ 4600 $ 4560 $ 30240 | $ 3,800
110 10/08/20 1 2:00 PM ~ DELRIO, TX. _ MJH VOLLEYBALL |$ 1370 $ 1850 |$ 1690 | $ 1,300 | $ 1,300
'111]  10/09/20 1| 6:00AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN VOLLEYBALL '$ 1,55 ¢ 2300/ $ 2280 $ 1,620 § 1,900
112]  10/09/20 5| 3:00PM |  LAREDO, TX. ’ EPHSBAND ¢ 7550 |$ 10500 % 11,525 ¢ 9,000 | $ 8,500
'113|  10/09/20 2 | 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. | EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL $ 3020 $§ 4200 $ 4250 $ 3,240 | § 3,400
'114] 10/09-10/2020 | 1 | 1:30PM | LAREDO, TX. y EPHS TENNIS '$ 2110 $ 3000| $ 2940 % 2700| § 2217
'115|  10/10/20 | 5 | 6:00AM | CONVERSE, TX. | CCWINNBAND '$  8225|$ 11,500 |$ 11,725|¢ 12500 | $ 9,750
'116]  10/10/20 | 5 = 9:30AM | ROBSTOWN, TX. [ EPHS BAND ¢ 8600 $ 12,500 | $ 14,200 | $ 12,500 | $ 12,000
'117]  10/10/20 1 | 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. | EPHSVOLLEYBALL $ 1510 $§ 2100 ¢ 2125 $ 1640 | § 1,700
118  10/13/20 1 6:00AM | FLORESVILLE, TX. | CCWINNVOLLEYBALL | ¢ 1,645  $ 2400 ¢ 1,965 | ¢ 1,700  $ 2,200
119/  10/13/20 1 8:00 AM ! LAREDO, TX. | EPHSTENNIS $ 1,510 ¢ 2100 $ 1,710 $ 1,590 | $ 1,700
1200 1013220 | 2 | 6:00AM | ~ UVALDE, TX. MJH 7TH GRADE FOOTBALL | ¢ 2,740 | § 3,700 | |$ 280 ¢ 2580 ¢ 2646
1121 10/13/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM DEL RIO, TX. i EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL ' $ 2740 § 3,700 $ 2,800 | § 2,580 | $ 2,600
'122|  10/15/20 | 1 | 5:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINNCROSSCOUNTRY | ¢ 1,545 | ¢ 2300 $ 2280 ¢ 1,630 $ 1,900
'123]  10/1520 | 2 | 6:00 AM LAREDO, TX. EPHS JV FOOTBALL 1§ 3020 $ 4200 $ 4250 $§ 3,200 $ 3,400
124 10/15/20 | 2 | 6:00AM LAREDO, TX. | EPHSFRESHMENFOOTBALL | ¢ 3020 $§ 4200 $ 4250 $  3200| $ 3,400
)125‘ 10/15-16/2020 | 2 | 1:30PM | LAREDO, TX. 1 EPHSCROSSCOUNTRY | § 4220 ¢ 3000 $ 580 $ 3200 $ 4,434
126 10/16/20 2 | 6:00AM LAREDO, TX. ‘ CCWINN VARSITY FOOTBALL | $ 3,020 | §  4200| $ 425 $  3500| $ 3,400
127 10M6/20 | 1 | 2:00PM |  LAREDO, TX. ~ CCWINNSTUCO $ 1510 $ 2,100 ¢ 2305 ¢ 1,750 | § 1,700
128 10/16/20 | 1 | 3:00PM | LAREDO, TX. 1 ~ CC WINN SILVERLINE |$ 1510 ¢ 2100 $ 2305 $ 1,750 | § 1,700
129 10/16/20 | 5 | 12:00PM |  LAREDO, TX. CC WINN BAND '$ 7550|$ 10500 | $ 11,525 $ 8750 | $ 8500
'130|  10/17/20 | 1 | 7:00AM |  CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. EPHS TENNIS '$ 1820 $ 2550 $ 2900 $ 1,750 | § 2,500 |
1131]  10/17/20 | 5 | 6:00AM | CONVERSE, TX. . CCWINNBAND '$ 8225|$ 11,500 | $ 11,725 |$ 10,000 | § 9,600
132]  10/17/20 | 5 | 6:30AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. i EPHS BAND ¢ 7725 ¢ 11,500 | $ 11,400 | $ 10,000 | $ 9,500 |
133] 10/17/20 | 1 | 6:00 AM LAREDO, TX. \ EPHS VOLLEYBALL |$ 1510 $ 2,100 | $ 2,125 | % 1,800 | § 1,700 |
1134/  10/20/20 1 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINNVOLLEYBALL | ¢ 1545 ¢ 2,300 § 1890 | $ 2000 $ 1,900
135/  10/20/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM DEL RIO, TX. MJH7TH GRADE FOOTBALL | ¢ 2,740 | ¢ 3,700 | ¢ 2,750 | $ 2,580 | § 2,600

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

' DATEOF  BUS DEPARTURE Cougar Bus Imgplz e Kerrville | OK Tours** _ Regent

| Ship QY TIME DESTINATION GROUP Lines * e Coachiline

| SR IR R Laredo, TX 5an Antonio, TX. | San Antonio, TX. |~ San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
136 10/21/20 | 2 6:00AM CORNERSTONE, TX. 1 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL $ 6200 $ 6800 $ 380 $ 3400 $ 3,800
1137, 10/21/20 2 | 6:00 AM CORNERSTONE, TX. 1 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL '$ 6200 $ 680 $ 380 $ 3400 $ 3,800
1138]  10/22/20 | 5 | 3:00PM LAREDO, TX. ~ EPHSBAND '$ 7550 $ 10,500 | $ 11,525 $ 10,000 | $ 8,500
139 10/22/20 | 2 6:00AM | LAREDO, TX. EPHSVARSITY FOOTBALL | ¢ 3,020 $ 4200 $ 4250 $ 3600 $ 3,400
'140]  10/24/20 | 5 | 4:30 AM | AUSTIN/ROUND ROCK, TX. EPHS BAND | $ 9250 ¢ 15000 $ 15150 | § 15500 | § 13,125 |
'141] 10/25-26/2020 | 1 | 5:00 AM | CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. CCWINNCROSSCOUNTRY  § 2420 $ 3500 $ 2940 $ 2,650 $ 2,600
'142| 10/25-26/2020 | 2 | 10:00AM = CORPUS CHRISTL, TX. ~ |  EPHSCROSSCOUNTRY | ¢ 4840 ¢ 7000 $ 580 $ 5700 | $ 5,200 |
1143 10/27/20 1 | 6:00AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. } CC WINN VOLLEYBALL '$ 1,545 ¢ 2300 $ 1890 $ 1640 | $ 1,900
144 10/27/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM 'UVALDE,TX. | MJHB8TH GRADE FOOTBALL  $ 2740[ $ 3700 $ 2800 $ 2580 | 2,646
1145 10/27/20 | 1 | 6:00AM DEL RIO, TX. | EPHSVOLLEYBALL 3 137ol $ 1,850 ¢ 1,375 ¢  1290| § 1,300
1146 10/27/20 2 6:00AM DEL RIO, TX. 'EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL '$ 2740 $ 3700 $ 2,750 $ 2,580 | $ 2,600
1147|  10/29/20 | 2 | 6:00AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN JV FOOTBALL $ 300 $ 4600 $ 4560 $ 30280 | $ 3,800
'148]  10/29/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CC WINN FRESHMEN FOOTBALL | $ 3,090 | ¢ 4600 $ 4560 $ 3,280 | $ 3,800
1149 10/31/20 | 5 | 6:00 AM | CONVERSE, TX. CC WINN BAND '$ 8225 $ 11,500 $ 11,725 $ 10,000 | $ 9,600
1150| 11/02-04/2020 | 1 | 6:00 AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ CCWINNVOLLEYBALL | $ 2,745 ¢  4200| § 3870 $ 2950 | § 3,175
1151  11/05/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM LAREDO, TX. CC WINN JV FOOTBALL $ 302 $§ 4200 $ 4250 $ 3200 $ 3,400 |
1152 11/05/20 2 | 6:00AM LAREDO, TX. | CC WINN FRESHMEN FOOTBA ‘ $ 3020 § 4200 $ 4250 $  3200| § 3,400
7153 11/05/20 | 2 | 6:00 AM DEL RIO, TX. . EPHS JV FOOTBALL $ 2,740 _3,7oo| $ 3380 $§ 2580 | $ 2,600
154/ 11/05/20 2 | 6:00 AM 'DEL RIO, TX. | EPHS FRESHMEN FOOTBALL l $ 2,740 $ 3,700 $ 3380 $ 2580 | $ 2,600
155|  11/06/20 | 2  6:00AM | RIO GRANDE CITY,TX. | CCWINNVARSITYFOOTBALL | $ 3,740 | § 6000 $ 6720 $ 5000 | $ 4,930
1156,  11/06/20 | 1 | 10:00AM | RIO GRANDE CITY, TX. CC WINN STUCO |'$ 1870 ¢ 3000 $ 3360 $ 2,500 $ 2,465
157, 11/06/20 1 | 1:00 PM RIO GRANDE CITY, TX. CC WINN SILVERLINE |$ 1,870 $ 3000 $ 3360 $ 2500 | § 2465
158, 11/06/20 | 5 | 6:00AM | RIO GRANDE CITY, TX. CC WINN BAND ' $ 9350 $ 15000 $ 16,800 $ 12,500 | § 12,325
1150 11/06-07/2020 | 1 | 5:00AM | ROUND ROCK, TX. ~ CCWINNCROSSCOUNTRY | ¢ 2450 | $ 4000 $ 3,240 $ 2850 | $ 2,725
1160| 11/06-07/2020 = 2 = 7:00 AM ROUND ROCK, TX. ~ EPHSCROSSCOUNTRY ' ¢ 4900 $ 8000 $ 6480 $ 4700 | $ 5450
161 11/07/20 1 | 7:30AM | CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | § 1370 ¢ 1,850 | ¢ 1620 $ 1,400 $ 1,230
'162] 110720 | 1 | 9:00AM | UVALDE, TX. CCWINN GIRLS BASKETBALL | $ 1,370 | $ 1,850 § 1,715 § 1,200 | & 1,323 |
'163]  11/07/20 1 | 6:00 AM FREDERICKSBURG, TX. EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1800 $ 255 | $ 2715 ¢ 1,900 § 2,216 |
164  11/09/20 1 1:30PM LAREDO, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,510 § 2100 $ 1,710 $ 1,600 | $ 1,700
1165 11/10/20 | 1 | 1:15PM LAREDO, TX. EPHS GIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1510 $ 200 $ 1710 $ 1600 | $ 1,700
166,  11/10/20 | 1 1:30 PM CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. CCWINNGIRLSBASKETBALL ¢ 1370 ¢ 1,85 $ 1325 $ 1,290 | § 1,230
167 11/11/20 | 1 | 2:30PM CASTROVILLE, TX. EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1445 § 2075 ¢ 1,740 $ 1525| ¢ 1,675
(168 11/12-14/2020 h 1 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. " CCWINNGIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 2745 ¢ 4200 $ 3,870 $ 2950 | & 3,175
169 11/13/20 1| 1:15PM SOMERSET, TX. EPHS GIRLS BASKETBALL | $ 1,545 $ 2,000 $ 2155 $§ 1,750 | $ 1,765 |
170/ 11113/20 | 5 } 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN BAND $ 7725 ¢ 11,500 | $ 11,400 § 10,000 | $ 9,500 |
171 1113/20 | 1 | 2:30PM |  CRYSTALCITY, TX. EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL $ 1,370 ¢ 1850|$ 1630 $§ 1,290 | $ 1,230
1172 11/13/20 | 5 | 10:30 AM | PHARR, TX. EPHS BAND $ 9350 % 15750 |$ 17,500 § 12,500 | $ 15275
'173]  11114/20 | 5 | 6:00AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~CC WINN BAND $ 7725 ¢ 11500 | $ 11,400 | § 12,500 | $ 9,500 |
174, 11/14/20 | 5 | 10:30AM | PHARR, TX. EPHS BAND | $ 935 $ 15750 | $ 17,500 | $ 12,500 | § 15275
175/ 1116/20 1 | 1:30PM | CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | § 1,370 | $ 185 $ 1325  § 1,200 | § 1,230
176 1117/20 | 1 | 1:30PM SAN ANTONIO, TX. | EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | § 1,545 ’ $ 2300| ¢ 1890 $ 1620 $ 1,900
177)  11/19/20 1 | 5:00AM ~ MCALLEN, TX. ~ CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1870 | $ 3250 $ 4,050 $ 2300 | $ 3,055
\178 11/19-21/2020 | 1 | 5:30 AM MCALLEN, TX. EPHS GIRLS BASKETBALL | ¢ 3,070 | § 4650 $ 4050 $  3200| ¢ 3,055
'179| 11/19-21/2020 1 | 5:30 AM DILLEY, TX. EPHS GIRLS BASKETBALL $ 2570|$ 4200 $ 380 $ 2750 | $ 3,375
180 11/19-21/2020 | 1 | 5:30 AM LA JOYA, TX. EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 3070 | $ 4650 $ 405 ¢ 3200| $ 3,375

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BUS DEPARTURE Cougar Bus Im;:sﬁa' Kerrville | OK Tours** _ Regent
s orY  TIME DESTINATION GROUP Lines * or Goathiline
Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX. | San Antonio, TX | San Antonio, TX |
181 11/2020 | 5  6:00 AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN BAND |$ 7725|¢ 11,500 [F$FN0/450| $ 12,500 | $ 9,500 |
182 11/20/20 | 5 | 10:30AM |  PHARR, TX. o EPHS BAND |$ 9350]$ 15750 |$ 14675|$ 12,500 [I§NNN1575
1183  11/21/20 | 5 | 6:00 AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. 'CC WINN BAND |'$ 7725 ¢ 11,500 | § 9450 | $ 12,500 | $ 9,500 |
(184 11/21/20 | 5 | 10:30 AM | PHARR, TX. EPHS BAND |$ 9350 |$ 15750 |$ 14,675 |$ 12,500 | $ 15275
\185‘ 11/24/20 | 1 9:00 AM DEL RIO, TX. CC WINN GIRLS BASKETBALL | § 1 73,79173; 1,850 | $ 1,375 | $ 1,290 [RGTNNH, 5001
186)  12/01/20 | 1 1:00 PM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1545 | $ 2300, § 1890 $ 1,630 [ $ 1,90
1187, 12/03/20 | 1 | 5:00 AM POTEET, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1545 ¢ 2300 $ 1,830 $ 1,600 | § 1,800
188 12/03-05/2020 | 1 530AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS GIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 2745 & 2300 $ 3870 $ 3,050 $ 3,175
1189| 12/03-05/2020 | 1 | 6:00 AM ~_ HONDO, TX. CCWINN GIRLS BASKETBALL | $ 2745 ¢ 4200 $ 3870 | § 2,950 1 48375
1190| 12/03-05/2020 | 1 | 8:00 AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 2,745 § 4200 | $ 3870 $ 3,050 $ 3,175
Qﬁl | 12/0420 | 1 | 800AM | DEL RIO, TX. CCWINNBOYS BASKETBALL | § 1,370 | $ 1,850 § 1,375 | $ 1,200 | $ 1,300
1192| 12/04-05/2020 = 1 | 9:00 AM DEL RIO, TX. ~ EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | § 1970 | ¢ 2900 $ 2,580 | ¢ 2590 | 2,217
(193|  12/05/20 | 4 | 6:00AM |  CASTROVILLE, TX. CC WINN BAND '$ 5780 % 8300 $ 690 | $ 6000 $ 6,700
1194  12/0520 | 1 | 7:00 AM DELRIO, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1370 ¢ 1850 | $ 1,375 | § 1290 | $ 1,300
1195|  12/05/20 | 1 | 2:30PM SAN ANTONIO, TX. 'EPHS BAND $ 1545| ¢ 2300 $ 1,800 $ 1,920 | $ 1,900
196]  12/08/20 | 1 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ EPHS GIRLS BASKETBALL | § 1,545 ! s 2,300 | $ 1,890 $ 1620 $ 1,900
197|  12/10/20 | 1 | 500AM |  SANANTONIO, TX. CC WINN BOYS BASKETBALL | $ 1,545 2,300 | $ 1,890  $ 1,620 | $ 1,900
1198, 12/10/20 1 | 2:30PM LAREDO, TX. | CCWINNGIRLSSOCCER | § 1 1510} $  2100| $ 1,710 $ 1,590 | $ 1,700 |
199/ 12/10-12/2020 | 1 | 8:00 AM NEW BRAUNFELS, TX. | EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | $ 2950 ¢ 4350 | $ 3,870 $ 3450 | $ 3,375
200 12/10-12/2020 \ 1 900AM | SABINAL, TX. | EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL l $ 2745 $ 4200 $ 3,870, $ 2900 | $ 3,375
201  12/11/20 | 1 | 800AM | PLEASANTON, TX. | CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,545 | § 2250 $ 1,865 $ 1,725 [RSRSIEE0 |
202’ 12/12/20 | 1 | 7:00AM |  PLEASANTON, TX. \ CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | $ 1,545 $ 2250 $ 1,865 §$ 1,725 | ¢ 1,860
203, 121520 | 1 | 1:15PM LAREDO, TX. | EPHSGIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,510 $ 2100| $ 1,710 § 1,600 | $ 1,700
204,  12/1520 | 1 | 1:30PM CASTROVILLE, TX. | CCWINNGIRLSBASKETBALL | § 1,445 § 2075 ¢ 1,740 | § 1,500 | $ 1,675
1205  12/18/20 | 1 | 1:00 PM VONORMY,TX. =~ CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | $ 1545 ¢ 2,100 $§ 1,735| ¢ 1630 $ 1,750
‘zoew 12/19/20 1 | 6:30 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. | EPHS BAND |$ 1545 ¢ 2300 $ 1,890 $ 1,630 $ 1,900 |
1207|  12/2220 | 1 | 1:15PM | LAREDO, TX. | EPHSGIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1510 $ 2100 $§ 1,710 ¢ 1590 | $ 1,700
1208]  12/22/20 | 1 | 7:30AM | SOMERSET, TX. | CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,545 \ $ 2100 $ 1,790 $ 1,590 | § 1,775
209]  12/28/20 | 1 | 10:00 AM | ~ LAREDO, TX. i EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,510 $ 2,100 $ 1,710 $ 1,590 | $ 1,700
1210, 01/0521 | 1 | 1:30PM “SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINN GIRLSBASKETBALL | § 1545 ¢ 2,300 | § 1,890 ¢ 1,630 | $ 1,900
211 01/05/21 1. 230PM DELRIO,TX. |  CCWINN GIRLS SOCCER 7),,, 1,370 | $ 1,85 | $ 1,375 $ 1,290 | $ 1,300
212]  01/05/21 | 1 | 1:45PM LAREDO, TX. EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL $ 15100 § 2100 $ 1710 $ 1590 | § 1,700
1213 01/07-09/2021 ' 1 1:30PM | LAREDO, TX. | CCWINNGIRLS sﬁoﬁgg;&ii $ 2710 $ 4200 $ 3870 $ 3300 $ 3,375
214 01/08/21 | 1 | 1:15PM 'LAREDO, TX. | EPHSGIRLSBASKETBALL | § 1510 $ 2100 $ 1,710 | § 1,590 | $ 1,700
215 01/0821 | 1 1:30PM FLORESVILLE, TX. | CCWINNGIRLSBASKETBALL | § 1,645 $ 2400 | ¢ 1965 | $ 1,630 | $ 1,985
1216, 01/08-09/2021 | 1 | 2:00 PM CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. | EPHS BAND s 2420¢$ 3500 $ 2940 ¢ 2850 | % 2,600
1217 01/12/21 | 1 1:00 PM VONORMY,TX. | CCWINNBOYS BASKETBALL | § 1,545 |$ 2100 $ 1,790 $ 1,630 | $ 1,750
1218 01/12/21 1| 300PM | UVALDE, TX. I CC WINN GIRLS SOCCER '$ 1,370 $ 1,850 $ 1,400 | $ 1,290 | $ 1,323
219 01/14-15/2021 | 1 | 6:00AM | CASTROVILLE, TX. ‘ CC WINN BAND $ 2045 $ 3,100 7,«:7 2580 | $ 2,750 [ & 2,217
1220, 01/14-16/2021 | 1 | 6:00 AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. ! CC WINN GIRLS SOCCER $ 2,745 § 4,200 3870 $ 3,050 | $ 3,175
1221  01/15/21 1| 1:30PM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNGIRLS BASKETBALL | $ 1,545 $ 2,300 1,890 $ 1,630 | $ 1,900
(222 01/15/21 1| 2:30PM DEL RIO, TX. | EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | $ 1370 § 1,850 s 1,375 | 1,290 [ § 1,300
1223| 01/16-17/2021 | 1 | 6:30 AM 'SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ EPHS BAND $ 2145 $ 3200 $ 2,580 | $,,, 02,300 | $§ 2,117
224 01/19/21 1| 1:00PM CASTROVILLE, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | § 1445 $ 2075 ¢ 1,740 $ 1,500 | $ 1,675
1225/  01/19/21 | 1 | 1:45PM | LAREDO, TX. EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,510 ¢ 2100| $ 1,710 § 1,590 | $ 1,700 |

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.

Page 5 of 7



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BUS DEPARTURE
TRIP QTY  TIME
1226 01/22/21 1| 1:15PM
227, 01/22/21 1| 1:30PM
228 01/23/21 1 | 6:30 AM
229 01/26/21 1| 1:30 PM
1230, 01/26/21 1| 1:45PM |
231 ol29/21 | 1| 1:45PM |
232]  01/29221 | 1 1:00PM
233)  01/29/21 1 2:00 PM
234]  01/30/21 1 6:00 AM
235|  01/30/21 1 6:30 AM
236‘ 01/30/21 1 6:30AM |
1237]  02/02/21 1 12:30PM |
238] 02/02/21 1| 2:30PM
1239]  02/02/21 1| 1:45PM
1240 020521 | 1 | 1:30 PM
241 02/0521 | 3 | 6:00AM |
1242 02/05-06/2021 | 1 | 6:00 AM |
243 02/06/21 1 6:30 AM
244 020621 | 1| 6:30AM
245 0209/21 | 1 | 1:15PM
}&7 02/09/21 | 1| 1:00 PM
247]  02/09/21 | 1 | 2:00PM_
1248 0211221 | 3 | 6:00 AM
249]  0216/21 | 1 | 1:00PM
1250 02/16/21 1| 2:30PM
251 02/16/21 1 | 1:45PM
252 02/18/21 3 | 6:00 AM
253 021921 | 1 | 2:30PM
1254 02/19-20/2021 | 1 | 1:30 PM
255 02120121 1
1256 02/20/21 1
257 02/20/21 | 1
258 0225721 | 4
1259 02/25-26/2021 | 1
260 02/26/21 4
261 0202721 | 3 |
262] 0229121 | 1
263 03/0221 | 1
1264 03/04/21 4
1265 030521 | 3
1266/ 03/06/21 1
267 03/06/21 | 1
268]  03/07/21 1
1269  03/14/21 1
270, 03/14/21 1

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.

Cougar Bus Im; erlal K il OKT S Regent j|
DESTINATION GROUP Lines * Coml::gny SIS ours™ | Coach Line |
155 s Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX. | San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
LAREDO, TX. | EPHSGIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1510 ¢ 2100 $ 1,710 $ 1,590 | $ 1,700
SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNGIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1545 ¢ 2300 ¢  1,890| $ 1,630 | $ 1,900
AUSTIN, TX. ‘ EPHS BAND $ 1,800 | $ 2900, $ 2445 | $ 2,100 $ 2475
FLORESVILLE, TX. CCWINN GIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1645 $ 2400 | $ 1965 | $ 1,630 $ 2,015
LAREDO, TX. EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL $ 1510[¢ 2100 $ 1710 § 1,590 [F§TT4,700
LAREDO, TX. EPHS GIRLS BASKETBALL | ¢ 1510 ¢ 2,100 $ 1710 § 1,590 | $ 1,700 |
SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,545 | ¢ 2300 $ 1,890 ¢ 1,630 $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINN GIRLS SOCCER | ¢ 1,545 & 2300 | ¢ 1890 § 1630 $ 1 éoo |
SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ CC WINN BAND $ 1545 $ 2300 $ 180 $ 1,695 $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND $ 1545 § 2300 $ 180§ 1,695 $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND 0 $ 1,545 ¢ 2300 $  1,890| $ 1,695 $ 1,900 |
FLORESVILLE, TX. | CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | $ 1645 $ 2400 | $ 1,965 $ 1,630 | $ 2,015
FLORESVILLE, TX. | CCWINNGIRLSSOCCER | § 1,645 | $ 2400 | ¢ 1965 | $ 1,630 $ 2,015
LAREDO, TX. | EPHSBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,510 | § 2,100 ¢ 1,710 $ 1,590 | $ 1,700 |
SANANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNGIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1545 | ¢ 2300 § 1890 | $ 1,620 $ 1,900
LAREDO, TX. | CCWINN TRACK $ 4530 % 6300 $ 5130 $ 4770 ¢ 5100
SAN MARCOS, TX. ‘ CC WINN BAND $ 2320 $ 3600 $ 2,760 § 3 ojsﬁ AR 1Y)
SAN MARCOS, TX. - EPHS BAND '$ 1,720 $ 2600 $ 2320 $ 200| $ 2,145
SAN ANTONIO, TX. ' EPHS BAND |$ 1545 ¢ 23008 1890 $ 2,000 $ 1,900 |
DELRIO, TX. | EPHSGIRLSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1370 ¢ 185 | $ 1,375 ¢ 1,200 [ § 1,300
SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | § 1545 | § 2300 $ 1,890 $ 1,600 $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. . CCWINNGIRLSSOCCER | ¢ 1545 ¢ 2300 ¢ 1,890 | $ 1,600 | $ 1,900 |
DEL RIO, TX. | CC WINN TRACK | $ 4110 $ 5550 $ 4125| ¢ 3870 | $ 3,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNBOYSBASKETBALL | ¢ 1,545 ¢ 2300 | s 1,890 $ 1,630| $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINNGIRLSSOCCER | $  1,545| ¢ 2300 | ¢ 1,890 ¢ 1630 $ 1,900
LAREDO, TX. EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL $ 1510 $ 2100 $ 1,710 $ 1,600 | $ 1,700 |
SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ CC WINN TRACK |$ 4635 ¢ 6900|8% 5670 $ 480 $ 5700
SAN ANTONIO, TX. CCWINNGIRLSSOCCER | ¢ 1,545 ¢ 2300 § 1,890 ¢ 1,600 $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHSBAND $ 2145 $ 3300 $ 2580 | $ 1,600 § 2,117
SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN BAND $ 1545 ¢ 2300 $ 1890| $ 1,600 $ 1,900 |
SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND '$ 1,545 $ 2300 $ 1,890| $ 1,600 $ 1,900 |
SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ EPHS BAND ' $ 1545 ¢ 2300 $ 1,890 $ 1600 | $ 1,900
LAREDO, TX. ~ MJH TRACK ' $ 6040 $ 8400 § 6840 |'$ 8000 $ 6800
SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND | $  2145| % 3300 $ 2580 § 1,800 | $ 2,117
UVALDE, TX. MJH TRACK ' $ 5480 $ 7,400 $ 5600 $ 5600 | § 5292
UVALDE, TX. CC WINN TRACK ' $ 4110 $ 5550 | $ 4200 $  4200| § 3,969
MISSION, TX. ' EPHS BAND ¢ 1870 ¢ 3250 § 2840| $ 2500 $ 3,100 |
SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CCWINNGIRLSSOCCER | ¢ 1545 ¢ 2300 ¢ 1,890 | $ 1,640 $ 1,900
UVALDE, TX. 1 MJH TRACK | $ 5480 § 7400 $ 5600 $ 5600 | $ 5202
UVALDE, TX. | CCWINNTRACK | ¢ 4110 $ 5550 $ 4200 $ 4200 | $ 3,969
SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CC WINN BAND s 1545 ¢ 2300 % 1,890 $ 1,800 $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. { ~ EPHS BAND $ 1545 ¢ 2300 § 1,800| ¢ 1,800 $ 1,900
“SAN ANTONIO, TX. ‘ EPHS BAND |$ 1545 ¢ 2300 $ 1,890 $ 1,800 | $ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND $ 1,545 $ 2300 $ 2,280 | $ 1,800 | $§ 1,900
SAN ANTONIO, TX. ) EPHS BAND $ 1,545/ § 2300 $ 2280 $ 1,800 | & 1,900 |

Page 6 of 7



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 210906 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF BUS|DEPARTURE Cougar Bus Imgperial Kerrville | OK Tours* | _ Regent

i orY| TIME DESTINATION GROUP Lines * COm;Sa Z errville ours** |~ ach Line

. Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX. San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
271, 03/16/21 | 1 | 2:30PM CASTROVILLE, TX. CCWINNGIRLSSOCCER | $ 1445 $§ 2,075 | $ 2, @oﬁl $ 1,590 | § 1,675
272/ 03/18/21 | 4  6:00AM | DELRIO, TX. MJH TRACK '$ 5480 $ 7400 $ 6760 $ 5600 § 5200
1273]  03/2021 | 1 | 6:00 AM ~ SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN BAND $ 1545 ¢ 2300 $ 2280 $ 1,800 | $ 1,900
1274 032021 | 3 | 6:00AM DEVINE, TX. CC WINN TRACK '$ 4635 $ 580 $ 6084 | $ 4200 & 4920
1275 03/25/21 | 4 | 6:00 AM CASTROVILLE, TX. MJH TRACK '$ 5780 ¢ 8300 $ 8360 $ 6400 | $ 6,700
1276/ 03/27/21 | 3 | 6:00 AM CASTROVILLE, TX. CC WINN TRACK |$ 4335 $ 6225 $ 6270 $ 4800 $ 5025
277)  03/27/21 | 1 | 6:30AM KINGSVILLE, TX. EPHS BAND | $ 1,720[ ¢ 2500 $ 2810 $ 2300 § 2,400
'278]  03/27/21 | 1 | 6:30AM | SANANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND | $ 1,545 '$ 2300 $ 2280 $ 1,90, § 1,900
1279| 03/30-31/2021 | 3 | 6:00AM | FLORESVILLE, TX. CC WINN TRACK s 6735$ 10,200 $ 93@07»}, 6200 $ 6,650
1280]  04/01/21 | 3 | 6:00AM | FLORESVILLE, TX. CCWINNTRACK | $ 4935 ¢ 7200 $ 7125 $ 6200 $ 6,255
1281 04/01/21 | 5 | 3:30AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND $ 7725 |$ 11,500 | § 11,400 | $ 10,000 | $ 9,500 |
1282 04/02/21 5| 6:30AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. | EPHS BAND ¢ 7725 ¢ 11,500 | $ 11,400 $ 10,000 | $ 9,500 |
283 04/03/21 1 | 6:30AM | SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ EPHS BAND  |'$ 15451¢ 2300 $ 2280 $ 2000 $ 1,900
1284, 04/04/21 | 1 | 6:30AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND $ 1545 ¢ 2300 $ 2,280 | $ 2,000 $ 1,900
‘285 04/09-10/2021 1 = 6:00 AM AUSTIN, TX. ~ CCWINNBAND $ 2400 $ 3900 $ 3,582 | 3,200 $ 2,675
‘286\ 04/15-16/2021 = 3 | 6:00 AM ~ SAN ANTONIO, TX. | CC WINN TRACK $ 6435 $ 9,900 % 8820| $ 5200 $ 6,350
287 04/22-24/2021 | 1 | 6:00 AM LAREDO, TX. ~ CC WINN BAND $ 2710 $ 4200 $ 4410 $ 30200 | § 3,425
1288| 04/22-24/2021 | 3 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. CC WINN TRACK $ 8235 ¢ 12,600 $ 13230 § 9,150 | $ 9,526
1289, 04/22-24/2021 | 1 | 6:30 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND ) $ 2745 $ 4200 $ 4410 | ¢ 3,050 | $§ 3,175
1290 04/23-24/2021 | 1 | 6:00 AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. ~ CC WINN BAND ' $ 2145 % 3300 $ 2940| $ 2,000 $ 2,117
291 04/24/21 | 1| 6:30AM SAN ANTONIO, TX. EPHS BAND | $ 1545 ¢$ 2300 $ 2280 $ 2,000 | ¢ 1,900
292 05/06-08/2021 = 3 | 6:00AM | AUSTIN, TX. CC WINN TRACK |'$ 9000 $ 13,500 l”sL 13, Zzoj $ 8400 | % 10,126
P93 05/29-31/2021 | 2 = 6:30 AM AUSTIN, TX. EPHSBAND 9000 $ 9180 $ 7200 | $ 6750
1294 06/13/21 1 | 7:00 AM KINGSVILLE, TX. EPHS BAND i 2500 | § 2345 $ 2,800  $ 2,400 |
1295|  06/17/21 | 1 | 7:00 AM KINGSVILLE, TX. EPHS BAND 2500 | § 2345  § 2800 § 2,400

Approval:

\

|
== ,‘ —

|

Mr. Samuel Mijares, Supenntendent of Schools

|Proposal Notes:
\

1. Dates and quantity of buses needed are subject to change

‘* Cougar Bus Lines is not being recommended to be awarded any specific trips even when they submitted the lowest bid. The reason is due to their
|substandard reputation, the vendor's decifient quality of service, and the vendor's unsatisfactory relationship with the district, among other factors
\considered. Cougar Bus Lines, however, is recommended as a "stand-by" for trips that the other approved vendors do not have availablity on.

— T

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.

3. ** Vendor requires 50% occupancy on buses.
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acenparrem 10

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

I: Workshop Regular [ ] special

(A) I:' Report Only |:] Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

B) [ X] Actionlitem )

Presenter(s): ISWVAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO APPROVE THE EDUCATION
SERVICE CENTER REGION 20 PARTICIPATION COMMITMENTS FOR THE 2020-21 SCHOOL YEAR
AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE
RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY (CH).

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

(D) Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM.




EP FAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScaHOOL DISTRICT

FHaréed 7o Treellense

TO: Samuel Mijares, Superintendent
FROM: Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance _ Waareels
<syihei
SUBJECT: EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER REGION 20 PARTICIPATION e
COMMITMENTS

DATE: July 27, 2020

In accordance with Board Policy CH (Local), please accept this Request for the
2020-21 school year to allow the Eagle Pass Independent School District to
participate and have access to the Education Service Center Region 20
Participation Commitment Services for use throughout the District. Enclosed are
copies of the Participation Commitment Forms.

Please let me know if you should have any questions.

587 Mabnisox ST ® EaGLE Pass, Tixas 78852 o Ter (830) 773-5181 [~ WAW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

AN EqQuar Orrorrunity EMPLOYER



Commitments Selected

ESC+20

Serving the Educational Community

1314 Hines Avenue
San Antonio, TX © 78208-1899

System

Commitment & Contract

Eagle

Pass

ISD

User Guide Account Info Logout

Commitments Selected

STATUS

Saved

Commitment For: 2020-2021

Commitment Forms
Commodity Processing

Personnel Services Cooperative - Option Il
(501 - 1000)

Option Il - Educational Technology

Personnel Services Cooperative - Option |

Career and Technical Education (CTE)
Support Coop

iTCCS Audit Trail Of Maintenance
Transactions - Business

iTCCS Audit Trail Of Maintenance
Transactions - Student

iTCCS Remote Job Entry/Network Job Entry
Campus Administrator Academy

Personnel Services Cooperative - Option llI

iTCCS Core Services - Business Services
and Student Services

Option | - General Supplies
Business Management Cooperative (BMC)

Gifted/Talented Services Coop

Eduphoria SchoolObjects Premium Suite
(Existing Subsribers prior to July 1, 2018)

TEKSbank Test Generator
Discovery Education Experience (DEX) k-12
Related Services Cooperative

Clarity - District access

iTCCS Job Submission Business and
Student

School Health and Safety Cooperative

Commercial Food Service Purchasing

Group PRICE

Texas20 Purchasing
Cooperative
Personnel Services Cooperative $4,050.00
2013 Purchasing Cooperative $772.00
Personnel Services Cooperative $6,695.00
Career and Technical Education
(CTE) Support Coop 31,878.00
iTCCS - Miscellaneous $3,777.00
iTCCS - Miscellaneous $3,193.00
iTCCS - Miscellaneous $4,025.00
Administrator Academies for
Professional Development #5,600,00
Personnel Services Cooperative $4,950.00
iTCCS Core Services $395,292.97
2013 Purchasing Cooperative $876.00
Business Management
Cooperalive $3,200.00
GIT Services Coop $8,600.00
Eduphorial: Analysis/Premium
Edition $52,550.00
Eduphorial: Analysis/Premium
Edition $12,056.25
Discovery Education $24,753.70
Related Service Cooperative $100.00
Clarity $8,700.00
Job Submission $14,375.00
School Health and Safety
Cooperative $2,800.00
Texas20 Purchasing
Cooperative

$562,240.92
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