

Bid Tabulation



OWNER Community Consolidated School District 89

PROJECT TITLE **2025 Pavement Rehabilitation**

PROJECT NUMBER 225032.00

DATE / TIME: February 13, 2025, 1:30 p.m.

Apparent Low Bidder

BIDDER	ADDM		BASE BID:	BID FORMS				COMPLETION DATE	BID BOND	CERTIFICATES						* REMARKS	
	NUMBER 1	NUMBER 2		ALTERNATES						SUBST.	Drug Free Workplace	Human Rights Act	Criminal Background	**Investigation Authorization	Non-Collus'n Affidavit		References
				Alternate No. 1	Alternate No. 2	Alternate No. 3	Alternate No. 4										
A. Lamp Concrete Contractors, Inc.	X		\$528,000.00	\$0.00	\$64,000.00	\$19,900.00	\$59,900.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	Only Acknowledged One Addenda
Abbey Paving & Sealcoating	X	X	\$266,150.00	\$0.00	\$20,950.00	\$12,455.00	\$22,275.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	Apparent Low
Accu-Paving	X	X	\$349,425.00	\$0.00	\$41,550.00	\$15,465.00	\$36,490.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
Advantage Paving Solutions, Inc.	X	X	\$301,000.00	\$0.00	\$31,000.00	\$9,450.00	\$26,000.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
Chicagoland Paving Company	X	X	\$339,000.00	\$0.00	\$15,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$40,000.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
Evan & Son Blacktop Inc.																	No bid
Everlast Blacktop																	No bid
Geneva Construction Company																	No bid
M & J Asphalt Paving Company	X	X	\$373,333.00	\$0.00	\$41,933.00	\$17,333.00	\$35,333.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
Maneval Construction	X	X	\$409,432.00	\$0.00	\$51,637.00	\$14,144.00	\$47,467.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
McGill Construction																	No bid
Obsidian Asphalt Paving, Inc.	X	X	\$313,197.00	\$0.00	\$33,295.00	\$14,660.00	\$34,534.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
R.L. Sohol General Contractor																	No bid
R.W. Dunteman Company	X	X	\$356,433.18	\$0.00	\$34,938.30	\$18,057.00	\$30,338.50	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
Schroeder Asphalt Services	X	X	\$349,000.00	\$1.00	\$39,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$35,000.00										No bid
Troch McNeil Paving Company Inc.	X	X	\$329,690.00	\$0.00	\$28,000.00	\$12,500.00	\$24,545.00	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	
YAD Construction LLC																	No bid

Alternate No. 1: Renegotiate Liquidated Damages

Alternate No. 2: West Playground Replacement

Alternate No. 3: Sidewalk Replacement

Alternate No. 4: South Playground Replacement