

Action Item G.2

Bids for Milk and Juice for 2013/14

Background: The school cafeteria is required to bid all food and supply items each year. Mineola ISD is a member of the Region VII purchasing cooperative. We purchase all food items and supplies through them with the exception of milk, juice, bread and ice cream. For the past three years, Region VII has bid some of the items. We have continued to bid these items to compare prices.

The Board approved Borden Dairy for milk and Juice in the June 17, 2013 meeting. Since that time, the Student Nutrition Director, Kim Myers, has experienced several problems with delivery, quantity and quality. We have notified Borden's that Mineola ISD Board of Trustees will be asked to award the contract to Oak Farms through Region VII, effective November 1st if they do not meet our requirements before that time. There is a price increase of .0005 per carton of milk and a .007 increase in juice.

Recommendation: This agenda item is to grant the Superintendent the authority to award a new contract for milk and juice to Oak Farms effective November 1st, if deemed necessary.

Sample Motion:

"I move the approval of granting authority to the Superintendent to award a new milk and juice contract to Oak Farms through Region VII if necessary.

Mineola Independent School District

1000 West Loop
Mineola, Texas 75773

William Bjork
Telephone: (903) 569-2448
Director of Business Affairs
Fax: (903) 569-5155

BID REQUEST

Borden

Milk and Juice Items:

<i>Description</i>	<i>Unit Size</i>	FIRM <i>Bid Price</i>
Fat-Free milk unflavored	1/2 pint	<u>.2318</u>
Fat-Free milk flavored	1/2 pint	<u>.2318</u>
Low-Fat milk unflavored	1/2 pint	<u>.2318</u>
Orange juice	4 ounces	<u>.1425</u>
Apple juice	4 ounces	<u>.1425</u>
Grape juice	4 ounces	<u>.1525</u>

Bread Items:

Whole Wheat Sandwich Bread 20 oz	1 1/2 pounds	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat Hot Dog Buns 13 oz	8 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat Hamburger Buns 15 oz	8 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat English Muffins 12 oz	1 1/2 pounds	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat Tortilla 8"	10 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Grain Sandwich Bread	20 oz	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Grain Hot Dog Bun 6"	8 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Grain Hamburger Bun 4"	30 count	<u>No Bid</u>

Ice Cream Items:

Ice Cream Cups, assorted	3 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Ice Cream Bars, assorted	3 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Fruit Freeze Bars, assorted	2.75 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Ice Cream Sandwiches, assorted	3.75 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Ice Cream Novelty Cones	4 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>

High School and Middle School Snack Bars request a freezer.

Mineola Independent School District

1000 West Loop
Mineola, Texas 75773

William Bjork
Telephone: (903) 569-2448
Director of Business Affairs
Fax: (903) 569-5155

BID REQUEST

OAK FARM

Milk and Juice Items:

<i>Description</i>	<i>Unit Size</i>	<i>Bid Price</i>
Fat-Free milk unflavored	1/2 pint	<u>.2415</u>
Fat-Free milk flavored	1/2 pint	<u>.2415</u>
Low-Fat milk unflavored	1/2 pint	<u>.2415</u>
Orange juice	4 ounces	<u>.1495</u>
Apple juice	4 ounces	<u>.1495</u>
Grape juice	4 ounces	<u>.1595</u>

Bread Items:

Whole Wheat Sandwich Bread 20 oz	1 1/2 pounds	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat Hot Dog Buns 13 oz	8 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat Hamburger Buns 15 oz	8 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat English Muffins 12 oz	1 1/2 pounds	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Wheat Tortilla 8"	10 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Grain Sandwich Bread	20 oz	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Grain Hot Dog Bun 6"	8 count	<u>No Bid</u>
Whole Grain Hamburger Bun 4"	30 count	<u>No Bid</u>

Ice Cream Items:

Ice Cream Cups, assorted	3 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Ice Cream Bars, assorted	3 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Fruit Freeze Bars, assorted	2.75 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Ice Cream Sandwiches, assorted	3.75 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>
Ice Cream Novelty Cones	4 ounces per dozen	<u>No Bid</u>

High School and Middle School Snack Bars request a freezer.

BREAD/MILK BM1314 TABULATIONS- MILK

(AWARD WILL NOT BE VAILD UNTIL JULY 1, CONTINUE TO UTILIZE BM1213 AWARD)

Item #	Title	Description	Case Quantity	BORDEN DAIRY		OAK FARMS	
				Price Per Case with District Owned Equipment	Price Per Case with Vendor Owned Equipment	Price Per Case with District Owned Equipment	Price Per Case with Vendor Owned Equipment
10	Skim White	Milk; skim; vitamin A & D; grade A; pasteurized/homogenized in 1 gallon container	60	4.05	4.05	3.27	3.27
11	LF White Gal	Milk; low fat (1%); unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1 gallon container	250	4.05	4.05	3.27	3.27
12	Buttermilk	Milk; Buttermilk; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 gal.	1553	2.69	2.69	2.05	2.05
13	LF White 16	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 16 oz bottle	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14	LF White, 12	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 12 oz bottle	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15	LF White	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	740824	0.31	0.315	0.2323	0.2323
16	RF White	Milk; Reduced Fat; Vanilla; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	84826	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
17	FF White	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	72530	0.31	0.315	0.2323	0.2323
18	FF White Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	89125	0.35	0.355	0.2626	0.2626
19	LF White PL	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz bottle	74050	0.35	0.355	0.2626	0.2626
20	FF Choc	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	704768	0.31	0.315	0.2323	0.2323
21	FF Choc Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz. plastic bottle	48035	0.35	0.355	0.2626	0.2626
22	FF St	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	117792	0.31	0.315	0.2323	0.2323
23	FF Van	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Vanilla; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	89130	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

COUNTY ISDS COVERED
 ANDERSON ELKHART ISD
 FRANSTON ISD
 WESTWOOD ISD
 ANGELINA ZAVALLA ISD
 CHEROKEE WELLS
 NACOGDOCHES ETOILE ISD
 GARRISON ISD
 SABINE HEMPHILL ISD
 SAN AUGUSTINE BROASSUS ISD
 SAN AUGUSTINE ISD
 WOOD MINEOLA ISD

Region IV