
No.___________________

Topic: Approval and Recommendation of JOC 005-2021 Water Bottle Filling Station at Current Water 
Fountains on UISD Campuses  

Submitted by: Ms. Cordelia Flores-Jackson/Ignacio Alaniz    of: Director of Purchasing/ Director of 
Construction Management  

Approved for transmittal to school board:  March 23, 2022 

Recommendations: 
Administration is recommending approval of JOC 005-2021 Water Bottle Filling Station at Current Water 
Fountains on UISD Campuses to Romo Contractors, LLC.  in the amount of $584,500.00 which includes 
base bid, and $ 50,000.00 contingency allowance.  

Budgetary Information: 
$600,000.00 Budget Source 
ESSER III  

Board Policy Reference and Compliance 
CV Legal- Facilities Construction 
Government Code 2269 

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
AGENDA ACTION ITEM 





Description American Contracting & 
Roofing

Hellas Construction
Leyendecker Construction

 of Texas
Quantum Construction, LLC. Romo Contractors Summit Builing & Design

Sunbelt Air Conditioning
& Refrigeration Services, 

Inc. 
Zertuche Construction, LLC. 

Base Bid Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $534,500.00 No Bid No Bid $713,333.00

Contingency Allowance
$50,000.00

$50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

Total Base Bid plus 
Contingency

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $584,500.00 No Bid No Bid $763,333.00
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