

Project: 2019 ROOF REPAIRS AT MULTIPLE SITES

Owner: PROSPECT HEIGHTS SCHOOL DISTRICT 23

Project No.: 18103

Bid Date / Time: January 31, 2019 at 10:00 AM



	CONTRACTOR	BID BOND	ADDENDUM	BASE BID NO. 1 (GRODSKY) ROOF AREAS 9.0 & 10.0	BASE BID NO. 2 (EISENHOWER) ROOF AREAS 2.0, 3.0, 4.0, 5.0, 6.0 & 7.0
1	Elens & Maichin Roofing & Sheet Metal, Inc.	Y	1, 2, 3	\$176,500	\$354,600
2	Knickerbocker Roofing and Paving Co., Inc.	Y	1, 2	\$211,000	\$391,000
3	L. Marshall, Inc.	Y	1, 2, 3	\$214,000	\$377,950
4	Bennett & Brosseau Roofing, Inc.	Y	1, 2	\$223,900	\$448,500
5	F&G Roofing Company, LLC	Y	1, 2, 3	\$246,000	\$407,000
6	Riddiford Roofing Company	Y	1, 2, 3	\$249,896	\$427,237
7	A-1 Roofing Company			NO BID	NO BID
8	DCG Roofing Solutions, Inc.			NO BID	NO BID
9	Ridgeworth Roofing Company, Inc.			NO BID	NO BID
10	Sealtight Exteriors, Inc.			NO BID	NO BID

Project: 2019 ROOF REPAIRS AT MULTIPLE SITES

Owner: PROSPECT HEIGHTS SCHOOL DISTRICT 23

Project No.: 18103

Bid Date / Time: January 31, 2019 at 10:00 AM



	CONTRACTOR	UNIT PRICE NO. 1 (STEEL DECK REPLACEMENT / SQ.FT.)	UNIT PRICE NO. 2 (STEEL DECK REPAIR / SQ.FT.)	UNIT PRICE NO. 3 (STEEL DECK RUST PAINTING / SQ.FT.)	UNIT PRICE NO. 4 (ADDITIONAL WOOD BLOCKING / BD.FT.)	UNIT PRICE NO. 5 (WOOD DECK REPLACEMENT / BD.FT.)
1	Elens & Maichin Roofing & Sheet Metal, Inc.	\$8.50	\$5.50	\$3.50	\$4.50	\$4.00
2	Knickerbocker Roofing and Paving Co., Inc.	\$12.00	\$10.00	\$2.75	\$3.50	\$6.00
3	L. Marshall, Inc.	\$10.00	\$8.00	\$5.50	\$6.50	\$6.50
4	Bennett & Brosseau Roofing, Inc.	\$10.00	\$3.00	\$5.00	\$6.00	\$10.00
5	F&G Roofing Company, LLC	\$14.00	\$10.00	\$5.00	\$16.00	\$16.00
6	Riddiford Roofing Company	\$11.00	\$5.00	\$3.00	\$5.00	\$7.00
7	A-1 Roofing Company					
8	DCG Roofing Solutions, Inc.					
9	Ridgeworth Roofing Company, Inc.					
10	Sealtight Exteriors, Inc.					