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BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop x Regular Special

Report Only

Recognition
Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE

LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 170406 FOR CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE

SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES
OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHoOOL DisTRICT

Hlasted fro Tecellente
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Digitally signed by Luis A. Vélez
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Date: 2016.06.29 10:20:30
-05'00'
Date: Thursday, June 30, 2016
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 170406 for Cafeteria

Food and Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal Number 170406 for Cafeteria Food and Supplies be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal
and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EaGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @  TeL (830) 773-518]1 @  WwW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 170406 - CAFETERIA FOOD AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
J Item Central Poly Eagle . Matera Syanl o
No. Decintion Estimated | Ben E. Keith G Daxwell ** e Gulf Coast Labatt Lt Mayfield School  [U.S. Foods **| Vicco Supply
! Quantity Products
| San Antonio, TX Linden, Ny Houston, TX Eagle Pass, TX San Artonio, TK ‘San Antonia, TX San Antonio, TX $an Angelo, TX Tampa, FL Buda, TX Eaghe Pass, TX
|CATEGORY: MISCELLANEOUS CAFETERIA SUPPLIES |
1180 DEGREASER, NON-BUTYL 400 | $ 553  NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 535 $ 17.60 $ 6.75| NOBID NOBID |$ 415/ $ 1040
[ 1450 PAPER, NAPKINS 750 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 3885/ $ 3640/ NOBID NOBID |$ 3550
1563 SOAP, DISHWASHING 100|$  7866] NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 88.62| S 9525[$  6555| NOBID *$27.95 |$  103.37
M200 APRONS, DISPOSABLE 1,540 | § 395/ NOBID |S$ 434| NOBID NOBID | $ 472 % 13.85| $ 6.48| $ 443] NOBID |$ 4.95
[M201|  FORKS,PLASTIC i 1300|$ 1560 S 790 *$636 |$S 6.95| 8 680[$  771/$ 750 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |$ 6.90
[ m202 SPOONS, PLASTIC 1,500 | 8 1560| § 791 *$636 | S 6.95| 6.80| $ 771§ 7.50| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 6.90
M203| STRAWS, INDIVIDUAL (UNWRAPPED) 200 | $ 67.33/ $ 38.89| *$2800 |$ 2800 NOBID |3 28.23| NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 2999
[ M204 FORKS, STAINLESS STEEL 20[8 520/ NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 525/ NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID *$3.49
| M205 SPOONS, STAINLESS STEEL 80 | S 351 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 5.25| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID *$2.99
[ M206 BAGS, BUN PAN 220 | § 12.73| & 1110 NOBID NO BID NOBID | $ 16.44| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 1220| 8 46.20
M207 BAGS, FREEZER 3005 29973 13.90| NOBID NO BID NOBID | § 10.37| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 825|$ 4219
[ M208 BAGS, FREEZER 80 ]S 12.67| NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 11.47| NOBID NOBID |$ 11.98| $ 10.50| $ 33.50
M209 BAGS, SANDWICH 60 |$ 3269/ NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 8.33| NOBID NO BID NOBID |[$ 9.50| $ 34.80
M221|  FILM,PLASTIC 60 |S 2364 NOBID *$16.00 NO BID NOBID | § 2000 NOBID | *$13.26 'NOBID | NOBID |5 24.75
‘M223 FOIL, ALUMINUM ~ 70|$  4552|6  3010| *54200 | NOBID |$ 4556 $  4478| NOBID |$ 8191, NOBID |$ 4255/ $ 5252
| M225 FOIL, SHEET 1,850 [$ 4526 $ 6.63| *$6.33 NOBID |$S 6.26 S 6.07| NOBID |S 39.09| NOBID |$ 33.50| § 7.40
| M226 FOIL, SHEET 430 | § 6.75] $ 815 *39.17 NO BID NOBID | § 960 NOBID |$ 425| NOBID |[$ 5778 $  13.25
[m240 LINERS, PAN 150 | $ 3850/ NOBID NOBID |$ 3318 NOBID | S 3176/ NOBID | S 37.52| NOBID NOBID |5  29.00
M245 NETS, HAIR 10][$ 1588 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 321§ 3.00(5  14.68) NOBID NOBID |5 1495
[ m250 SACK, LUNCH 300 [ s 12.02| NOBID NOBID |$  1045| NOBID | & 1252| NOBID |$ 12.71| NOBID NOBID |$ 1050
| M255 | SPONGE, HEAVY-DUTY STAINLESS STEEL 5)s 1252 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | § 443 s 12.00] NOBID |5 429| NOBID [ 4.99
[m259 TOWEL, FOOD SERVICE 40 s 4556/ NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | S 3239|$ 3900/ NOBID |S 61.99] NOBID |[$  46.00
| M260 ~ TRAY, BREAKFAST | ~ 300[$ 5465 NOBID NOBID | NOBID |$ 5341 *$2538 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID [$ 4850 S 5590
[ M261 TRAY, OFFER/SERVE 300 |8 2651| NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | *$54.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID *$19.97 | § 27.30
M262 TRAY, SCHOOL LUNCH 3200 [§  16.89] NOBID NO BID *$28.00 | S 17.62| $ 2358 NOBID |$ 18.99| NOBID NOBID | S 17.85
' M426 GLOVES, RUBBER 10| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | § 706 NOBID |[$ 5.46| $ 1.09] NOBID |S 7.84
[ M427 GLOVES, RUBBER 15| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | § 800/ NOBID |5§ 5.46| $ 1.03| NOBID |$ 7.84
' M428 GLOVES, RUBBER 30| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 800/ NOBID |S$ 5.46| $ 1.09] NOBID |$ 7.84
|l M429 GLOVES, DISPOSABLE 230 [ § 3.95) $ 232  *$1.33 NO BID NOBID | § 553 *$230 |3 4.49| $ 049 NOBID |3$ 5.45
* Not Bid as specified
- ** minimum order quantity/weight requirement on orders | = - . - _
I *** Price subject to change during contract - o - . - o J o

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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