
FACILITIES/CONSTRUCTION REPORT
JULY 2024

BHS Sportsplex:

7-1 Calm, warm@66 degrees. Sletten pour/finish concrete sidewalk and curbs, set forms for stairs ,7 
workers. Nationwide Sports Construction roll geo tech liner and flat drains out, backfill ½” minus rock 
with tracked skidsteer and compact with smooth drum roller, 4 workers. Trails End haul ½” fill with side 
dump and belly dump, haul concrete with 1 mixer truck, 2 loads, 3 workers. Schellenger grading 
backslope with tracked skidsteer, picking rock, 1 worker.

7-2 Calm, warm@67 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction roll geo tech liner and flat drains out, 
backfill ½” minus rock with tracked skidsteer and compact with smooth drum roller, 4 workers. Trails 
End haul ½” fill with side dump and belly dump, haul concrete with 1 mixer truck, 3 workers. Schellenger 
grading backslope with tracked skidsteer, picking rock, 2 workers. Storm Water Construction rake up 
rocks with tracked skidsteer, 1 worker.

7-3 Rain, warm@62 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction roll geo tech liner and flat drains out, 
backfill  ½” minus rock with tracked skidsteer and compact with smooth drum roller, 4 workers. Trails 
End haul ½” fill with side dump and belly dump, 2 workers. Schellinger fine grading/picking rocks with 
tracked skidsteer, also swept asphalt with street sweeper and broke hydraulic hose which leaked from 
the football field to the SSS building, 2 workers.

7-8 Calm, hot@84 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction grade outfield with tracked skidsteer, 
compact with smooth drum roller, start framing pitchers mound in the south bullpen, 4 workers. Trails 
End haul ½” fill with side dump and 2 belly dumps, 3 workers. Montana Fence begin install of backstop 
extend posts, install top rail around perimeter of field, posts were already driven, 1 tracked skidsteer, 1 
snorkel lift, 1 scissor lift, 8 workers.

7-9 Calm, hot@90 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction set forms and pour/finish concrete for 
pitchers mound in south bullpen, start framing pitchers mound in the north bullpen, 3 workers. Trails 
End haul concrete with 1 mixer truck, 1 load, 1 worker. Montana Fence extend backstop posts and start 
hanging chain link fence, hang chain link fence around the perimeter of field, 1 tracked skidsteer, 1 
snorkel lift, 1 scissor lift, 8 workers. 

7-10 Calm, hot@91 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction set forms and pour/finish concrete for 
pitchers mound in north bullpen, start fine grading ½” base @ 4-1/2” deep with tracked skidsteers (2) 
with grader attachment (1), compact with smooth drum roller, 3 workers. Trails End haul concrete with 
1 mixer truck, 1 load, 1 worker. Montana Fence hang chain link fence at the backstop, hang gates 
around the perimeter of the field, start driving metal posts around perimeter of the holding pond, 1 
tracked skidsteer with pounder, 1 snorkel lift, 1 scissor lift, 8 workers.

7-11 Calm, hot@91 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction start fine grade ½” base @ 4-1/2” deep 
with tracked skidsteers (2) with grader attachment (1), compact with smooth drum roller, 4 workers. 



Montana Fence drive metal posts, install top rail, hang chain link fence around the perimeter of the 
holding pond, 1 tracked skidsteer with pounder, 8 workers.

7-13 Calm, hot@88 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction fine grade ½” base @ 4-1/2” deep with 
tracked skidsteers (2) with grader attachment (1), compact with smooth drum roller, 3 workers.

7-15 Breezy, hot@84 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction fine grade ½” base @ 4-1/2” deep 
with tracked skidsteer (2) with grader attachment (1), compact with smooth drum roller, 3 workers.

7-16 Calm, hot@88 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction fine grade ½” base @ 4-1/2” deep with 
tracked skidsteer (2) with grader attachment (1), compact with smooth drum roller, 3 workers.

7-17 Calm, hot@90 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction fine grade ½” base @ 4-1/2” deep with 
tracked skidsteer (2) with grader attachment (1), compact with smooth drum roller, 3 workers.

7-18 Calm, hot@88 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction fine grade ½” base @ 4-1/2” deep with 
tracked skidsteer (2) with grader attachment (1), compact with smooth drum roller, 3 workers. Trails 
End haul in ½” minus chips for finish grade, 2 end dump trucks, 2 workers.

7-19 Calm, hot@91 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction finish 4-1/2” depth of ½” base, start 
finish grade of ½” minus chips with tracked skidsteer (2) with grader attachment (1), compact with 
smooth drum roller, start framing to grade pitchers mound, 3 workers. 

7-22 Calm. hot@92 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction start framing to grade home base plate 
and batters boxes, compact outfield with smooth drum roller and plate compactor, 4 workers.

7-23 Breezy, hot@91 degrees. Nationwide Sports Construction fine grading south pitchers bullpen, 2 
workers. Trails End haul ½” minus chips for finish grade, 1 end dump, 1 worker.

 


