
 

February 28, 2025 
 
 
TO:​ ​ Dr. Monica Kelsey-Brown 
​ ​ Board of Education 
 
FROM:​​ Brian Borowski 
 
RE:​ ​ ACS Group Donation 
 
 
On behalf of Mr. Jeff Willauer, Technology and Engineering Instructor, I would like to request your 
permission to accept the following donation.  For your reference, the price breakdown of the items is 
included below. 
 

●​ (x1) Screen ¼” – CA0700520064 – $675.00 each – in stock 
●​ (x3) Rotor knives – CA0700220000 – $135.00 each – in stock (Total $405.00) 
●​ (x2) Bed knives – CA0700180000 – $140.00 each – in stock (Total $280.00) 
●​ Final Total $1,360.00 

 
This donation would be a wonderful addition to the shop at Waunakee Community High School.       
It will also benefit and support the students with their continued work on a solution to reduce 3D 
printing. 
 
We are grateful for the ACS Group and their donation and we hope you will consider this donation 
opportunity.  It will make a significant difference for our students and their projects.    
 
With sincere thanks, 
 
Brian Borowski, Principal 
Waunakee Community High School 

 



 

On Fri, Feb 14, 2025 at 9:24 AM Willauer, Jeff <jeffwillauer@waunakee.k12.wi.us> wrote: 

Dr. Brown, 

I wanted to take a moment to share a fantastic experience one of our Engineering Design and Development 
teams had last week. Louie King and Sam Anderson visited ACS Group to gain insight into their project, 
speak with engineering experts, and tour the facility. 

Sam and Louie are working on a solution to reduce 3D printing waste by repurposing the by-product into a 
useful base material for applications like new filament production and injection molding pellets. ACS, a 
manufacturer of industrial grinders and granulators for the recycling industry, provided them with invaluable 
information and even offered to donate some parts to support their project. 

Attached is the email to Sam outlining the donated products and their value. Since donations like this are rare, 
I recall that the school board typically recognizes the donor at a board meeting, and the Central Office handles 
paperwork to acknowledge the contribution. Could you confirm if that process is still in place? 

On an exciting note, the students also received verbal offers for summer internships once they begin college! 

Please let me know if you need any additional information. Wishing you a great weekend! 

JW 

—------------------------------------------------------ 

Hi Sam, 
  
The price breakdown of the knives and screens is below. 
 (x1) Screen ¼” – CA0700520064 – $675.00 each – in stock 
(x3) Rotor knives – CA0700220000 – $135.00 each – in stock (Total $405.00) 
(x2) Bed knives – CA0700180000 – $140.00 each – in stock (Total $280.00) 
  
Final Total $1,360.00 
  
Thank you 
  
Mike Tuchalski Jr 
Sales Director 

 
Cell: +1 262-777-0369 
mtuchalski@acscorporate.com 
www.acscorporate.com 
-- 
Jeff Willauer 
Waunakee Technology and Engineering Instructor 
PLTW IED, DE, EDD 
Innovation Center Director 
Whipurwauna Yearbook Adviser 
jeffwillauer@waunakee.k12.wi.us 
Office: 608-849-2169 - Fax:  608-849-2164 

 

http://www.acscorporate.com/

