Patricia Garcia dba Ace Promotions
REGION ONE EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER
Child Nutrition Program - South Texas Cooperative
Food Service Uniforms & Marketing Items RFP 15-10-03-E2
s . o Discount
Item No. Description Brand / Colors] Item # Sizes Unit Price .
Applied
LIST SELECTIONS AVAILABLE AND PROVIDE CATALOGS
CUSTOM LOGO UNIFORMS & WEARABLES
Chef Coat - Double Breasted, Long Sleeve, White, Poly / Cotton
, 9 Y Red cap/ Assorted  4ogh S-3X $29.00 15%
Twill. colors
2 Chef Style Hat - Velcro adjustable, White, Poly/Cotton twill blend
v ) y White CHAT One size $6.25 15%
000-950
3 Chef/Cook Skull Style Cap - Poly/Cotton blend, Velcro Closure. ) )
Blk/white HD70 One size $9.50 15%
4 "Gatsby Cap" - Poly/Cotton, six section crown, adjustable tab
back, one size to fit all. Assorted 1001 One size $8.75 15%
5 "Golf Cap" - Poly/Cotton, adjustable tab back, one size to fit all. .
Assorted 7360 One size $6.00 15%
6 "Visor" - Poly/Cotton, adjustable tab back, one size to fit all. .
Assorted 7460 One size $5.25 15%
7 Apron, Bib style - adjustable neck and tie back, Poly/Cotton Port Authority/ )
Poplin, Pocket Front. Assorted colors A500 One size $11.98 15%
8 Apron, Bib style - with adjustable neck and tie back, Poly/Cotton|  port Authority/
Poplin, NO - Pocket Front. Assorted colors AT705 S-XL $15.00 15%
9 Apron, Cobbler Cover Up style - Poly/Cotton Twill, with .
"Kangaroo" style pockets and adjustable side ties. Assorted TP61 S-XL $15.00 15%
10 Smock - Oversized, button front, pockets, Poly/Cotton blend.
Assorted TP31 S-3X $19.50 15%
11 Knit Sports Shirt - Polo style, with or without pocket, 100% .
. . Port Authority K500 S-3X $15.00 15%
Heavyweight pique, 3 button front.
12 Knit Sports Shirt - Polo style, Contrasting Collar and Culffs,
without pocket, 100% Heavyweight pique, 3 button front. Jerzees J100 S-3X $19.00 15%
13 T-Shirt - 100% heavyweight cotton, full cut, reinforced, ribbed
. Jerzees 29M S-3X $7.50 15%
crew neck, without pocket.
14 Scrub-style top - 100% cotton, solid and print design, v-neck.
Assorted B102 S-3X $8.90 15%
15 Scrub-style pant - 100% cotton, solid and print design, with and Assorted
without leg closures. Assorted D102 sizes $9.98 15%
16 "Work" Shirts - 100% Cotton Twill, with pocket(s), machine .
washable, Short sleeve/Long sleeve. Assorted SC40 S-3X $30.00 15%
17 "Work" Shirts - 100% Cotton Twill, without pockets, machine .
washable, Short sleeve/Long sleeve. Assorted SC16 S-3X $32.00 15%
18 "Work" Pants - 100% Cotton Twill, Soil Release fabric, machine Red Cap/ PT20 A q $29.00 15%
washable. Assorted colors ssorte ' °
19 Jackets - Soil Release fabric, machine washable.
Red Cap! JT22 S-3X $55.00 15%
Assorted colors
20 Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, non-safety toe.
N/A 15%
21 Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, oil resistant footwear, safety toe.
N/A 15%
22 Name tags - Plaque style name tags, magnetic back.
Assorted LAO3M $8.50 15%
23 Name tags - Plaque style name tags, pin back.
Assorted LAO3N $8.50 15%
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Discount

Item No. Description Brand / Colors] Item # Sizes Unit Price .
Applied

24 Other Custom Logo Wearables not listed above: 159
0

CUSTOM LOGO MARKETING ITEMS

30 Canvas Tote Bags - Heavy Duty, Color contrasting Cotton

handles, approx. 15" x 12", suitable for silk screening. Assorted 3019 $6.25 15%
31 Plaques, trophies and awards - include catalog or listing of

available products and cost for set up. Assorted Assorted $25.00 15%
32 Water Bottles Assorted WB20C $0.99 15%
33 Ceramic Coffee Mug Assorted 45140 $1.72 15%
34 Thermal Coffee Cup 15%
35 Desk Top Clock/Thermometer 15%
36 Ball Point Click Pens Assorted KK-640 $0.50 15%
37 Pencils Assorted BW #2 $0.19 15%
38 Foam Collapsible Bottle/Can Coolers Assorted 45081 $1.00 15%
39 Other Custom Logo Marketing Items not listed above: 15%

Custom Print Logo Menu Boards and Sighage

Custom Digital Menu Boards and Sighage

Custom Logo Food Packaging

Custom Logo Equipment

Set-up Fees (include minimum and maximum fees and any miscellaneous charges)

100 Logo Set-up Fee Embroidery $25.00 15%
101 Logo Set-up Fee Engraving $20.00 15%
102 Logo Set-up Fee Printing $50.00 15%
103 |Logo Set-up Fee Silk-Screen $50.00 15%
104 |Other Set-up Fees not listed above 15%

Additional Items:
(include description of items that may be "personalized" with logos to market school nutrition programs)
None stated

List Website and Online Catalogs:

None stated

Minimum Delivery Requirements and Delivery Terms:
None stated

Shipping Via:

UPS; FedEx; Truck

Shipping & Handling, Fuel Surcharges, and/or Other Charges/Fees:
None stated

Average lead time for delivery once order has been placed:
2-3 Weeks

Payment Terms:

Return Policy:
Return - Full refund damaged products

Additional Information:
None stated
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Elite Promotions
REGION ONE EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER
Child Nutrition Program - South Texas Cooperative
Food Service Uniforms & Marketing Iltems RFP 15-10-03-E2

_ Brand / . oo Discount
Item No. Description Item # | Sizes | Unit Price .
Colors Applied
LIST SELECTIONS AVAILABLE AND PROVIDE CATALOGS
CUSTOM LOGO UNIFORMS & WEARABLES
Chef Coat - Double Breasted, Long Sleeve, White, Poly / Cotton
Twill. 10-50%
2 Chef Style Hat - Velcro adjustable, White, Poly/Cotton twill
blend. 10-50%
3 Chef/Cook Skull Style Cap - Poly/Cotton blend, Velcro Closure.
10-50%
4 "Gatsby Cap" - Poly/Cotton, six section crown, adjustable tab
back, one size to fit all. 10-50%
5 "Golf Cap" - Poly/Cotton, adjustable tab back, one size to fit all.
10-50%
6 "Visor" - Poly/Cotton, adjustable tab back, one size to fit all.
10-50%
7 Apron, Bib style - adjustable neck and tie back, Poly/Cotton
Poplin, Pocket Front. 10-50%
8 Apron, Bib style - with adjustable neck and tie back, Poly/Cotton
Poplin, NO - Pocket Front. 10-50%
9 Apron, Cobbler Cover Up style - Poly/Cotton Twill, with
"Kangaroo" style pockets and adjustable side ties. 10-50%
10 Smock - Oversized, button front, pockets, Poly/Cotton blend.
10-50%
11 Knit Sports Shirt - Polo style, with or without pocket, 100% 0-500
Heavyweight pique, 3 button front. 10-50%
12 Knit Sports Shirt - Polo style, Contrasting Collar and Cuffs,
without pocket, 100% Heavyweight pique, 3 button front. 10-50%
13 T-Shirt - 100% heavyweight cotton, full cut, reinforced, ribbed 0
crew neck, without pocket. 10-50%
14 Scrub-style top - 100% cotton, solid and print design, v-neck.
10-50%
15 Scrub-style pant - 100% cotton, solid and print design, with and
without leg closures. 10-50%
16 "Work" Shirts - 100% Cotton Twill, with pocket(s), machine
washable, Short sleeve/Long sleeve. 10-50%
17 "Work" Shirts - 100% Cotton Twill, without pockets, machine
washable, Short sleeve/Long sleeve. 10-50%
18 "Work" Pants - 100% Cotton Twill, Soil Release fabric, machine
washable. 10-50%
19 Jackets - Soil Release fabric, machine washable.
10-50%
20 Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, non-safety toe.
10-50%
21 Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, oil resistant footwear, safety toe.
10-50%
22 Name tags - Plaque style name tags, magnetic back.
10-50%




23 Name tags - Plaque style name tags, pin back. 10-50%
24 Other Custom Logo Wearables not listed above:
10-50%
CUSTOM LOGO MARKETING ITEMS
30 Canvas Tote Bags - Heavy Duty, Color contrasting Cotton
handles, approx. 15" x 12", suitable for silk screening. 10-50%
31 Plagues, trophies and awards - include catalog or listing of
available products and cost for set up. 10-50%
32 Water Bottles 10-50%
33 Ceramic Coffee Mug 10-50%
34 Thermal Coffee Cup 10-50%
35 Desk Top Clock/Thermometer 10-50%
36 Ball Point Click Pens 10-50%
37 Pencils 10-50%
38 Foam Collapsible Bottle/Can Coolers 10-50%
39 Other Custom Logo Marketing Items not listed above: 10-50%

Custom Print Logo Menu Boards and Signhage

o2 | | | | | Nosd_

Custom Digital Menu Boards and Signage

jooo2 | | | | | Nosd_

Custom Logo Food Packaging

70-75 No Bid
76 Salad Containers 10-50%
7 Soup Cups & Lids 10-50%
78 Cold Beverage Cups & Lids 10-50%
79 Hot Beverage Cups & Lids 10-50%
80 Other Custom Logo Food Packaging items not listed above: 10-50%

Custom Logo Equipment

I e A I S S T

Set-up Fees (include minimum and maximum fees and any miscellaneous charges)

100 |Logo Set-up Fee Embroidery $30.00
101 Logo Set-up Fee Engraving $30.00
102 Logo Set-up Fee Printing $30.00
103 Logo Set-up Fee Silk-Screen $30.00
104 |Other Set-up Fees not listed above $30.00

Additional Items:

(include description of items that may be "personalized" with logos to market school nutrition programs)
None stated

List Website and Online Catalogs:

www.elitedpromo.com

Minimum Delivery Requirements and Delivery Terms:
None stated

Shipping Via:

Shipping & Handling, Fuel Surcharges, and/or Other Charges/Fees:
None stated

Average lead time for delivery once order has been placed:

2 to 3 weeks

Payment Terms:

Net 15

Return Policy:




None stated

Additional Information:




Happy Chef, Inc.
REGION ONE EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER
Child Nutrition Program - South Texas Cooperative
Food Service Uniforms & Marketing Items RFP 15-10-03-E2

LIST SELECTIONS AVAILABLE AND PROVIDE CATALOGS
All coop members will receive catalog pricing, which is based upon volume discounts.

List Website and Online Catalogs:

happychefuniforms.com

Shipping & Handling, Fuel Surcharges, and/or Other Charges/Fees:
Shipping is additional, see rate schedule:

Sale Total: Ground: Next Day: 2 Day: 3 Day:

$0-$99.99 $10.95 $65.00 $20.00 $19.00
$100-$249.99 $12.95 $79.00 $38.00 $27.00
$250-$499.99 $17.50 $99.00 $54.00 $38.00
$500-$749.99 $26.25 $129.00 $70.00 $49.00
$750-$999.99 $33.75 $165.00 $91.00 $65.00
$1,000-$1,499.99 $56.75 $196.00 $109.00 $82.00
$1,500-$1,999.99 $83.00 $255.00 $164.00 $113.00
$2,000-$2,499.99 $107.10 $299.00 $208.00 $141.00
$2,500-$3,000 $125.00 $345.00 $252.00 $151.00

Shipping Via:

UPS

Average lead time for delivery once order has been placed:

5-7 days on stock items, 2 weeks for logos.

Payment Terms:

Net20

Return Policy:

All items returnable for refund or exchange within 30 days provided they are not personalized or logoed.

Additional Information:

Electronic payments accepted




Kristine L. Keierleber dba K Graphics Posters
REGION ONE EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER
Child Nutrition Program - South Texas Cooperative
Food Service Uniforms & Marketing ltems RFP 15-10-03-E2

Item No. Description

LIST SELECTIONS AVAILABLE AND PROVIDE CATALOGS
CUSTOM LOGO UNIFORMS & WEARABLES

| | | NoBd

| | | NoBd

Custom Print Logo Menu Boards and Signage

40-43 No Bid
44 Posters Montlh
363 6): 2436
1 Copy $20.00 $16.00 Each
2-5 Copies $16.00 $14.00 Each
6-9 Copies $14.00 $12.00 Each
10-24 Copies $12.00 $10.00 Each
25+ Copies $10.00 $9.00 Each
45-59 No Bid

Custom Digital Menu Boards and Sighage

| | | Nosd |

Custom Logo Food Packaging

| | | Nosd |

Custom Logo Equipment

| | | Nosd |

Set-up Fees (include minimum and maximum fees and any miscellaneous charges)
| [ | NoBu |
Additional Items:

(include description of items that may be "personalized" with logos to market school nutrition programs)

None stated
List Website and Online Catalogs:

www.kgraphicsposters.com
Minimum Delivery Requirements and Delivery Terms:

N/A
Shipping Via:

Shipping & Handling, Fuel Surcharges, and/or Other Charges/Fees:
Priority mail
Average lead time for delivery once order has been placed:
-10 days
Payment Terms:
0 days
Return Policy:
Free replacement if the fault is ours
Additional Information:




Payless Shoesource Worldwide, Inc./Payless Gold Value, LLC
REGION ONE EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER
Child Nutrition Program - South Texas Cooperative
Food Service Uniforms & Marketing Items RFP 15-10-03-E2

Item

No Description Brand / Colors| Item # Sizes | Unit Price Discount

Applied

LIST SELECTIONS AVAILABLE AND PROVIDE CATALOGS

CUSTOM LOGO UNIFORMS & WEARABLES
20 Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, non-safety toe.

Retail

Safe Step * All sizes ) 15%

Varies

21 Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, oil resistant footwear, safety toe. ) Retail
Safe Step * All sizes Varies 15%

List Website and Online Catalogs:
www.saveTstep.com

* See Payless Womens and Mens Styles attached
Minimum Delivery Requirements and Delivery Terms:
See Payless Shipping Methods & Schedule attached

Shipping Via:

USPS, UPS and/or Payless ShoeSource (PSS)

Shipping & Handling, Fuel Surcharges, and/or Other Charges/Fees:

In-store: free; Standard: $5.95; Expedited: $11.95; Rush: $17.95

A $10.00 surcharge per order applies to all orders shipped to Alaska and Hawaii regardless of shipping
Average lead time for delivery once order has been placed:

0-15 days, same day at store or longer with ground delivery.

Payment Terms:

Varies depending on program; Net30 with corporate account.

Return Policy:

See Payless Happiness Guarantee: Returns & Exchanges attached

Additional Information:

Payless has lots of programs from simple coupons to full on-line business accounts. We will extend 15% on all, but
shipping, billing, etc. will vary with program.




Lugra, Inc. dba Specialty Advertisers

REGION ONE EDUCATION SERVICE CENTER

Child Nutrition Program - South Texas Cooperative

Food Service Uniforms & Marketing Items RFP 15-10-03-E2

Item — . Unit Discount
Description Brand / Colors| Item # Sizes . .
No. Price Applied
LIST SELECTIONS AVAILABLE AND PROVIDE CATALOGS
CUSTOM LOGO UNIFORMS & WEARABLES
1 |Chef Coat - Double Breasted, Long Sleeve, White, Poly / Cherokee,
Cotton Twill. Dickies, Port
! - 0,
Authority, VF, SPE500 XS-6X $49.00 5%
ect..
2 |Chef Style Hat - Velcro adjustable, White, Poly/Cotton twill CTIETOREE,
blend Dickies, Port SPE400 S-XL $18.00 5%
) Authori \VVE
3 [Chef/Cook Skull Style Cap - Poly/Cotton blend, Velcro herokee
Closure Dickies, Port SPE-300 S-XL $19.00 5%
i Anthaite \E
4 |"Gatsby Cap" - Poly/Cotton, six section crown, adjustable tab D‘_"I'(_e' E’e’t
back, one size to fit all. Ickies, For . 9
Authority, VF, SPE200 S-XL $15.00 5%
act
5 |"Golf Cap" - Poly/Cotton, adjustable tab back, one size to fit all. Cherokee,
Dickies, Port
! - 0,
Authority, VF, SPE250 S-XL $10.00 5%
ect..
6 |"Visor" - Poly/Cotton, adjustable tab back, one size to fit all. Cherokee,
Dickies, Port
! - - 0,
Authority, VF, SPE-225 S-XL $8.00 5%
ect..
7 |Apron, Bib style - adjustable neck and tie back, Poly/Cotton Cherokee,
Poplin, Pocket Front. Dickies, Port : 0
Authority, VF, SPE520 S-XL $16.00 5%
ect..
8 |Apron, Bib style - with adjustable neck and tie back, therokee,
Poly/Cotton Poplin, NO - Pocket Front. Dickies, Port SPE521 S-XL $15.00 50
Authority, VF,
9 |Apron, Cobbler Cover Up style - Poly/Cotton Twill, with L‘,ns%kee, .
"Kangaroo" style pockets and adjustable side ties. E"::'e_s' P\c;'r:t SPES522 S-XL $17.00 5%
11 orl
10 [Smock - Oversized, button front, pockets, Poly/Cotton blend. ~TIETOKEE,
Dickies, Port SPE524 S-7X $19.00 5%
Authoritv \/E
11 |Knit Sports Shirt - Polo style, with or without pocket, 100% Cherokee,
Heavyweight pique, 3 button front. Dickies, Port
! - 0,
Authority, VF, SPE530 S-7X $21.00 5%
ect..
12 |Knit Sports Shirt - Polo style, Contrasting Collar and Cuffs, Cherokee,
without pocket, 100% Heavyweight pique, 3 button front. icki
P o Hieavyweignt pia Dickies, Port | gpegay S-7X $23.00 5%
Authority, VF,
ect..
13 |T-Shirt - 100% heavyweight cotton, full cut, reinforced, ribbed Cherokee,
crew neck, without pocket. Dickies. Port
! - 0,
Authority, VF, SPE550 S-7X $6.00 5%
ect..
14 |Scrub-style top - 100% cotton, solid and print design, v-neck. CTIETOREE,
Dickies, Port SPES555 S-7X $23.00 5%
Aufhnrit_}( \(E
15 |Scrub-style pant - 100% cotton, solid and print design, with Lherokee,
and without leg closures Dickies, Port SPE556 S-7X $20.00 5%
: Aunthoritv \/E




CNEToKeE,

listed above:

16 |"Work" Shirts - 100% Cotton Twill, with pocket(s), machine —1 Ik .
washable, Short sleeve/Long sleeve. E"::'e_s' P\c;'r:t SPES560 S-7X $26.00 5%
11 orl
17 |"Work" Shirts - 100% Cotton Twill, without pockets, machine herokee, .
washable, Short sleeve/Long sleeve. E'C:'e?" P\‘j'r__t SPES61 S-7X $27.00 5%
uthaorl
18 ["Work" Pants - 100% Cotton Twill, Soil Release fabric, Lherokee, .
machine washable. Dickies, Port SPE570 28-52 $26.00 5%
Authori \VVE
19 [Jackets - Soil Release fabric, machine washable. herokee,
Dickies, Port SPE575 S-7X $49.99 5%
Aufhnrit_}( \/E
20 [Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, non-safety toe. Lherokee,
Dickies, Port SP50 5-12 $74.00 5%
Authori \VVE
21 [Shoes/Footwear - Non-slip, oil resistant footwear, safety toe. herokee
Dickies, Port SP51 5-12 $89.00 5%
Aufhnrit_}( \/E
22 [Name tags - Plaque style name tags, magnetic back. Lherokee, _ _
Dickies, Port SP40 various size| $8.10 5%
Authori \VVE
23 |Name tags - Plaque style name tags, pin back. herokee, ] ]
Dickies, Port SP41 various size| $8.00 5%
Aunthority \/E
24 |Other Custom Logo Wearables not listed above: see attached
catalog
CUSTOM LOGO MARKETING ITEMS
30 |Canvas Tote Bags - Heavy Duty, Color contrasting Cotton
handles, approx. 15" x 12", suitable for silk screening. Port SP600 All sizes $5.00 5%
31 |Plaques, trophies and awards - include catalog or listing of various
available products and cost for set up. All Brands SP601 prices 5%
32 |Water Bottles All Brands SP602 $0.99 5%
33 |Ceramic Coffee Mug All Brands SP603 $2.99 5%
34 |Thermal Coffee Cup All Brands SP604 $2.99 5%
35 |Desk Top Clock/Thermometer All Brands SP605 $4.00 5%
36 |Ball Point Click Pens All Brands SP607 $0.40 5%
37 |Pencils All Brands SP608 $0.25 5%
38 |Foam Collapsible Bottle/Can Coolers All Brands SP609 $0.90 5%
39 |Other Custom Logo Marketing Items not listed above: All Brands SP610 See catalog 5%
Custom Print Logo Menu Boards and Signage
40-41 No Bid
42 |Signs Available 5%
43 |[Banners Available 5%
44 |Posters Available 5%
45 [Table Tents Available 5%
46 |4-Panel Menu System and Hardware Available 5%
47 |2-Panel Menu System and Hardware Available 5%
48 |Menu or Graphic Panel and Hardware (per panel price) Available 5%
49 |Menu or Graphic Replacement Panel (per panel price) Available 5%
- Price
50 |Menu Logo Header Available varies 5%
51 |Marquee Sign with Lighting (standalone) Available dependin 5%
52 |8' Marquee Sign without Lighting (standalone) Available 9 ‘;” ;he 5%
iz
53 |11' Marquee Sign without Lighting (standalone) Available 5%
54 |16' Marquee Sign without Lighting (standalone) Available 5%
55 |Add Lighting to Marquee Available 5%
56 |Blade Sign (metal hardware and graphics) Available 5%
57 |Counter Card Holder and Insert Available 5%
58 |Poster 22"x28" (includes frame) Available 5%
59 |Other Custom Print Logo Menu Boards & Signage items not .
Available 5%




Custom Digital Menu Boards and Signage

coe2 ] v | | | | Nobid]

Custom Logo Food Packaging

70 |Stickers Available 5%
71 |Menu Paper Available 5%
72 |Food Trays/Boats Available 5%
73 |Sandwich Bags Available 5%
74 [Sandwich Boxes Available 5%
75 |Pizza Boxes Available 5%
76 [Salad Containers Available 5%
77 |Soup Cups & Lids Available 5%
78 |Cold Beverage Cups & Lids Available 5%
79 |Hot Beverage Cups & Lids Available 5%
80 |Other Custom Logo Food Packaging items not listed above: Available 5%
90 |Cooling Equipment Available
91 |Warming Equipment Available
92 |Kiosks Available
93 |Other Custom Logo Equipment items not listed above: Available

Set-up Fees (include minimum and maximum fees and any miscellaneous charges)
100 |Logo Set-up Fee Embroidery $20-$35
101 [Logo Set-up Fee Engraving $35.00
102 |Logo Set-up Fee Printing $35.00
103 |Logo Set-up Fee Silk-Screen $35.00
104 |Other Set-up Fees not listed above None

Additional Items:

(include description of items that may be "personalized" with logos to market school nutrition programs)
Uniforms, cups, lunch boxes, backpacks, jackets, t-shirts, bags, ect
List Website and Online Catalogs:

Minimum Delivery Requirements and Delivery Terms:

5-10 days after everything has been approved

Shipping Via:

Shipping & Handling, Fuel Surcharges, and/or Other Charges/Fees:
Average lead time for delivery once order has been placed:

10-20 working days

Payment Terms:

Return Policy:
5-7 working days after merchandise has been delivered
Additional Information:

None stated
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