PURCHASING AGENDA ITEMS
AUGUST 26, 2025 REGULAR BOARD MEETING

A. Competitive Sealed Bids and/or Request for Competitive Sealed Proposals
e Instructional Materials and Supplies, RFP #25R-032LG
e Fundraising Items and Services, RFP #25R-033LG

B. Information Summary of Purchase Orders over $10,000
e July 1, 2025, through July 31, 2025

Director of Purchasing: Laurie Pruett



A. Competitive Sealed Bids and/or Request for Competitive Sealed Proposals

SUBJECT:

BACKGROUND:

RECOMMENDATION:

Consideration and possible approval of awards for
RFP  #25R-032LG Instructional Materials and
Supplies, in the amount not to exceed $10,620,600 for
the length of the contract.

In accordance with state bid laws, legal notices were
published in accordance with Texas Education Code
44.031. The purchasing office electronically distributed
to 1572 companies and 248 companies responded.
Contract dates will run from September 1, 2025 to
June 30, 2028

We recommend approval of awards for RFP #25R-
032LG Instructional Materials and Supplies, in the
amount not to exceed $10,620,600 for the length of
the contract.

e 95 Percent Group, LLC
ABDO-Spotlight-Magic Wagon (ABDO
Publishing Company Inc.)

Abecedarian ABC, LLC

Accelerate Learning, Inc.

AccuCut, LLC

ACP Direct (Affordable Computer Products,
Inc.)

ACT Education Corp.

Age of Learning, Inc.

American Ceramic Supply Company
American Vending & School Supplies (Charles
W. Sears)

Amira Learning, Inc.

Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC
Armstrong McCall (Blume Beauty Supply, Inc.)
Attainment CO., Inc.

B.E. Publishing

Ballard & Tighe, Publishers (Educational Ideas,
Inc.)

Barnes & Noble Booksellers, Inc.

e Beable Education, Inc.

Bellwether Media, LLC, Flutterbee Education
Group (AD Astrada Education, LLC)

Bilingual Generation LLC

Bio Corporation (Bio Company, Inc.)

Blick Art Materials (Blick Art Materials, LLC)
Blue Willow Bookshop (VBK, Inc.)

Bone Clones (Bone Clones Holdings)



Books del Sur, LLC

Bound To Stay Bound Books, Inc.
BrainPOP, LLC

Broad Reach (Red Brick Resources)
Brooks Duplicator Company

Bruins Montessori Int'l USA, Inc.
Cambridge University Press & Assessment
(University of Cambridge)

CareerSafe, LLC

Carnegie Learning, Inc.

Carolina Biological Supply Company
Cengage Learning, Inc.

Ceramic Store of Houston, LLC

CEV Multimedia, LLC

Character Development and Leadership
Charco Promos (Charco Promotional Products,
Inc.)

Childswork/Childsplay (Prevention, Products &
Services, Inc.)

Cignition, Inc.

Circle Saw Builders Supply, Inc.

Cohere Beauty,Omaha Inc.

College Board

Complete Book and Media Supply, LLC
The Continental Press, Inc.

Cosenza & Associates, LLC

Crisis Prevention Institute, Inc.

Curriculum Associates, LLC

Delaney Educational Enterprises, Inc.
Demco, Inc.

Discount School Supply (EarlyChildhood, LLC)
Discovery Education, Mystery Science, Inc.
Mystery Science, Pivot Interatives SBC, Pivot
Interactives, Breambox Learn (Discovery
Education, Inc.)

EAI Education (Eric Armin, Inc.)

EastWest (Lerner Publishing Group)

ECS Learning Systems (Asteria Learning
Systems)

EdTech Games, LLC

Educational Products, Inc.

Eduphorial, Inc.

Edusmart (Learn-Ed, LLC)

Edvotek, Inc.

eDynamic LP, (eDynamic Holdings, LP)
Encore Data Products, Inc.

Escue & Associates (Lektro, Inc.)
ExploreLearning, LLC (LAZEL, Inc.)
Express Booksellers, LLC



First Choice Educational Publishing

Fisher Science Education Business Unit (Fisher
Scientific Company, LLC)

Flinn Scientific, Inc.

Follett Content Solutions, LLC

Forde-Ferrier, LLC

Foundations In Teaching (Rogelio Gomez Jr.)
Frog Publications, Inc.

Fun and Function, LLC

Garrett Book Company (Garrett Operating
Company, LLC)

Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.

Geyer Instructional Products (Prime Ed
Products, LLC)

GF Educators, Inc.

Goodheart-Willcox Publisher (The Goodheart-
Willcox Company, Inc.)

Gravitas Publications, Inc.

Greater Houston Office Products (Office &
Furniture Companies of TX, LLC)

Gumdrop Books (Central Programs, Inc.)
Hameray Publishing Group, Inc.

Hand2mind, Inc.

Harry K. Wong Publications, Inc.

Hawthorne Educational Services, Inc.

Hey Beautiful Nail Supply & Cosmetics, LLC
(Alejandro Flores)

HighScope Educational Research Foundation
Imagine Learning, LLC

Innov8 TX (Parachute RGV, LLC)

IXL Learning, Inc.

J W Pepper & Son, Inc.

Junior Library Guild (MT Library Services, Inc.)
Just Right Reader, Inc.

K12savings (Textbook Brokers, Inc.)
Kaduceus Holdings, Inc.

KAMICO Instructional Media, Inc.

Kaplan Early Learning Company

Kiddom, Inc.

Klett World Languages, Inc.

Knowbuddy Resources (Red Brick Resources)
Knowsys Educational Services, LLC
Lakeshore Learning Materials, LLC (Lakeshore
Parent, LLC)

Lakeview (Lerner Publishing Group, Inc.)
Lead4ward, LLC

Learning A-Z, LLC (Lazel, Inc.)

Learning Without Tears (No Tears Learning,
Inc.)



Learning Zone (Kimco Educational Products,
Inc.)

Lerner Publishing Group

Lexia Voyager Sopris, Inc.

Liberty Office Products, Daniel Office Products,
Gorilla Office Supplies (Gateway Printing &
Office Supply, Inc.)

Libraria (Children's Plus, Inc.)

Lingco Language Labs, Inc.

Lone Star Learning (Lone Star Learning Sales
& Marketing, Inc.)

Lookout Books (Red Brick Resources)
Loving Guidance, LLC (Conscious Discipline
Holdings, LLC)

Mackin Educational Resources (Mackin Book
Company)

Magazine Subscription PTP (Melvin Clearman)
Markerboard People, The

Master Teacher, Inc., The

Math & Science Cut Ups (Integral Mathematics,
Inc.)

Math GPS, LLC

Math Teachers Press, Inc.
MathWarm-ups.com (Baker & Petsche
Publishing, LLC)

Mavich, LLC

Maxi Aids, Inc.

McGraw Hill, LLC

Medicaleshop, Inc.

Michaels Stores, Inc.

MIND Education

MindWorks Resources Incorporated
miniPCR bio (Amplyus)

Mountain Math/Language, LLC

Mrs. Nelson's Book Company

Multi-Health Systems, Inc.

Nasco Education, LLC

National Inventors Hall of Fame, Inc.
National Science Teachers Association
Neuhaus Education Center (The W. Oscar
Neuhaus Memorial Foundation)

Newsela, Inc.

Northern Speech Services, Inc.

Okapi Educational Publishing, Inc.

OTC Brands, Inc.

ORIGO Education, Inc.

Oticon, Inc.

OTTER Reading, LLC (Meagan Beam)

Pala Supply Company, Inc.



Penn State Industries

Perfection Learning Corporation
Perma-Bound Books (Hertzberg-New Method,
Inc.)

Pieces of Learning, Inc.

Pitsco Education, LLC

Pivot Point International, Inc.

Plank Road Publishing, Inc.

Playlearn USA, Inc.

Positive Promotions, Inc.

Powerling, Inc.

Precision Business Machines, Inc.
Prestwick House, Inc.

PRO-ED, Inc.

Progress Learning, LLC

Project Wisdom, Inc.

PAR, Inc. (Psychological Assessment
Resources, Inc.)

QEP, Inc.

QuaverEd, Inc.

Rainbow Book Company of lllinois (Rainbow
Books, Inc.)

Raise 3D Technologies, Inc.

RALLY! Education (RALLY Education, LLC)
Raymond Geddes & Co., Inc.

RDA Pro Mart and SalonCentric (RDA
Woodlands, LLC)

Reading Warehouse, Inc., The
Realityworks, Inc.

Really Good Stuff, LLC

Red Brick Resources

Renaissance Learning, Inc.

Reynolds Manufacturing Corporation

Rifton Equipment (Community Products, LLC)
Riverside Insights (Riverside Assessments,
LLC)

Romeo Music (Romeo Music, LLC)

Rosen Classroom, Rosen Digital, Power Kids
Press, Jackda Publications, Norwood House
Press (The Rosen Publishing Group, Inc.)
Rosetta Stone, LLC

Russell’s Educational Consulting (Hazel
Russell)

S&S Worldwide, Inc.

Saddleback Educational, Inc.

Salem Press, HW Wilson (Grey House
Publishing)

SAM Labs, Inc.

Savvas Learning Company, LLC (Gateway



Education Holdings, LLC)

Scholastic, Inc.

School Datebooks (SDI Innovations, Inc.)
School Health Corporation

School Mate (Morris Printing Group, Inc.)
School Specialty, LLC

Seidlitz Education, LLC

Sempco, Inc.

Sirius Education Solutions (Sirius Education
Solutions, LLC)

SkethforSchools Publishing, Inc.

Smart Apple Media (Red Brick Resources)
Nystrom Education, Good Year Books, The
Center for Learning, MindSparks, The Writing
Company (Social Studies School Service)
SolidProfessor (SP Applications Holdings, LLC)
Southern Floral Company

Spark Innovations

Speech Corner (Speech Corner, LLC)

STEM Education Works, LLC

STEMfinity, LLC

Sujan Shah, Inc.

Summit K12 Holdings, Inc.

Sundance Newbridge Publishing (Lerner
Publishing Group, Inc.)

Super Duper Publications (Super Duper, Inc.)
Sweet Pipes, LLC

Teacher Created Materials, Inc.

Teacher Direct (TDSA, LLC)

Teacher's Discovery, Inc. (American Eagle Co.,
Inc.)

Teachers Pay Teachers (Teacher Synergy,
LLC)

Teaching Strategies, LLC (UTJ Holdco, Inc.)
Teachtown (Jigsaw Learning, LLC)
Techland Houston

Technical Laboratory Systems, Inc.
TechTerra Education (TechTerra Education,
LLC)

Tejas Office Products, Inc.

Texas Art Supply Co.

Texas Pride Marketing (James M. Orr)
Textbook Warehouse, LLC

The Make Up Artist Project (Niche Tex, LLC)
Therapro, Inc.

Therapy Shoppe, Inc.

Thinking Maps, Inc.

Tobii Dynavox, LLC

Unipak Corp.



CABINET MEMBER:

CONTACT PERSON:

BOARD MEETING DATE:

Vestige International

Vista Higher Learning, Inc.

Visual Techniques, Inc.

W.T. Cox Information Services (Cox
Subscriptions, Inc.)

Western Psychological Services -WPS (Manson
Western, LLC)

Whole Phonics, Inc.

Wieser Educational, Inc.

William H. Sadlier, Inc.

Willow Lane Education (Lerner Publishing
Group, Inc.)

Winward Academy, Inc.

Wood Etc. Co.

Woodburn Press LTD

World Book, Inc.

Writing Academy, LLC, The

Certified Education Consultants, Inc. (Writing by
Design)

XtraMath

Young N Refined (Tzvi Grossman)
Zaner-Bloser, Inc.

Tamika Alford-Stephens

Laurie Pruett
Lisa Gann

August 26, 2025



SUBJECT:

BACKGROUND:

RECOMMENDATION:

Consideration and possible approval of awards for
25R-033LG Fundraising Items and Services, in the
amount not to exceed $2,362,000 for the length of the
contract.

In accordance with state bid laws, legal notices were
published in accordance with Texas Education Code
44.031. The purchasing office electronically distributed
to 504 companies and 47 companies responded.
Contract dates will run from September 1, 2025 to
June 30, 2027.

We recommend approval of awards for 25R-033LG
Fundraising ltems and Services, in the amount not to
exceed $2,362,000 for the length of the contract.

1st Photo (1st Photo Texas)

Adrenaline Fundraising (MJS Fundraising Co.)

Bazzini, LLC

Believe Kids Fundraising, Cherrydale

Fundraising,Spirit Gear

Direct,ShopFund.com,FundGive.com,Polar Pals,

Pop! Power of Purpose (Kredo, Inc.)

e Big Fundraising ldeas (CL Boggess
Enterprises, LTD)

e Big Kahuna Fundraising (Procter & Franzke Big

Kahuna TX., Inc.)

e BSN Sports LLC (Varsity Brands, Inc.)

e Century Resources, LLC

e Champion Teamwear (It's Greek To Me, Inc.)

e Club’s Choice Fundraising (Choice Products
USA, LLC)

e Coastal Fundraising Concepts, Inc.

e Deanan Gourmet Popcorn (Deanan Products,
Inc.)

e Educational Products, Inc.

e ESF Fundraising of TX (ES fundraising of TX)

e EZFund.com (Fundraising.com)

e Follett Content Solutions, LLC

e Fort Worth Running Company (Kevin P Simms)

e Freedom Fundraising

e Fundraiser Blankets (Birdy Boutique, LLC)

e Fundraising Manager (Fundraise 21, Inc.)

e Gandy Ink (G & G Investments, Inc.)

e Herff Jones (Graduate Sales & Recognition,

LLC)

Hometown, LLC (Hometown Ticketing, Inc.)
e Jenny's Penguin Patch (R & K Sales, Inc.)

e JMS Fundraising; InstaRaise (Joint Marketing



CABINET MEMBER:

CONTACT PERSON:

BOARD MEETING DATE:

Solutions)
e Literati, Inc.
Nothing Bundt Cakes-Pasadena (January Baby
Cakes, Inc.)
Old Fashion Candy Co., Inc.
Ozark Delight Candy Company, Inc.
Peter Piper Pizza (Pizza Properties Inc.)
Platinum Fundraising, LLC.
Ready Set Fund, Inc.
Scholastic Book Fairs, Inc.
Signature Fundraising, Inc.
Snap Raise (Snap! Mobile, LLC)
Southern Floral Company
Speed Stacks, Inc.
Sunline Products (SLPC, Inc.)
TeamFunded
USA Fundraisers, LLC (Terence Kitchens)
Vertical Raise, LLC
WiddyUp, Inc.
World's Finest Chocolate, Inc.

Tamika Alford-Stephens

Laurie Pruett
Lisa Gann

August 26, 2025



B. Information Summary of Purchase Orders over $10,000
July 1, 2025 thru July 31, 2025

TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Transportation | NC RANEHAS & 26000004 | $10,000.00 25R-002EZ | 10/22/2024
. ASTRO PROMO &
Maintenance UNIEORMS LLG | 26000013 | $10,000.00 24R-010LM | 2/27/2024
Facilities & | CLEAR BROOK CITY
Construstion MUD 26000016 |  $33,000.00 UTILITIES
. CARRIER
Maintenance |y rERPRISE LLG | 26000020 | $20,000.00 23P-019TJ | 2/28/2023
Facilities & KIRKMONT
. MUNICIPAL UTILITY | 26000033 | $280,000.00 UTILITIES
Construction DIS
Facilities & SWART
Construstion | ARCHITEGTS INC | 26000037 | $15,000.00 PROF SERV | 9/24/2019
Transportation | DF SALES TXLLC |26000039 | $50,000.00 25R-001EZ | 10/22/2024
. BAYSIDE PLUMBING
Maintenance SERVICES 26000040 |  $20,000.00 24R-024EZ | 5/28/2024
. FIRE PROTECTION
Maintenance SERVICE INC 26000051 |  $50,000.00 23P-022TJ | 2/28/2023
Facilities & TEXAS GENERAL
Construstion AND OFFIGE | 26000055 | $410,000.00 UTILITIES | 11/28/2023
- OVOL BOSWORTH
Printing HIGH POINT 26000056 |  $25,000.00 HCDE/CP 4/22/2025
Facilities & | o1y oF PASADENA | 26000058 | $1,300,000.00 UTILITIES
Construction
Maintenance | CTANNEL DOORT 155000076 | $10,000.00 25R-012LM | 2/25/2025

LP




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Facilities & CITY OF SOUTH
gaonties & N N 26000078 |  $73,000.00 UTILITIES
ELEVATOR
Maintenance | TRANSPORTATION | 26000082 |  $20.000.00 ESC5 4/22/2025
SRVC INC
Transportation CINTAS CORP | 26000092 | $27,000.00 OMNIA 4/22/2025
Maintenance | CPMR 'I"N%USTON 26000093 |  $25,000.00 25R-001EZ | 10/22/2024
Facilities & RUNOFF
gacntes & MANAGEMENT | 26000096 | $53,190.00 PROF SERV | 5/27/2025
GROUP INC
GRAYSON
Maintenance | ARMATURE WORKS | 26000103 |  $10,000.00 NO BID
INC
Facilities & WEST BELT
Lacities & SURVEVING NG | 26000111 | $45,000.00 PROF SERV
Facilities & | ~.+v OF PEARLAND | 26000116 |  $61,000.00 UTILITIES
Construction
Facilities & STERLING
cacites & | ENVIRONMENTAL | 26000141 | $20,000.00 PROF SERV
CONSULTING LLC
Maintenance | ASCO EQUIPMENT | 26000148 | $10,000.00 HGAC 4/22/2025
Facilities & | ~\rv OF HOUSTON | 26000151 | $720,000.00 UTILITIES
Construction
Maintenance | HUNTON SERVICES | 26000158 | $100,000.00 23P-019TJ | 2/28/2023
Faciliies & | cENERGISTIC LLC | 26000169 | $1,590,000.00 |  19P-012LP | 1/22/2019
Construction
Maintenance | MSCINDUSTRIAL | 50660172 $15,000.00 25R-001EZ | 10/22/2024

SUPPLY CO




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Maintenance | BIG Z LUMBER CO | 26000173 | $20,000.00 25R-001EZ | 10/22/2024
| SOUTHERN TIRE
Transportation MART LLC 26000180 $70,000.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
Transportation | O NCLLYAUTO 26000185 | $50,000.00 23R-006LL | 10/25/2022
REGION IV
Transportation EDUCATION | 26000191 | $20,000.00 ESC4 9/15/2017
SERVICE CENTER
Libraries &
Instruct NROC%'TSJECT' 26000197 | $72,000.02 | BUYBOARD | 4/22/2025
Materials
Libraries &
CENGAGE
instruct EARNS R | 26000198 | $18,000.00 23R-003TM | 11/29/2022
Materials
LASSETTER
Transportation LAFOUR 26000201 | $10,000.00 23R-006LL | 10/25/2022
EQUIPMENT LP
Transportation | CHALKS TRUCK | 56000203 | $50,000.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
PTS INC
TEXAS
Transportation | ALTERNATOR | 26000210 | $25,000.00 23R-006LL | 10/25/2022
STARTER SVC
Transportation | PP (SBTL%EAUTO 26000214 |  $10,000.00 23R-006LL | 10/25/2022
RUSH TRUCK
Transportation CENTERS OF | 26000221 | $50,000.00 23R-035TM | 8/22/2023
TEXAS LP
ACME
Maintenance | ARCHITECTURAL | 26000229 | $15,000.00 25R-001EZ | 10/22/2024
HARDWARE
Maintenance GRAINGER 26000242 | $20,000.00 | BUYBOARD | 4/22/2025
Transportation | BAo0 & MEINEKE | 50000046 | $50,000.00 23R-006LL | 10/25/2022

NO 1 LLC




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Facilities & DIRECT ENERGY
Construction BUSINESS LLC 26000259 | $9,999,999.00 UTILITIES
. MONUMENT
Transportation CHEVROLET 26000260 | $10,000.00 23R-006LL 10/25/2022
. PO PANHA
Transportation CORPORATION 26000263 $25,000.00 BUYBOARD 4/22/2025
EAGLE COLLISION
Transportation REPAIR CENTER | 26000264 | $25,000.00 23R-006LL 10/25/2022
INC
Transportation | HOPSKIPDRIVE INC | 26000266 | $100,000.00 HCDE/CP 4/22/2025
BUILDING
Maintenance CONTROLS & 26000271 $15,000.00 25R-001EZ 10/22/2024
SOLUTIONS
Transportation | >/°° S MEINERE 126000274 | $25,000.00 23R-006LL | 10/25/2022
Transportation | NAPA AUTO PARTS | 26000280 | $35,000.00 BUYBOARD 4/22/2025
Transportation THOMACSC)ig.? GULF 26000281 $50,000.00 23R-006LL 10/25/2022
Transportation HARRIS COUNTY | 26000282 | $24,000.00 GOVT ENTITY
Transportation BEAED LP 26000284 | $12,000.00 24R-009LM 2/27/2024
. C&C WHOLESALE
Maintenance DISTRIBUTORS 26000289 | $15,000.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
South Houston | TREMONT HOUSE STUDENT
High School HOTEL, THE 26000307 | $18,600.00 FUNDS
HERMETIC
Maintenance | COMPRESSORS OF | 26000310 | $10,000.00 25R-013LM 4/22/2025

HOUSTON INC




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Maintenance GRAINGER 26000312 $40,000.00 BUYBOARD 4/22/2025
. TRANSFINDER
Transportation CORPORATION 26000314 $36,000.00 BUYBOARD 4/22/2025
MARIACHI
Fine Arts SUPPLIES 26000320 $11,413.00 25R-041EZ 6/24/2025
EXPRESS
Maintenance HOME DEPOT 26000322 $20,000.00 OMNIA 4/22/2025
) CITY SUPPLY
Maintenance COMPANY 26000326 $40,000.00 23R-047TJ 5/30/2023
DEALERS
Maintenance ELECTRICAL 26000328 $40,000.00 25R-001EZ 10/22/2024
SUPPLY
) FERGUSON
Maintenance ENTERPRISES LLC 26000333 $10,000.00 25R-013LM 4/22/2025
Pasadena
Memorial High RICOH USA INC 26000351 $12,000.00 OMNIA 4/22/2025
School
Buildings and NOVUS WOOD
Grounds GROUP LP 26000355 $15,000.00 25R-013LM 4/22/2025
) HUNTON
Maintenance DISTRIBUTION 26000368 | $100,000.00 23P-019TJ 2/28/2023
Buildings and BFI WASTE
Grougnds SERVICES OF 26000370 | $250,000.00 24P-015LL 2/27/2024
TEXAS LP
) IML SECURITY
Maintenance SUPPLY 26000372 $50,000.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
) JOHNSON HVAC
Maintenance DISTRIBUTION 26000376 $20,000.00 23P-019TJ 2/28/2023
Maintenance | NDLEY'S VACUUM | 55000381 | $50,000.00 23R-052TJ | 7/25/2023

& JANITORIAL




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Technolo NETSYNC
Divisiongy NETWORK 26000382 | $85,731.18 DIR 4/22/2025
SOLUTIONS
Maintenance | SHERWIN-WILLIAMS | 26000384 | $15,000.00 SOURCEWELL | 4/22/2025
Maintenance | s CLMBING 96000388 | $40,000.00 | 25R-001EZ | 10/22/2024
Buildings and WASTE
Grounds MANAGEMENT 26000389 | $608,000.00 CITYORD/P
. ROESSLER
Maintenance EQUIPMENT CO INC 26000395 | $40,000.00 23P-019TJ 2/28/2025
: SUN COAST
Transportation RESOURCES LLC 26000399 | $50,000.00 HCDE/CP 4/22/2025
. SOUTHWASTE
Maintenance DISPOSAL LLC 26000408 | $50,000.00 25P-008LM 11/19/2024
: SUN COAST
Transportation RESOURCES LLC 26000432 | $1,000,000.00 HCDE/CP 4/22/2025
Maintenance PARTS TOWN LLC | 26000436 | $40,000.00 23R-028LL 3/28/2023
. CHANNEL BEARING
Maintenance 8 SUPPLY LLC 26000438 | $10,000.00 23P-019TJ 2/28/2025
Printing FTG TEXAS 26000454 | $119,008.00 DIR 4/22/2025
UNITED
Maintenance REFRIGERATION | 26000457 | $20,000.00 23P-019TJ 2/28/2025
INC
Maintenance TEJAS '\I/l,\'?g ERIALS 26000464 | $15,000.00 25R-001EZ 10/22/2024
WILSON FIRE
Maintenance EQUIP & SERV CO | 26000485 | $20,000.00 23P-022TJ 2/28/2023

INC




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
WILSON FIRE
Maintenance | EQUIP & SERV CO | 26000486 | $50,000.00 23P-022TJ | 2/28/2023
INC
. VMI PREMIER
Maintenance o ey | 26000487 | §10,000.00 24R-020EZ | 4/23/2024
RUSH TRUCK
Transportation CENTERS OF | 26000496 | $50,000.00 23R-006LL | 4/25/2023
TEXAS LP
HERITAGE
Maintenance | PROFESSIONAL | 26000498 | $10,000.00 24R-007TJ | 10/24/2023
PROD GRP
HOLT TRUCK
Transportation CENTERS OF | 26000500 | $50,000.00 23R-006LL | 4/25/2023
TEXAS LLC
J Frank Dobie BALFOUR 26000501 | $10,000.00 | 23R-025TM | 2/28/2023
High School
Maintenance | STEEL SUPPLY LP | 26000510 | $10,000.00 05R-001EZ | 10/22/2024
HOLT TRUCK
Transportation CENTERS OF | 26000516 | $50,000.00 23R-006LL | 10/25/2022
TEXAS LLC
Maintenance | CHEM-AQUA INC | 26000522 | $155,817.52 HCDE/CP | 3/25/2025
. PRECISION DELTA
PISD Police o RPCRATION | | 26000556 |  $42728.20 | BUYBOARD | 4/22/2025
Fine Arts | LISLE VIOLIN SHOP | 26000572 |  $16,000.00 O5R-041EZ | 6/24/2025
Fine Arts MUSIC AND ARTS | 26000588 |  $15,000.00 05R-041EZ | 6/24/2025
FLEMING MUSICAL
Fine Arts INSTRUMENT & | 26000592 |  $16,000.00 O5R-041EZ | 6/24/2025
REPAIR
Fine Ats | BROOKMAYSHEH | 56000604 | $30,000.00 05R-041EZ | 6/24/2025

MUSIC




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Child Nutrition ICE EXPRESS 26000633 $10,000.00 24R-023LL 5/28/2024
. TEXAS SCHOOL
Finance ALLIANCE 26000634 $25,200.00 REGISTRATION
Career & FORT WORTH
Technical High RUNNING 26000653 $13,425.00 24R-010LM 2/27/2024
School COMPANY
Human GATEWAY
RESOUICES PRINTING & OFFICE | 26000662 $10,000.00 ESC5 4/22/2025
SUPPLY INC
PISD Police CITY OF HOUSTON | 26000664 $58,000.00 GOVT ENTITY
NAPCO SECURITY
Finance TECHNOLOGIES 26000668 $13,000.00 NO BID
INC
RH”ma” DISA INC 26000680 | $18,000.00 NO BID
esources
LIBERTY MUTUAL
Finance INSURANCE 26000683 $68,000.00 PSA 4/22/2025
COMPANY
Finance AT&T TEXAS 26000684 $90,000.00 DIR 4/22/2025
Tax Office SPINDLEMEDIA LLC | 26000687 $53,123.00 16-017 2/23/2016
Career & NTL CTR
Technical COMPETENCY 26000688 $12,300.00 REGISTRATION
Education TEST (NCCT)
Maintenance FILTERBUY INC 26000701 $10,818.00 23R-019TJ 2/28/2023
Tegeler Career TREETOP
Center PRODUCTS LLC 26000702 $15,093.27 NO BID
Buildings and ADVANCED 26000706 | $12,982.50 25B-024LM | 5/27/2025

Grounds

BLENDING LLC




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Facilities & SITEK OMNI
gaciities SERVIGERLLC | 26000715 | $40,000.00 ESC5 4/22/2025
Maintenance PUREMAXX LLC | 26000717 | $29.884.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
Human H2U WELLNESS
moman CENTER 26000720 | $1,000,000.00 | 20P-032LP | 6/23/2020
J Frank Dobie | D ZINE GRAPHICS
Hich School o 26000723 | $15,000.00 23R-039LM | 4/25/2023
J Frank Dobie || £ AN LEOTARDS | 26000727 | $10,000.00 23R-039LM | 4/25/2023
High School
ARMSTRONG
Child Nutrition | REPAIR CENTER | 26000744 | $50,000.00 HCDE/CP 4/22/2025
INC
» ERNIE'S CAFE &
Printing CATERING LG | 26000755 |  $26,000.00 24R-023LL | 5/28/2024
ARMSTRONG
Child Nutrition | REPAIR CENTER | 26000756 | $250,000.00 HCDE/CP 4/22/2025
INC
Superintendent TASB 26000759 | $11,000.00 | REGISTRATION
Finance AT&T MOBILITY LLC | 26000762 | $130,000.00 DIR 4/22/2025
Athletics SIGN CHAMP INC | 26000765 |  $17.200.00 BUYBOARD | 4/22/2025
Academic EDUPHORIA! INC | 26000795 |  $23.760.00 23R-034TM | 8/22/2023
Achievement
M"Stgiﬁo'\gl'dd'e BAZZINI LLC 26000799 | $24,125.00 24R-035LG | 8/27/2024
Atkinson '
Elementary | WORLD'S FINEST [ 55000806 | $13,320.00 24R-035LG | 8/27/2024

School

CHOCOLATE INC




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Prof Leaming & KICKUP INC 26000818 |  $18,797.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
Tchr Induction
Fine Arts CLARK FREIGHT | 55600820 | $32,500.00 25R-007LG | 9/24/2024
LINES INC
. MCRAY CRANE &
Maintenance 2IGGING ING 26000827 | $19,000.00 NO BID
Libraries &
CENGAGE
Instruct LEARNING ING | 26000832 |  $16,764.00 23R-003TM | 11/29/2022
Materials
Maintenance DAIKIN APPLIED | 26000835 | $10,000.00 OMNIA 412212025
Garfield
WORLD'S FINEST
Elementary CHOGOLATE INC | 26000841 | $19,920.00 24R-035LG | 8/27/2024
School
Career & WESTCOAST
Technical PRODUCTS & 26000873 | $10,000.00 CTPA 412212025
Education DESIGN LLC
| Erank Dobie | 'S! COMMERCIAL
. REFRIGERATION | 26000897 | $10,203.73 23R-035TM | 8/22/2023
High School LLC
Tegir\‘/?s?('%gy BUMP ARMOR | 26000900 | $48,186.47 TIPS 412212025
Technology AGPARTS
Ao WORLDWIDE [NC | 26000907 | $40,440.00 23R-005LM | 10/25/2022
. BRINK'S
Finance INCORPORATED | 26000912 | $90,000.00 23P-023LL 2/28/2023
curriculum & | BARNES & NOBLE
Imstruction COLLEGE 26000917 | $100,000.00 CTPA 412212025
BOOKSELLERS LLC
Academic EDUPHORIA! INC | 26000918 | $186,093.90 23R-034TM | 8/22/2023
Achievement
PISD Police VERIZON 26000921 | $25,000.00 DIR 4/22/2025

WIRELESS (POLICE)




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Human EIS 26000930 | $481,000.00 DIR 4/22/2025
Resources
Maintenance CULINARY DEPOT | 26000950 $10,000.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
Special BAYOU CITY
Education INTERPRETING LLC 26000953 $10,000.00 25R-015EZ 2/25/2025
SOUTHERN ICE
Child Nutrition CREAM (FOOD 26000956 $94,200.00 SPA 4/22/2025
SERVICE ONLY)
FREEZING POINT
Child Nutrition LLC (FOOD SRVC | 26000959 $19,500.00 HCDE/CP 4/22/2025
ONLY)
Child Nutrition | GOLD STAR FOODS | 26000961 $97,000.00 SOURCEWELL | 4/22/2025
) JOHNSON
Maintenance CONTROLS INC 26000968 $25,000.00 OMNIA 4/22/2025
Facilities & BROWN & ROOT
Construction INDUST SRVS LLC 26000977 $12,167.00 OMNIA 4/22/2025
Libraries & EBSCO
Instruct INFORMATION 26000982 $38,650.00 23R-003TM 11/29/2022
Materials SERVICES LLC
Finance WHITLEY PENN LLP | 26000988 $40,000.00 PROF SERV 4/23/2019
BROTHERS
) ” PRODUCE INC
Child Nutrition (FOOD SERVICE 26000990 | $1,018,000.00 SPA 4/22/2025
ONLY)
Fine Arts ROMEO MUSIC 26000993 $27,644.95 23R-035TM 8/22/2023
) J&M CABLE
Maintenance CONSTRUCTION 26000996 $19,000.00 NO BID
ACADIAN
Athletics AMBULANCE SVC | 26000998 $20,600.00 PROF SERV

OF TEXAS




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
GORDON FOOD
. - SERVICE INC
Child Nutrton | S Couice | 26001004 | §12,752,000.00 SPA 4/22/2025
ONLY)
Finance EUNA SlﬁéUT'ONS 26001009 | $38,805.04 | SOURCEWELL | 4/22/2025
Special HARKREADER,
capocal ARl A G 26001015 | $25.000.00 | 24R-001LL-1 | 10/24/2023
Special SCHOOL
capecd OUTRIMERS LLC | 26001023 |  §13,172.80 TIPS 4/22/2025
Athletics BSN SPORTS INC | 26001026 |  $13.284.56 23R-039LM | 4/25/2023
MISSION
Transportation RESTAURANT | 26001039 | $15,229.16 BUYBOARD | 4/22/2025
SUPPLY
Pasadena
Memorial High | JONES, DEVIONNE | 26001045 | $10,500.00 NO BID
School
ABBOTT NUTRITION
Child Nutriton | (FOOD SERVICE | 26001090 | $15,000.00 NO BID
ONLY)
Libraries &
Instruct CEV MEtE'MED'A 26001091 | $330,011.00 | 23R-034TM | 8/22/2023
Materials
Facilities & SITEK OMNI
Lacities & SERVIGERLLG | 26001094 | $43,050.00 ESC5 4/22/2025
Child Nutrition SMART;E’;‘SE BY 126001102 | $10.100.00 HCDE/CP | 4/22/2025
Technology AODOCS 26001108 |  $49,999.00 NO BID
Division
Technology | CDW GOVERNMENT | 5001445 | $10,000.00 TIPS 4/22/2025
Division LLC
HILAND DAIRY
Child Nutriton | FOODS CO LLC | 26001126 | $3,034.600.00 SPA 4/22/2025

(FOOD SRV ONLY)




TENDR DT Vendor Name PO # PO Total Legal Authority CEI
Name Approval
Technolo WEAVER
Divisi 9y TECHNOLOGIES | 26001160 | $328,278.45 DIR 4/22/2025
ivision
LLC
Finance HOUSTON ISD 26001161 $59,850.00 GOVT ENTITY
Human DNT EDUCATIONAL
Resources CONSULTANTS 26001189 | $17,600.00 NO BID
Eacilities & ARGIO ROOFING &
c . CONSTRUCTION | 26001231 | $655,070.04 25P-044LP 7/22/2025
onstruction

LLC




	PURCHASING AGENDA ITEMS AUgust 26, 2025 REGULAR BOARD MEETING
	July 1, 2025 thru July 31, 2025

