
Dates to Remember 
  4/3~Dance 6-8 
4/24~Progress Reports  
4/28~Honor Society Induction 6-8 
4/30~Conferences No school 

 
Dance 

Attention 7th & 8th graders, you are 
invited to the Fleming Middle School 
Spring Fling Dance-n-Tumbler. 
When:  April 4, 2009, 7p.m. 10:00 p.m. 
 
Where: Unlimited Sports- 2051 NW 
Hawthorne 541-956-4985. 
 
What:  Dance, dodge ball, tumbling, 
trampoline & open gym. 
 
6.00 Prepay w/permission slip, $7.00 
at the door. Pizza, soda & water for 
purchase - Photographer available. 
Fundraiser for Fleming's 'Moving On' 
Dance. 
 

Student of the Month 
Congratulations to the “Student of the 
Month” winners for the month of 
February.   

6th ~ Summer Christman & Tanner 
Hyde 
7th ~ Taylor Larson & Michael Andrus 
8th ~ Jamie Sholes & Anthony Jarvis 
 

Please Note Change 
This year’s 8th grade “Moving On” 
celebration will be held on the last day 
of school, June 9, after lunch.  Details 
will follow as we work them out... 
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8th Grade Celebration  
Our annual 8th Grade Celebration is 
coming Saturday, May 30 from 6-10 
PM.  This is an event for Lincoln 
Savage eighth graders only.  This 
year’s theme is, ”A Night to 
Remember”.  The colors are silver, 
light blue, and dark blue.  The theme 
and colors were selected by vote of 
the eighth grade.  We plan to serve a 
Mexican style buffet; there will be 
dancing, a photographer, and prizes.  
Tickets will be five dollars per person, 
and go on sale the first week of April.  
As we do every year, we request each 
family pay ten dollars towards the 
expenses.  If there is any money left 
over, it will go towards the Class of 
2013 account at Hidden Valley High 
School.  We are in serious need of 
volunteers to chaperone and help set 
up and clean up.  Anyone wishing to 
volunteer please contact: 
 
Cece Hansen   home 471-9031       
cell 660-7048 
 
There are some details regarding the 
celebration that we would like to make 
clear to all parents and students. 
 
No tuxedos or prom dresses.  This 
night is a celebration, not a formal 
dance.  A collared shirt/tie for young 
men and a nice dress for young 
women are appropriate attire.  
Clothing must meet school dress code. 
 
Dates are not encouraged.  We want 
every eighth grader to come and have 
fun.   
 

Food is available for all.  The food is 
part of the fun so dining out before is 
not needed. 
 
We appreciate your support during 
your child’s time at Lincoln Savage 
Middle School.  We look forward to 
your support of the 8th Grade 
Celebration.  Thank you. 
 

Essay Winner 
 Veteran’s of Foreign Wars (VFW) 

Essay Contest Winner 
“Congratulations" to sixth grade 
student, Kristin McGuinness, who has 
been chosen as the SECOND PLACE 
winner of the 2008-2009 Veterans of 
Foreign Wars Essay Contest for 
Post #2302 in the city of Grants Pass. 
Her essay was entitled “Why 
America’s Veterans Should Be 
Honored.” Mrs. Taylor, Mr. Workley, 
and the Lincoln Savage Middle School 
Language Arts Department are very 
proud of Kristin’s accomplishment and 
recognition. An award ceremony and 
dinner will be held at China Hut Café 
on Tuesday, April 7, 2009 at 6: 30 
P.M. to honor all of the student writers 
and their parents. Please take the time 
to congratulate Kristen when you see 
her in classes here at Lincoln Savage. 
Once again, a huge “Bravo!” to Kristin 
for her excellent writing. ☺ 

Yearbooks 
Yearbooks are on sale now for 
$23.00.  This year, the yearbook will 
be a hard back and all color.  So buy 
your yearbook now to ensure you have 
one reserved. 

Honor Society 
The Honor Society Induction will be 
held on April 29, 2009 at 6:00 p.m.  
Dinner will be provided for members 
and their families following the 
ceremony.  

Mailings 
This year we started mailing report 
cards and progress reports home to 
ensure that parents receive them.  We 
in turn are spending more in postage.  
If you have an email address, we 
would like to send the report cards and 
progress reports to you & save on 
postage too.  You may send in your 
email address with your child or you 
may send via email to 
deborah.scuitto@threerivers.k12.or.us   

PTO News 
Do not forget about eScrip.  By 
registering your Safeway Club Card 
with eScrip, you make a donation 
every time you shop!  Go to www. 
escrip.com or call 1-800-400-7878 to 
register. 

Albertsons is offering to share a 
percentage of proceeds with schools 
through their Community Partners 
Program.  Simply link the Lincoln 
Savage number 49001017552 to your 
regular Albertsons Preferred Savings 
Card, and they will send us a 
percentage of your purchases.  You 
can register either by mail or online at 
www.albertsons.com.  Please see the 
attached flyer for more information on 
how to sign up.  This is another easy 
way to help earn cash for your school.  
Please consider signing up!   


