FOREST LAKE AREA SCHOOLS
FOREST LAKE, MN 55025

May 29, 2014

AGENDA ITEM: 9.4

TOPIC: RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD OF PAPER SUPPLY BID

BACKGROUND: To comply with the bid law and to obtain the best
possible pricing, the District annually solicits sealed bids for paper supplies.

Permission to go out for bid was received from the School Board on April
3, 2014.

PROCESS: A bid announcement was published in the Forest Lake Times
on April 10 and 17, 2014. The bid opening occurred on May 15, 2014 at
10:00 a.m. in the Board Room at the District Office. Sixteen companies
were sent bid specifications, six companies returned bids. Bids were
analyzed and Board approval is being requested. The budget for the bids
was $120,000. A copy of the bid tabulation is attached.

RECOMMENDATION: The administration recommends that the School
Board approve the following award of the paper bid for 2014-2015.

C. J. Duffey $ 96,799.42
Pyramid School Products $ 10,796.01

TOTAL $107,595.43



FOREST LAKE AREA SCHOOLS
Forest Lake, MIN 55025

May 15, 2014
PAPER SUPPLIES
2014 - 2015
Item/s Supplier Amount
1 Not Bid No Bid
2-4 Not Bid No Bid
5 Pyramid School Products $ 448.50
6-34 Pyramid School Products $ 7,091.25
35-38 Pyramid School Products $ 599.20
39-47 C. J. Duffey $ 43,098.40
48-49 C. J. Duffey $ 50,734.80
50 Not Bid No Bid
51 Not Bid No Bid
52-62 Pyramid School Products $ 2,657.06
63-66 Not Bid No Bid
67 Not Bid No Bid
68-76 C. J. Duffey $ 2,763.57
77-79 C. J. Duffey $ 202.65
TOTAL $ 107,595.43
C. J. Duffey $ 96,799.42
Pyramid School Products $ 10,796.01
TOTAL $ 107,595.43
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[NOTE: Recommended award in Gray

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT #831
Forest Lake, MN 55025

May 15, 2014

PAPER SUPPLIES

2014 - 2015

CPG - Contract Paper

C. J. buffey

* Pyramid School

School Specialty

“*Standard Stationery

Group Paper Company Products Supply Co. Wilcox Paper
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.i{Envelopes #10, Plain, 500 Per Box, 5 Box Per Cs. White 0 Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUMBID ITEM 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6-1/8 x 9-1/2, 28 Ib. Stock, ) ) .
2.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per Case Manila 0 Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#90, 9 x 12, 28 Ib. Stock, ) ) .
3.|{Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case Manila 0 Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#97, 10 x 13, 28 Ib. Stock, ] )
4.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case Manila 0 Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUMBID ITEMS 2 - 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|Paper, Blanks, Plain 6 Ply, 22 x 28, 100 Sht Per Package White 25 I Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 179418 448.5011$ 306018S 765.00 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 5 No Bid No Bid $ 448.50 $ 765.00 No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, ) .
6.[Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Black 20 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2666 1% 533.20 | $ 25501 $ 510.00 1% 300019 600.00f|$ 2564 | % 512.80 || No Bid No Bid
9'x 12, Groundwood Fibre, . .
7.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Blue 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $24.9919% - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, . )
8.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Dark Blue 20 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2666 % 533.2011% 25501 % 51000 1% 300018 600.001% 256913 513.80 || No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, . .
9.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | Light Blue 0 Cases  |i No Bid No Bid $ 2499 1% - Is - I3 - s - 1% - 48 - 18 -l No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, ) .
10.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Brown 5 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2666 1% 13330} $ 2550 % 127.5011$ 30001 % 150.00 1S 2569 1§ 128.45 || No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, ) .
11.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Gray 5 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2499 (% 124.9511$ 23501 % 11750 1$ 27501 % 137.501% 23.811% 119.05 || No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, Brilliant ) )
12.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Green 5 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 249918 124.9514% 23008 115.00 18 27501 $ 1375018 23.1118 115.55 || No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, ) .
13.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | Dark Green 0 Cases |l No Bid No Bid $ 287818 - s - 1s - s - 1s - 4% - $ -1 NoBid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, , )
14.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Orange 20 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 287818 5756018 275018 55000 11§ 325018 6500018 278315 556.60 || No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, ) )
15.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Pink 20 Cases No Bid No Bid $249918% 49980013 235018 470.001|% 27501 % 55000013 238118 476.20 | No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, B . .
16.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Scarlet 20 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 28788 5756018 275018 5500018 325018 6500013 2777 1% 555.40 || No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, ~ . . .
17.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Violet 10 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 24951§ 24990418 23501 % 235.004% 27501 % 2750043% 238118 23810 i No Bid No Bid
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CPG - Contract Paper

C. J. Duffey

* Pyramid School

School Speciaity

**Standard Stationery

Group Paper Company Products Supply Co. Wilcox Paper
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED| UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, Bright

18.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case White 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 292918 - $§ - $ - $ - 18 - $ - $ - No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,

19.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Yellow 10 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 249918 249,00 1% 235018 235.0011$ 275018 275.0011$ 23.811§ 238.10 it No Bid No Bid
12 x 18, Groundwood Fibre,

20.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Black 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 261318 - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

21.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Blue 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 242118 - $ - $ - $ - $ - S - 3 - No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

22.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Dark Blue 15 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 261318 39195118 25251 § 378751$ 30.00 | $ 450.0011$ 25.30 (% 379.50 f} No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

23.1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Light Blue 0 Cases |l No Bid No Bid $242113 - $ - $ - § - $ - § - $ - No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

24 1Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Brown 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $261318$ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

25.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | Dark Brown 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2848 1% - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

26.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Gray 15 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 242119 363.154% 23.001 % 345001 % 2750 % 41250 (|$ 23.24 18 348.60 || No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre, Brilliant

27.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg,25 Pkgs Per Case Green 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 242118 - s - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

28.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Orange 5 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 284818 14240118 27751 % 138.7541$ 337518 168.751$ 27.97 18 139.85 || No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

29.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Pink 15 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 242118 363.15)1$ 23.001$% 345000% 27501 &% 4125041% 23.24 1% 348.60 || No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

30.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Red 10 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 318 | $ 318601% 28751 % 28750 11% 350018 350.00|$ 29.021% 290.20 || No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

31.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Scarlet 15 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 284818 427200% 27751 % 41625116 33.751% 506.2511$ 28.021% 420.30 it No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

32.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Violet 10 Cases No Bid No Bid $242118% 24210 1% 23.00 1% 23000 1% 275018 2750018 232418 232.40 |i No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre, Bright

33.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case White 40 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 28158 1,126.00 18 267518 1,070.00 S 30.001$ 1,200.001$ 26.73|$ 1,069.20 | No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,

34.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Yellow 20 Cases No Bid No Bid $§ 242118 48420 1$ 23.001$ 460.00 1$ 27501 % 550.00}1$ 23.24 13 464.80 Il No Bid No Bid

LUMP SUMBID ITEMS 6 - 34 NO BID 3 7,458.18 ARc $ 7,091.25 $ 835000 *APC | § 7,147.50 No bid

BIDSHT

Page 2




CPG - Contract Paper

C. J. Duffey

* Pyramid School

School Specialty

**Standard Stationery

Group Paper Company Products Supply Co. Wilcox Paper
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT |EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
35.|Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. Manila 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 |b. Manila 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37.1Papert, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. White 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. White 20 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 339618 67920 1% 29.96 | % 599201 $ 31201 % 624.0011% 30.16 | § 603.20 || No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 35-38 NO BID 3 679.20|| "APC |3 599.20 3 624.00 || “APC $ 603.20 No Bid
39 -46 PAPER, PREMIUM NUMBER 4. MILL BRAND, XEROGRAPHIC
See Instructions to Bidders for Specifications.
39.{Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 201b., 10 Rms Per Case Blue 280 Cases $ 34531 8% 9668404 9% 3169}|$ 8,873.20 |l No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 31.701$ 8,876.00
40.{Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Canary 280 Cases $ 345318 96684011% 316913 8,873.20 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 31.701$ 8,876.00
41.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 |b., 10 Rms Per Case Gold 120 Cases $ 34531% 41436018 31691]8 3,802.80 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 31.701% 3,804.00
42.{Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Green 240 Cases $ 34531% 8,287.20[|% 31691 9% 7,605.60 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 31.701$ 7.608.00
43.{Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 |b., 10 Rms Per Case Pink 160 Cases $ 345318 5524.8011$ 316918 5,070.40 Ji No Bid | No Bid No Bid | NoBid No Bid No Bid $§ 317018 5,072.00
44.1Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x.11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms.Per Case Salmon 120 Cases $ 34531 8% 4,1436001$ 31691 % 3,802.80 ) No Bid | Ne Bid No Bid - | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 31.701% 3.804.00
45 |Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Buff 40 Cases $ 34531% 1,381.201% 31691 % 1,267.60 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 317018 1,268.00
46.{Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2x 11,20 1b., 10 Rms Per Case Orchid 120 Cases $ 34531% 414360413 3169 % 3,802.80 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 31.701§% 3,804.00
47 .|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 14, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Green 0 Cases $ ~ 3 - S - $ - No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - $ -
Flambeau
LUMP SUMBID ITEMS 39 - 47 FASCOPY | §  46,960.80 | Torchgiow | § 43 098.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid River $ 43,112.00
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
48.|Specs. #4, 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib. White 2120 Cases $ 252918% 53,614.80 | $ 2369 {8 50,222.80 |l NoBid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 2375]% 50,350.00
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
49.|Specs. #4,8-1/2x 14,20 ib. White 16 Cases $ 408419 65344 11$ 320019 512.00 || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 369518 591.20
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 48 - 49 (See Instructions to Bidders for Specifications) FASCOPY | § 54,268.24 |FRP32B | §  50,734.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid Boise $ 50,941.20
8-1/2 x 11 - 172" Writing Line With a 1/4"
Broken Line and a 1/4" space Between
Writing Lines, The Following is accsplable:
Pacon Corp. #2639 -- SEE SAMPLE
50.|Paper, Manuscript ATTACHED, 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey * Pyramid School School Speciality *Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Supply Co. Wilcox Paper
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED| UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT [EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

51.|Paper, Mounting Board 22 x 28, 14-Ply, 50 Sheets Per Pkg White 0 Pkgs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUMBID ITEM 51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
52.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Black 5 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 277618 166.56 1| $ 258118 15486 1§ 43008 258.0011$ 25.97 1§ 155.82 §f No Bid No Bid
53.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Blue 7 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 2563183 17941 1% 24301 % 1701011 % 36.00 | § 2520011 24.4418§ 171.08 || No Bid No Bid
54.]1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Dark Brown 8 Rolls No Bid No Bid $2497 18 189.76 | § 23571 % 188561 % 38.001$% 304.004$ 23.701 % 189.60 | No Bid No Bid
55.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Green 8 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 2378189 19024 11$ 2244 ( § 179521 % 36301 % 290401% 225719 180.56 i No Bid No Bid
56.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000 L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Orange 7 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 300518 21035113 2832 1% 19824 $ 5050 1 § 353501 284918 199.43 | No Bid No Bid
57.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Pink 12 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 291518 34980 11$ 26.96 | $ 323.5211$ 46.30 1% 555.60 1% 27.081% 324.96 || No Bid No Bid
58.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Red 7 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 3149 15§ 22043 11$ 2866 1§ 200621 57.351% 401451% 29.121§ 203.84 |l No Bid No Bid
59.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Scarlet 4 Rolls No Bid No Bid $2711 18§ 108.44 1§ 25091 ¢ 10036 $ 426518 1706011 25251 9% 101.00 §| No Bid No Bid
60.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Sky Blue 12 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 296018 3552011$ 277919 3334818 491018 580.2011$ 27.96 1% 335.52 |f No Bid No Bid
61.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight White 20 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 244918 489.80J1$ 232918 46580 1$ 37.008§ 74000 1% 234118 468.20 |l No Bid No Bid
62.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Yellow 12 Rolls No Bid No Bid $ 300518 360604 $ 2850 | § 342.00]1$ 480018 576.00}l$ 28.681% 344.16 il No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUMBID ITEMS 52 - 62 No Bid $ 2,830.59|| "APC |'§ 2,657.06 $ 449075 “APC |§ 2674.17 No Bid
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CPG - Contract Paper

C. J. Duffey

* Pyramid School

School Speciaity

**Standard Stationery

Group Paper Company Products Supply Co. Wilcox Paper
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9x 12, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
63.|Paper, Tagboard 12 Pkgs/Case Manila 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
12'x 18, 1501b., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
64.{Paper, Tagboard 10 Pkgs/Case Manila 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
65.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg Manila 0 Pkgs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg White 0 Pkgs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUMBID ITEMS 63 - 66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red Lined, Left Margin,
67.|Paper, Theme (holeless) 3/8" Ruled, 8-1/2 x 11 (NOT 3 Hole) White 0 Cases No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid ] No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUMBID ITEM 67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
68.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Blue 12 Cases $ 34251 8% 411.00|$ 3054 1% 366.48 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid | NoBid No Bid No Bid $ 308018% 369.60
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
69.Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover {Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Canary 10 Cases $ 34251 % 34250 11$ 3054 | § 305.40 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 308019 308.00
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
70.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Goldenrod 10 Cases $ 342518% 34250 14% 30541 8% 305.40 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ - No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 87 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
71.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover {Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Gray 5 Cases $ 34251% 171251% 3054 1 § 152.70 I No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ - No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
72.1Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |{Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Green 9 Cases $ 34251% 308.25% 305413 274.86 § No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 30.801]% 277.20
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
73.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case lvory 5 Cases $ 342518 1712501$ 3054 1 8 152.70 I No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 30801% 154.00
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
74 IPaper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Pink 8 Cases $ 34.2518% 274.0011% 3054 | $ 244.32 |l No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 30801% 246,40
8-1/2 x 11, 87 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
75.1Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover [Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Tan 4 Cases $ 34251% 137.001$ 3054 | $ 122.16 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ - No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 lb., 250 Sheets Per
76.1Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case White 29 Cases $ 32681% 947.7214% 28951 % 839.55 || No Bid | No Bid Neo Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid $ 308018 893.20
bid not
Neenah or bid on
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 68 - 76 Equal $ 3,10547 | Domtar | §  2,763.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid affitems | 8§ 2,248.40

BIDSHT




CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey * Pyramid School School Specialty *Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Supply Co. Wilcox Paper
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

77 .{Paper, Xerographic 11x 17,20 1b. White 3 Cases $ 57501 8% 172501 $% 26.75 1 % 80.25 || No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 29951% 89.85
78.]Paper, Xerographic 11 x17, 20 1b. Blue 1 Cases $ 66.00 | $ 66.004$ 40.80 | $ 40.80 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 39251% 39.25
79.|Paper, Xerographic 11x17,20 b, Gold 2 Cases $ 66.0019% 132.001$ 408019 81.60 il No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 52501% 105.00
LUMP SUMBID ITEMS 77 - 79 FASCOPY | § 370.50 $ 202.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 234.10

All other bidders submitted a bid security.

*Pyramid School Products - APC - American Paper Company

Minimum order $5,000 full cases. Any combo of items in full cases.

**Standard Stationery - APC minimurm bid $9,000.
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