Proposal project:

Service & Academic Pins, Award Jackets & Blankets

Proposal #: 0803-05
Proposal date: March 28, 2008

Awarded to: Award date:
A-1 Sports
Center, Inc/ Authentic Fort Worth J. Brandt North Texas Neff
Texas Chenille] Promotions.co | Balfour - Ft | Promotional | Recognition Recognition / Motivation
Embroidery m Worth Products Ltd Meca Sportswear Inc

Award Jacket

$43.95 each

$110.00 each

$46.00 each

*$64.71

No bid

**$42.90 each with
the "Meca Jacket
Program" or $60.00
each

$46.99 each

Award Blanket

Fleece: $43.95
Wool: $49.95

$79.99 each

$47.00 each

*$62.42

No bid

No bid

$46.99 each

KISD Crest Pin

$46.00 each

$43.28 each

$7.23 each

**100 pieces
Die Struck
Soft Enamel,
1.2mm
Unit price:
$1.09
Die charge:
$92.48
Plating
change:
$27.20 per
change up to
2x Minimum
charge:
$87.00

$11.23 each

No bid

No bid

Academic
Excellence Pin

No bid

$8.90 for nickle
or copper

$43.28 for 1/10

10k & y/g plate

$7.77 each

**100 pieces
Die Struck
Soft Enamel,
1.2mm
Unit price:
$1.09
Die charge:
$92.48
Plating
change:
$27.20 per
change up to
2x Minimum
charge:
$87.00

$3.75 each

No bid

No bid




A-1 Sports
Center, Inc/ Authentic Fort Worth J. Brandt North Texas Neff
Texas Chenille] Promotions.co| Balfour - Ft | Promotional | Recognition Recognition / Motivation
Embroidery m Worth Products Ltd Meca Sportswear Inc
**100 pieces
Die Struck
Soft Enamel,
1.2mm
Unit price:
$1.09
Die charge:
$92.48
Plating
change:
$27.20 per
change up to
2x Minimum
School Board charge:
Pin No bid $43.28 each | $11.23 each $87.00 $9.75 each No bid No bid
N Natural
atural .
diamond: | **100 pieces e
Natural $19.00 Die Struck $1 6'00_
diamond: $4.56 | synthetic | Soft Enamel, synthetic
synthetic topaz | topaz round | synthetic | toPaz round
round stone: | stone: $3.00 |stones 1.2mm| Stone: $2.50
$4.56 synthetic Unit price: | Synthetic
synthetic sapphire $2.50 Die sapphire
sapphire round | round stone: charge: round stone:
stone: $4.56 $3.00 $120.00 $2.50
1.5 mm Stones synthetic ruby [synthetic ruby| Minimum synthetic
(including round stone: | round stone: charge: ruby round
setting labor) No bid $4.56 $3.00 $87.00 stone: $2.50 No bid No bid
1,350 Jackets = 1,350 1,350 1,350
Estimated $59,332.50 | 1,350 Jackets =| Jackets = Jackets = Jackets =
Yearly Cost for 130 Wool $148,500.00 | $62,100.00 | $115,654.50 1,350 Jackets = | $63,436.50
Jackets & Blankets = 130 Blankets = |130 Blankets| 130 Blankets $81,000.00 130 Blankets
Blankets $6,493.50 $10,398.70 = $6,110.00 | = $11,583.00 No bid Blankets = No Bid | = $6,108.70
Exceptions:

* Ft Worth Promotional Products: Jacket patches: 6" letter K or C: 1 color felt = $13.05 each. 2 color felt = $15.66 each.
4" letters FR : 1 color felt = $21.21 each. 2 color felt = $25.46. Emblem logo insert = $2.58 Chenille & emblem sew-on fees = $2.7.

per line/location

* Ft Worth Promotional Products: Blanket patches: 8" chenille letter: 1 color felt = $17.82 each. 2 color felt = $21.38 each.
Emblem logo insert = $2.58 Chenille & emblem sew-on fees = $2.72 per line/location
** Ft Worth Promotional Products: Did not meet bid specifications

** North Texas Recognition/Meca: $60.00 as specified, with 7-9 week lead-time. (Vendor does not keep jackets in stock)
$42.90 under the "Meca Jacket Program": Vendor will go to each school to custom fit each student, place orders for jackets &
patches and distribute packets of information to students on how to "decorate" their jackets. 7-9 week lead-time.




