Bid Proposal
PAVEMENT

Date Rep Estimate #
101 Josephine Ln (P) 972-721-9796 g " o020
Grand Prairie, TX 75050 (F) 972-721-1755
Billing / Customer Name Service Address
Quanah ISD Quanah ISD High School project
PO Box 150 PO Box 150
Quanah, TX 76252 Quanah, TX 76252
PO Number Terms Project
Net 30
ltem Description

Quanah ISD High School project

Asphalt Overlay | Asphalt Overlay: (approximately 6080 square feet, 85 Tons,1 Arcas)
1. Clean area to be overlaid.

2. Tack with RC-250.

3. Install 2" of HMAC Type D.

4. Roll and compact with 3 - 5 ton roller.

Flex Base Repair | back fill small areas after plumbing reapir to level for aspahalt Flex Base:(approximately 3000 square fect, 60 approximately 1
areas.

Overlay aspahit after plumbing repair , area to be back fill pior to overlay

Subtotal $18,986.00

CI Pavement is not responsible for damage to underground utilities or graffiti on new
pavement. Any invoice past due will be subject to a late fee compounded at a rate of 2.0%
per month prorated. Any alteration from above specifications involving extra costs, will be Sales Tax (0‘00) LU0
executed only upon written orders, and will become an extra charge over and above the
propasal. Payment terms shall be 50% up front 50% upon completion. Total
This proposal expires 30 days from date listed.

$18,986.00

ACCEPTED: The above prices, specifications and conditions are satisfactory and
are hereby accepted. CI Pavement. is authorized to do the work as specified. )
Payment will be made as outlined above. Signature:

Phone # Fax #

972-721-97%6 972-721-1755




51212019 Quanah 18D Mail - Re: drain/culvert/Catch basin

Re: drain/culvert/Catch basin

1 massage

Brad McClendon <brad@cipavement.com>
To: Armando Leal <armandc.leal@gqisd.net>

So car parking spot striping ? it would be $£50.00

On Thu, May 2, 2019 at 11:11 AM Amando Leal <armando.leal@qisd net> wrote:
The new 6000 sq ft parking you will do.

On Thu, May 2, 2019 at 11:05 AM Brad McClendon <brad@cipavement.com> wrote:
How much striping are we talking about ? can you mark it on a map f google earth image or send me a few pics .

0On Thu, May 2, 2019 at 10:562 AM Amando Leal <armando Jeal@qgisd.net> wrote:
Hey Brad, the asphalt quote, did it include striping. If not, how much?

On Thu, Apr 18, 2019 at 8:42 AM Brad McClendon <irad@cipavement.com> wrote:
No problem, see you then

On Thu, Apr 18, 2019, 8.41 AM Armando Leal <armandc leal@gisd nel> wrote:
Ok thanks for letting me know

On Thu, Apr 18, 2019 at 8:40 AM Brad McClendon <brad@cipavement.com= wrote:
| got stuck in traffic getting out of town my GPS is saying 11 is when I'l be there instead of 13 .

On Mon, Apr 15, 2019, 4:19 PM Brad McClendon <brad@cipavement com:> wrote;
Yos sir Il see you Thursday

On Mon, Apr 15, 2019 at 4:19 PM Armando Leal <armando leal@q sd net> wrote:
That's fine, thank you for coming

On Mon, Apr 15, 2019, 4:06 PM Brad McClendan <brad@cipavement com> wiote:
How would 10:30 be it's a bit of a drive

On Mon, Apr 15, 2019 at 4.02 PM Armando Leal <armando ieal@qisd net> wrote:
801 elbert

On Mon, Apr 15, 2019, 3;58 PM Brad McClendon <brad@cipavement com> wrote.
What's a good address to meet you s | can map the drive from the office ?

On Mon, Apr 15, 2019 at 2:26 PM Armando Leal <armando 'ea@q sd net> wrote:
Sure, what tme?

On Mon, Apr 15, 2019 at 2:04 PM Brad McClendon <brad@cipavement com> wrote:
Armando . Rob asked me to work with you on this , | have some time Thursday to meet up if that works for you ?

Thanks,

Brad McClendon
Sweeping ops/ Account Manager

@ PAVEMIENT

101 Josephing Ln
Grand Prairie. TX 75050

Phone: 872-721-9796

Celi: 214-518-0064

Fax: 972-721-1755

Brad@cipavernant.com

WWW Cipavement.com

Click here to join or support our team the "Pavement Peddlers” in our fight against MS

Thanks,

Brad MeClendon
Sweeping ops/ Account Manager

Armando Leal <armando.leal@qisd.net>

Thu, May 2. 2018 at 11:12 AM

https://mail google.com/mail/w/0?k=60a96466da& view=pt&search=all & permthid=thread-f%3A 1630907978249760552% 7Cmsg %3 A [6324373695575 1 1364 &sim... /3



